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3/1/05  
9:15 AM  
 
My people, this area that separates the sea and the land will soon be eliminated. The 
waters shall come forth and a new coastline will be present. My people, this earth will 
begin to show mankind the depth of his sins. The just hand of My Father is about to strike 
for waves of warning have come to show mankind that his ways are not pleasing to Me.  
Man continues to ignore My pleas.  

My people, man has yet to see his greatest trials and sufferings. You are not your own, 
you are merely a grain of sand that has been sent forth on a mission. This world will not 
have peace until My Commandments are being lived and My people are obedient to 
them.  Each time My little ones are killed through abortion My Commandments are broken. 
Each time that there is no regard for life at any stage, My Commandments are broken. 
Each time man places his love for money and power over his Heavenly Father, My 
Commandments are broken. Each time man engages with man or woman with woman, 
My Commandments are broken.  My people, each time man engages with woman outside 
of the union of marriage, My Commandments are broken.  

My people, the greatest sin is abortion and abortion is breaking My Commandments. 
When there is no regard for life there is no regard for the sanctity of ones soul. Be on 
guard for this earth will rock, this earth will tremble. Those who seek darkness will perish 
into eternal darkness. Those who stand for the truth and seek the light will find reward in 
My kingdom for My kingdom is not of this world.  

My people, be on guard and stay awake for days of darkness are soon to cover this earth 
yet it is I, Jesus, that will come with My light and shine it into the souls of mankind. Do not 
fear this time for it will be the greatest purification since the beginning of creation. It will be 
the greatest act of mercy since My Passion, Death and Resurrection. Now go forth, come 
live in My light for I am Jesus and My mercy and justice will prevail. 

3/2/05  
7:00 PM  
 
My people, your time is not My time.  Do not question My words, My love, for this time that 
has been given to you shows the great depth of My mercy.  Behold the signs for all will 
soon awaken.  So many continue to ignore My words that they will be the foolish ones 
caught off guard.  

The days are upon you that will call all to their knees.  All will see the state of their soul.  
Not one will be spared of seeing where they stand in the eyes of their creator.  When you 
see man killing man and the innocence of My little ones being deprived of their mission, 
know that justice will soon prevail.  
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Do not believe that evil will prevail for I am Jesus.  Be at peace if your soul is in a state of 
grace.  Be at peace if you strive to walk in My light, the light of My love.  My 
Commandments will be restored into the hearts of men.  Days of selfishness and laziness 
will soon come to an end.  

My people, you are not here on your own for the one that speaks these words to you is the 
one that formed you in My image and likeness for I am Jesus.  You are here on a mission 
to serve one master.  

Go forth and live your mission.  Your free will is to choose My way or the world's way.  Do 
not be fooled for this world does not grant you eternal salvation.  The world does not save 
your soul.  It is I, Jesus, who has come to warn you that vessels that have been sleeping 
will soon awaken, sending great fire and ash.  The waters are no longer calm and great 
waves of warning are soon to call many to their hour of judgment. Areas that have become 
the root of such evil where many culminate will soon be washed away.  Mountains will 
awaken and will ripple across nations showing the true dividing line.  

These words do not come as being far in the distance rather take heed and give thanks to 
your Heavenly Father that you have been given this time, this time of repentance.  Begin 
today by examining the state of your soul.  Begin today spending time in front of My Most 
Blessed Sacrament.  

If you give the world your focus, you will not hear the guiding words of your master.  Recite 
the Chaplet of My Most Divine Mercy daily. Call upon the intercession of your guardian 
angels to assist you.  Armor yourselves in prayer for the coming of the antichrist is near for 
you will be grazed and numbered.  This time has been foretold through the Gospel 
message.  The trumpets will sound and all will know I am the true Messiah.  Now go forth 
and take heed to My words today for I am Jesus and My mercy and justice will prevail.  

3/4/05  
2:45 PM  
 
My people, speak to one another in harmony to My words for I am Jesus. I am light, love 
and peace. The battle has intensified for the division is multiplying. Seek to live in My light 
for it is there that you will take refuge in My Most Sacred Heart. You must be a witness to 
the truth and be a shining example to those around you.  

My people, you have no merit over your brothers and sisters.  Do not step ahead for I am 
Jesus. I am the just judge and the merciful Savior. Do not judge your brothers and sisters 
in their areas of weakness, rather guide them in love into My light.  

My people, I come to warn you that these times in which you are in will cause great 
division amongst you. I have come to warn you that the prowling lion is seeking his last 
victims before the heart of My Mother triumphs. Seek to live in the light for the prince of 
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darkness knows your areas of weakness for, as I have told you, he tricks the mind to use 
the body to trap the soul. Do not give Satan what is not his, your soul. Allow your free will 
to choose the path of your Creator. Walk the road to Calvary and cleanse your soul and 
spend time in front of My Most Blessed Sacrament.  

Recite the Chaplet of My Most Divine Mercy daily. Now go forth for days of darkness are 
soon to come forth. Be at peace for I am Jesus the light of the world and My mercy and 
justice will prevail.  
 
3/5/05 
10:00 AM (Message from God the Father) 
 
My people, when you reject the Fifth Commandment, you reject the First. When you reject 
any of My Commandments you reject the First for I am the Lord your God and it all comes 
back to the First. I am the Alpha, the Omega, the first, the last, the beginning and the end. 
I sent forth My Son to bring light to the world in order for you to see eternal life in My 
Kingdom. My just hand is about to strike upon humanity for all who seek to diminish My 
Commandments and step ahead of Us, your Triune God. This world has been plagued by 
the darkness of evil that continues to prevail because of your free will.  

My people, behold the days for you will see the wounds you have added to My Son. Live 
the Commandments and do not destroy them for the rocks of the earth that I formed will 
soon awaken. They will awaken and bring nations to a halt. They will bring mankind to his 
knees. My just hand will strike the seas and all that is not of Me will be washed away. 
Even those that walk in My light will stand for their judgment and find their place in My 
Kingdom. This hour that has been given is about to expire for all must live in obedience to 
My laws. Now go forth and live your mission. Live your life in accordance to My will for I 
am your Heavenly Father who has come to warn My children that your time is at hand. Be 
at peace for it is My mercy and justice that will prevail.  

 
3/5/05  
10:35 AM  
 
My chosen sons, walk the road to Calvary and live your mission as My chosen son. This 
road will become difficult for great division is about to come upon you. There will be a 
great dividing of My Church, yet all will know who are My true chosen sons. All will see 
those who walk in My light and those who live their vocation according to the ways of the 
world. You are all called to be like John the Baptist. You are each called to be a rock like 
Peter for the world did not choose you to be My chosen son, it is I, Jesus, that formed you 
to be My chosen son.  Now go forth and imitate your Creator.  

Live, live the Gospel message by your witnessing and example.  Do not allow the world to 
dictate your mission, rather allow your Heavenly Father to dictate your mission for 
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mankind.  Speak the truth from the pulpit and do not hide your face in the bush, rather let 
your voice be heard in the world for where your voice is, there is Mine. Teach your flocks 
the Commandments. My people need to understand the Commandments. Follow the 
guidance of your brother, the Holy Father, for he is guiding My Church according to My 
will.  

My sons, those of you who deny My words and deny the truth, deny Me. Do not be foolish 
in your actions for all will be held accountable. Now go forth and take heed to My words for 
I am Jesus and My peace be with each one of you, My chosen sons.  

3/6/05 
11:00 PM ( Message from the Blessed Mother) 
 
My children, continue to be humble and loving servants. Continue to come closer to my 
son, Jesus, through the Sacraments. My children, the time is coming when all will know 
where they stand in the eyes of God. The blood that covers the hands of these abortion 
doctors is the blood of the innocence. 
 
You must repent of your sins, dear children, and turn away from the world. Open your 
hearts to the love of my son. Be loving servants for God. I have come to light the way so 
come take my hand and live for God by living the Gospel message for I am your heavenly 
Mother. 

3/8/05 
6:30 PM 
 
My people, these evil souls are out there prowling amongst you and seek to kill. They are 
on a mission, a mission that is not of Me, but one that seeks to claim more souls for the 
prince of darkness. These evil souls seek money and power and will go to great lengths to 
bring themselves greater glory and honor. Many have walked the path of darkness and 
have become so far in the distance that they will never see My light for the only light will 
be that of their judgment. 

My people, My love is infinite, it is unconditional. I ask that today you take heed to My 
words for a shepherd always guides his sheep. The time is coming when My words of 
warning will no longer be, rather they will come to light. This is the hour to be on guard. Be 
on guard with the state of your soul and your words and actions to those around you. This 
is the hour to be on guard to armor yourselves in prayer for the battle is on. The battle of 
good versus evil and you cannot fight this battle alone. You need to stay focused on the 
cross for the distraction and confusion will multiply. Do not become the devil's victim as he 
prowls his final lap before the heart of My Mother triumphs. 
 
Behold the signs for they are all around you, yet man will try and justify them. Do not take 
heed to the explanation of man, rather take heed to your Creator for the one who formed 
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the seas will instruct them. The one who formed the mountains, the earth and all that is in 
it knows the depth of your sins and how the earth is responding according to them. 
 
My people, I have sent My Mother to warn you that it is because of the blood of the 
innocence that mankind will see a great chastisement for this world needs to be cleansed 
of its filth for the greater survival of humanity. The rock of the earth will shift and great 
waves will rise in the east sending forth an awakening of historic proportions. Trust in the 
words of your master for if you are tending to the state of your soul you have nothing to 
fear for fear does not come from Me. It is My gentle hand reaching out to guide you and 
My words of love calling your name. I am not far in the distance, I am standing in your 
midst inviting you into the light of My love. Now go forth for I am Jesus and be at peace for 
My mercy and justice will prevail. 
 
3/11/05 
10:30 AM 
 
My people, today I ask that parents take heed to their children. Today I ask that you guide 
them by your witnessing and example into the light of My love. Guide your children 
through prayer so that they may come to know the fullness of My love. Your children will 
not imitate their Creator if they do not know Me. 

My people, today I ask that you teach your children to recite the rosary for it is the greatest 
armor against the prince of darkness. Teach your children the message of My Divine 
Mercy and teach them how to recite this prayer. Meditate on My Passion. The only way 
you can guide your children in the right way is for you to look to the guidance of your 
Heavenly Father through prayer. 

Parents teach your children the Commandments and do not rely on the world to define 
them for the world only diminishes them. Bring My little ones in front of My Most Blessed 
Sacrament. This is the hour to grab hold of your children and not leave them to be 
exposed to the ways of the world. The world's ways will bring them confusion and make 
them to easily fall victim to Satan. 

You are the first teachers of your children for I have entrusted them to you. They are My 
gift to you and your mission is to guide them so that they may one day be with Me in My 
Kingdom. Your mission is to guide them and love them. Now go forth and take heed to My 
words for I am Jesus and My mercy and justice will prevail. 
 
3/13/05 
10:30 PM 
 
My people, as I have told you, the earth will respond according to the depth of your sins. 
My words come and speak volumes of how your sins are causing your own sufferings. 
This earth is changing and your patterns of change will make it difficult to ward off disease 
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and there will be famine. Do not take comfort in the routine of your day for your routines 
are about to change. 

In the blink of an eye the mountains can awaken. In the blink of an eye the rock of the 
earth can shift causing great division. Take heed to My words for time is truly at hand. You 
will see a change in My Church and division will consume the hearts of My people for, as I 
have told you, I came to divide and your division will multiply. There is no longer going to 
be a middle line for I am Jesus, the way, the truth and the life. 

Be open to Me, be open to My plan for it is through your obedience that you will see the 
light, the light of My Kingdom. This world only fills you with temporary comforts that drive 
you to be selfish. I am Jesus, I am what your soul is truly missing. Respond to your free 
will for to deny these words I am speaking is to deny what has been written in the Gospel 
message. The trumpets will sound and all of creation will respond to My coming. 

Prepare, prepare today for in the light of good, darkness lingers. Darkness that will soon 
come to an end. You must stay awake and be on guard for this time of tribulation is here 
and many evil souls linger to guide you into their trap. You are not to take refuge in the 
world, rather take refuge in My Most Sacred Heart for I promise you will find eternal joy. 
Now go forth for I am Jesus and be at peace for My mercy and justice will prevail. 
 
3/14/05 
3:45 PM 
 
My people, take heed to the guidance of the Holy Father for he has been given this time 
as a witness to mankind how through prayer and obedience one can persevere through 
the greatest obstacles. He is a true model of humility and obedience of how one is 
dedicated to his mission and fulfilling the will of his Father. 

Listen to his words for so many have turned away and do not realize he was formed for 
this mission in guiding My Church. Mankind does not realize that I speak words to him to 
speak to you, My flock, My children. Pray for him and his protection for there are many, 
even those inside the walls of My church, that seek to diminish his guidance, his presence, 
for there are many Judases amongst you. 

My people, this world is changing rapidly and your only true comfort is through your faith 
and trust in Me. Do not fear being mocked and persecuted for it is a sign that you are 
journeying the road to Calvary. This is a time to come to Me through the Sacraments. 
Come to Me at Mass for I am truly present Body, Blood, Soul and Divinity. 

Do not allow the world to guide you for it is one with eternal consequences. Now go forth 
for I am Jesus the light of the world that is inviting you into the light of My love. Now be at 
peace for it is My mercy and justice that will prevail. 
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3/14/05 
9:00 PM 
 
My people, it is not just the war of the womb that is being waged, it is life at all stages. 
Removing My little ones from the womb by abortion is like permanently removing Me from 
the Tabernacle. 

Wake up, dear children, for life is the most precious gift there is. Each soul is a perfection 
of My creation, and when My creation is interrupted by man, when it is diminished, My 
mission for that soul and its purpose on earth is eternally lost. When mankind steps ahead 
of Me and denies the life of any person from the womb till he reaches old age, he will see 
his day of judgment for I am the first to create and the last to judge. I am the giver and 
taker of each and every human being on the face of the earth. 

Listen to My words and be obedient to My Commandments for when you reject one you 
reject them all. It is by your obedience that you will gain eternal life. You cannot alter My 
laws for they are given to you so you may come closer to Me. Do not stand for the world 
for the world's ways are not My ways. The war of the womb is the greatest sin for it is the 
destruction of Me, of My creation. The greatest deprivation of the soul is not allowing Me 
to be at the center for I am Jesus. 

My people, you justify these wars to bring peace, yet again, I say to you, you cannot fight 
evil with evil. This war that is waging is not in large proportions compared to the one in the 
womb. When each person responds to My Commandments is when peace will reign. 
Again, I say to you, you have a free will and it must respond to the will of your Heavenly 
Father in order for you to gain eternal life. 

My children, live your mission and stand for the truth for it is only by your willingness to 
defend the truth that the truth will prevail. Be willing to stick out of the crowd instead of 
standing with it. Let your light shine, shine on the mountain top, for all will respond by your 
witnessing and example. Now go forth for I am Jesus and be at peace for My mercy and 
justice will prevail. 
 
3/15/05 
9:00 PM 
 
My people, behold the signs for a mountain that has been sleeping for a length of time will 
soon awaken causing everything that is close to it to be annihilated. You shall see millions 
at war and it will be one that will find even those well prepared defenseless. This is not the 
hour of calmness for evil is culminating the hearts and minds of My people. There is no 
calmness when there is still the war of the womb going on. There is no calmness when 
you see some having money and power and multiplying their treasures and yet hundreds 
of My little ones search for homes of love, search for comfort; and yet I will never abandon 
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them. 

Simplicity is the way of the Cross. There is no calmness when My Commandments are 
broken. I come in love, not as your just judge, rather as your merciful Savior to show you 
how even through the most grave sins I love you unconditionally. So many believe that I 
am far in the distance and do not see the continuation of mankind stepping ahead of Me. 

I see your sins, I suffered for them during My agony in the garden and yet it was only by 
My endless love for each and everyone of My people that I persevered to My crucifixion. 
This world and all that is in it can be washed away; for as I have told you not to take 
comfort in it. Your soul is eternal so take heed to the state of it. I am Jesus, your master, 
who has come to guide you into the light of My love. Now go forth and be at peace for My 
mercy and justice will prevail. 
 
3/16/05 
1:00 PM 
 
My chosen sons, I am Jesus, the light of the world that is soon to come and shine My light 
into the world covered in darkness. My sons, prepare for the time is coming when many of 
you will stand for persecution. This is not a time to run in fear; rather it is time to go out on 
a limb. Come take My hand for if you keep your focus on Me you will not fall. 

Persevere to the kingdom by fulfilling the mission you have been called to do. There will 
be much chaos amongst you for the division amongst your brothers has begun. Unite 
yourselves with those who stand by the Holy Father. Unite yourselves to those who stand 
for life at all stages. Now is not the hour to focus on the ways of the world, rather a time to 
focus on guiding your flock into the light of My love. 

My sons, in order for you to truly carry your cross, you must be prepared for crucifixion. 
There are many who seek to bring down My Church. Many of your brothers who seek to 
diminish the presence of the Holy Father. The way of My Church is soon to diminish for 
there are many evil souls who walk amongst you. 

Live your mission by building the foundation of your priesthood on solid rock for I am 
Jesus. Come to Me for again, I say to you, My hand is here to guide you. Place your trust 
in Me for I promise you will find favor with My Father in heaven. This hour of preparation is 
nearing the end for the just hand of My Father is about to strike. 

Prepare today by preparing your flock by your witnessing and example. Now go forth and 
be at peace, My sons, for I am Jesus and My mercy and justice will prevail. 

 

 



Words from Jesus 

285 

3/18/05 
4:45 PM 
 
My people, I am warning you that you are disobedient children. I am warning you that this 
world will no longer be as you have come to know it. My people, I am warning you that it is 
because of the blood of the innocent that mankind will be brought to his knees. It is 
because of the blood of the innocent that this earth will open up and echo the sounds of a 
woman harboring the pains of labor. Your ways are not My ways and your ways will 
become simplified. 

My people, you will never have peace if you are not allowing Me to guide you for you must 
trust in Me. You will never be unloved for I am Jesus My love is unending, unconditional. 
Behold the signs for these times in which you live are not of calmness rather they are 
times of true division and this division will multiply. I am warning you just as I did in the 
time of Noah for your continuation of offending Us your Triune God. 

You ignore the Son, you ignore the Father. If you say that My Passion, Death and 
Resurrection did not exist you will come to know that I am the true Messiah. I am the 
Alpha, the Omega, the first, the last, the beginning and the end. Again, I say to you, when 
mankind steps ahead and takes away life at any stage My Commandments are broken. 

When My Commandments are broken you are in grave sin and, My people, your sins are 
many. You cannot gain eternal life if you are destroying My Commandments. Your trials 
and sufferings are a result of your disobedience. Your free will must respond to My call. 
This nation that has been blessed with many fruits will soon be simplified. You have 
become a selfish nation that has become the root of evil. Your reference to Me and My 
presence in guiding this country has been diminished. Replacing My Commandments with 
false idols does not grant you the graces necessary to continue to bear fruit. 

This world and its infatuation with evil will soon be brought to its knees. Again, I say to 
you, abortion is the greatest sin. If you persevere in following the ways of the world I say to 
you that your perseverance is temporary for the world deprives you of heaven and brings 
you to the ever widening path of hell. The coast lines from east to west will be diminished 
for what is will no longer be. The mountains will awaken in areas that are not known to 
man. The just hand of My Father is about to strike and send forth a chastisement that has 
been foretold through the Gospel message for what is written is soon to come to light. 

The destination of your soul comes down to your willingness to take heed to the state of it 
for My words of warning are soon to expire. My words are not to cause fear for I am Jesus 
and fear does not come from Me. I am your Shepherd who has come to warn you in love 
that you must turn away from the world and come walk into the light of My love. Now go 
forth repent and sin no more for all are welcome to My banquet table. Your invitation is 
living the Commandments. Go forth and accept your invitation for I am Jesus the light of 
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the world and it is My mercy and justice that will prevail. 

3/18/05 
7:45 PM 
 
My people, your greatest trial is man against man. It is the true spiritual battle between 
heaven and hell. It is a battle that has been waged for mankind since the fall of Adam and 
Eve. It is time to allow your free will to choose My way or the world's. If you want to gain 
eternal life then you must be willing to carry your cross and the only way to carry your true 
cross is to be prepared for crucifixion. You must be prepared to be mocked and 
persecuted for the road to Calvary is long and narrow. Do not journey the ever widening 
path to hell for it is eternally dark where you will remain a burning ember. 

Come to Me and take refuge in My Most Sacred Heart for I am Jesus for you are never 
unloved. I love you and it was by My hands that I formed you into My image and likeness 
with a mission to fulfill in the world. Listen to your Master for I am Jesus. There will be 
division amongst your brothers and sisters, amongst your neighbor, spouse will be against 
spouse, priest against priest, sister against sister. This will not be a time to walk the middle 
line for the middle line will no longer be. You will see the fall of My Church yet this is not a 
fall that will remain for I am Jesus and My Church will always triumph for the truth will 
always prevail. 

My people, I warn you that the prowl of the lion is on his final lap to seek the victory of 
souls. Do not give Satan what is not his, your soul. Your soul belongs to your Creator and 
the only way for you to gain eternal life is through being obedient to My Commandments, 
living the Gospel message. Live your mission and take heed to the state of your soul. Go 
forth for the days of great change are drawing closer upon you for the hour is about to 
expire. Now go forth for I am Jesus and be at peace for My mercy and justice will prevail. 

 
3/21/05 
9:45 PM 
My people, today I am asking that My faithful to do acts of penance for those who have 
turned away and for those who have not yet come to know that I am the true messiah. 
This time in which you are in, preparing for My Passion, Death and Resurrection, is a time 
to deepen your faith and trust in Me. It is a time to begin to deny your ways and live to 
serve your neighbor. 

My people, pray, pray to your Heavenly Father. My Father's just hand is about to strike for 
this time that has been given is soon to expire and mankind will be awakened. Your 
greatest sin is your disobedience of the Fifth Commandment. Life is to be respected at any 
stage. This period of calmness that you have come to know will soon expire. Prepare, 
prepare today for all are called to live My Commandments. All are called to strive to live in 
holiness. Now go forth for I am Jesus who will shine My light into the souls of mankind. 
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Now go forth for it is My mercy and justice that will prevail. 
 
3/24/05 
7:00 PM 
 
My chosen sons, as this time of Lent comes to an end it is not a time to return to your old 
ways. It is time to come to Me more in prayer for too many souls need to be saved. This is 
a time of true division for all My faithful servants are on the front lines of the battle. My 
sons, speak the truth and use your voice. On Easter Sunday speak to My people of how it 
is only through the way of the cross that one will resurrect into eternal life in My kingdom. 
Heaven is only gained through suffering. The lukewarm soul does not persevere into 
paradise for it is only the soul that is faithful to Me. 

My sons, listen, listen to the guidance of your brother, the Holy Father, for he will not be 
with you much longer. Welcome My Passion, Death and Resurrection as a beginning of 
the novena of My Most Divine Mercy. On the first Sunday after Easter open the doors of 
My church to Divine Mercy Sunday. Teach your flock that it is only through the rays of My 
Most Sacred Heart that My oceans of love and mercy are poured out upon mankind. 
Teach My people how to say the Chaplet of My Most Divine Mercy and tell them to recite 
this daily for not only their salvation but the salvation of their neighbor. 

Speak to your flock about the Sacrament of Reconciliation. Tell My people about My 
endless love for them that is shown through the Eucharist for I am Jesus who is present in 
all the tabernacles of the world. I am present Body, Blood, Soul and Divinity. 

My sons, go forth and model your brothers who have journeyed this path before you. The 
ones who have truly gone out on a limb to be a witness and example of My love and 
mercy. Days of great change are coming closer for it is on the horizon and it is time to 
shepherd your flocks in love according to the true teachings of My Church. Now go forth 
and be at peace for I am Jesus your Master and it is My mercy and justice that will prevail. 

 
3/25/05 
12:45 PM 
 
My people, it is time to prepare for the just hand of My Father is about to strike. My time of 
warning you is soon to expire. The greatest sin is abortion. The greatest fall of mankind is 
breaking My Fifth Commandment. Woe to you who believe that you are the final judge. 
Woe to you who say that one's life is not precious and does not have a mission to fulfill. 

My people, your ways are not My ways. You have engaged yourselves in war that is not 
seen by the world as a war for it is the war of the womb, the war of the innocence. Man 
has become the dictator of who should live and who should die. Mankind has left no room 
for miracles when he continues to step ahead of Me. My words will speak volumes when 
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this earth begins to respond according to the depth of your sins. 

My people, you have come to serve yourselves and not your Heavenly Father. When you 
destroy My laws and diminish the Gospel message you will see your just punishment. This 
earth is soon to awaken for that is why I have told you to take heed to the state of your 
soul. When you reject any of My Commandments you reject the first for I am Jesus. I am 
the Alpha, the Omega, the first, the last, the beginning and the end. My Father's just hand 
is about to strike America. My Father's just hand is about to awaken a nation that has 
become the leader of killing My little innocent ones. 

My people, all of humanity in My eyes are My little ones for life taken away at any stage is 
breaking My Fifth Commandment. Do not relish in this world for this world has spoken of 
its lack of morals. This world has shown how it personifies evil and turns against its 
creator. Your free will must respond to Me and My call for you will not gain eternal life if 
you are living in grave sin. Go forth, come to the Sacraments and unite yourself to My 
suffering by walking the road to Calvary. Rejoice when others mock and persecute you for 
defending the truth for you will find favor with My Father in heaven. Now go forth and be at 
peace for I am Jesus and My mercy and justice will prevail. 
 
 
3/25/05 
5:00 PM (Good Friday) 
 
My child, go forth and write down these words I give you and share this message with the 
world. 

My child, I have heard your prayers for the life of My innocent little lamb that is being taken 
away. You see how on this day the lives of many innocent ones are sharing in My 
Passion, Death and Resurrection. My life was another life of innocence that was taken 
away, yet My Passion, death and Resurrection was the new covenant poured out upon 
mankind. 

My child, these times in which you are in are no different then when I walked this earth, yet 
evil has multiplied. Each time My people reject My love, My words, My laws, My wounds 
begin to bleed. My face is covered in spit and My scourging begins. Each time My people 
deny that I am the true messiah, the nails are being driven through My hands and feet. 
These evil ones who claim they are leaders are no different than the high priests who 
sought to put Me to death for speaking the truth. These judges who do not defend life are 
the Pontius Pilates of these times. 

My child, as I have spoken, the just hand of My Father is about to strike. Continue to be 
willing to suffer for the time of warning is near. I will come in radiant splendor and claim My 
faithful children. My Father's just hand will serve this world its just punishment for 
continuing to step ahead of us, your Triune God. The seas will rise, the earth will rock and 
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tremble and mankind will be plagued with war, disease and famine. You will see the 
coming of the one who will claim he is Me and My people will be grazed and numbered by 
the authorities who work for this false messiah, this antichrist. 

Stay awake, My child, and keep your focus on Me for I am Jesus the light of the world. I 
will protect you and My faithful with My heavenly graces. It is by the fire of My love that I 
yearn for all My children to turn away from the world and come live in My light. 

My child, go forth and do as I have asked for I am Jesus who was and is and is to come 
for many of My chosen instruments are relaying My words of warning all around this world 
to prepare mankind for the awakening that is about to be bestowed upon all of humanity. 
Now be at peace, My child, for it is My mercy and justice that will prevail. 

 
3/27/05 
9:00 PM (Easter Sunday) 
 
My people, My peace be with you for I am Jesus. On this day of My resurrection take heed 
to how it was only through My suffering that I triumphed over sin and death in order for you 
to gain eternal life. My people, live the Commandments and live the Gospel message. It is 
because of your sins that I came into this world and suffered My agony in the garden, My 
crowning of thorns, My scourging at the pillar and My crucifixion. 

My people, My words come out of love just as My crucifixion was done out of My 
unending, unconditional love. This time that I have given you is about to expire just as My 
time on earth had expired. I was sent by My Father to fulfill a mission and My mission was 
complete through My Passion, Death and Resurrection. Live each day by carrying your 
cross prepared for crucifixion. I am Jesus reaching out not as your just judge but as your 
merciful savior. 

I am shepherding you in love to warn you that you must turn away from the world and live 
the mission you have been called to do. This is the hour to respond for your time of 
slumber will no longer be. You have continued to turn away from your Creator. You have 
continued to step ahead of Us, your Triune God. The bells of My churches will soon be 
silenced and the division will multiply leading up to the coming of the antichrist. You will 
see the coming of a war that will have nations rising up against one another. 

My people, I have warned you that it is because of the war in the womb that My Father's 
just hand is about to strike. Today I ask that you come live in My light. Today I ask that you 
come to the Sacraments and cleanse your soul and walk the road to Calvary. My hand is 
here to guide you. Now go forth and do as I have asked for I am Jesus, the light of the 
world that will soon shine My light into the souls of mankind for it is My mercy and justice 
that will prevail. 
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3/30/05 
8:55 PM 
 
My people, today I ask for you to pray. Pray for those who are not prepared to meet Me for 
many will soon be called to their judgment. My people, pray for many vessels that have 
been sleeping will soon be awakened. My people, pray for the seas are no longer calm 
and this earth has begun to awaken. The roar of the lion is on the prowl searching for as 
many souls as he can as he wages his final lap. 

My people, again I say to you, the just hand of My Father is about to strike awakening 
mankind. It is those that are in silence that this war is being waged upon. Days of 
darkness are soon to cover this earth for mankind will soon be simplified. My 
Commandments are being destroyed for mankind believes that he is the dictator of his 
own destination. 

My people, your continuation of stepping ahead of your Creator is why I have come to 
warn you that this world will soon be purified of its filth. When you reject life through 
abortion, through contraception, you are breaking My Commandment. When you are 
engaging together outside of the union of marriage, you are breaking My Commandment. 
When you place the world ahead of your Creator with money and power, you are breaking 
My Commandments. When you speak falsely of another and place judgments on them, 
you are breaking My Commandments. 

My people, arise from your slumber for a new day is upon you and your ways will be 
simplified. You are given a free will to live your mission or to live for the world and lose 
your soul. My people, take heed to the signs for My Church has spoken that you are to 
respect life at any stage. You have been warned and those who do not defend life will see 
their day of judgment. 

My people, it is I, Jesus, who has come to warn you that a chastisement is about to prevail 
upon a nation that has allowed evil to persevere. This nation that has been blessed with 
so many fruits yet has become a selfish nation who only seeks to be the dictator to the 
world. My people, My words of warning are soon to expire. This war that is being waged in 
the womb will come to an end for I will come in radiant splendor and claim My faithful 
children. Your time of warning is near, your time of warning is near. Prepare, prepare, 
prepare for I am Jesus who comes out of My unending, unconditional love. Now go forth 
and take heed to the state of your soul for it is My mercy and justice that will prevail. 

3/31/05  
11:15 AM (Message from God the Father) 
 
My people, you will soon be brought to your knees. You remain disobedient children that 
seek to turn against your Father. My just hand is about to strike upon humanity to awaken 
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your soul to know that I am. I am the Lord your God who will not allow you to continue to 
step ahead of Me. I have sent My Son to warn you that your time of preparation is about to 
expire. You have diminished My Commandments and have given in to a world that is not 
the final judge. 

Your mission on earth is to be a servant who seeks to fulfill the will of your Father. Behold 
the signs for they will multiply. My just hand will raise the seas and awaken this earth for 
you will come to know that I am your Heavenly Father. You will come to know that you 
have destroyed My creation, My plan. You will come to know that no one comes to Me 
except through My Son and His wounds are bleeding profusely. When you deny the 
teachings and laws of My Church you deny Me. The days of justice are about to prevail 
upon humanity. Your time of simplification is near. Turn away from the world and live the 
mission I have sent you to do. Now go forth and be at peace for it is only through My Son 
that mercy and justice will prevail for I am your Heavenly Father who will live and reign 
forever and ever. 

3/31/05 
2:45 PM 
 
My people, when you live in a world where it seems that evil is persevering, take heed to 
My words that evil does not persevere when it comes to one's day of judgment for I am 
Jesus. My people, you do not know the day or hour when you will stand before Me. When 
the life of the innocent is taken away, know that the one who steps ahead of Me will stand 
before Me. Know that there is a judgment day. I come today not as your just judge but as 
your merciful Savior to ask that you turn away from the world. 

Today I ask that you take heed to the state of your soul. Are your ways reflecting My 
ways? Are you imitating your creator? The truth is in the Commandments and the Gospel 
message. The truth is not in the world for the only truth in the world is that it misguides you 
and misleads you down a path to eternal fire. It is I, Jesus, who has come to warn you that 
unless you follow Me, you will not gain eternal life in My Kingdom. It is I, Jesus, who has 
come to warn you that there is a hell. 

My people, this path to hell is ever widening. You cannot journey the road to heaven 
unless you journey the road to Calvary. There is a time to defend the truth and speak 
words and a time to be in silence and offer prayers to your Heavenly Father. This is a time 
when all are called to strive in holiness for you are seeing true division between heaven 
and hell, light and darkness. You are seeing those who walk in My light and those who are 
blinded by the darkness of the world. 

My love is unending, unconditional for it was poured out upon mankind through My 
Passion, Death and Resurrection. Come live in My light and go out and be My witness in 
the world by love and example and a willingness to speak the truth. Behold these words 
that I give you for days of change are about to prevail upon mankind for again, I say to 
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you, take heed to the state of your soul for I am Jesus and My mercy and justice will 
prevail. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


