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9/2/04  
9:45 PM 
  
My chosen sons, now is the hour to bring your flocks in front of My Most Blessed 
Sacrament. Now is the time to guide them to Me by your witnessing and 
example. My sons, so many of you have become lazy in guiding your flocks. 
You do not become a worthy disciple by diminishing My message and turning 
away from the true teachings of My Church. 
  
My sons, if you are not following the guidance of the Pope completely, then you 
are not a follower of Me for I am Jesus.  Listen and take heed for the Pope will 
soon see the light of My Kingdom and you will need to begin relying on what you 
have been directed to do now. You must use reverence at Mass for I am there in 
true presence, Body, Blood, Soul and Divinity. 
  
Teach My people that they must dress modestly and show reverence in My 
House for My House is not a sanctuary of conversation, but a House of silence 
and prayer. My House is a place where My faithful are to focus on Me in order 
for their prayers to be heard. Guide your flocks, My sons, by the truth and speak 
to them in love for you do not realize how so many are not prepared to meet Me. 
Now go forth and do as I have asked and be at peace for I am Jesus who was 
and is and is to come. 

9/6/04  
7:00 PM 

My people, do you see the signs? For some they appear to be small and yet, in 
time, you will see that My Father's wrath has slowly begun to awaken mankind. 
You will hear a voice in the distance that will wail like a woman in labor for, as I 
have told you, the earth will respond according to the depth of man's sins. 

My people, it is time to awaken from your sinful slumber for you have become 
lazy and selfish and choose to fulfill your own selfish desires instead of serving 
the will of your Heavenly Father. You are not spared of the evil around you for it 
is there and is multiplying for it is a battle for your soul.  

My people, it is only by your willingness to pick up your cross that you will gain 
the rewards of My Kingdom. It is only through suffering that you witness the 
fruits of My love. So many do not accept suffering with joy, yet it was through My 
Passion, Death and Resurrection that you realize the joy I had knowing that 
through My suffering you would one day be with Me in Paradise.  

You have seen these storms and yet this is just the beginning for many 
mountains that have been sleeping will soon be awakened. You will feel a great 
shifting of the earth representing the true dividing line between heaven and hell, 
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the division of man. You will see the sign appear out of the East with a great 
light shining into the souls of mankind awakening them for this world to begin a 
great purification. 

My people, you are in a period that has been foretold through the Scriptures and 
is about to unfold. You are in a time that many all around this world have been 
responding to My call of making these messages known to the world of the 
urgency to repent. I have sent My Mother, yet only few respond and just as My 
Father has sent Me before I am coming with My words of warning. 

My people, your days are numbered and the world is soon to witness the Heart 
of My Mother triumph. The world is soon to see the sins that pierce My Most 
Sacred Heart. Pray and repent for it is only those who walk in My light that will 
be saved. Now go forth for I am Jesus and be at peace for My mercy and justice 
will prevail.  

9/9/04  
2:00 PM 

My people, today begin a deeper time in prayer. Today I am asking for you to 
open your eyes and hearts to My plan to fulfill your mission in the world. Come 
to Me, come to Me for in times of doubt and confusion I shall be your guide, your 
strength. You are in times that many things feel uncertain and many more 
changes are on the horizon. Do not relish in your worldly things, rather relish in 
My Most Sacred Heart. Abandon your troubles of this world and come follow Me 

My people, as I have told you, many changes are on the horizon for this world is 
soon to face a great chastisement for the number of My innocent ones being 
killed through abortion. My Commandments are broken and mankind feels that 
he only answers to himself. You are not your master for it is I, Jesus, who 
created you and have sent you here on a mission.  

You must go out and be My light in the world. The truth must be spoken in love 
in order to draw souls closer to Me. You must begin with yourself in order for 
people to see My light shining through you and My light is soon to shine into the 
souls of mankind. I have come to warn you, yet so many ignore My pleas. 

You are in a world that needs to become simplified in order for you to realize 
that you are not your own. You live in a world that is soon to face a battle from 
every direction and out of the East you will see the sign. In the dead of winter 
remain more prayerful for your survival.  Remain focused on your mission and 
take heed to the signs for the just Hand of My Father will continue to come down 
on a world that has so willingly turned against its Creator. 

My people, you will face many false prophets that will come and claim they are 
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sent by Me so it is important for you to remain vigilant in prayer. My people, if 
you remain blind to the Gospel message and diminish your time in prayer you 
will become like the foolish man that is caught off guard. 

Satan seeks your soul and he sends his many evil spirits to try and trap you 
through doubt and confusion. He comes as innocent and gentle as a lamb and 
feeds you until he knows you are weak and will fall. He tempts you with false 
promises that keep you from Heaven and guides you to hell.  

You are only given one life, one soul, and if you have a pure heart that seeks the 
Kingdom of Heaven then you will find favor with your Heavenly Father. If you live 
for the world then relish in it and lose your soul for you are not My disciple 

Do not fear My words for all that has been foretold in the Scriptures is about to 
unfold. Your time is coming closer. Now go forth and live the Commandments, 
repent and live the Gospel message for your time of judgment is near. Now go 
forth for I am Jesus and be at peace for My mercy and justice will prevail.  

9/12/04  
3:40 PM  

My people, so many spend their time building your temples of financial 
treasures, yet how many spend time building your souls for the Kingdom of 
Heaven. If you spend your time building your treasures of this life then you have 
wasted your opportunity of spending eternal life in My Kingdom. Your treasures 
belong to the world, but your soul belongs to Me. 

My people, so many of you waste your opportunity of coming to the Sacraments 
and do not realize the filth that has taken over your soul. I do not come with 
words to cause you to fear for fear does not come from Me. I have come to warn 
you that you may hide your sins from a judging world, but your eternal judgment 
comes from Me. You may believe that the world's judgment is a suffering, but it 
is a false suffering that does not compare to the suffering your soul has from 
being separated from Me. 

This is your hour of opportunity to repent for when your hour of judgment comes 
there is no turning back for you have now come to the moment that has been 
prepared from the moment you were created. 

Again, I say to you, take heed to the signs, take heed to the Gospel message for 
your days are numbered. Now go forth for I am Jesus and be at peace for My 
mercy and justice will prevail.  
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9/15/04  
1:00 PM 

My people, open your eyes, open your eyes for you are not living in peaceful 
times. You will feel, in a shortened period of time, a great shifting in the earth 
that will bring much chaos and destruction. You will see, in a shortened period of 
time, just how gravely your sins have pierced My Most Sacred Heart. 

My people, you will see, in a shortened period of time, just how loving and 
merciful I truly am. This is not the hour to be sleeping for the signs are being 
given in order for you to repent and live your life more pleasing to Me. This is the 
hour to begin to walk toward My light and not away because eternal darkness is 
forever.  

Your storms will continue to move forward and what lies behind these storms for 
mankind will awaken My people, with great warning. You are not your own and 
in order for you to fulfill the mission you have been sent to do you must be open 
to My plan and deny your selfish desires. You must begin to live the Gospel 
message by living the Commandments and not break them by your own selfish 
ways. 

My people, the more you are walking in My light the more division you will see of 
how darkness has become personified and the way of the cross has been 
diminished. You see those who live for the world and die with an empty soul and 
those who live for their heavenly Father and die with their soul prepared to meet 
Me. Days are growing shorter so again I say to you take heed! Take heed to the 
state of your soul for you do not know the day or hour. Now go forth for I am 
Jesus and be at peace for just as the winds begin to change so are the days of 
the awakening of mankind.  

9/16/04  
8:49 PM 

My people, prepare for battle for as I have spoken to you before that this is the 
hour of preparation. You will hear the roar of the lion in fury preparing for his 
final round of battle before the heart of My Mother triumphs, crushing the head 
of the serpent. I have come to warn you that your days are numbered and as the 
final battle comes forth you need to decide if you are on the side of darkness or 
the side of light. 

This is not a time to believe that your signs will begin to diminish for I have sent 
these times to divide those who are  walking in My light and those who are not. 
These signs are coming to a world that has continued to try and step ahead of 
Me. I hear the cries of My unborn who are killed at the hands of Satan for 
anyone who kills My unborn is on the path of eternal darkness. Those who kill 
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My unborn will see each and every soul that they did not permit to fulfill their 
mission in the world. 

My people, take heed to the state of your soul for so many of you do not realize 
the path that you are headed down. So many of you feel that your sins may be 
small yet you do not realize how in My eyes the smallest sins pierce My Most 
Sacred Heart. Do not allow anger and hatred to overcome your heart, but rather 
stand for the truth and be at peace for all will be held accountable for their 
actions. 

My people, go forth, go forth today and prepare the state of your soul for you do 
not realize the awakening you will endure. Pray!  Pray for the state of the world 
for so many souls are falling into the fires of hell. Wake up dear children and 
come and walk out of the darkness into My light for each day you are given an 
opportunity. Now go forth for I am Jesus and be at peace for My light will soon 
shine into a world covered in darkness.  

9/19/04  
4:15 PM  

My people, it is only through sin that Satan traps your soul.  It is only by your 
unwillingness to cleanse your soul and take heed to the filth that has overcome it 
that separates you from Me. 

My people, each time you sin you are separating yourself from Me. Each time 
you sin My light inside of you becomes dimmer.  

My people, as I have told you, now is the hour to take heed to the state of your 
soul.  This is the hour for the awakening of the earth for it will respond according 
to the depth of man's sins and your sins are many.  Wake up dear children for 
these events that you are witnessing with your storms and earthquakes have 
slowly begun and if man does not respond to My pleas a far greater awakening 
will soon follow. 

Prepare today for My words will not come much longer.  Now go forth, go forth 
and live the Commandments, live the Gospel message and cleanse your soul 
for I am Jesus who was and is and is to come.  

9/20/04  
9:15 PM 
 
My people, come live in My Light. Go forth and be My disciples in the world for 
some are chosen to write My words, yet all are chosen to relay them by your 
witnessing and example. If you are trying to live your faith then be at peace and 
know that I see the pure intentions in your heart. 
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My people, a great chastisement is soon to fall upon this earth. A great 
awakening is soon to come to this country that I have blessed with many fruits, 
yet continues to deny the right for life to come forth. You speak that you are a 
nation that is under God. 
  
My people, which false God do you worship for it is I, Jesus, who will soon 
witness My Father's wrath awaken this nation that denies My Commandments.  
This nation that speaks of us, your Triune God, yet you continue to pierce Me by 
your offenses to the life in which I have created. In times of suffering you speak 
of prayer, yet so few are down on their knees as the repentant sinner. 
  
My people, I am not blind to your sinful ways for that is why I come to you with 
My words of warning.  My churches are empty, My tabernacles are empty and 
My chosen sons are divided.  Do you not see how the ways of the world have 
consumed your soul? Wake up dear children for the Kingdom of Heaven awaits 
your coming, yet your souls are not worthy. 
 
I do not come because I am accepting of your selfish and sinful ways, I am 
coming to awaken a world that continues to try and step ahead of Me by trying 
to be the dictator of your own destination. 
  
Again I say to you, I Am the Alpha, the Omega, the First, the Last, the Beginning 
and the End and you are not your final judge for unless you can move 
mountains and raise the seas you will have to answer to your Heavenly Father.  
Listen to My words and take heed to them for it is I, Jesus, your loving and 
merciful Savior that comes to bring you back. 
  
I come to ask for you to magnify the light that I have created in you to a world 
covered in darkness. Do not hide the truth rather be My witness in the world for 
your reward will be great in My Kingdom. Now go forth for your days of 
preparation are numbered. Be at peace for I am Jesus who comes out of My 
infinite love for you. 

9/22/04  
1:30 PM 

My people, you have been waged in a battle and it will only intensify. You have 
been waged in a battle that is in the final round to define those who choose 
darkness and those who choose My light. My people, do not stand by and allow 
sin to overcome the truth, rather speak the truth to overcome sin 

My people, this time you are in is going to call all to examine the state of their 
soul. If you choose a leader that does not defend life and speaks as though he is 
a follower of Me, then you have been misguided, misled. If your leader is in the 
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darkness then he will only guide you into the darkness.  

My people, you cannot have two masters and your focus needs to remain true to 
the cross. Your focus needs to remain on living the Commandments, living the 
Gospel message. If you are relishing in the comforts of freedom and money, do 
not be fooled for in days to come your lives will become simplified. Your time of 
being selfish and lazy will soon come to a halt.  

You see this war that is going on and yet this is small than that of what is to 
come.  You will see the fall of a great leader and nations will rise up against one 
another and the true and final battle of the lion will claim his last souls before the 
Heart of My Mother triumphs, crushing the head of the serpent. 

My people, you see the dividing line between land and sea and yet heaven and 
hell are much the same way. You can spend your lifetime drifting across the sea 
never meeting your true destination, yet you are given an opportunity on land to 
climb the mountains and live the mission you were sent to do until at last you 
reach the kingdom of heaven.  

Do not spend your time drifting in the sea for if you are caught off guard you may 
be swallowed by the serpent, rather remain focused on the cross and place it at 
the top of the mountain for I promise you will find reward in the kingdom. Do not 
waste this time for time is at hand. Now go forth for I am Jesus and be at peace 
for My mercy and justice will prevail.  

9/22/04  
4:30 PM 

My people, life is not to be rejected for each and every human being is to be 
permitted to fulfill the mission they were created to do. You are not to reject life 
because of blindness or disease or by your own selfish desires. 

My people, it is because of the fall of man that sin comes forth. The child is not 
the sin and although it may not be conceived in love, it was created in love by 
Me. You are not saving your soul by abortion for abortion is the greatest sin and 
the world will soon pay the price for each soul rejected through abortion. 

My people, as I have told you, each and every human being will be held 
accountable for their actions. If you are choosing darkness then you will be in 
eternal darkness. If you choose to be fooled by the false promises of the world, 
then you are only denying your soul the light of My Kingdom. If you choose to 
commit adultery and try and repent of your sin with abortion, then the fires of hell 
is yours for you do not repent of sin with sin. 

Wake up dear children for the path you are headed down is not one of eternal 
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light. Do not make light of My words rather take heed and live them. Live the 
Gospel message by living the Commandments. Each and every day is to be 
lived coming closer to the kingdom by striving in holiness. Do not believe that I 
am blind to your sins for it is those of you who are unwilling to repent that are 
blind to your own sinfulness. 

My people, you cannot fool your Master for it is I, Jesus, who sees the pure 
intentions in your heart. Today I ask for you to awaken and walk toward My light 
for in time darker days are coming. Now go forth and be at peace for it is I, 
Jesus, who comes out of My infinite love and will shine My light into a world 
covered in darkness.  

9/23/04  
6:50 PM 

My child, go and write down this message I give to you and share it with the 
world for so many eyes will be opened, and share this prayer I give you with My 
people.  

My child, thank you for accepting your suffering. It is only through suffering that 
you understand the depth of My love. It is only through your willingness to pick 
up your cross that My will for you can unfold.  

My child, you see how so many in purgatory suffer because they are separated 
from Me. You see how the soul is created to have Me at the center and when I 
am not present the heart of the soul is diminished. My child, it is only through My 
passion, My suffering that the depth of My love was poured out upon mankind. I 
see all that is in your heart and the hearts of My people, yet your heart must 
yearn to come to Me in order for My graces to be poured out upon you. 

  
My child, you must deny your will and be open to Mine for the greatest fall of 
mankind is pride of the heart. The greatest fall of mankind is believing that he 
can manifest himself without Me, for again I say to you, the core of the human 
soul is diminished when I am not present. Today My child, begin to call upon My 
Most Sacred Heart. Begin to allow Me to surround you with all the graces 
needed to continue to move forward. The battle is raging on so continue to trust 
in Me for it is only through Me that you will find your strength. 

My child, say these words daily so that you may be given the strength. Now go 
forth for I am Jesus and My peace be with you My child.  

 
 " May the precious blood of Jesus cover me and may my heart be joined with 
yours oh Lord. May I accept my suffering and walk the road to Calvary. Allow 
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your voice to carry me and your gentle hand to guide me. Allow me to take 
comfort in the most Sacred Heart of your Son Jesus and protect me through this 
mission as your child. Amen "  

9/23/04  
8:40 PM 

My people, if you could only see the suffering in your Mother's heart. If you only 
would take heed to My words instead of the ways of the world. My wounds are 
bleeding profusely because of your grave sins. My wounds bleed, yet My Most 
Sacred Heart yearns to gather My lost sheep. I have come, dear children, do 
you hear My voice for My voice echoes each time the winds blow and the earth 
begins to rock and tremble. 

Each time the waters overcome the lands I am calling for you to turn back and 
take heed. Each time new life comes forth you see My gentle hand guiding that 
soul into this world. Each time a soul prepares to leave this world I am there to 
greet you, to face your hour of judgment. I am not far off in the heavens blind to 
your sinful ways, rather I am pleading with you, My people, to wake up and 
prepare you for the light that is soon to come and awaken your soul. I am 
coming to bring justice to an unjust world.  

Each time you hear the thunder, the roar of the lion is magnified claiming 
another soul. Do not become his victim by falling into the ways of the world, 
rather take comfort in My Most Sacred Heart. This is the hour to awaken for your 
time is at hand. Now go forth for I am Jesus who was and is and is to come.  

9/27/04  
7:50 PM 

My people, not one human being on the face of the earth is spared from My 
judgment. Not one soul can pass by Me to move on to your eternal destination. 
You are all called to strive in holiness. You are called to walk in My light and be 
My witness in the world.  

My people, so many of you only answer to yourselves that you do not believe 
you will be held accountable for your actions. You believe that the world's ways 
are My ways, but, My people, My ways are the Commandments and if you are 
engaging together outside of marriage you are in grave sin for the engaging of 
man and woman is reserved for the union of marriage in order for life to come 
forth. When you begin taking things out of order is how man falls into sin for 
everything has an order and it is given through the Commandments and 
reiterated through the Gospel message.  

My people, when you try and step ahead of Me is how you lose your soul to the 
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devil for he is there and ready to tempt you for this is why I have told you to keep 
your focus on Me for without Me you have nothing but false promises. You are 
only given one life, one soul and if you are not living My ways you are not 
fulfilling the mission you have been called to do. If you are welcoming the 
temptations of evil in by the ways of the world, you are only leading yourself 
down the path of eternal darkness. 

Come to Me, dear children, for again, I say to you, you cannot hide your 
sinfulness from your Master. I am the way, the truth and the life and unless you 
seek darkness you must follow Me in order to live in the light of My kingdom. 
Now go forth for the hour is at hand and be at peace for I am Jesus and My 
mercy and justice will prevail.  

9/29/04  
9:20 PM 

My people, so many have begun to keep a watchful eye to the sight of many 
earthquakes, yet you do not realize that the great shifting of the earth will come 
from a place that has been sleeping. This earthquake will cause much chaos 
and destruction and it will come and catch so many off guard for that is why I 
have told you to take heed to the signs. Your winter will rise with great force and 
for some it will present times of hardship. 

My people, you must come to Me and trust in My will for it is only through Me 
that you will find your strength. Be open to My plan and surrender everything to 
Me. My people, you are truly living in uncertain times and, although you may not 
be witnessing times of hardship, do not believe that you are spared for the times 
of great battle are soon upon you.  

If you are living in times of calmness and your sufferings are few then give 
thanks to your Father in heaven for you should be taking heed to this time that 
you have been given to prepare by coming to the Sacraments. 

My people, you have been waged in a battle and you will not rest from this battle 
until you are called to your eternal judgment. The battle for your soul is on and it 
is only intensifying daily. The devil does not rest until he has you in his trap and 
he seeks out My most faithful servants. 

He seeks out those who continue to strive to walk in My light. Do not be fooled 
by his temptations for darker days are soon to fall upon this world. Go forth, My 
people, and do as I have asked for this world is soon to be brought to its knees. 
Now go forth for I am Jesus and be at peace for My mercy and justice will 
prevail.  
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9/30/04  
7:05 PM 
  
My people, I have oceans of love for you for it is unending, unconditional. Be 
humble loving servants that strive to please your heavenly Father. This is a 
battle, a battle for the lives of My unborn. You speak of men being killed in war 
and will stand and protest an end to war yet you do not protest an end to 
abortion. The number of men being killed through war, disease, and famine 
does not exceed the number of My little ones being killed through abortion. 
  
My people, you need to redefine your morals for you lack them. You lack the 
willingness to take heed to My words, but are open to a world that will direct you 
to hell. You seek ways to find peace yet you will not find peace if you continue to 
try and step ahead of Me. 
  
My people, much of mankind is lost in the darkness because the darkness does 
not contain Me. I am the Way, the Truth and the Life and it was only through My 
Passion, Death and Resurrection that you have eternal life. You cannot seek the 
light of truth if you are living in the darkness of sin.  
  
My people, it is only through cleansing your soul that I can magnify My light off 
of you. Each time you sin the light of My love becomes dimmer and each time 
your soul is in grave sin there is no light at all for you are separated from Me. If 
your soul is in the darkness then you will not receive all the graces and strength 
needed to truly fulfill the mission you were sent to do. 
 
Now is the moment, dear children, for your hour has come and this world will be 
simplified greatly. This world will be awakened by My light and the world will 
soon know those who choose to serve their Master and those who walk down 
the path to eternal fire. Now go forth for the time is at hand and be at peace for I 
am Jesus and My mercy and justice will prevail.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


