
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

803.798.4466 

info@datacomcolumbia.com 

www.datacomcolumbia.com 

RFID Printers 

ZT600 Series 

STRONG, SMART AND SCALABLE 
RFID ENCODING 

ZT600 Series printers combine industrial 
durability and user-friendly features with 
future-proof adaptability — including a 
factory- or field-installable RFID encoder 
— to meet your evolving needs for years 
to come. 

 
On Demand Metal Asset Tagging 

THE COMPLETE SOLUTION 

A specially designed ZT410 RFID printer 
and Silverline tags allow companies to 
realize the benefits of RFID tracking on 
much broader group of items including 
metal and liquid filled containers. 

 

ZT600 Series 

HIGH-VOLUME ENCODER AND 
PRINTER 

This high-performance RFID encoder and 
printer delivers superior flexibility, high 
print speeds and high media roll capacity 
for more productivity. 

mailto:info@datacomcolumbia.com


  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

  

 

 

ZT400 Series 

RICH IN FEATURES, CONNECTIVITY 
OPTIONS 

The ZT400 Series RFID printer/encoders 
offer advanced features for reliable 
printing and encoding, even in tough 
environments. Gain a competitive edge 
with greater tracking abilities, deeper 
visibility and enterprise insights. 

ZD500R Series 

SMALL SHELL PACKED WITH 
FEATURES 

Bring UHF RFID printing to your desktop. 
This small, easy-to-use printer delivers 
advanced features in a compact footprint 
for convenient, simple operation. 

 

ZE500R Series 

PERFORMANCE LEADER 

Zebra's enhanced RFID-ready OEM print 
engines are ideal for high-volume 
industrial applications for manufacturing, 
shipping, receiving and more. 

 

High-Performance Card Printers 

PHOTO-QUALITY PRINTING 

The ZXP Series 7 has superb photo-
quality card printing in medium- to high-
volume applications. The ZXP Series 7 
delivers fast yet reliable performance 
while offering users exceptional value by 
lowering the printer's total cost of 
ownership. Time after time, it prints sharp 
vivid cards with precise color control. 


