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Richard Kays 

Producer/Presenter Dre,in,s for Living TV 

I J I DREAMS for llJIWllOO@

Q1 Hi Ric'.hard thank you so much for taking
time out to answer some questions for me. Firstly 
how did you come to know Jesus as your Lord & 
Saviour? 

A Well I was 14 years old whenever I became a 
Chris6an. I was heavily involved in football. I was 
extremely committed like getting up at 5am in the 
morning, and I was talented at this, so mvch so I was 
scouted by Arsenal Football Academy. I was picked 
out of several youngsters to go to the next level, I 
believed in a God but I didnY have a personal 
relationship with him. / lived in London and we always, 
as a family, went to the Notting H,11 Carnival. This 
particular year my older brother decided to meet us 
there and he would contact us whenever he got there, 
however, we heard nothing the en�re day from my 
brother. 

Anyhow, the next day I decided to have a nap and my 
brother walked in to my room. I said 'how was the 
carnival?' He replied that he hadn't gone to the 
camival, he staled he had gone to our aunrs house 
instead he said as he was on the way there he heard 
an audible voice speak to him to go lo our aunt's house. 
He ignored 11, then he heard ii again and ignored ii 
again, and finally he heard it a third time, by this time it 
was too tale to go to the carnival so he decided lo go lo 
our aunrs house, and obeyed the voice. When he got 
there a lady was preaching the gospel message of 
Jesvs. My brother really ten God's calling and gave his 
life to Jesus there and then. Now while my brother was 
relating this all lo me I suddenly became ve,y jealous 
and I asked God the question: 'How come you are 
calling him and not me?' 

I told my brother this and he immediately replied 'I think 
God is calling you too·. Around two weeks later the 
lady was preaching in our auntie's house again a'1d this 
lime I went along with my 4 brothers and sisters. We 
were all so committed by the message that all of us 
!!}ave our lives to Christ at the ve,y same moment! 
Right from that moment I was on fire for God, I had this 
amazing heal come all over my chest, and for some ii 
;;an be a slower process but I had a zeal and hunger. 
Various pastors began prophesying all over the world 
about my life, my love for Christ increased, and then I 
had to make a big choice between my career and God. 
I really believed that God had called me for the ministry 
so I surrendered my love of football and the prospects 
of a glittering career for God. I slarled heading home 
!!Jroups at 14 years old and I gave my first se1111on at 18 

years, I completed a Bible College Degree in Theology 
and travelled lo 10 different countries spreading the 
Word. 

UCB 
Richard Kays Dreams for I.Nine Show goes frve on UCB 

on Sunday 6th June 2010. Richard will be a regul.ir 
ero1d<.Htt:r for tht popullr Christin Chlnnt:I 

Q2 How did you come up with the idea for 
Dreams for Living TV? 

A I had a real passion for the minisl,y and for 
preaching. However, for some reason I always had 
friends who were ve,y influential figures. Then at 19 
yea,s I had a vision where I saw myself in a studio 
interviewing a new breed of people who live for God. 
These people were not bound by circumstances, and in 
the vision I was not just the presenter but the director 
as well! Now a ve,y good friend of mine, Carl used to 
have what we would call our 'dream talk' �me , we would 
jot down profiles of guests, put loge/her a team - ii was 
a crazy kinda faith going on! So I had this vision but no 
finances to forward ii, then I shared my vision with the 
Director of Revelation TV, and he said he would do a 
deal with me and if I could raise a cerlain amount of 
money they would go ahead with the show - I said 
'Yes!' trust me this was in faith. So I had to find this 
money, ii wasn 't a lo/ for broadcast media but ii was a 
huge amount for me. Then a shorl while later I was out 
in the car with one of my friends and out of the b.lue he 
asked me about my 'dream show', I told him the current 
s�uation and then he replied '/'II cover it!' I couldn't 
believe it Dreams for Living TV was born/ 
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