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Stage 1 

 
10 Pistol, 10 Rifle and 3 Shotgun 

 
Pistol(s) loaded with 5 rounds and holstered. Rifle loaded with 10 rounds is staged on the middle 
table, shotgun is staged on the right table. 
 
Bonney had been advised by Josey that Joe Grant, a newcomer in Lincoln, intended to kill him. 
Billy walked up to Grant, told him he admired his revolver, and asked to examine it. Grant 
complied. Before handing the pistol holding only three shells back to Grant, Bonney positioned 
the cylinder so the next shot would fire on an empty chamber. Again in possession of his 
weapon, Grant stuck the pistol in Bonney's face and pulled the trigger. After the revolver failed 
to fire, Bonney drew his own pistol, shooting Grant in the head. 
 
Start at the left table with hands in the surrender position. When ready say “IT WAS A GAME 
OF TWO AND I GOT THERE FIRST!”   At the buzzer, with your pistol(s), shoot the targets in 
the following order: 2 on 1, 1 on 2 and 2 on 3 and repeat.  Move to the middle table and with 
your rifle, shoot the targets in the same order as the pistol(s).  Make the rifle safe and move to the 
right table. With your shotgun, knockdown the 3 targets. 
 
 
 

Stage 2 
 

10 Pistol, 10 Rifle and 3 Shotgun 
 

Pistol(s) loaded with 5 rounds and holstered. Rifle loaded with 10 rounds is staged on the middle 
table, shotgun is staged on the right table. 
 
Bonney formed a friendship in 1880 with rancher Jim Greathouse, who later introduced him to 
Dave Rudabaugh. On November 29, 1880, Bonney, Wales, Rudabaugh and Billy Wilson ran 
from a posse led by sheriff's deputy James Carlyle. Cornered at Greathouse's ranch, Bonney let 



the posse know they were holding Greathouse as a hostage. Carlyle offered to exchange places 
with Greathouse, and Bonney took him up on the offer. Carlyle later attempted to escape by 
jumping through a window.  
 
Start at the left table with hands on pistols. When ready say “HE’S TRYING TO ESCAPE!”   At 
the buzzer, with your pistol(s), shoot the targets in the following order: 4 on 1, 1 on 2, 4 on 3 and 
1 on 2.  Move to the center table and with your rifle, shoot the targets in the same order as the 
pistol(s).  Make the rifle safe and move to the right table. With your shotgun, knockdown the 
targets from right to left. 
 
 

Stage 3 
 

10 Pistol, 10 Rifle and 3 Shotgun 
 

Pistol(s) loaded with 5 rounds and holstered. Rifle loaded with 10 rounds is staged on the middle 
table, shotgun is staged on the right table. 
 
A few weeks after the Greathouse incident, Bonney, Wales, Rudabaugh, Wilson, Charlie Bowdre, 
Tom Pickett, and O'Folliard rode into Fort Sumner. Unknown to Bonney and the group, a posse 
led by Pat Garrett was waiting for them at the fort. As they approached, the posse opened fire, 
killing O'Folliard. Bonney and the rest escaped unharmed. 
 
Start in the left table with hands on the table. When ready say “LET’S GIT!”   At the buzzer, 
with your pistols(s), shoot the targets in the following order: 3 on 1, 2 on 2, 3 on 3 and 2 on 2.  
Make the pistol(s) safe and move to the middle table and with your rifle, shoot the targets in the 
same order as the pistol(s). Make the rifle safe and move to the right table.  With your shotgun, 
knockdown the targets outside, outside, middle. 
 

Stage 4 
 

10 Pistol, 10 Rifle and 3 Shotgun 
 

Pistol(s) loaded with 5 rounds and holstered. Rifle loaded with 10 rounds is staged on the middle 
table, shotgun is staged on the right table. 
  
There is a story that Billy the Kid met Jesse James in a restaurant in Las Vegas, NM.  But 
imagine there was a third man at that meeting, Josey Wales.  Josey tried to convince Billy to 
carry more than 1 revolver.  Billy said he would consider it as he could not always get to his 
Winchester when needed.  As Josey and Billy left the restaurant, they were confronted by 2 
bounty hunters standing on the street.  
 
Start at the left table with both hands at your sides. When ready say “SHOW ME HOW IT’S 
DONE JOSEY!”   At the buzzer, with your pistol(s), double tap the targets.  Move to the middle 
table and with your rifle, double tap the targets. Make the rifle safe and move to the right table. 
With your shotgun, knockdown the 3 targets. 



 
Stage 5 

 
10 Pistol, 10 Rifle and 3 Shotgun 

 
Pistol(s) loaded with 5 rounds and holstered. Rifle loaded with 10 rounds is staged on the middle 
table, shotgun is staged on the right table. 
 
On February 18, 1879, Bonney and friend Tom O'Folliard were in Lincoln when attorney Huston 
Chapman was shot and his corpse set on fire while Bonney and O'Folliard watched. According to 
eyewitnesses, the pair were innocent bystanders forced at gunpoint by Jesse Evans to witness the 
murder.  Josey happened upon the scene a few minutes later. 
 
Start at the right table with shotgun pointing down range. When ready say “GIT HIM JOSEY!”   
At the buzzer, with your shotgun, knockdown the 3 shotgun targets starting on the left target.  
Make the shotgun safe and move to the center table and with your rifle, shoot the targets in the 
following order: 1, 2, 3, 2, 1, 3, 2, 1, 2, 3. Make the rifle safe and move to the left table. Shoot 
the targets in the same order as the rifle. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 


