BRANDON DUBOIS 4 - MARK BALL
District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana G:(g’;t I;?rts’ol Ir;?hcea :gf:;y District 5, Bentley, Louisiana
ain otreet - Lourinouse b
OHNNF JAMISON Colfax, Louisiana 71417 VARSTON AOBERTS
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana Telephone: 318-627-3157 District 6, Poffock, Louisians
CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527 _ MIKE MERRELL
District 8, Colfax, Louisiana R District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana
ARNOLD MURRELL ROY EDWARDS

District 4, Colfax, {.ouisiana Distvict 8, Georgetowr, Loulsiana

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on the following fuel & oil for the calendar
year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending
Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

Unleaded gasoline
RAC price plus cents
Low sulphur diesel
RAC price plus cents
Off road diesel
RAC price plus cents e
MOTOR OIL

- Quarts Per Case Amount Per Case
5W20 Motor Oil Quart Case full spthchi € =Y
SW30 Motor Oil Quart Case « ' _ 5  33e2
Tube Grease AW2 5‘ o »«/v/&e{ Z25.00
15w40 55 Gallon Barrel AT
20 Gallon Drum Grease AW2 42‘7 £
DEF Fluid 300-Gallon tote with pump
DEF Fluid per case 2 / 2.59/ 2 4
AW 68 Hydraulic 5 Gallon 29 ¢o
80-90 Gear Qil 5 Gallon g5
80/90 Synthetic Gear Oil 5 Gallon /0400
Mabile SHC 5 Gallon -
Antifreeze 55 gallon drum 55 z7%%




10W30 Motor Oil / l/ [ ?’-f' ) ‘%‘5&

Chainsaw Bar Oil 3] 194 150
Pre mixed gas / 50:1 ratio { 4%{9 / g o0

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “FUEL & OIL” marked clearly on the
envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the Jowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Sincerely, .
6WU\§C}QQ

Sissy Pace

Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury

Company Name: %ZHN hl'.&p S y ﬂé‘/ﬂ |

Address: P08 241 U“(Zu,a, WS 397

Pronerumber 6O - 855 $E9F

Email Address: a_(%}e,_@aol Cem. / EhsTive 0aof. ’.‘.7.{‘,“;.}
; .

Signature:

Date:




BRANDON DUBOIS 7 y MARK BALL
District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana Gf(ll’lt ParlSh POI!CB Jury District 5, Bentley, Louisiana
200 Main Street - Courthouse Building

JOHNNY JAM]SQN Colfax, Louisiana 71417 'WI'NSTON ROBERT_S
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana Telephone: 318-627-3157 District 6, Pollock, Louisiana

CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527 MIKE MERRELL
District 3, Colfax, Louisfana AT District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana

ARNOLD MURRELL ‘“ / ROY EDWARDS
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana ‘x\i District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

December 9, 2024
FUEL & OIL

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on the following fuel & oil for the calendar
year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending
Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

Unleaded gasoline Fregh?” o407 P
Mgy O Tt 0407

, Froihr +098Y
Low sulphur diesel _
RAC price plus cents Mt M’O‘L _ / ofpl . 05;{ Y

Fonr 10987

RAC price plus cents

Off road diesel . { //
RAC price plus cents Ml 0P~ Jorst 08¢
MOTOR OIL
uarts Per Case Amount Per Case
SW20 Motor Oil Quart Case — //L R j2 e
5W30 Motor Oil Quart Case s 832 e
/O JS§T oo
Tube Grease AW2 A ARG
15w40 55 Gallon Barrel %797 4
Y
20 Gallon Drum Grease AW2 u/ 7 %0
DEF Fluid 300-Gallon tote with pump 2 S /(/ G- N
DEF Fluid per case . 7«) _?Z N
AW 68 Hydraulic 5 Gallon ; 2%
80-90 Gear Oil 5 Gatlon b9
20/90 Synthetic Gear Qil 5 Gallon 7 5,/ 0
Mobile SFIC 5 Gallon A
Antifreeze 55 gallon drum {/9/ G _%_M{__ 192 yone, § 02

1



10W30 Motor Oil J2, 00

L/
Chainsaw Bar Oil Y000 (ghn Coun
Pre mixed gas / 50:1 ratio 27,00 7/'5 7/ 00 94 Neng

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “FUEL & OIL” marked clearly on the
envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject

any and all bids.
Smcereiy, &%

Owssi. Naeo
Sissy Pace
Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury

Company Name: mé&// | 2282
i I Lo D9 ot L /v
prone Numbers___5/ V-6 Y V¥

Email Address: 5o ﬁ///v/,y b _oT g co
Signature: /{J Q SR

Date: / 7/ oo




BRANDON DUBQIS ' y MARK BALL
District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana Grant ParlSh POhC'e Jury District 5, Bentiey, Louisiana
200 Main Street - Courthouse Building

JOHNNY JAMISON Colfax. Louisiana 71417 lWI'NSTON ROBER'T.S
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana Teleph (’) ne: 318-627-3157 District 8, Pollock, Louisiana
CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527 MIKE MERRELL

District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana

ROY EDWARDS
District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

District 3, Colfax, Louisiana

ARNOLD MURRELL
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana

December 9, 2024

EMULSIONS

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on the following type of emulsions for the
calendar year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and
ending Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

CRS2 MC 30
Minimum gallons to order 4000 gallons Minimum gallons to order
Price per gallon $ 2.86/gal Price per gallon $

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “EMULSIONS” marked clearly on
the envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Sincerely, Q
/D ooy YOoLe

Sissy Pace

Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury

Company Name: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions

Address: P.O Box 1639 Jackson MS 39215
Phone Number: 225-397-8143
Email Address: _mark.hartman@ergon.com

Date:  12/19/24




PASPHALT
PRODUCTS
UNLIMI TED inc.

PRODUCTS FOR THE PLANT » PRODUCTS FOR THE ROAD

4675 INTERSTATE HIGHWAY, PORT ALLEN, LOUISIANA 70767-4150
TELEPHONE (225) 346-0836 FACSIMILE (225) 346-0838

January 6, 2025
Grant Parish Police Jury
200 Main Street
Colfax, LA 71417

RE: Sealed Bid—AC-10, MC-30, CRS-2
Calendar Year 2025

Bid Due: Th 1/09/2025, 3:30 pm
Bid Opens:  Th 1/09/2025, 5:00 pm

Phone:318-899-5755

Dear Sir/Madam:
Asphalt Products Unlimited, Inc. is pleased to bid the following for the above period:

AC-10 Asphalt Cement S no bid gallon
CRS-2 Asphalt Emulsion S 2.85 gallon
MC-30 Cutback Asphalt S 5.30 galion
Freight to any location (Grant Parish) S 975.00 load

*Detaining transport on job site will be charged at $75.00 per hour after the 15t hour

NOTE—Asphalt Products Unlimited, Inc. claims the Louisiana Preference under LA R.S. 38:2251,
for the above products are manufactured at our only facility, which is located in Port Allen, LA.

We appreciate the opportunity to bid on the above items and look forward to future business
with you.

Sincerely,
ASPHALT PRODUCTS UNLIMITED, INC.

“R. Steele Yeargain, Il
President



()

2090 Industrial Park Rd / P.O.BOX 7618 / ALEXANDRIA, LA. 71303
OFFICE: (318) 427-1381 / (318) 443-5686 FAX: (318) 427-1481

Diamond B

CONSTRUCTION CO,, LLC

January 6, 2025

Grant Parish Police Jury
200 Main St. Courthouse Bldg.
Colfax, LA 71417

Upon your request, we are pleased to provide this quote, for the January 2025 bid
letting, for the following materials meeting the Department of Transportation and
Development Specification as follows:

Hot Mix-Type PG 67-22 $102.75 per ton FOB plant
Location: Alexandria LA

Cold Mix High Performance $119.00 per ton FOB plant
Location: Alexandria LA $136.00 per ton Delivered

(25 ton minimum load delivered)

This price is offered through June 30, 2025.

We can discuss in June 2025 the possibility of extending this price till April 2025 if both
parties agree.

The above price does not include sales tax. Our terms are net 30 days.

We look forward to serving your account.

Sincerely / ﬂ
%;R. Davis

Sales Representative



BRANDON DUBOIS
District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana

JOHNNY JAMISON
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana

CEPHAS BOWIE, JR.
District 3, Colfax, Louisiana

ARNOLD MURRELL
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana

Grant Parish Police Jury

200 Main Street - Courthouse Building
Colfax, Louisiana 71417
Telephone: 318-627-3157
Fax: 318-627-3527

December 9, 2024

METAL CULVERTS

MARK BALL
District 5, Bentlsy, Louisiana

WINSTON ROBERTS
District 6, Pollock, Loulsiana

MIKE MERRELL
District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana

ROY EDWARDS
District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on metal culverts for the calendar year 2025,
We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending Thursday,

January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.
SIZE ASPHALT COATED GALVANIZED

127 l4ga 25,80/If 16ga 2204 i 14ga )80/ (P 160 2245Y/)P

15”

1 8,7

2”

30”

36”

42”

48"

60”

Connecting Bands % f,& /19 ¢ pl9e.

l4ga_23.18

1P16ga 22051 /(p

14ga 37,75 [1f1682 3Y 30 | 1€
14ga 52,59/ I 16ga U7, 25 | [$
14ga (675 |{ 16ga S5 61/ [P
14ga 79:00 )1 16526700 | [P

l4ga ?&.;.2..5?/1{’_ 16ga_8%.00 [ |-f

14ga [1Y, [0 [ ff 16ga 74,75/ [P

14ga (€635 19 166 14100 [ I

14ga 92,50 [ 1P 16ga 2508/}

taga 4SO/ 16ga 95 251§

14&*‘&..‘__@[‘& 16ga Y<.01 “:E
14ga £7. QLH’ 16ga SY.5Y / 1P

14ga_9j_._l‘Q]u_~e 16ga 77,186 z If
l4ga | Y{ "Sj/” 16ga ] |7 18 /19

xS W__Qf_.?i'pq_

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “METAL CULVERTS?” marked
clearly on the envelope.



BRANDON DUBOIS 7 7 MARK BALL
District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana Grant ParlSh POllce Ju’y District &, Bentley, Louisiana
200 Main Street - Courthouse Building

JOHNNY JAMISQN Colfax, Louisiana 71417 .WI‘NSTON ROBEBTS
District 2, Colfax, Loufsiana Telephone: 318-627-3157 District 6, Pollock, Louisiana
CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527 MIKE MERRELL
District 3, Colfax, Louisfana District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana

ARNOLD MURRELL
District 4, Colfax, Louisfana

ROY EDWARDS
District 8, Georgetown, Louislana

December 9, 2024

PLASTIC CULVERTS

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on plastic culverts for the calendar year 2025.
We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending Thursday,
January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

SIZE ROUND

127 _10.03 [“P_

15 13,60 |10 }
18 1£.83 [P

2 20.31( 1P
307 Yeoo |
36” éo_‘_?d;’p R
38/1p

- 7972/

11177 i

*Must be double walled, bell and spigot type*

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID* “PLASTIC CULVERTS” marked
clearly on the envelope.



Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Sincerely, Q
Dmany YL

Sissy Pace

Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury

Company Name: Pe /\Jq uson Wmfe A LUM/(K

Address: /00 Credif DN?/«E, Seolt LA J0583

Phone Number: 377 - 70%-68%¢ 7

Email Address:  Jetred « W amdd> Ferguiur s com

Date: /220, M




BRANDON DUBOIS Gr(mt Parish Poh'ce Jufy MARK BALL

District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana District 5, Bentley, Louisiana

200 Main Street - Courthouse Buildin
JOHNNY JAMISON Colfax, Louisiana 71417 ¢ 'WI’NSTON HOBEBTS
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana Telephone: 318-627-3157 District 8, Pollock, Louisiana
CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527 _ MIKE MERRELL
District 3, Coifax, Louisiana : District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana
ARNOLD MURRELL RQY EDWARDS

District 4, Colfax, Louisiana District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

December 9, 2024

METAL CULVERTS

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on metal culverts for the calendar year 2025.
We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending Thursday,
January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

SIZE 1&&.’1‘ COATED GALVANIZED

127 Uga (2.0 16ga (71 1aga 1533 1gge 170
15" lga (979 q6ga U376 qage Vb g 15,44
18 1dga 1877 16pa 31T vaga 129 16e (598
207 l4ga 5791 16ga Y5 14ga D31 16ga 25729

30° 1aga 1)-S7  qgga S 00
36" 14ga 57"”?___ ~ l6ga bg.l{bf

14ga 9.1/ 16ga 31 68

277 16ga 0O MY laga S 63 16ga 39 .73

20 14ga bb M) 16ga 7794 laga 57329 16ga 3!
48" lga 7.0l 160930 l4ga 70167 16ga £O.88

60 14ga )1TET g 3% aga 9957 1gg 7573
Connecting Bands /. 2236' | Stimes ustprice € SAne
Y2"-4g" 2 tints pot fite < SAmE

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “METAL CULVERTS” marked
clearly on the envelope.




Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Sincerely, Q
Dmony YL

Sissy Pace

Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury

Company Name: (/\/(}&)/\ é/}b{(‘ﬁ,jn(.

Address: PO Bt 7 Clkbect 7 DSB37
Phone Number: ? O% %7 - g 4o

Date: )2 -2%-74




BRANDON DUBOIS 1 y MARK BALL
District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana Grant ParlSh POllCB Jury District 5, Bentley, Louisiana
200 Main Street - Courthouse Building

JOHNNY JAMISON Colfax. Louisi 71417 WINSTON ROBERTS
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana Te?ep?fzu(éngués;%?gw-m 57 District 6, Pollock, Louisiana

CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527 MIKE MERRELL
District 8, Colfax, Louisiana T District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana

ARNCLD MURRELL ROY EDWARDS
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

December 9, 2024

PLASTIC CULVERTS

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on plastic culverts for the calendar year 2025.

We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending Thursday,
January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

SIZE ROUND

127 N
15” 1150

18” 15.00

247 0
307 39.00 o
36” 5200 .
427 B 68.00

48” — .
60” _ 145.00

*Must be double walled, bell and spigot type*

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “PLASTIC CULVERTS” marked
clearly on the envelope.



Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Sincerely, N
C )usok NOLo

Sissy Pace
Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury

Company Name: _ Coastal Culvert & Supply

Address: P.O. Box 1145 Eunice, La 70535

Phone Number: 337-546-6887

Email Address: tbrown@coastalculvert.com

,,,,/"// __,,-f",_!/’
Signature: N €ty (S Ao B
£ [’ —
Date: 112125




BRANDON DUBOIS
District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana

JOHNNY JAMISON

District 2, Colfax, Louisiana

CEPHAS BOWIE, JR.
District 3, Colfax, Louisiana

ARNOLD MURRELL
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana

December 9, 2024

Grant Parish Police Jury

200 Main Street - Courthouse Building
Colfax, Louisiana 71417
Telephone: 318-627-3157

Fax: 318-627-3527

METAL CULVERTS

MARK BALL
District 5, Bentley, Louisiana

WINSTON ROBERTS
District 6, Pollock, Louisiana

MIKE MERRELL
District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana

ROY EDWARDS
District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on metal culverts for the calendar year 2025.

We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending Thursday,
January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

SIZE ASPHALT COATED

127 14ga 2444 16ga 2088

157 14ga 3138 16ga %
18" 14ga_3£_3_.22 - 16g3._32.88

247 14ga 5043 16ga 4155
307 14ga 6344 16ga 5276
36” 14ga 7487  16ga 6243
427 14ga 8709 16ga_ 7088
48”  14ga__ 10003 l6ga 9010
60” 14ga 150,50 16ga 13587
Connecting Bands

GALVANIZED

l4ga 2183 16ga 1819
l4ga 2729 16ga 2183
l4ga 3274 16ga 2729
ldga 4396 16ga 3456
l4ga 5457 l6ga 4366
l4ga 6549  16ga 5276
l4ga 7640 16ga 6185
l4ga 9605  16ga 7604
l4ga  140.17 l6ga  115.06

1" wide band priced at 2' LF of pipe, 2' wide band priced at 3' LF of pipe

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “METAL CULVERTS” marked
clearly on the envelope.



Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Sincerely, Q
‘Dusany Y02

Sissy Pace

Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury

Company Name: Coastal Culvert & Supply

Address: P.0. Box 1145 Eunice,La 70535 -

Phone Number: 337-546-6887

Email Address: tbmwn@mj%ulve_rt com

Signature: /@ ©'CC9~—— . .
Date: 12025




Phone: (337) 546-6887 Fax: (337) 546-6889

Coastal Culvert & Supply, Inc.

991 North St. Mary - P. O. Box 1145
Eunice, Louisiana 70535-1145

1/2/2025

To the members of Grant Parish Police Jury:

Louisiana manufacturers may be given an opportunity to meet the lowest and
best bid as applied to products manufactured out of state in accordance with
Louisiana law.

Pursuant To “Louisiana Preference Law” Statute R.S. 38:2251

In accordance with title 38:2251 of the Louisiana Revised Statutes a
preference of 10% may be allowed for the products produced, manufactured
or assembled in Louisiana of equal guality.

Coastal respectfully requests this opportunity as afforded by the above
referenced State Statute for Metal Pipe & Metal Fittings in the enclosed
bid.

Thank You,

Terry Brown
President/ Owner



REMIT TO:

'D G G E I I Doggett Machinery Services  Alexandria, LA 71301 St. Rose, LA70087  Covington, LA 70435 Monroe, LA 71202 Shreveport, LA 71119
- (318) 442-0455 (318) 343-8787

P.0. BOX 15869 (504) 466-5577 (985) 893-3005 (318) 631-3030
Doggett Machinery Services Baton Rouge, LA 70895  Broussarc, LA 70518 Tyler, TX 75708 Longview, TX 75602 Lufkin, TX 75301  Lake Charles, LA 70615
i i ) . Phone: (225) 291-3750 (337) 837-9481 {903) 562-8900 (903) 758-3326 (936) 634-8801 (337) 430-3045
1-800-569-1626 » www.doggett.com Fax: (225) 238-1824
Branch
. IN STORE PICKUP 23 - ALEXANDRIA LA
@) -
it Date Time Page
% 12/30/2024 15:00:37 (0O) 1
7} Account No. Phone No. Invoice Nd@ 2
0000322316 3186273157 019417
Ship Via Purchase Order
é GRANT PARISH POLICE JURY QUOTE
s, 200 MAIN ST Sales Tax License No. FST.ID
g COLFAX LA 71417
-4 Salesperson
Jgc7
ESTIMATE EXPIRY DATE: 02/03/2025
QUOTE DESCRIPTION
Part# Description =~ U = Oty ___ Price = Amount
7T1638 3/4X8X72 1 158.33 158.33
7T1643 5/8X8X84 1 150.22 150.22
Subtotal: 308.55
TOTAL: 308.55
Authorization:

Received By

TERMS: Due and payable on receipt of invoice. All unpaid invoices greater than 30 days from the invoice date are subject to late fee and finance charge on the unpaid balance.
Buyer will pay all costs of collection of delinquent accounts including reasonable attorney fees



Company Name: QQ G_ﬁ%' /LIQK% N/
Address: 4 300 / /bt asaic r. Aé%a{ﬂ'? Lq.jl.z /

Phone Number: _( /R 2 Ypl—- 093535 .
Email Address: __ . ~q ¢ ¢ f}‘u 1 IKXW73 sz com

Signature: %—\W /-Z | _

Date: _ /9‘/(/501/&7%/



. 4 BALL
BRANDON DUBOIS Gr ant P anSh P 0hce J u’y Distﬂcti\él,ABZZIey, Louisiana

District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana

200 Main Street - Courthouse Building
JOHNNY JAMISON Colfax, Louisiana 71417 D‘sYt\lr}[\ltSesngloFc‘:g?.EZLSna
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana Telephone: 318-627-3157 istrict 6, 4
CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527 ~ MIKE MERRELL
District 3, Colfax, Louisiana District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana

ROY EDWARDS

RRELL
ARMOLD MU District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

District 4, Colfax, Louislana

December 9, 2024

GRADER BLADES

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on the following grader blades for the
calendar year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and
ending Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

GRADER BLADES BID SPECIFICATIONS

% x 8" x 6 WITH HOLES FOR %" BOLTS 5 HO).00 a;er Y)\&é%
5/8 x 8" x 7 WITH HOLES FOR 5/8" BOLTS ﬁx\ _(LS_O_ O Ure)\ Y\o&&

*Must be high carbon blades*

Delivery to be made to 1141 Landfill Road, Dry Prong, LA 71423.

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “GRADER BLADES” marked clearly

on the envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Sincerely,
ooy Yacs

Sissy Pace

Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury



Company Name: 5 C, @ U OMJ( CU
Address: %OC) 7 O A /V\O\é A {’\Lﬂ [~ (9& fﬂ:’% 7 ‘%6
Phone Number: % % L{L\g I (|

Email Address: LA[ /MQPS (/C(/!/\
L {
Signature: ﬂ/{/t{ . S——

Date: [%/QO/ QGQL{




SCOTT
EQUIPMENT

HEAVY-DUTY COMMITMENT

ORDER NO ORDER DATE SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY CUSTOMER NO
PS0012506 12-20-2024 3007 N Macarthur Dr BP0002270
Alexandria LA 71303-4143
PAYMENT TERMS 318.448.1647 CUSTOMER PO
DUE UPON RECEIPT www.scottcompanies.com GRADER BLADE BID

PARTS INVOICE PREVIEW

INVOICE TO: SHIP TO:

GRANT PARISH POLICE JURY SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY
200 Main St 3007 N Macarthur Dr

Colfax LA 71417-1859 Alexandria LA 71303-4143

318.448.1647

SALESMAN : ALEX JEROME ORDER NO . PSO012506 DELIVERY TERMS
SHIPVIA  : WILL CALL CONTACT NAME : R ROBERTS
POS. QTY PARTNUMBER / DESCRIPTION WHS PRICE CORE TOTAL
Lot/Serial No
1 1 7T1643 5/8x8x84CSB WH151 105.00 0.00 105.00
2 1 7T1638 3/4X8X72 BLADE WH151 110.00 0.00 110.00
SALES TAX DETAILS
PARTS 215.00
STATE - LOUISIANA : FREIGHT CHARGES
PARISH! - RAPIDES : SUBTOTAL 215.00
CITY - ALEXANDRIA : SALES TAX
INVOICE TOTAL (USD) 215.00

For Payments by ACH: WellsFargo Bank, N.A.  For Payments by Check: Scott Equipment
Account Name: Scott Equipment Company, LLC PO BOX 208377

Account # 4127328789 Dalias, TX 75320-8377

RTN/ABA # 121000248

CUSTOMER ACCEPTANCE
Scoft Equipment Company, LLC Terms

Payments are due upon receipt of the invoice. All accounts not paid in full by the due date will incur a finance or late charge after the date due calculated at a rate
equal to the lesser of 18% per annum or the highest rate allowed by applicable law. Credit card payments are subject to a 3% convenience fee. All claims and
returned goods must be accompanied by this bill. Special ordered parts returned within 15 days in new condition will be accepted and a handling charge of up to
20% will be assessed. However, parts not returnable to the factory are non-returnable to us and will not be accepted for refund. All electrical parts are non-
returnable. Core credits due upon receipt, subject to manufacture inspection. If manufacture deems core is damaged upon inspection, surcharge will be applied.



BRANDON DUBOIS Grant Parish POlice Jury MARK BALL

District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana District 5, Bentley, Louisiana

200 Main Street - Courthouse Building
JOHNNY JAMISON Colfax, Louisiana 71417 .WI.NSTON ROBEH.T'S
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana Telephone: 318-627-3157 District 8, Pollock, Louisiana
CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527 _ MIKE MERRELL
District 3, Colfax, Louisiana 391,5\ District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana
ARNOLD MURRELL ﬁ% 7 ROY EDWARDS
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana ot >y District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

December 9, 2024

GRADER BLADES

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on the following grader blades for the
calendar year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and
ending Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

GRADER BLADES BID SPECIFICATIONS

% x 8" x 6 WITH HOLES FOR %" BOLTS $0 9561

5/8 x 8" x 7 WITH HOLES FOR 5/8" BOLTS 70 /576

*Must be high carbon blades*
Delivery to be made to 1141 Landfill Road, Dry Prong, LA 71423.

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “GRADER BLADES” marked clearly

on the envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Sincerely,
=S ooy Yacs

Sissy Pace

Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury



Company Name: Wau /(GSAJ\ - /)C;M’C»e Talr)
Address: $732 5 MachrHen PR /f/?'i’dh/nm,- ]
Phone Number: Sy G54 - $639

Email Address: _ Je FFIZ<7 e S th @ 1P, com

Signature:

Date:



WAUKESHA-PEARCE INDUSTRIES, LLC

A PEARCE INDUSTRIES, INC. COMPANY Counter Ticket: 270978
P.O. BOX 35068, HOUSTON TEXAS 77235-5068 Invoice:
/4 PHONE (713) 723-1050 Invoice Date:
Branch: 601
QUOTE
Sold To: 529907 601 Ship To: 601
GRANT PARISH POLICE JURY WPI ALEXANDRIA
200 MAIN ST 5732 S MACARTHUR DR
COLFAX LA 71417 ALEXANDRIA LA 71302
United States United States
318-627-3157
Ship Via: -
Special Instructions:
Customer PO: quote Open: 1/7/2025 Equip ID: 12950
Contact Name: Sold by: PAUFER Model: OTHER
Phone: Terms: Net 30 Days Serial No:
Notes : SisRep: Chrisprtwa
[ Quantity ey
Line # Ship | BIO V Part Number Description Location LT Price Ext Price
1 0 ITR 5D9561-ITR GRADER BLADE A 132.98 132.98
1 0 ITR 7D1576-TR GRADER BLADE A 138.60 138.60
#+k v+ REMIT TO ADDRESS *** *+*
WAUKESHA-PEARCE INDUSTRIES, LLC. EXCHANGE ACCOUNT Subtotal $271.58
P O BOX 204116 DALLAS, TX 75320-4116
ACH/WIRING: WELLS FARGO BANK, N.A. Sales Tax
ABA##: 121000248 A NT# 412237421
A 000248 ACCOUNT# 3 8 Total $271.58
Total Due By 2/6/2025 (USD) | $271.58 |

PRINTED NAME

SIGNATURE
** QUOTE PRICES ARE VALID FOR 30 DAYS

** PARTS MUST BE RETURNED IN ORIGINAL UNOPENED PACKAGING FOR CREDIT

** RESTOCK FEE MAY BE APPLIED ON ANY AND ALL RETURNS

** NO RETURNS WILL BE ACCEPTED AFTER 30 DAYS FROM INVOICE
** PARTS VALUED AT LESS THAN $10.00 ARE NOT ELIGIBLE FOR RETURN

***NO RETURNS OR REFUNDS ALLOWED ON NON-STOCK PARTS THAT

REQUIRE SPECIAL ORDER. ALL SALES ARE FINAL.

In accordance with acceptable state laws, we may impose a surcharge on credit cards that is not greater than our cost of acceptance.

et RETURN POLICY *****

REQUIRES PROOF OF PURCHASE FOR ALL PARTS ... NO RETURNS AFTER 30 DAYS ON STOCK PARTS.

1af1




BRANDON DUBOIS Grant Parish POlice Ju':y MARK BALL

District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana v District 5, Bentley, Louisiana
200 Main Street - Courthouse Building

JOHNNY JAMISON Colfax. Louisiana 71417 -WINSTON ROBERTS
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana Telephéne: 318-627-3157 District 6, Pollock, Louisiana

CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527 _ MIKE MERRELL
District 3, Colfax, Louisiana District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana

ROY EDWARDS
District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

ARNOLD MURRELL
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana

December 9, 2024

GRAVEL & STONE

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on the following gravel and stone for the
calendar year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and
ending Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

DELIVERED PICK UP
#57 Crushed Limestone
#47s o S
#7’s (wash) -
#8 Chip Seal Stone (wash)
#67 Crushed Limestone N B
610 Base
#55 Rip Rap ) R
Class 30 Rip Rap -~
4x1 Rock - S
Washed Pea Gravel ¥ 54.°% A 5 g %__Pm\(ed P
Washed Maintenance Gravel k_}_&_&ﬁ*gm 298°° 4o puaked
Washed Sand = 550 e & b Ao N (N ?{&b\z\;i
%.00 W
Manl R ddeess \ PhySica ) Nedeess,
P gi&;}sA&—E\t‘i QS B3\ S=lenn C;I‘GL\( Rd
W f\\f\%\@s\r“ o, s NI"\S Ole e NS




Priced by ton, deliver 30 days from order time and approximately 5600 tons per year

Washed Maintenance Gravel

(Maximum size shall be 1.5 inches and free of any wood, debris, dirt, clay, lumps, or any non-rock material. Any
deliveries not satisfactory shall be rejected and no payment made.)

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “GRAVEL & STONE” marked
clearly on the envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Sincerely,

b Yac s
Sissy Pace
Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury

Qmmwwamjﬁﬁﬁuﬁ;llﬁgﬁﬁgﬁgiﬁs

aan
Address: _&L\.g '&\5\5‘ =N \6"\\/\_\/\%\00(‘(3;\—0-_-_ AL\ LN =
Thysica L 7 231 Salen Cgeld RA Ol ban MW

Phone Number: _ 20t~ g \L - \R Y, j_ﬁ:._'ﬁﬁf)?__ﬂ_ﬂﬂ \
Email Address: PBK g&}f\c@%ﬂ&\i@%@;\ Q_QW\

Signature: . % % - ) —

Date: j_‘a,_;'a\\-_a\k\ - o




BRANDON DUBOQIS
District 1, Montgomery, Loulslana

JOHNNY JAMISON
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana

CEPHAS BOWIE, JR.
District 3, Colfax, Louisiana

ARNOLD MURRELL
Distriet 4, Colfax, Louisiana

Grant Parish Police Jury

200 Main Street - Courthouse Building
Cclfax, Louisiana 71417
Telephone: 318-627-3157
Fax: 318-627-3527

December 9, 2024

GRAVEL & STONE

MARK BALL
District 5, Bentley, Louisiana

WINSTON ROBERTS
District 6, Pollock, Louisiana

MIKE MERRELL
District 7, Dry Prong, Loulsiana

ROY EDWARDS
District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on the following gravel and stone for the
calendar year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and
ending Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

DELIVERED
#57 Crushed Limestone $50.50
#4’s $50.50
#7’s (wash) $53.00
#8 Chip Seal Stone (wash) $51.00
#67 Crushed Limestone $50.50
610 Base $48.00
#55 Rip Rap $52.50
Class 30 Rip Rap $52.50
4x1 Rock $50.50
Washed Pea Gravel E_/A o
Washed Maintenance Gravel N/A
Washed Sand N/A

* Delivery only to address
1141 Landfill Rd.

Dq¥
by Trailer Trucks
Only

PICK UP
$39.50
$39.50
$42.00
~$4Q.OO

$39.50

$37.00
$41.50
$41.50
$39.50
N/A

N/A
N/A

Prong, La 71423



Priced by ton, deliver 30 days from order time and approximately 5600 tons per year

Washed Maintenance Gravel N/A N/A
(Maxiroum size shall be 1.5 inches and free of any wood, debris, dirt, clay, lumps, or any non-rock material, Any
deliveries not satisfactory shall be rejected and no payment made.)

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “GRAVEL & STONE?” marked
clearly on the envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Singerely,

Dby NQCs

Sissy Pace

Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury

Company Name: Luhr Bros., Inc./Luhr Crosby,LLC

Address: 5311 Third-St., Alexandria, La 7130

Phone Number: _ (318)487-9263

Email Address:  jeremyl@luhr.com

Signature:M M‘% — e

Date: December 19, 2024




BRANDON DUBOIS : 7 MARK BALL
District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana Grant ParISh POllce Ju’y District 5, Bentley, Louisiana
200 Main Street - Courthouse Building

JOHNNY JAMISON Colfax, Louisiana 71417 W[NSTON ROBER_TS
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana Teleph(,)ne: 318-627-3157 District 6, Pollock, Louisiana
CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527 _ MIKE MERRELL
District 3, Colfax, Louisiana P District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana
ARNOLD MURRELL ﬁ:ﬁ;% ROY EDWARDS .
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana '\ %‘ / District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana
N el

BID TO BE SERVICED BY: SOUTHERN TIRE MART,
LLC 5007 HWY 84 W

VIDALIA, LA 71373

December 9, 2024 318-336-4242

MICHAEL PATTERSON, MANAGER RUSTY
ARNOLD, SALESMAN GOV-
SALES@STMTIRES.COM

LH

RETREAD TIRES-A GRADE TIRES

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on the following tire sizes for the calendar
year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending
Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

All caps must be on virgin castings. All grips must be 18-32 tread depth. Highway tires

must be 15-32 tread depth.

CASING CAP
11R22.5 Grip Tread ~ Mega Trek $5000 1 $225.34
11R22.5 Road Tread  BRTL-SA $5000 _$184.81
11R24.5Grip Tread  UDR $50.00 $214.38
11R24.5 Road Tread g $50.00 $176.85

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “RETREAD TIRES” marked clearly
on the envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Sincerely,

\

NP NQC o
Sissy Pace
Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury



Company Name: Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Phone Number: _877-786-4681,

Email Address: _gov-sales@stmtires.com

Signature; W B

Date: 1/2/2025




BRANDON DUBOIS 7 7 MARK BALL _
District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana Grant ParlSh POIlce Jury District 5, Bentley, Louisiana
200 Main Street - Courthouse Building

JOHNNY JAMISON Colfax, Louisiana 71417 'WI'NSTON ROBERTS
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana Telephone: 318-627-3157 District 6, Pollock, Louisiana

CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527  MIKEMERRELL
District 3, Colfax, Louisiana D District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana

ARNOLD MURRELL ﬁ) *;ra‘.p,’-f“@\ ROY EDWARDS -
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana \1\ %&‘ ) District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

December 9, 2024

RETREAD TIRES-A GRADE TIRES

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on the following tire sizes for the calendar
year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending
Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

All caps must be on virgin castings. All grips must be 18-32 tread depth. Highway tires
must be 15-32 tread depth.

CASING CAP
11R22.5 Grip Tread _£0.00 _1119.00
11R22.5 Road Tread 5000 1500
11R24.5 Grip Tread <600 179.00

11R24.5 Road Tread . gQMOQM_- J(@OO__

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “RETREAD TIRES” marked clearly
on the envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police J ury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The J ury reserves the right to reject
any and all bids.

Sincerely,

el N0 o
Sissy Pace
Parish Manager

Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury



BRANDON DUBQIS 4 7 MARK BALL
District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana Grant ParlSh POhce Jury District 5, Bentley, Louisiana
200 Main Street - Courthouse Building

JOHNNY JAMISON Colfax, Louisiana 71417 'WI'NSTON ROBEBTS
District 2, Colfax, Louisiana Telephone: 318-627-3157 District 6, Pollock, Louisiana
CEPHAS BOWIE, JR. Fax: 318-627-3527 _ MIKE MERRELL
District 3, Colfax, Louisiana /}“ L District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana
ARNOLD MURRELL f ‘\’\ ROY EDWARDS _
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana
December 9, 2024
TIRES & TUBES

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on the following tire sizes for the calendar
year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending
Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

Grader tires shall be mid-range or better rubber. ALL PRICES SHALL INCLUDE ALL

DEQ FEES.

SIZE DESCRIPTION DELIVERED PICK UP
17.5x 25 Radial LG L2 \ .200-00 1.260.00
12.5 180 - 18 Front Backhoc 2H600 240.00
12x165 Front Backhoe Tie-NHS ~ JJ)9.00 _DA5.00.

12 ply F3 tread tubeless

19.5.x 24 Rear Backhoe Tire - NHS MLDQB' m @_0 'QQ

16 ply F3 tread tubeless
225/70R 19.5 Radial Grip (12 ply rating) ~~_ Z\A 00 74060
225/80R 17 Radial Grip (12 ply rating) N M’ N l f

LT235/80R16 Radial Drive Axle Grip Tire “ QEl ‘ }O ‘ qu 00_
Load Range E (14 ply rating) Tubeless American Made

11R24.5 Grip Load Range H WM L\Uq DO ’HX\ ’-1 (ﬂq OO
AmericanMade  inp0Ost 3HA.00 oot 24 q.00
11R22.5 Grip Load Range H MV\ LAH4.00 A 1u2rq.00

American Made \(Y\QM 2344.00 \Mm{*' 5qq 00

11R24.5 Steering Axle Load Range H MM P\’M 'i—l‘:\_ao
American Made \‘“m ’5?)(,‘ 00 \N\Q)( 3 gqu



11R22.5

P235/75R15

265/T0R17

ST205/75R15

ST225/75R15

12.4 x R24

18.4 x R34

18.4 x R30

425/65 22.5

315/80R 22.5

235/85R16

255/70 R22.5

215/75 R17.5

235/75 R17.5

Steering Axle Load Range H “’W\ Ibq 0\ . OO WN\ Bq Q.00

American Made 1neort $39.60  impoet 339.60
Radial Drive Axle Grip 112.93 112.53
(6 ply rating) Tubeless American Made

Radial AT (10 ply rating) 422 ol 32
Tubeless American Made

Radial Trailer (6 ply rating) 1400 “19.00
Tubeless American Made

Radial Tire 8 ply rating) 1100 19-00
Tractor - 2 10 - O_O _alQ;O 0
Tractor 18a.00 . 718900
Tractor 985.00

Steering Tires B _519‘ 99_

SecrimgaGrip ST SEEOD

14 ply Trailer \1A. 00

Trailer _29-00 269.00
Trailer _A500 23560
Trailer 14 ply Q3900 206

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “TIRES & TUBES” marked clearly

on the envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject

any and all bids.

Sincerely, Q
delk QLo

Sissy Pace

Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury



Company Name: M‘OOKS Tf{ C &Z[\-“ ce.
agarss: 00 B0x §196 Wooedde L aze
Phone Number: ?)' % q"‘%’ 1"6(-0‘ _

Email Address: ijQ{(Q{) @d@?_mh(ﬁ oM
Signature: ?C’Z‘f/v\ W

Date: jj){\%‘m\_}/ﬁh QOQ? e



BRANDON DUBOQIS
District 1, Montgornery, Louisiana

JOHNNY JAMISON
District 2, Colfax, Louisfana

CEPHAS BOWIE, JR.
District 3, Coffax, Louisiana

ARNOLD MURRELL
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana

Grant Parish Police Jury

200 Main Street - Courthouse Building
Colfax, Louisiana 71417
Telephone: 318-627-3157
Fax: 318-627-3527

December 9, 2024

TIRES & TUBES

MARK BALL
District 5, Bentley, L ouisiana

WINSTON ROBERTS
District 6, Pollock, Louisiana

MIKE MERRELL
District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana

ROY EDWARDS
District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

The Grant Parish Polic;a Jury will be receiving bids on the following tire sizes for the calendar
year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending
Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

Grader tires shall be :ﬁmid'-range or beiter rubber. ALL PRICES SHALL INCLUDE ALL

DEQ FEES.
SIZE

17.5% 25
12.5180 18

12x16.5

19.5L x 24

225/70R 19.5
225/80R 17

LT235/80R16

11R24.5

11R225

11R24.5

PICK UP

DESCRIPTION DELIVERED
Radial LG 1.2 G500
Front Backhoe ) __Z,_éjjaf_w
Front Backhoe Tire - NHS [ 7 _
12 ply F3 tread tubeless
Rear Backhoe Tire - NHS éf»_{ goe
16 ply F3 tread tubeless
Radial Grip (12 ply rating) / 4‘?@
Radial Grip (12 ply rating)
Radial Drive Axie Grip Tire
Load Range E (14 ply rating) Tubeless American Made
oo
Grip Load Range H :_{/__Z»’ =
American Made
Yokohuns - 7 ;

- 5%
Grip Load Range H 433
American Made

1768
Steering Axle Load Range H 4 75
American Made



11R22.5

P235/75R15

265/70R17

ST205/75R15

ST225/75R135
124 xR24
184x R34
18.4 x R30
425/65 22.5
315/80R 22.5
235/85R16
255/70 R22.5
215/75R17.5

235/75 R11.5

Steering Axle Load Range Bl $90%

American Made
2 A0
Radial Drive Axle Grip 2 7 “
{6 ply rating) Tubeless American Made
- e
Radial AT (10 ply rating) 21 e
Tubeless American Made
Radial Traller 6 ply ratingy 7%
Tubeless American Made
Radial Tire (8 ply rating) 5_ 7°%
Tractor 3 -] 7.60
Tractor X?iuam_ B
Tractor ,7 36“ ee e
Steering Tires 742 R
25p % - Sheea
Steering & Grip Jee® -Gy
14 ply Trailer /3579 -
)
Trailer WALk
g el
oo
Trailer 14 ply / €L

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “TIRES & TUBES” marked clearly

on the envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject

any and all bids.

Sincerely, \
C:'_"_‘:\ .
AT \ﬁ@ﬁﬁ_
Sissy Pace
Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury



N Hod Doyl

Address: %&){ 2(// _ [)‘7;(4/ %f 39/7\//

Phone Number: é‘@/ g&f\)/ gcffff
Email Address: /?LI S 72' re @ Cﬂ.ﬂ/ Zonf

Signature: C}V%L

Date: ) —25 Z/




BRANDON DUBOQOIS
District 1, Montgomery, Louisiana

JOHNNY JAMISON
District 2, Colffax, Louisiana

CEPHAS BOWIE, JR.
District 3, Colfax, Louisiana

ARNOLD MURRELL
District 4, Colfax, Louisiana

Grant Parish Police

200 Main Street - Courthouse Building

Caolfax, Louisiana 71417
Telephone: 318-627-3157
Fax; 318-627-3527

December 9, 2024

TIRES & TUBES

MARK BALL
District 5, Bentley, Louisiana

WINSTON ROBERTS
District 6, Pollock, Louisiana

MIKE MERRELL
District 7, Dry Prong, Louisiana

ROY EDWARDS
District 8, Georgetown, Louisiana

BID TO BE SERVICED BY:
SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC

5007 HWY 84 W

VIDALIA, LA 71373

318-336-4242

MICHAEL PATTERSON, MANAGER
RUSTY ARNOLD, SALESMAN
GOV-SALES@STMTIRES.COM

LH

Jury

The Grant Parish Police Jury will be receiving bids on the following tire sizes for the calendar
year 2025. We will accept bids beginning Monday, December 23, 2024 at 8:00 a.m. and ending
Thursday, January 9, 2025 at 3:30 p.m.

Grader tires shall be mid-range or better rubber. ALL PRICES SHALL INCLUDE ALL

DEQ FEES.
SIZE
17.5x25
125180 -18

12x16.5

19.5L x 24

225/70R 19.5
225/80R 17

LT235/80R16

11R24.5

11R22.5

11R24.5

DESCRIPTION DELIVERED PICK UP

Radial LG L2 _$832.24 _$832.24  #425129
Front Backhoe $276.00 $276.00 #AL1007
Front Backhoe Tire - NHS $243.80 $243.80 #GAL111266
12 ply F3 tread tubeless

Rear Backhoe Tire - NHS NOBID _NO BID

16 ply F3 tread tubeless

Radial Grip (12 ply rating) $303.70 - $303.70  #004195
Radial Grip (12 ply rating) =~ NOBID ~~ NOBID

Radial Drive Axle Grip Tire NO BID NOBID

Load Range E (14 ply rating) Tubeless American Made

Grip Load Range H $380.95 _$380.95  #293733
American Made

Grip Load Range H $37065 _$370.65  #211206
American Made

Steering Axle Load RangeH ~ $375.80 $375.80  #156582
American Made



11R22.5

P235/75R15

265/70R17

ST205/75R15

ST225/75R15

12.4 x R24

184 x R34

18.4 x R30

425/65 22.5

315/80R 22.5

235/85R16

255/70 R22.5

215/715 R17.5

235/75R17.5

Steering Axle Load Range H $355.00 $355.00  #156558
American Made

Radial Drive Axle Grip $11416 $114.16  #014043
(6 ply rating) Tubeless American Made

Radial AT (10 ply rating) $169.92 $169.92 #013868
Tubeless American Made

Radial Trailer (6 ply rating) NO BID NO BID

Tubeless American Made

Radial Tire (8 ply rating) $72.25 $72.25 _#TMSTO07
Tractor $677.67 _$677.67 #007471
Tractor $1,118.81 $1,118.81  #003168
Tractor $997.72 $997.72 ______#007120
Steering Tires $716.12 $716.12 #241235
Steering & Grip $518.79 $518.79  #244465
14 ply Trailer $132.25 $132.25 #CWR1025
Trailer $293.40 $293.40 #004232
Trailer $158.00 $158.00 #RL1032
Trailer 14 ply $170.00 $170.00  #R1,1033

Bids must be in a sealed envelope with “SEALED BID” “TIRES & TUBES” marked clearly

on the envelope.

Bids will be opened at the regular scheduled meeting of the Police Jury on Thursday, January 9,
2025 at 5:00 p.m. Bids will be awarded to the lowest bidder. The Jury reserves the right to reject

any and all bids.

Sincerely, Q
Usolk QLo

Sissy Pace

Parish Manager
Secretary/Treasurer
Grant Parish Police Jury



Company Name: Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Address: 800 Highway 98 Columbia, MS 39429

Phone Number: 877-786-4681

Date: 1/2/2025




