
LTHS Foundation
 1st Annual Taste of Lockport
SPONSORSHIP OPPORTUNTIES 

PREMIERE EVENT
SPONSOR - $5,000

1 available

Includes 25 entry tickets to the
Taste. Identification as the event
Company logo included in all
promotional materials for the
event. Recognition on the LTHS
Foundation webpage for an
entire year. Signage posted at
entrance and tents, on menus,
and at other locations during
the event. Ability to have table
at event.

BEER TENT
SPONSOR - $4,000

1 available 2 available

CONCERT/BAND
SPONSOR - $3,000

Includes 15 entry tickets to the
Taste. Identification as the Beer
Tent Sponsor on the official
event website. Recognition on
the LTHS Foundation webpage
for an entire year. Company
logo included in all promotional
materials for the event. Sign
posted at the beer tent. Ability
to have your logo on beverage
cups at the event.

Includes 10 entry tickets to the
Taste. Identification as the
Concert Sponsor on the official
event website.  Recognition on
the LTHS Foundation webpage
for an entire year. Sign posted
at the stage. Opportunity to
introduce the band from the
stage.

MENU BOARD
SPONSOR - $2,500

ADVERTISING
SPONSOR - $1,000

SCHOLARSHIP 
 SPONSOR - $500

50/50 RAFFLE
SPONSOR - $250

GENERAL DONATION   
Any Amount

1 available 10  available unlimted available

10 available unlimited available

Includes 10 entry tickets to the
Taste. Identification as the
Menu Board Sponsor on the
official event website. Company
logo on all the menu boards for
each vendor. Recognition on the
LTHS Foundation webpage for
an entire year.

Includes 5 entry tickets to the
Taste. Identification as an
Advertising Sponsor on the
official event website.
Recognition on the LTHS
Foundation webpage for an
entire year. Company logo
included in all promotional
materials for the event. 

Signs posted at the event.
Company logo on the event
website. Recognition on the
LTHS Foundation webpage.
Opportunity to present
scholarship in your company’s
name to student at Awards
Night 2023.

Company logo on the event
website. Recognition on the
LTHS Foundation webpage.
Company logo printed on the
raffle tickets promotional
materials.

We would love to honor all our
donors! General donations are
welcome - your family name or
company logo will be posted on
the event website. 

SCAN THE CODE
FOR MORE DETAILS


