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On May 10, 2018, at 8:21 PM, Rudy Davis <ruddavis@yahoo.com> wrote: 

Peace and blessings Jeff, 
 
My name is Rudy Davis and I run a small Christian prison ministry in Texas 
at http://www.YearOfJubile.com.  I am in communication with both Yorie 
and Scott.  Do you have the rights to the film "Death and Taxes"?   Are you 
opposed to allowing me to upload this film on youtube and pointing back to 
your website  http://www.taoslandandfilm.com as the source and owner?   I 
only ask as I think this film could do a great deal in raising awareness about 
political prisoners Scott and Yorie that have spent the last 35 years in 
prison. 
 
Thank you for your consideration. 
Because of Jesus Christ, 
Rudy Davis 
YearOfJubile.com 
972-839-9848 

 

On 5/11/2018   8:09 AM 

 

Dear Rudy & Erin, 

 

I feel like Jeff will permit you to do as requested. So far as I know, he 

does own the rights to the documentary. I recently had a copy of the 

article I wrote sent to him. He never responded. So, who knows??? 

Thank you for informing me and thinking of S & I. Take care....     

Yorie 
 

On May 12, 2018 

 

Jeff's Email <jeff@taoslandandfilm.com> 

To:Rudy Davis 

May 12 at 12:30 PM 

mailto:ruddavis@yahoo.com
http://www.yearofjubile.com./
http://www.taoslandandfilm.com/
http://yearofjubile.com/
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It looks like you’ve already pirated the movie on YouTube. Not too 

happy about your dishonesty. Perhaps I should just show up at your 

house and steal stuff. 

Sincerely 

Jeff Jackson 

Sent from my iPhone 
 

 

On May 12, 2018 

I (Rudy) called Jeff at (575) 770-2685 and told Jeff that I did not appreciate 
being called a thief and that the link on YearOfJubile.com POINTED to a 
youtube video uploaded on a channel named Marty SchoenFeld at 
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=ev02YBXL1u0.    I then went about to 
tell Jeff Jackson that I will __NOT__ being sending Jeff a birthday card and 
that Jeff has been forever removed from my Christmas card list.  Before I  
got around to telling Jeff all of this, Jeff hung up on me.  I then sent the 
following email back to Yorie Von Kahl.  Jeff’s phone # and address are 
publicly available at his website. 

 

Jeff Jackson 

jeff@taoslandandfilm.com 

210 Cavalry Road 

Taos, New Mexico 87571 

(575) 770-2685 

 

 

5/12 Saturday 1:21 pm CST 

From Rudy to Yorie… 

Peace Yorie,  

Jeff and I had a big argument.  Someone (I have no idea who) put the 
video on youtube for free and I simply point to it from yearofjubile.  I do not 
host the video but just POINT to it.   

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=ev02YBXL1u0
mailto:jeff@taoslandandfilm.com
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Anyways,  Jeff sent me the following message back... 

From Jeff Jackson,, 

It looks like you’ve already pirated the movie on YouTube. Not too happy 
about your dishonesty. Perhaps I should just show up at your house and 
steal stuff. 

Sincerely 

Jeff Jackson 

I (Rudy) called Jeff and told him how the cow eats the cabbage.  Suffice it 
to say that I cant get along with Jeff. If he had of been a bit more polite, I 
would have tried to be his biggest promoter. I am sorry Yorie.  I too have a 
temper.  I am sorry and pray the Lord still can work a miracle. 

In Christ Jesus, 

Rudy 

 

At this point, I modified the website YearOfJubile to not point to the Marty 
Schoenfeld youtube video.  I do encourage anyone who has the money to 
watch the movie Death and Taxes to educate yourself about the Gordon 
Kahl story and to write an encouraging letter to both Scott Faul and Yorie 
Von Kahl, both of whom have spent 35 years in prison.  

 

On 5/12 Saturday 1:36 pm  

Yorie, FYI BELOW 

It’s none of my business what Jeff charges for his film but what set me off is 
being called a thief...  Jeff just assumed it was me (Rudy) that put it for free 
on youtube but the channel name is Marty Schoenfeld.  I strongly object to 
being called a thief when I had no idea who Marty Schoenfeld or Jeff 
Jackson are prior to May 12, 2018.   I reached out to Jeff in peace and for 
him to call me a thief was strongly objectionable.   
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http://www.taoslandandfilm.com/independent-films/Death-and-Taxes-
Gordon-Kahl/Gordon-Kahl-chronology-timeline.php 

BUY ONLINE  

Death & Taxes (DVD) 

First time on DVD (113 min) 

$29.95 

Add to Cart 

Death & Taxes (VHS) 

This is a limited edition collector's VHS in the original unbroken packaging. 
(113 min) 

$42.00 

Add to Cart 

Death & Taxes Miniseries (DVD) 

Set of 6 DVD's comprising the complete uncut footage from the 
documentary film project. (783 min) 

$195.00 

Add to Cart 
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