
2026

 BID TABULATION

2026 

CHEMICAL

ATLANTIC 

COAST 

POLYMERS

BRENNTAG 

NORTHEAST, 

INC.

CAP 

Remediation Chemrite

CHEMTRADE 

CHEMICALS US 

LLC

COYNE 

CHEMICAL

SHANNON

CHEMICAL 

CORP. UNIVAR USALCO

$9.93 $9.69

CAUSTIC SODA NO BID $19,860.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19,380.00 NO BID

$36.70 $34.00

LIQUID 

ALUMINUM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39,158.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID $36,278.00

$512.50 $221.00 $236.00 $291.78 $233.00 $233.00

POTASSIUM 

PERMANGANATE NO BID $20,500.00 $8,840.00 $9,440.00 NO BID $11,671.20 NO BID $9,320.00 $9,320.00

$334.00

COPPER 

SULFATE NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,680.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$141.77

CARBON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,835.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$18.30 $16.42

SODIUM HYPO NO BID $22,135.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21,660.00 NO BID

$53.00 $65.34 $53.00

SODIUM BISULFITE NO BID $2,120.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,613.60 NO BID $2,120.00 NO BID

$48.50 $47.52 $44.07 $44.00

FLUORIDE TOTE NO BID $11,640.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11,404.80 $10,576.80 $10,560.00 NO BID

$104.50 $83.55 $87.87

ZINC 

ORTHOPHOSPHATE NO BID NO BID NO BID $18,810.00 NO BID $15,039.00 $23,718.60 NO BID NO BID

$154.00 $155.00 $234.73

SUPERFLOC $12,320.00 $12,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18,778.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID


