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Pope Francis, Jorge Mario Bergoglio died on April 21, 2025, in his 88th Year. He was 
Head of the Roman Catholic Church and the Sovereign, i.e., the ‘King’ of the Vatican 
City State for 12 Years. He was the 1st Pope who was a Jesuit, the 1st from the 
Americas and from the Southern Hemisphere, Argentina. Bergoglio was the 1st born 
and raised outside of Europe since the 8th-Century Syrian Pope Gregory III. The 
Question was asked, who will be his Successor? Do the Malachy Prophecies come into 
play? This is what was being asked in the Days following the Death of the Pope. 
  
There have been many Books written about how the Roman Catholic Church is 
essentially the Successor to the Ancient Babylonian Religious System. And the ‘Spirit of 
Babylon’ is what has still ruled the World. Such Popes are the High Priest of Dagon, the 
Fish God. And at the Core of their Tenets is Luciferianism. Thus, many People would 
correlate the Roman High Priest as being the ‘King of Babylon’. And 1 such Book that 
exposed this Babylonian Connection is entitled, ‘The 2 Babylons’ by Alexander Hislop. 
  
Free PDF Download 
https://archive.org/details/theTwoBabylons/page/n45/mode/2up 

  
It was noted by some People that Francis died on the 8th Day of Passover, April 21, 
which results in a Number Sequence of 88-8. And? The Number 888 is associated with 
Jesus Christ, sometimes specifically as ‘Christ the Redeemer’. This is derived from 
Gematria, a System where Letters have Numerical Values and is used in calculating the 
Numerical Value of Jesus' Name in Greek, for example. It is also seen as a 
Counterpoint to the Number 666, that is associated with the Beast in the Book of 
Revelation, etc. Some Interpretations also link 888 to the Themes of New Beginnings, 
Eternity, and Divine Blessings. Here are a few highlighted Numerical Associations. 
 
- His Papacy was from March 13, 2013 = 4422 Days or ~12 Years. 
 
- His Lifespan was from December 17, 1936 = 32,267 Days or 88 Years, 4 Months, 4 Days. 
 
- April 21, 2025 was the 111th Day of the Year, for all the '11-11' People. 
 
The '888' Number is in reference to being 'The Christ', as that is what the Apostate 
Roman Church asserts and its Papacy is defined by. One would strongly suggest that 
whoever will be picked for the next Pope will be that which will carry through the 
Tribulation Period. And just in Time, as one and many other Bible Students 
surmise/calculate could coincide with the Start of the Tribulation Period. Perhaps. 
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Tower of Babel 
But if the World Stage is being set-up for the coming AntiChrist and the False Prophet, 
then that Time has arrived. Others noted that ‘Pope Francis died 2800 Days after the 7 
Salem Solar Eclipse of August 21, 2017,  which was exactly 400 Weeks (or 10 x 40 
Weeks). And he died 40 Days after the Purim Blood Moon in 2025. So, how is the Pope 
related to the ‘King of Babylon? The Book of Revelation defines this last 7-Year Period 
with ‘Babylon’ and a Religious False Prophet. He is called the 2nd Beast, etc. It has 
been, is and will be the Triangulation of the Spirit that controls World Commerce, 
Religion and Geo-Politics. 
 
And the Head of the Religious Babylon is speculated to be led, precisely by the Roman 
Pope. He will assist in channeling all World Worship during the 70th Week of Daniel or 
the 7-Year Tribulation Period etc. This 1st Beast, the Biblical AntiChrist will be the True 
‘King of Babylon’. This Notion harkens to the Time and Typology of Nimrod. He is 
considered to be the 1st AntiChrist Figure and the 1st Mason, for example. And what 
are the various Theories, Suppositions about what is considered to be Babylon? 
  
Will the actual City of Babylon be rebuilt for the Tribulation as some assert? Is there a 
Spirit of Babylon at all? Remember that Prophecy is multi-layered. For example, one 
can argue that Babylon has already been ‘Rebuilt’. But to what extent? It was Saddam 
Hussein that actually rebuilt a significant portion of the Ancient City called the ‘Gate of 
the Gods’. That is what Babel or Babylon derives its meaning from. However, do realize 
that the original Site of Babel is not the same as where Babylon is now in Iraq. 
 
The Tower of the Bible was at Eridu in Southern Iraq, based on one’s Research. The 
entire Region is all desolate now. If you all want to venture into the ‘Wild Side’ of Ancient 
Mythology and Astro-Archaeology, see this study on the ‘Real Tower of Babel’ below. 
Now, Hussein built his Presidential Palace overlooking the Ancient ‘Pleiades’ Palace of 
King Nebuchadnezzar in Babylon. When Saddam was in Power, there was the Annual 
Babylon International Festival that featured Reenactments and Ancient Pageantry, etc. 
However, there has not been a permanent and thriving Human Habitation there. 
  
ERIDU TOWER OF BABEL 
A Study of the Possible True Location of Nimrod’s Star-Gate 
https://www.fivedoves.com/letters/aug2019/luisv84-1.htm 

 
Then during the U.S. Invasion of Iraq, a U.S. Army Special Base was set-up next to the 
Pleiades Palace of Babylon and digging was going-on at Night. It was reported that 
some significant Archaeological Findings were made. And it had to do with the discovery 
of Gilgamesh’s Tomb, i.e., Nimrod. His Capital City was Uruk and then Eridu. As 
Gilgamesh was a Nephilim, the U.S. Iraqi Invasion was about, as some surmised, 
locating Ancient Lost Star-Gate Technology and extracting the DNA of Gilgamesh, 
allegedly. Here below is one’s Babylon Star Map that is triangulated to the Ancient Ruins 
on Mars, based on Ancient Lost Fallen Angel Civilizations. Judge for yourself. 
 
BABYLON CYDONIA MARS STAR MAP 
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1La0Q7POZG7V3SulZfAaFOMesCgPGnnKC/view?usp=drive_link 

https://www.fivedoves.com/letters/aug2019/luisv84-1.htm
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Which Babylon? 
As to the Topic of Who? or What? is Babylon, one would like to contribute to the List of 
Theories about what ‘Babylon the Great’ means or could in these Last Days. Most, if not 
all End Times Students of the Bible naturally overlook the Sister City of Rome, 
Constantinople. It is the corresponding ‘Leg’ and 5 Toes that makes-up the Eastern 
Roman Empire. One conjectures that the 4th Beast of Nebuchadnezzar’s Statue is still 
‘Alive’. The Easter Roman Empire had just morphed into the Eastern Orthodox Church, 
i.e., the Byzantines, etc. It has been reduced to an Office and Domain just like the 
Vatican. 
 
And presently, it is controlled by Islam in Istanbul. In Ancient Times, even before 
Emperor Constantine went over there to ‘Get out of Rome’, the Crest of the Locale, 
called Byzantium was that of the Star and Crescent. And? It beaconed the Muslims. So, 
it has been the ‘Clay not mixing with the Iron’, on 1 Level of Prophecy. It was named 
after Emperor Constantine, presumably converted to Christianity. This 2nd Roman 
Capital is also situated on 7 Hills like Rome. See Chart for a Graphic Depiction. 
 
CONSTANTINOPLE CYDONIA STAR MAP 
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1WmCygxfJFHb1zgCXaIf_DoGepr-LXQOQ/view?usp=drive_link 

  
One will make the following Observations in light of Where? and When? and Who? 
Regarding Babylon. The AntiChrist’s Origins could be contingent on this ‘Missing Link’ of 
Constantinople in some mysterious way. Perhaps. How so? Is it any wonder why the 
City Layout is called the ‘Horn’? Can GOD have made this Topographical Configuration 
as a Clue to signal just what part of the 4th Beast the ‘Little Horn’ will arise from? And 
one can see the Logic and Rationale why some in the Prophecy Community are 
convinced the AntiChrist will be ‘Muslim’. One does not agree though. 
 
In terms of Geo-Politics, the Roman Empire stretched up to the Border of the Persian 
Empire, i.e., the Parthians. And is not the AntiChrist called the Assyrian? But for sure, 
the Notion of Who? and What? and Where? the 10 Toes of the 4th Iteration of the 
Roman Empire is a Mystery with many Layers. There are at least 5 Iterations that one is 
aware of, as far as interpreting what the Iron not mixing with Clay means. 
 
1- Club of Rome division of the entire Globe into 10 Spheres of Power. 
 
2- Western and Eastern Europe, Geo-Politically. 
 
3- Interjection of ‘Iron’ Nephilim 3rd Strand DNA into Humanity’s Genome ‘Clay’. mRNA. 
 
4- The emerging Tech-A.I.-Technocrats? Kings without Kingdoms. 
 
Many End Times Students of Prophecy see the USA presently fulfilling the Typology of 
some of the Babylon Attributions. Fair enough. Consider how the Underground Reef 
leading-up to New York Harbor is called Babylon. And the Gate to New York is guarded 
by the veiled Baphomet Idol that is a fusion of Apollo and Isis. The French Masons who 
gifted the Statue originally had her lift a Cup. Coincidence?  

https://drive.google.com/file/d/1WmCygxfJFHb1zgCXaIf_DoGepr-LXQOQ/view?usp=drive_link
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Traditions of Men 
But then there are those that totally dismiss that the Vatican is excluded from possibly 
being ‘Babylon’. Really? Well, one can just say that either one has not taken or studied 
Western Civilization 101 to see that precisely, the Vatican was the ‘USA’ of the Middle 
Ages, for example. The Vatican ruled directly through the various Kings and Queens of 
the Royal Houses of Europe. Its Authority, Power and Inquisitions reached all the way to 
the New World in Mexico and Peru, etc. 
 
The Pope had and commanded standing Armies. Its Bishops were wealthy beyond 
belief. And the indulgences, and Debauchery of their Perversions are legendary. 
Through their Confessionals, they formulated 1 of the Greatest Spy Agencies. And with 
all the Money collected from its Parishioners, it created their Banks. Now, presently, the 
Pope and the Vatican rule much if not most of the World. 
 
It is through their local Parishes and Universities, Secret Police, Secret Intelligence 
Agencies, Occult Orders, Politicians and Secret Societies, etc. The case now is that it 
has shrunk down to the mere Vatican, like Constantinople, down to a small Walled City-
State. But they are to rise again. In terms of the Pope’s Claim that the Papacy is the 
Vicar of Christ, or of Jesus Himself? 
  
That Divine Claim is exclusionary and based on its History, does not reflect all that 
Jesus said and did. On the contrary, it has killed Jesus’ Followers. The Roman Church 
that claims to be the Mother Church teaches Heresy, False Doctrine and protects their 
Pedophile Priests. For example, the Roman Catholic Church Tradition is that Jesus’ 
Triumphal Entry was on a Sunday, died on a Friday and was resurrected on a Sunday 
Morning. It changed the Jewish Sabbath from Saturday to a Sunday. 
  
PASSION WEEK 
A Sabbath Triumphal Entry and Resurrection 
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1FgjxxaucEi-fy14S7S0ULLRm0KKllVOQ/view?usp=drive_link 

  
But if anything one can point out of all such High Watch Dates? As it pertains to when 
the Triumphal Entry occurred, what Day of the Week was Jesus crucified and what Day 
He Resurrected? Most Professing Christian defer to the Roman Catholic Historical 
Interpretation and Tradition that one has circumstantially shown is incorrect. 
Nonetheless, one has ventured to direct one’s Attention to how the Spirit of Babylon is 
Alive and Well and will rise to a worldwide Power again. 
  
After the Rapture of the True Church of Jesus, the Usurper King of Babylon, the Nimrod 
Figure that was the King and High Priest of Babylon will rise to assist the Biblical 
AntiChrist, the King of Babylon in funneling all Worship to Lucifer. This is what will 
constitute the 7-Year Tribulation Period. It is when the Final Iteration of the Present 
Roman Empire of Nebuchadnezzar’s Statue will morph into the 2 Feet and 10 Toe 
Confederation. They will then give their Power and Authority to the Little Horn, i.e., the 
Greater Nimrod, and the ‘Great Babylon’. However, all of its Facets will eventually be 
destroyed just before the True King, Jesus returns to Earth to set-up His Rule and 
Dominion. 

https://drive.google.com/file/d/1FgjxxaucEi-fy14S7S0ULLRm0KKllVOQ/view?usp=drive_link
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________________________ 
 
Books 
 
70TH WEEK OF DANIEL 
The purpose of this Book is to provide a Comprehensive Study of the  Political, Social, 
Religious and Biblical Factors demonstrating just how close the End of the Church Age. 
  
Order a Hard Copy on Lulu Publication. 
https://www.lulu.com/shop/luis-vega/daniels-70th-week/paperback/product-
w4vzv5w.html 
  
ANTICHRIST SAVIOR 
This Book examines the case for the Countdown to the coming Apocalyptic New World 
Order that will be tied to Daniel’s 7-Year Sabbatical Cycle of the Terminal Generation. 
  
Order a Hard Copy on Lulu Publication. 
https://www.lulu.com/shop/luis-vega/antichrist-world-savior/paperback/product-
7k99kzq.html?q= 
  
13TH KING OF ISRAEL 
The purpose of this Book is to correlate the first 13 Kings of both the Kingdoms of Judea 
and Israel with that of the 1st 13th ‘Kings’ of  Modern Day Israel in terms of its Prime 
Ministers. 
  
Order a Hard Copy on Lulu Publication. 
https://www.lulu.com/shop/luis-vega/13th-king-of-eretz-israel/paperback/product-
p6ekp9w.html?q= 
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