
 

 

 

 

 

Algester Guardians Netball Club 

REGISTRATION AND FEE PAYMENT POLICY 

 
Algester Guardians Netball Club will ensure all players are registered and financial before 
the commencement of each season. No player with outstanding monies from previous 
seasons will be accepted as a player unless full payment is made. 

 
Before the commencement of each season all players must register via Netball Connect.   

 
The Registration form and payment process must be completed online, prior to the 
commencement of each season (a cut-off date will apply) to allow adequate time for 
processing, grading (where necessary) and team placement. Any registrations received 
after that may be considered after consultation with the Committee. 

 
All fees for the season will be managed by the NetballConnect system via credit/debit card 
upon registration. Where this is not possible due to financial hardship or other exceptional 
circumstances, the player/parent or guardian must contact the Treasurer by emailing 
algester.guardians@gmail.com to request consideration for a payment plan. 

 
Registration fees consist of 3 components: 

 

• Netball QLD — Player insurance 

• Underwood Park Netball Association – court hire etc 

• Algester Guardians — umpires, presentation event, awards, equipment etc 

 
This policy only refers to the Algester Guardians component fees. The other 2 components 
are managed by the relevant entities. 

 
In the event that a player withdraws their registration prior to the player taking the court for 
any reason (this includes grading day, meet and greet or training), a full refund of the 
Algester Guardians component will be processed via the online payment system. Algester 
Guardians will also request a full refund be provided by Underwood Park Netball 
Association and Netball Queensland. 

 
Where a player withdraws their registration after taking the court for any reason (including 
grading day, meet and greet or training), and before fixtures have commenced, no refund is 
applicable for the Netball QLD component as insurance has been initiated.  Underwood 
Park Netball Association refund is at the discretion of Underwood Park Netball Association 
board. 

 
 



Where a player withdraws their registration after fixtures commence, no refund will be 
provided. 
 
As well as a financial commitment to Algester Guardians, each family must be willing to 
complete volunteer duties (canteen, BBQ, set up and pack down duty along with external 
fundraising days organized by Algester Guardians Netball Club) and assist in scoring and 
washing of bibs, when advised by the team manager. If you wish to be excused of these 
duties, you must forward a written application to the Committee, Algester Netball Club, prior 
to the commencement of the season, stating your reason, as to why you should be 
excused. 

 
Training is an important process and Players must have attended at least one training 
session before taking part in a fixtures game. It is the Player’s/Parent’s/Guardian's 
responsibility to inform the Coach/Manager if they are unable to attend training or a game.  


