
Simply Fun Childcare News

Thanksgiving Day -
Monday, October 

11, 2021. All centers 

will be closed.

THANKSGIVING MESSAGE

PARENTS

APPRECIATION EVENT

Dear Families and Staff, I wanted to take a moment to 

wish each and every one of you a very Happy 

Thanksgiving. Time passes by so quickly and this season is 

a reminder to reflect and think of ways we can use our 

talents to give back to someone in need! 

Thank you to all of our Parents 

who were able to make it to the 

Parents Appreciation Event on 

September 16, 2021



HIGHLIGHT FESTIVALS AND 
EVENTS OF THE MONTH

(https://victoriasbestplaces.com/events-
calendar/) 

• Thanksgiving Monday (Stat 
Holiday) – October 11, 2021

• Victoria Marathon – a marathon, 
half marathon and 8K running race 
on the Thanksgiving weekend 
(October 10, 2021). (TBC)

• Halloween – October 31, 2021.

• Public Markets

✓ Moss Street Market – a weekly 
outdoor farmers and artisan 
market from 10 am until 2 pm 
every Saturday at the corner of 
Moss Street and Fairfield Road 
between May and October. (TBC)

✓ Bastion Square Public 
Market – downtown on 
Thursdays, Fridays and 
Saturdays from the end of April 
until the beginning of October 
between 11 am and 5:30. Also a 
larger version on Sundays 
between 11 am and 4 pm. 
(CANCELLED for 2021 due to 
COVID-19.)

✓ Sidney Street Market – a night 
market on Thursday evenings 
from May to October. (TBC)

https://victoriasbestplaces.com/events-calendar/
https://victoriasbestplaces.com/thanksgiving-weekend-victoria-marathon/
https://victoriasbestplaces.com/moss-street-market/
https://victoriasbestplaces.com/bastion-square-market/
https://www.sidneystreetmarket.com/

