


This publication was inspired by God to bring to you some encouragement and 

understanding as we live out our life's on a daily basis.  Sometimes things do get stressful 

and weigh heavy on us.  We would like you to understand these are times of growth 

where we can learn and come into the knowledge of God and fully understand who He is 

as Creator and Father to use all.  We are in no way orphans when it comes to Him.  As 

we fortify our relationship with and in Him we will grown in ways that we may of never 

dreamed of.  It is not our aim with this publication to push any denominations but 

understand Kingdom and Jesus Christ as Lord of us all.  As we continue to discover 

together of the makings and strengthening of His Kingdom and ourselves as contributing 

citizens of the same.  Learning and understanding our purpose within the earth as we do 

our part in bringing the Kingdom forward.  In this we will pray for one another as we 

advance forward in levels in Him.  We speak growth and blessings throughout the year. 

Please share your testimonies with us that others might be blessed and encourage to 

standfast and see the salvation of God as we have learned too by submitting them 

through our Contact Us section on our website www.thetransformu.com  
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The Balancing Act                                                                                          
Evangelist Nate Griffin  

 

To everything there is a season, and a time for every purpose under the heavens 

(Ecclesiastes 3:1). There is a natural balance that has been set in place by God from 

the beginning. When we deviate from that established norm, we encounter turmoil. 

When you eat to satisfy your hunger, all is well. When you overeat, you have trouble. 

When you work to meet your financial goals or obligations, all is well. When you work 

for the sake of working without taking time to recharge, you have trouble. When you 

take medication in proper doses for an illness, all is well. When you overdose, you 

have trouble. I think you get my point! 

Keeping our spirit soul and body in balance on a daily bases, can be difficult. We lose 

sight of following our passion for being blinded by our addiction. We justify our over-

the-top excessive behavior by saying it’s all about the grind. True, we must be persis-

tent and disciplined enough to achieve our goals. But, doing so at the risk of our 

peace of mind or overall health, is not an exchange you want to make. Going into a 

new year, we want to make a concerted effort to take time to… take our time. Yes, 

there are things in our lives that require urgent attention and a strong push. But, taking 

the time to rest, recharge, regroup, refresh, and then return, will ensure we stay fresh, 

vibrant and passionate about what we must tackle. There were times when Jesus, in 

light of the fact that the  

Gospel must be preached, souls must be reached, people needed daily healing, and 

ministry must move forward. Said to his disciples, “Come ye yourself apart into a de-

sert place and rest a while”: for there were many coming and going, and they had no 

leisure so much as to eat.  So, even in a case of urgency and importance, Jesus un-

derstood and sought to teach his disciples the importance of balance.   

Learn to sit still for a short moment, meditate, or just sit still and listen to the sounds 

around you. Give yourself time to catch up, enjoy life, enjoy the moment. Avoid feeling 

the need to fill every moment of your life with activity. Learn the art of quietness. Then, 

when you need to pour on the juice, you’ll not run the risk of burnout or frustration. Re-

member, if you drop dead today, people will mourn your passing tomorrow and fill your 

spot at work and everywhere else the very next day.  

Happy New Year everyone. Soldier On! 





Gaining the Right Perspective                                                            
Dr. C.A. Dangerfield II 

 
What is the real reason behind this pandemic, earthquakes, hurricanes, tornadoes 
and shameful behavior it's a wakeup call to mankind?  Yet mankind still desires to act 
like a unruly and disrespectful child. Not paying attention and having no real 
understanding of what is happening to all of us. This place is called darkness and we 
are falling into a reprobate mindset as a society.  The solution to the whole problem is 
found in the Word of God. Our situations and circumstances could be able to be fix 
but we have failed in reading the manual in order to know and understand what to 
do.  The other problem is everybody's saying nothing but talking loudly, not having 
conversations with real solutions only selfish agendas. The world is so oblivious to 
these situations that we cannot seem to get a clue.  In our streets outside our doors 
man feels the only way to fix a problem is to eliminate it so every morning when you 
get up to get the weather.  You receive the news not that one person died but multiple 
people to violence. Your community comes out for a vital but the next day the story 
repeats itself and now the becomes the new normal and we just become immune and 
it escalates into a deeper womb not a simple cut but a blood gushing womb. 
 
We are so in trench with an overabundance of stuff because of the things and 
behaviors we were warned of it now feeds our personal lust, vanity, envy and 
pride.  Creating an even bigger hole of devastation racing towards us because we are 
so distracted by our own selfishness, we fail in maintaining correct solutions. 
 
We are complacent regarding so many things yet when we have a moment of 
consciousness, we wonder how this could be.  We have chosen the path of 
disobedience for generations and now we are living within the affects and outcomes 
that we decided upon by pass generations.  If they could have actually seen the 
results of their actions now, they surely would have made wiser choices then.  And the 
next will suffer the same or worst if we don't line up with the true principles of God and 
not man's watered-down version that has caused so much mismanagement.  We 
have to own these mistakes even in our so call entertainment there are visual 
warnings but again we are oblivious and don't heed them and go into shock when 
they become a reality. 
 
Even in this country with its many ticks wrote out a document of intent even though 
they were not living it out at the time of its creation.  They prepped Habakkuk 2:2 
which was to be a covenant that God is honoring because so many things then that 
should have been but were not.  Are today because words have power especially 
God's word.  Even though these things play out some still relish in an understanding 
that they have the right and power to inflict more harm and oppression on others.  Not 
understanding that this may be for a season but the reflection in the mirror will reap 
the same fate from another if we do not repent our ways.  The Word of God will 
operate out and do exactly what it says "You will reap that which you sow..." 
 
A few generations back one woman complained about the very thing that offered 
balance in a declining society because of that a panel of nine listened to one and  
 



A few generations back one woman complained about the very thing that offered 
balance in a declining society because of that a panel of nine listened to one and  
have helped to devastate many.  Prayer in school was one key factor to balance and 
provide oneness with God.  That removal accelerates more discord, increased 
violence, metal detectors, have chains on doors to keep certain people out. Guns, 
knives drugs mass shootings, sexual pervasiveness by opening the door to the 
darkness because we refused to maintain light.  So, in the school now we are 
teaching and instilling a very different way of life then how God intend and our society 
is suffering.  Because what should have been the adult authority in room decided it 
was to many rules and walked away from responsibility.  We are living in the outcome 
and reality of that decision.  Every time we’ve given to a wining, pouting and 
disruptive behavior it's like giving the keys to a toddler knowing good and well they 
can't see over the dash board to know where they a going and create a lot of 
mayhem. Just because we want the noise to stop well sometime in order to change 
behavior you have to address the attitude directly.  Thou shalt beat him with the rod, 
and shalt deliver his soul from hell.  Proverbs 23:14 KJV 
Foolishness is bound in the heart of a child; But the rod of correction shall drive it far 
from him. 
Proverbs 22:15 KJV  
Withhold not correction from the child: For if thou beatest him with the rod, he shall 
not die. 
Proverbs 23:13 KJV 
The rod and reproof give wisdom: But a child left to himself bringeth his mother to 
shame. 
Proverbs 29:15 
Some would argue this can be viewed as child abuse.  But to not discipline a child is 
a far greater form of child abuse. They will never recover from their childhood 
because you have aided in destroying their adulthood because of the absence of the 
Godly principles that will keep them in alignment.  It is the parents’ responsibility to 
ensure that these actions take place.  Parents are the first form of educators a child 
has because they have been entrusted to us by God for God.  They are a part of what 
we have been given to manage in the earth.  One day we too will be reviewed on the 
performance of this task. 
 
The appeal and escape from things and times when we fall out of alignment with the 
principles of God which He has placed throughout His Word promises that would 
apply when we comply with obedience. 
But if the wicked will turn from all his sins that he hath committed, and keep all my 
statutes, and do that which is lawful and right, he shall surely live, he shall not die. 
Ezekiel 18:21 KJV 
So, there it is God said it and I believe!  His mercy endures forever! 
 
So, if you are reading this and the spotlight lands on you as it also hit me in a few 
places while I was writing it.  We all have some urgent work and adjustments to be 
made from our mismanagement of what God has entrusted to us. This is His mercy in 
play by allowing us this moment to fix our behavior and reap the benefits of God's  



Word and promise in 2 Chronicles 7:14 by complying to it in its entirety and not only in 

part.  Let's get it done our future depends on our obedience so there is no need to 

look outside at others we first must fix ourselves and bring back balance and 

alignment the way that it is meant to be. 





Life Becomes Difficult When We Lack Balance                              
Dr. C. A. Dangerfield II 

 
Life becomes difficult when we lack balance and most importantly relationship with 
God our Creator.  Because we rapidly become unbalanced in our way of 
understanding and recognizing truth and not giving credit to fictions created by our 
lack of knowledge to create falsehoods. Observation is also not our strong suit when 
lack relationship because we fail to see the nature of God as He demonstrate that 
which He has spoken and shown throughout man's entire existence.  History has 
demonstrated His steps and movements countless times but when the will of man far 
exceeds the principles of God it requires a reality check and a abrupt wake up call to 
bring us back in alignment with the principles of God.  
 
It is the arrogance and disobedience of those whom have been given grace to lead 
who fail to keep their alignment with God in complete balance in order not to lead 
astray those to whom he has entrusted to their hands.  Having the understanding of 
the instructions given "In all thy ways acknowledge Him and He shall direct your 
path." Comprehension of the truth creates the necessary balance for our journey 
throughout life to eliminate pitfalls in darkness (ignorance) because we have the 
sense and where with all to turn on the light (knowledge that is obtained through His 
Word).  "My Word is a lamp unto your feet and a light unto your pathway."   
 
To gain the appropriate wisdom one has to study without excuses.  For when we do 
so we are understanding that which is spoken through His Word in regards to "The 
blind leading the blind they both wind up in the ditch” Every misstep we align 
ourselves with proves over and over this fact independently or collectively we 
manifest the outcomes we eventually experience.  Denial of our wrong doing just 
keeps adding insults and prolonged our healing because pride and humility are on 
different sides of scale. If not properly balanced each will render a very defined 
outcome of destruction for disobedience to God's law or opportunity rendered for 
obedience to His Word. 
 
 This comes down to our individual decision and choice. Creator or creation who do 
we recognize and trust based on this fact and one choice.  Adam's way or Jesus’ 
way?  That's pretty cut and dry and to the point.  If you don't know how to answer the 
question then you have to study without excuses to make the decision.  One truly 
offers an opportunity for a new beginning.  
 
As we are approaching the threshold to see a New Year.  Ask yourself if it is your 
desire to walk across or continue stumbling across rather than get your balance in 
order to see a clear path?  Your action toward this question will most definitely 
demonstrate your outcome and truly highlight your demeanor and character going 
forward.  Those paying attention will choice to stay clear of your choice for a 
destructive path, but through grace will render prayers that the scale that blind you 
would somehow be remove affording you a second chance to make the right 
decision.  Where you humble yourself at the feet of Jesus and put pride aside.  There 
is no other way!  One way only! 





535 to 1                                                                                             
Dr. C. A. Dangerfield II 

 

Well, it's really time for a serious reality check. Our government is so distracted calling 

out colors like the crips and bloods and acting like some production spinoff of 

Westside Story where there is a tragic end. As we snowball down the hill because 

everyone is talking and no one is paying attention to the destructive path that has 

historically destroyed previous civilizations because they operated in the same 

behavior of lost focus, arrogance, selfishness and side deals which were for personal 

gains and not the people they were entrusted to serve.  Trying to severe every 

connection to the one constant truth that will right this pathway.  Every time it looks as 

though there is a glimmer of hope someone wants to reintroduce oppression as 

though it's some great path in life.  Are we that ignorant that we sign on and endorse 

the very things that go against the very principles of God as if we know more than the 

Creator?  Everything that the Word says thou shall not we push agendas to do as if 

there is some compromise in place that gives mankind the authority to do so.  All of 

our problems stem from our disobedience and destructive nature. It is what is, we 

have mismanagement so many things that we even lost the ability to become 

somewhat humble.   

We've failed at two simple rules "Love the Lord thy with all thy heart and mind and 

love your neighbor as thyself."  With these two principles we have cut ourselves off to 

the point of a gushy womb that a band aid or tunic cannot fix, it requires a complete 

operation with full participation to close up the womb before it becomes totally 

infected.  Gangrene is really trying to set in.  We need a strong astringent to clean the 

womb and it has to be administered in each house, each nation the Word of God not 

a partial dosage but full strength following the prescription to the letter.  "If my people 

which are called by my name would HUMBLE THEMSELVES and pray seek my face 

and TURN FROM THEIR WICKED WAYS then I WILL hear from heaven and HEAL 

their land.  This is a prescription with a definitive promise.  Not a might or maybe but 

an actual guarantee.  The solution to the effects to which we have caused by our 

disobedient nature. P535 people making a lot of noise flexing colors without 

resolutions or merit misguided from the real truth and misaligned  

vs one, the one, I AM that I AM, The first and the last, the beginning and the end. I AM 
the way the truth and the light 





 What is the lesson Lord you are teaching me today?                      
Dr. C. A. Dangerfield II 

I used to complain about life situations until while listen to a message my Pastor was 
given to deliver to the church which gave me a new perspective and totally different 
outlook on life.  Yes, some circumstances we bring upon ourselves due to our 
disobedient behavior to the principles of God.  While other maybe because God has 
decided to grow our perception of who He truly is and expand our level of faith and 
increasing our trust as a child does a parent until demonstrated otherwise and we 
learn to refrain. 
 
I found that through my faith and trust level that God saw fit to show favor towards me 
and enlarged my territory of responsibility to which He was confident that I could 
handle that would not cause me to go astray because He understood that I had to 
recognize my true source in everything that takes place in my life and I have become 
mature within our relationship.  
 
The circumstances to which I may face at times I will refer to them as test as Job 
came to understand.  Having the ability to hold on to God even in the extreme of 
circumstances even when others press you to give up.  Powering through because 
even in any situation victory was purchased at the cross for us to become a notable 
witness for God throughout our lives so we are able to reflect to others what we have 
come to understand firsthand. 
 
So, my prayer each day is Lord what is my lesson for Today?  What will I be able to 
walk away from with a greater understanding of your true power and might?  Even 
when it appears that there may be no way out but through patience and persistence 
He always comes through on time.  I walk away cherishing our relationship more 
because He allows me to prevail over mankind.  Even when I have been found to be 
misaligned with Him, he shows mercy and provides grace with a new understanding 
that I might not trespass again. This is how I have grown in maturity not on my own 
accord but solely through Him.  That is what opens the door to making life meaningful 
with this incredible relationship with the Father because we understand how nurturing 
He is also as it should be because we choose to mirror Him.  Take some time to study 
His Word that demonstrates His principles and reflect back on them as they have 
made appearances throughout your life so you never forget the wonders of His love 
as it appears to you.  Then as you worship Him that experience becomes more 
meaning and intense and then you will have a greater understanding to why David 
danced and not some watered downed misguided understanding.  It is through our 
personal experiences that we render higher praise and become effective witness 
because we know what we know it's personal. We can't fake truth it will always stand 
no matter what. That's why the Word of God proclaims "Oh taste and see that the 
Lord is good..." Because of that we have the understanding that "No weapon that is 
formed against thee shall prosper; and every tongue that shall rise against thee in 
judgment thou shalt condemn. This is the heritage of the servants of the LORD, and 
their righteousness is of me, saith the LORD." Isaiah 54:17 KJV.  Mediate on Him and 
allow the Holt Spirit to work in you.  You have nothing to lose but rather a whole lot 
more to gain when you trust in Him! 







Silence is not Golden                                                                           
Dr. C. A. Dangerfield II 

 

The saying "Silence is Golden" is definitely not true.  When you hear the reasons 
behind why some people throughout life have gotten in trouble aside from the one 
major issue based on where they are discriminated against is the number one factor 
and that a totally different problem where accountable will arise when those who had 
a hand in that stand before God.  
 
For those other who speak about their childhood that is also significant because of the 
lack of structure and the lack of guidance which has a child stumbling through life in 
darkness.  Darkness in this case meaning ignorance, the lack of knowledge.  The sad 
truth of the matter it has snowballed recklessly endangering everyone in its path from 
generation to generation until someone recognizes it then bravely and caringly insert 
themselves in its path to try and stop the destruction and devastation before it claims 
another generation because they can't stand being a gossiping do nothing spectator 
only giving their unmerited opinion during the evening or morning news.  Clearly 
because they understand that is not enough to fix the issues.  Mankind's hands off 
and pass the buck approach proves not to be working.  Beside that our disobedience 
in not adhering to core principles of God has us directly in the place we find society 
today.  Not paying attention to history and its outcome has us clearly walking in 
ignorance towards an even greater fate.  
 
Even within this spend of time we hear ridiculous slogans and misguided 
understandings and desires which have not been well thought out or come from a 
selfish nature or mindset lost in complacency because we are failing to see the true 
conditions around us. What pleasure or comfort derives from administering repeated 
oppression on people when you have the power to change the behavior and/or 
remove it.  Why is going back to this sort of behavior viewed as normal or a time of 
greatness.  Clearly this is a very narrow sighted way of thinking and a misguided 
reality to the actual truth of the matters which are at hand.   
 
A much-needed reality check which requires some to step outside of the box of 
comfort and get a taste and understanding of the real existence as it is from a different 
vantage point to see the real truth.  Because you have been sheltered too long and a 
much-needed intellectual stimulation of understanding is in fact needed.  Rose tinted 
lenses has in fact provided a view in color of being in a pleasant environment, when in 
reality if removed when illustrate the cold hard truth.  Which is not having the ability to 
retreat anywhere no time soon.  But to remain to force us to wake up to reality which 
will eventually visit those who try hard to ignore it.  So, it's better now rather than to 
prolong it to be later.  But a taste of reality will come to visit us all.  Then we will have 
the scares of complacency to remind us of our part.  When I could I wouldn't and now 
I want to and I can't. 
 
We must become the generation of action and not the repeated spectators of regret  



from the past.  We are all accountable for what we continue to let go as if individuals 

have more power than God.  The Bible speaks to doing our first works over again.   

Gods grace and mercy continues to open doors of opportunity for change but it is 

the lack of faith that doesn't permit most to venture in.  Simply due to a weak 

relationship with God and not having the ability to understand His nature or His 

purpose for each one of us.   

We all need to know Him on an intimate level which creates the greatest trust level 

we will experience with anyone and we will see true truth when we get there.  It is at 

that point that His word takes hold and you literally walk in Him and His words do not 

come back void. Just one step towards Him is all it takes.  He will balance out 

everything in your life from that one step.  As you make that one step towards Him 

shut off all outside distractions because this is your individual opportunity and you 

can see everyone and everything later. Just focus on the one step and enter in to 

the new room made especially for you.  It doesn't require you to bring anything but 

yourself because it's brand new.   

God our provider will fill it with everything you need. Just respond to the invitation 

with the one step.  Can't you hear the call right now? Every day we are blessed to 

awaken is an opportunity for a new beginning.  Experience the awakening and see 

what happens and embrace the opportunity and the new beginning. It's all good and 

it's all God! Your relationship with God will be proof all by itself!  

No outside noises will change this fact. Go ahead and experience it for yourself.  For 

those who got distracted His grace and mercy has created a pathway back to Him 

on your behalf.  He would that no one would perish it's that same one step in the 

right direction.  He is a loving father who uses every means to get our attention and 

our focus back on being obedient.  Even in our disobedience we wreck the car so to 

speak your life is worth more than that mere object and if losing it draws you back to 

the true comfort found in Him than so be it. The wakeup call was worth it He has 

your attention. 





Individual Power and Responsibility                                                 
Dr. C. A. Dangerfield II 

 

Let us keep it real.  The term or phrase of "Individual Power and Responsibility" right 
phrase for now but we have to apply it to the correct reason.  We have to put our 
understanding and reasoning above and over everything that the worldwide 
leadership is focused on and look at the one key fact that has to be addressed and 
that is our Individual Power and Responsibility to align ourselves with the principles 
of God.  When the Word of God is factual with what has to be done to fix all 
issue.  The created has become oblivious to the fact that the creator is still present 
and His principles are what truly set the tone of what happens in the earth.  We are 
proving the Word of God daily with regards to what the scriptures have already 
proclaimed.  1 Corinthians the very first chapter lays out exactly what we are doing 
today in and out of the church yet mankind continues to push his own agenda as 
though he possesses the remedy to that which is hindering mankind on every level. 
In this passage of scriptures, it is proclaimed "but God hath chosen the foolish things 
of the world to confound the wise; and God hath chosen the weak things of the world 
to confound the things which are mighty...1 Corinthians 1:27 KJV. You can read the 
same thing in any version of Word of God it states the same sentiment of what is 
wrong with mankind.   
 
Believe it or not we are currently in a place of judgement.  Just like a parent should 
be with their child.  We have to do what is necessary to change the disobedient 
behavior to bring that child back into alignment with the principles and standards for 
our home, so than it is for mankind with the principles of God. We as the created 
cannot run over or dismiss the authority of God as if His Will does not matter.   
Even in the situations we find ourselves in today the Word of God provides the 
antidote to fix the poisons that have been applied to mankind that we should not 
perish without hope.  Proverbs recognized as the book of wisdom explains within the 
24 Chapter what we should consider even during these time in which we find 
ourselves even after all the things we have already faced.  God always has a way of 
escape even for His children who are diligent in seeking Him for guidance towards 
the right direct so we don't misstep and fall into temptation and make a costly 
decision that can even do harm to a generation. 
 
These things also belong to the wise. It is not good to have respect of persons in 
judgment. Proverbs 24:23 KJV.   
Seek ye the LORD while he may be found, call ye upon him while he is near:  Isaiah 
55:6 KJV 
 
Seek ye the LORD, all ye meek of the earth, which have wrought his judgment; seek 
righteousness, seek meekness: it may be ye shall be hid in the day of the LORD's 
anger. 
Zephaniah 2:3 KJV 
 
The issue is also there are a lot of distractions and misinformation which aid in  



creating an abundance of chaos and confusion leaving an overwhelming number of 

scars mental, spiritual and physical. Simply because even though the answers and 

remedies are available to us, the Word of God provided for mankind is only 

considered as a last result.  Rather than studying as instructed to avoid the constant 

circumstances and situation we find ourselves in daily.  We continue to react to life 

rather that responding in a favorable manner because we haven't done our due 

diligence as we should have.   So, the outcomes are on us due to disobedience and 

the cliques apply to our behavior.  God's promises come with our obedience to His 

Word and His principles and this fact will never change. 





 
Don't Allow Distractions To Rob You Of Your Blessings             

Dr. C. A. Dangerfield II 
 
 
God is the creator of opportunities that can provide much awaited blessing. It's when 
we fail to realize what God is doing or has done that the enemy can come in steal it 
right from under us.  Humble yourselves therefore under the mighty hand of God, that 
he may exalt you in due time: casting all your care upon him; for he careth for you. 
Be sober, be vigilant; because your adversary the devil, as a roaring lion, walketh 
about, seeking whom he may devour: 1 Peter 5:6-8 KJV 
 
In our failure to keep our eye on the prize we are murmuring about the process rather 
than recognizing and understanding in its entirety the impact and outcome present 
within the results. So, in our mismanagement and misalignment with God's planned 
blessing we eliminate ourselves due to our own inability to recognize the hand of God 
and fully misstep away from that which was meant to be a blessing and transform it 
into a curse simply because we yielded residence to the wrong spirit.  
 
Now finding ourselves robbed from our blessing in which we fully opened the door to 
the intruder of our soul.  Unless we are able to get back to a place where we can 
humble ourselves, we will continue to intensifying and attack the innocent because 
we are operating in darkness and have been taken over by a reprobate 
mindset.  Recognizing and getting back to a place of humility is our own and only 
recourse, putting pride aside is our greatest hurdle to understanding our misstep.   
 
Humbling ourself is also our pathway back from the pathway of darkness and 
destructive behavior to which we ourselves have created by entertaining seductive 
spirits and thoughts desiring to work through us with the agenda of robbing your 
blessing.  This is truly why the Word of God instructs us watch as well as pray so the 
we are not caught unaware and fight off sneak attacks. This we will find as a constant 
reoccurrence until we stop being reluctant to the changes God is trying to fulfill in us.  
 
We must yield to God so that we can proclaim with certainty that.  "No weapon that is 
formed against thee shall prosper; and every tongue that shall rise against thee in 
judgment thou shalt condemn. This is the heritage of the servants of the LORD, and 
their righteousness is of me, saith the LORD. Isaiah: 54:17   
We do not want to allow the enemy to use us as weapon against the brethren to 
promote his agenda of divide and conquer. Dismantling the unity of God's people 
from performing the works in which he has ordained for Kingdom building.  Watch 
and prayer for guidance and protect the unity . 










