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ABSTRACT 
This report examines the systemic failures of the U.S. 
Department of Veterans Affairs (VA) and the Veterans 
Benefits Administration (VBA) in adjudicating disability 
claims filed by Gulf War veterans from 1991 through 
the 2020s. Despite the implementation of 
presumptive service connection laws—codified under 
38 U.S.C. §1117 and 38 C.F.R. §3.317—for conditions 
such as chronic fatigue syndrome (CFS), medically 
unexplained chronic multisymptom illnesses (MUCMI), 
and undiagnosed illnesses, veterans were repeatedly 
denied benefits. Drawing on Government 
Accountability Office (GAO) reports, VA Office of 
Inspector General (OIG) findings, court rulings, and 
Congressional investigations, the report outlines 
widespread institutional deficiencies, including failure 
to conduct appropriate medical exams, misapplication 
of statutory presumptions, and the use of “delay and 
deny” tactics.The report highlights how Gulf War 
veterans faced disproportionately high denial rates—
approaching or exceeding 80%—compared to non-
Gulf War claims. Internal VA reviews revealed that 
staff were often untrained or confused about how to 
apply Gulf War Illness protocols. Moreover, decisions 
were frequently grounded in vague psychological 
labels such as somatoform disorder, rather than 
medical evidence or presumptive guidelines. These 
patterns persisted for decades and mirror similar 
historical VA mismanagement seen with Vietnam 
(Agent Orange) and post-9/11 (burn pit) veterans. 
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Systemic Mishandling of Gulf War Veteran Disability Claims 

Background: Gulf War Illness and Presumptive Claims (1991–2020s) 

 
Figure: VA defines three categories of “Gulf War Illness” for disability claims: (1) Undiagnosed 

illness signs or symptoms (e.g. headaches, joint pain, fatigue, sleep disturbances), (2) Medically 

unexplained chronic multisymptom illnesses (MUCMI) such as Chronic Fatigue Syndrome, 

fibromyalgia, or functional gastrointestinal disorders, and (3) Certain infectious diseases 

endemic to the Gulf regioncck-law.com. Ever since veterans returned from the 1990–91 Persian 

Gulf War reporting unexplained chronic ailments, Congress and VA established presumptive 

service connection rules to aid these claims. Starting in 1994, law allowed Gulf War veterans to 

receive disability compensation for chronic undiagnosed or unexplained conditions without 

https://cck-law.com/blog/va-denies-over-80-of-gulf-war-illness-claims-report-finds/#:%7E:text=,Nine%20specific%20infectious%20diseases


needing to prove a specific in-service cause, as long as the symptoms manifested within a 

presumptive period after service. Over time this presumptive period was repeatedly extended 

(now through December 31, 2026 per recent policy) given ongoing illnesses and scientific 

uncertaintymilitarytimes.comva.gov. 

Despite these presumptions intended to help veterans, Gulf War-related claims have historically 

been met with skepticism and confusion. Many veterans also suffer from diagnosed conditions 

common in post-combat populations – such as Post-Traumatic Stress Disorder (PTSD), 

depression or anxiety (MDD/GAD), insomnia, sinusitis/rhinitis from environmental exposures, 

tinnitus from noise, and even obstructive sleep apnea – in addition to or associated with Gulf 

War Illness. The record shows that from the 1990s through the 2020s, the Veterans Affairs (VA) 

and its Veterans Benefits Administration (VBA) often mishandled these disability claims. Patterns 

of failure to properly investigate symptoms, improper denials of service connection, lack of 

medical follow-through, and pervasive “delay and deny” tactics have been documented. Below is 

a detailed examination of these issues, drawing on Government Accountability Office (GAO) 

reports, VA Inspector General inquiries, court rulings, and Congressional investigations. 

Patterns of Mishandling Gulf War Veteran Claims 

Failure to Investigate and Provide Adequate Exams 

One recurring issue has been VA’s failure to fully investigate veterans’ complaints through proper 

medical exams and diagnostics. GAO found that VBA staff often did not order the specialized Gulf 

War medical examinations when warranted. In 2015–2016, VBA’s own internal reviews uncovered 

incorrect claim decisions where staff failed to obtain required medical exams for Gulf War 

illness claims, violating VA’s duty to assist. These missed exams meant veterans were denied 

without a proper medical work-up. Even when exams were conducted, VA medical examiners 

themselves reported challenges in evaluating Gulf War veterans – the broad range of 

https://www.militarytimes.com/veterans/2016/03/15/va-gets-f-for-persian-gulf-war-claims-approvals/#:%7E:text=Currently%2C%20the%20conditions%20must%20appear,circumstance%20or%20cause%20for%20consideration
https://www.va.gov/health-care/health-needs-conditions/health-issues-related-to-service-era/gulf-war/#:%7E:text=The%20PACT%20Act%20expands%20benefit,pits%20and%20other%20toxic%20substances


symptoms made exams difficult, and many examiners were unfamiliar with Gulf War Illness 

protocols. Notably, VA made Gulf War Illness training optional for its examiners, and as of 2017 

only 10% had taken it. GAO concluded that inadequate training left many examiners unprepared 

to identify Gulf War-related conditions, so their reports often failed to provide the medical 

nexus information needed to grant the claim. In short, VA frequently did not follow through 

diagnostically: veterans were either never examined for their Gulf War ailments or examined by 

doctors unfamiliar with the illness, resulting in cursory or misinformed evaluations. 

Furthermore, mental health conditions like PTSD, depression, and anxiety were sometimes 

used as catch-all explanations without investigating physical causes. For example, a 1997 House 

Committee investigation found VA had an “over-reliance on somatoform disorder and PTSD 

as the basis of disability claims” for Gulf War veteranscongress.gov. In practice, VA doctors 

too readily labeled veterans’ unexplained pain, fatigue, and memory issues as “psychological” 

(stress-related or psychosomatic), instead of pursuing diagnostic testing for conditions like chronic 

fatigue syndrome, neurological damage, or other service-related illnesses. This bias toward 

psychological diagnoses meant some veterans were denied or under-rated for physical 

disabilities and told essentially that “nothing [was] wrong” beyond stressdocs.house.gov

docs.house.gov. The failure to properly examine both the physical and mental aspects of Gulf 

War veterans’ health led to incomplete claim development. 

Improper Denials of Service Connection 

Evidence strongly indicates Gulf War veterans’ claims have been denied at abnormally high 

rates, even when presumptive service connection should simplify approval. A GAO analysis 

revealed that from 2010–2015, approval rates for Gulf War Illness claims were about three 

times lower than for all other disability claimscck-law.com. In other words, VA was denying 

the vast majority of Gulf War-related claims. According to GAO and other sources, over 80% of 

https://www.congress.gov/congressional-report/105th-congress/house-report/388/1#:%7E:text=14,personal%20medical%20records%2C%20missing%20toxic
https://docs.house.gov/meetings/VR/VR08/20160223/104497/HHRG-114-VR08-Wstate-HardieA-20160223.pdf#:%7E:text=Illness,PERSIAN%20GULF%20WAR%20VETERANS%20LEGISLATION
https://docs.house.gov/meetings/VR/VR08/20160223/104497/HHRG-114-VR08-Wstate-HardieA-20160223.pdf#:%7E:text=Illness,PERSIAN%20GULF%20WAR%20VETERANS%20LEGISLATION
https://cck-law.com/blog/va-denies-over-80-of-gulf-war-illness-claims-report-finds/#:%7E:text=The%20Department%20of%20Veterans%20Affairs,serious%20shortfalls%20in%20research%20efforts


Gulf War Illness claims have been denied, compared to much lower denial rates for non-Gulf War 

issuescck-law.com. For example, in early FY2015 VA denied nearly 82% of claims for Gulf War 

presumptive conditions (undiagnosed illnesses and chronic multi-symptom illness) – essentially 

only 1 in 5 such claims were approvedmilitarytimes.com. Even a few years prior, the denial rate 

was around 76%, so the trend actually worsened over timemilitarytimes.com. By contrast, 

veterans filing claims for other conditions typically had a significantly higher chance of approval 

(GAO noted the Gulf War claims’ approval rate “three times lower” than normal, implying other 

claims might be around 50–60% approved)cck-law.com. 

These improper denials often stemmed from VA’s misapplication of the law and evidentiary 

standards. Congress had designed Gulf War presumptions to give veterans the benefit of the 

doubt, recognizing that pinpointing a cause for these illnesses was difficult. Yet VA adjudicators 

frequently insisted on definitive proof or diagnoses that were not required. In many denied cases, 

VBA cited lack of a clear nexus or an alternative explanation for symptoms to reject the claim – 

essentially negating the very purpose of the presumptive allowance. The GAO in 2017 observed 

that despite the presumption, VA continued to deny Gulf War claims at high rates “in part, 

because they are not always well understood by VA staff, and veterans sometimes do not 

have the medical records to adequately support their claims.” In other words, poor 

understanding of Gulf War illnesses by claims processors led to legitimate claims being 

dismissed as unproven. 

Missing service records or medical evidence have been a particular point of contention. A 

Congressional report in 1997 highlighted that VA denied many Gulf War vet claims due to absence 

of concrete exposure or medical records, even when the symptoms aligned with Gulf War Illness. 

It noted that if a claim’s denial was “attributable in any way to missing medical records,” that 

was problematic – since the lack of records was often not the veteran’s faultcongress.gov. The 

same report bluntly stated that, at the time, “VA will not compensate the veteran” without 

https://cck-law.com/blog/va-denies-over-80-of-gulf-war-illness-claims-report-finds/#:%7E:text=The%20Department%20of%20Veterans%20Affairs,serious%20shortfalls%20in%20research%20efforts
https://www.militarytimes.com/veterans/2016/03/15/va-gets-f-for-persian-gulf-war-claims-approvals/#:%7E:text=In%20the%20first%20two%20quarters,symptom%20illness%20and%20undiagnosed%20illnesses
https://www.militarytimes.com/veterans/2016/03/15/va-gets-f-for-persian-gulf-war-claims-approvals/#:%7E:text=illnesses
https://cck-law.com/blog/va-denies-over-80-of-gulf-war-illness-claims-report-finds/#:%7E:text=The%20Department%20of%20Veterans%20Affairs,serious%20shortfalls%20in%20research%20efforts
https://www.congress.gov/congressional-report/105th-congress/house-report/388/1#:%7E:text=12,missing%20medical%20records%20should%20be


proof of the toxic exposure, even though such proof was “nearly impossible to obtain” given 

DoD’s poor tracking of exposurescongress.govcongress.gov. This institutional insistence on 

documentation (that often did not exist) led to systemic under-compensation. Thousands of 

Gulf War vets in the 1990s were initially denied because their undiagnosed conditions didn’t 

manifest within the original 2-year window after the war. Although VA later readjudicated those 

claims when the presumptive period was extended, only a few hundred were granted upon 

review – indicating the rest were denied for other reasons (suggesting many denials were not truly 

fixed by the rule change). This reflects a pattern of VA finding any basis to deny service connection 

(be it timing, lack of records, or alternative diagnoses) rather than embracing the generous intent 

of the law. 

Notably, the U.S. Court of Appeals for Veterans Claims (CAVC) and other federal courts have 

repeatedly had to correct VA’s handling of Gulf War claims. In cases like Gutierrez v. Principi, the 

CAVC confirmed that a Gulf War veteran’s lay reports of chronic symptoms could suffice for 

service connection under the undiagnosed illness presumption, even without a specific medical 

nexus, because Congress intended these veterans to be compensated despite medical 

uncertainty. Similarly, the courts have remanded many decisions where the Board of Veterans’ 

Appeals failed to properly apply 38 C.F.R. §3.317 (the Gulf War presumption) or where VA did not 

obtain an adequate medical opinion. The frequency of such remands underscores that improper 

denials were not rare mistakes but part of a systemic problem in adjudication. In fact, VBA 

itself admitted finding confusion and “incorrect claim decisions” in special focused reviews of 

Gulf War denials. Those internal reviews (in 2015–2016) forced retraining of staff, implying that 

many prior denials had been wrongful. 

  

https://www.congress.gov/congressional-report/105th-congress/house-report/388/1#:%7E:text=proper%20medical%20treatment%20and%20fair,Furthermore%2C%20the
https://www.congress.gov/congressional-report/105th-congress/house-report/388/1#:%7E:text=,182


“Delay, Deny, and Hope They Die”: A Culture of Delay and Poor 

Communication 

Gulf War veterans and advocates often describe an unwritten VA strategy to “delay and deny” 

claims until veterans abandon them. While no official policy would ever state this, the institutional 

culture at VA during the 1990s and 2000s certainly discouraged swift resolution of Gulf War 

claims. As noted, VA officials initially were **“entrenched” in the position that nothing was truly 

wrong with Gulf War vets, that it was “all in our heads, just stress”docs.house.gov. This bias 

translated into procedural inertia – claims languished or bounced around on remand. The average 

Gulf War Illness claim took substantially longer to process than other claims. GAO found that 

Gulf War claims took four months longer on average to complete than standard disability 

claims. Many veterans waited years, cycling through appeals, supplemental exams, and re-

adjudications. The 2017 GAO report flagged “longer wait times for Gulf War Illness claims” as 

a serious concern, correlating it with the general misunderstanding and complexity of these cases

cck-law.comcck-law.com. 

Not only were decisions delayed, but when denials finally came, they often failed to clearly 

explain the reasoning. GAO noted that VA’s denial letters for Gulf War claims “do not always 

include key information on why the claim was denied.” Veterans would receive boilerplate 

letters saying their condition was not service connected, without clarification if the denial was due 

to lack of a current diagnosis, insufficient evidence of chronicity, or some other gap. This lack of 

transparency made it harder for veterans to appeal, essentially compounding the denial with 

further delay as vets tried to figure out what evidence was needed. In one instance, a veteran 

might be denied for “no evidence of exposure in service” – a rationale directly at odds with the 

presumptive policy (which doesn’t require proving a specific exposure) – but the veteran might 

not realize that the decision misapplied the law unless they had expert legal help. 

https://docs.house.gov/meetings/VR/VR08/20160223/104497/HHRG-114-VR08-Wstate-HardieA-20160223.pdf#:%7E:text=Illness,PERSIAN%20GULF%20WAR%20VETERANS%20LEGISLATION
https://cck-law.com/blog/va-denies-over-80-of-gulf-war-illness-claims-report-finds/#:%7E:text=Accountability%20Office%20report,serious%20shortfalls%20in%20research%20efforts
https://cck-law.com/blog/va-denies-over-80-of-gulf-war-illness-claims-report-finds/#:%7E:text=The%20report%20also%20found%20longer,serious%20shortfalls%20in%20research%20efforts


Congressional committees took VA to task for these delay tactics. A 105th Congress House report 

was tellingly titled “Gulf War Veterans’ Illnesses: VA, DOD Continue to Resist Strong 

Evidence Linking Toxic Causes to Chronic Health Effects.”congress.gov The use of the word 

“resist” underscores that VA’s posture was perceived as oppositional – more focused on 

defending against claims than helping veterans. That report (based on 11 hearings) concluded 

that VA’s sluggishness in acknowledging toxic exposure effects and its poor data tracking had 

hindered Gulf War vets’ access to care and benefits. It recommended, for example, that no time 

limit should restrict Gulf War presumptive claims because scientific understanding was evolving 

and veterans should not be shut out simply due to an arbitrary deadlinecongress.gov

congress.gov. It also pushed VA to re-examine denied claims in light of new evidence – an effort 

that VA was slow to implement. Indeed, VA’s follow-through on Congressional mandates was often 

delayed or minimal. 

Veteran advocacy groups provided stark testimony on this culture of delay. In 2016, Gulf War 

veteran Anthony Hardie told the House Veterans’ Affairs Committee that even after 25 years, VA’s 

approach to Gulf War illness claims was a “complete contravention” of the intent of Congress, 

with approval odds “approach[ing] the limited odds of winning a scratch-off lottery.”

militarytimes.commilitarytimes.com Hardie stated bluntly: “If we measure VA's success by how it 

has approved Gulf War veterans' claims 25 years after the war, VA has failed most ill and 

suffering Gulf War veterans.”militarytimes.com He and others described how VA dragged its feet 

in responding to Gulf War issues at every turn – from delaying the establishment of a research 

advisory committee (RAC) that Congress had ordered, to failing to implement provisions of laws 

passed in 1998 that were meant to improve processing of Gulf War claimsdocs.house.gov

docs.house.gov. In Hardie’s words, “VA officials fought against implementing these laws, 

dragging their feet and upending their implementation.”docs.house.govdocs.house.gov This 

resulted in years of lost time for veterans awaiting answers. Only after intense pressure and new 

https://www.congress.gov/congressional-report/105th-congress/house-report/388/1#:%7E:text=GULF%20WAR%20VETERANS%27%20ILLNESSES%3A%20VA%2C,CAUSES%20TO%20CHRONIC%20HEALTH%20EFFECTS
https://www.congress.gov/congressional-report/105th-congress/house-report/388/1#:%7E:text=match%20at%20L1359%2013,any%20limitation%20as%20to%20time
https://www.congress.gov/congressional-report/105th-congress/house-report/388/1#:%7E:text=13,any%20limitation%20as%20to%20time
https://www.militarytimes.com/veterans/2016/03/15/va-gets-f-for-persian-gulf-war-claims-approvals/#:%7E:text=The%20low%20approval%20rates%2C%20which,House%20Veterans%27%20Affairs%20subcommittees%20Tuesday
https://www.militarytimes.com/veterans/2016/03/15/va-gets-f-for-persian-gulf-war-claims-approvals/#:%7E:text=The%20low%20approval%20rates%2C%20which,House%20Veterans%27%20Affairs%20subcommittees%20Tuesday
https://www.militarytimes.com/veterans/2016/03/15/va-gets-f-for-persian-gulf-war-claims-approvals/#:%7E:text=,as%20well%20as%20in%20Somalia
https://docs.house.gov/meetings/VR/VR08/20160223/104497/HHRG-114-VR08-Wstate-HardieA-20160223.pdf#:%7E:text=Instead%2C%20we%20learned%20that%20enactment,Many%20of%20the%20exposures%20were
https://docs.house.gov/meetings/VR/VR08/20160223/104497/HHRG-114-VR08-Wstate-HardieA-20160223.pdf#:%7E:text=And%20only%20after%20significant%20pressure,substantially%20diminish%20its%20charter%20and
https://docs.house.gov/meetings/VR/VR08/20160223/104497/HHRG-114-VR08-Wstate-HardieA-20160223.pdf#:%7E:text=Instead%2C%20we%20learned%20that%20enactment,Many%20of%20the%20exposures%20were
https://docs.house.gov/meetings/VR/VR08/20160223/104497/HHRG-114-VR08-Wstate-HardieA-20160223.pdf#:%7E:text=From%20the%20beginning%2C%20VA%20officials,met%20Gulf%20War%20veterans%E2%80%99%20expectations


leadership did VA belatedly take some actions (for instance, finally creating the Gulf War Illness 

RAC years late, and initiating special training after GAO shined a spotlight). 

The “delay and deny” pattern is further evidenced by VA’s historical handling of similar issues in 

other eras. Just as Vietnam veterans in the 1970s and 80s experienced protracted battles to get 

Agent Orange-related conditions recognized, Gulf War vets saw VA officials default to denial and 

deferral. In both cases, it took decades – and external intervention – to shift the approach. By the 

time VA began making earnest improvements (around the mid-2010s), tens of thousands of Gulf 

War veterans had already been denied or discouraged. This institutional inertia and 

defensiveness created a backlog of appeals and remands that itself contributed to delays. In 

essence, the VA’s culture turned the Gulf War presumptive process (which should have been 

straightforward) into an adversarial, drawn-out process akin to a war of attrition against the very 

people it was supposed to help. 

Evidence from Oversight Reports and Legal Proceedings 

The systemic failures outlined above are well-documented in primary sources. Key oversight 

findings and legal judgments include: 

• Government Accountability Office (GAO) Reports: GAO’s 2017 investigation found 

Gulf War Illness claims had extremely low approval rates (~17–20% granted), roughly 

one-third the approval rate of other disability claimscck-law.com. It attributed this to 

VA staff’s poor understanding of Gulf War Illness and inconsistent application of 

examination policies. GAO noted VA had only elective training for examiners (with low 

uptake) and that denial letters lacked sufficient explanations, leaving veterans in the 

dark on how to fix their claims. GAO recommended mandatory training for VA examiners 

on Gulf War claims and clearer communication to veterans. In follow-up testimony in 2020, 

GAO reported that VA had begun implementing training and conducted “consistency 

https://cck-law.com/blog/va-denies-over-80-of-gulf-war-illness-claims-report-finds/#:%7E:text=The%20Department%20of%20Veterans%20Affairs,serious%20shortfalls%20in%20research%20efforts


studies,” but challenges remained—particularly the need to ensure examiners know when 

to request Gulf War evaluations and how to properly identify qualifying conditions. The 

persistence of errors even after 2017 indicates a long-term systemic issue, not just a one-

time lapse. 

• VA Office of Inspector General (OIG) and Internal VA Memos: While a comprehensive 

OIG report specifically on Gulf War claims processing is not cited here, the VA did conduct 

internal “Special Focus Reviews” in 2015 and 2016 due to concerns about high denial 

rates. These reviews (essentially internal audits) corroborated that regional offices were 

inconsistently processing claims and at times making erroneous denials (such as 

failing to order exams or misapplying regulations). The outcome was that VBA initiated 

nationwide re-training for personnel handling Gulf War cases. The need for such remedial 

action across the agency is evidence of systemic problems. (In addition, veterans’ 

advocates have pointed out that OIG has occasionally seemed more interested in 

preventing “overpayments” than ensuring entitled Gulf War veterans were paid – e.g., an 

OIG report reportedly claimed some Gulf War vets might have been over-compensated, a 

notion advocates found troubling given the overwhelming trend of under-compensation.) 

• Congressional Hearings and Reports: The 1998 Special Investigation Unit (SIU) 

Report to the Senate Veterans’ Affairs Committee uncovered that VA’s data on Gulf War 

claims was in disarray, leading to underestimating the number of sick Gulf War vets 

receiving benefits. It forced VA to admit that earlier reports were flawed and that in fact 

over 69,000 Gulf War vets were receiving service-connected compensation (more than 

double what VA originally claimed). This discrepancy suggested that VA had failed to 

accurately track and prioritize Gulf War disability issues in the 1990s. The House 

Government Reform Committee’s 1997–98 investigation went further, concluding VA and 

DoD were “resisting evidence” of chemical exposure effects, and that compensation for 



ill veterans was being minimized by bureaucratic obstaclescongress.govcongress.gov. 

Among its findings were that “compensation ratings for sick veterans are minimized due 

to inadequate records” and by an overemphasis on psychological diagnosescongress.gov. 

It recommended presumptive coverage not be cut off by arbitrary deadlines and that 

missing records should not be used as a basis to deny claimscongress.gov. Decades later, 

in 2016, Congress held joint hearings again because Gulf War denial rates remained 

appallingly high. Veterans like Anthony Hardie and Paul Sullivan testified about VA’s 

“delay, deny” culture, citing that nearly 80% of claims had been denied despite the 

presumptive lawmilitarytimes.commilitarytimes.com. This testimony and accompanying 

data from Veterans for Common Sense (VCS) spurred bipartisan calls to extend the 

presumptive period indefinitely and to hold VA accountable for fully and fairly adjudicating 

these claimsmilitarytimes.commilitarytimes.com. 

• Court Rulings (CAVC and Federal Circuit): While individual court cases do not single-

handedly prove a systemic issue, the pattern of judicial rebukes to VA in Gulf War cases 

is telling. For instance, in Gutierrez v. Principi, 19 Vet. App. 1 (2004), the CAVC reversed 

a Board denial of a Gulf War illness claim, emphasizing that under 38 U.S.C. §1117 and 

§1118 (the Gulf War statutes), a veteran is not required to provide evidence of a nexus for 

an undiagnosed illness – yet VA had denied for lack of medical linkage. The CAVC 

acknowledged the unique nature of Gulf War claims and effectively instructed VA to apply 

the presumptive rules as intended. In Joyner v. McDonald, 766 F.3d 1393 (Fed. Cir. 

2014), the Federal Circuit addressed Gulf War chronic multi-symptom illness, clarifying 

aspects of what constitutes a MUCMI, again correcting VA’s narrow interpretation. More 

recently, Stewart v. Wilkie, 30 Vet. App. 383 (2018) became a precedential decision 

where the CAVC held that a condition with an inconclusive etiology (in that case, migraine 

headaches) could still qualify as a MUCMI presumptive disease – pushing back on VA’s 

https://www.congress.gov/congressional-report/105th-congress/house-report/388/1#:%7E:text=GULF%20WAR%20VETERANS%27%20ILLNESSES%3A%20VA%2C,CAUSES%20TO%20CHRONIC%20HEALTH%20EFFECTS
https://www.congress.gov/congressional-report/105th-congress/house-report/388/1#:%7E:text=Compensation
https://www.congress.gov/congressional-report/105th-congress/house-report/388/1#:%7E:text=Compensation
https://www.congress.gov/congressional-report/105th-congress/house-report/388/1#:%7E:text=12,missing%20medical%20records%20should%20be
https://www.militarytimes.com/veterans/2016/03/15/va-gets-f-for-persian-gulf-war-claims-approvals/#:%7E:text=In%20the%20first%20two%20quarters,symptom%20illness%20and%20undiagnosed%20illnesses
https://www.militarytimes.com/veterans/2016/03/15/va-gets-f-for-persian-gulf-war-claims-approvals/#:%7E:text=The%20low%20approval%20rates%2C%20which,House%20Veterans%27%20Affairs%20subcommittees%20Tuesday
https://www.militarytimes.com/veterans/2016/03/15/va-gets-f-for-persian-gulf-war-claims-approvals/#:%7E:text=off%20lottery%2C,House%20Veterans%27%20Affairs%20subcommittees%20Tuesday
https://www.militarytimes.com/veterans/2016/03/15/va-gets-f-for-persian-gulf-war-claims-approvals/#:%7E:text=Citing%20a%20recent%20report%20from,five%20years%20if%20not%20indefinitely


attempt to exclude certain diagnosed illnesses from the presumptive benefit. Each of these 

cases highlights VA’s tendency to err on the side of denial until forced to change by the 

courts. The frequency of remands in Gulf War cases (for VA to obtain adequate medical 

opinions or consider favorable medical literature) suggests a systemic pattern of 

inadequate development and premature denial at the agency level. Importantly for 

CUE (Clear and Unmistakable Error) considerations, these issues show that VA often 

misapplied laws or ignored evidence in a way that was later deemed erroneous – precisely 

the scenario CUE is meant to address, if it can be shown in an individual case. 

Parallels with Vietnam and Post-9/11 Veteran Claims  

(Precedent and Reform) 

The plight of Gulf War veterans does not stand alone; it echoes patterns from earlier and later 

generations of veterans, underscoring an institutional learning curve that was, at times, tragically 

slow. During the Vietnam era, veterans exposed to Agent Orange herbicides faced years of denial 

as VA insisted there was “no proof” that their ailments (like cancers, Type II diabetes, etc.) were 

service-related. It wasn’t until Congress passed the Agent Orange Act of 1991 – and continually 

pressed via the NAS (National Academy of Sciences) updates – that VA grudgingly established 

presumptive service connection for a list of diseases. Even then, VA often waited for overwhelming 

scientific consensus before adding new conditions. For example, only in 2010 did VA add ischemic 

heart disease and Parkinson’s as Agent Orange presumptives, and only in 2021 (after an 

IOM/NAS report and legislative pressure) did VA acknowledge others like bladder cancer and 

hypothyroidismmilitarytimes.com. This shows a pattern: institutional reluctance to concede 

causation until forced by Congress or external science – a pattern paralleled in Gulf War Illness. 

In the 1990s, VA similarly resisted acknowledging that low-level chemical exposures, oil well fire 

https://www.militarytimes.com/veterans/2016/03/15/va-gets-f-for-persian-gulf-war-claims-approvals/#:%7E:text=Citing%20a%20recent%20report%20from,five%20years%20if%20not%20indefinitely


smoke, pesticides, or other Gulf toxins could cause lasting illness, much as it had once resisted 

linking Agent Orange to Vietnam vets’ diseasescongress.govcongress.gov. 

Likewise, after 2001, a new generation of veterans from Iraq and Afghanistan began reporting 

respiratory conditions, rare cancers, and other health issues linked to burn pits and 

environmental hazards. Initially, these post-9/11 veterans encountered the same skepticism and 

slow movement from VA. For years, VA maintained there wasn’t enough evidence to grant many 

burn pit-related claims, often denying service connection for conditions like constrictive 

bronchiolitis, sinusitis, or reactive airway disease, saying “not enough research” or pointing to 

other risk factors. Veterans feared a repeat of the Gulf War experience – or Vietnam – and indeed 

many post-9/11 vets languished with denied claims for ill-defined conditions. It took a 

groundswell of advocacy, media attention, and legislative action to change course. Lawmakers 

explicitly cited the Gulf War and Agent Orange lessons, saying they did not want “another Agent 

Orange” or “another Gulf War Syndrome” delay for the Iraq/Afghanistan vets. This culminated in 

the landmark PACT Act of 2022 (Promise to Address Comprehensive Toxics Act), which greatly 

expanded presumptive benefits for toxic exposures. The PACT Act added presumptive 

service connection for a list of respiratory illnesses and cancers associated with burn pits and 

other deployments, and crucially, it extended the Gulf War Illness presumptive period to 

December 31, 2026 (with authority to extend further)va.gov. The fact that Congress intervened 

in 2022 with such a sweeping law is itself evidence that the previous culture of “delay and deny” 

was untenable. Lawmakers referenced how delays in recognizing Gulf War and Vietnam toxic 

injuries left veterans suffering for decades, and they explicitly sought to prevent the same for 

post-9/11 vetsmilitarytimes.com. In committee hearings on the PACT Act, many drew parallels to 

the Gulf War experience – noting that only with persistent advocacy did VA slowly improve Gulf 

War claim approvals, and even then many vets were still waiting or had given up. 
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The PACT Act’s passage suggests that institutional inertia at VA was overcome by external 

mandate, much as it was by the 1994 and 1998 Gulf War laws and the 1991 Agent Orange Act. 

It reflects a recognition that the “culture” needed to change. Indeed, VA Secretary Denis 

McDonough acknowledged in 2022 that the approach to toxic exposure claims needed reform, 

effectively conceding that veterans had not been well-served by previous policies. VA is now 

launching initiatives to re-examine past denied toxic exposure claims (including Gulf War claims) 

under new, more liberal rules – an effort that implicitly admits that many past denials may have 

been erroneous or unjust under today’s standards. 

Conclusion and Implications for a CUE Claim 

The body of evidence – GAO audits, Congressional investigations, advocacy testimony, and 

judicial decisions – converges on a clear conclusion: the VA/VBA’s handling of Gulf War 

veterans’ disability claims between 1991 and the 2020s was marred by systemic failure and 

institutional negligence. There was an unwritten but very palpable policy of delay and denial, 

rooted in skepticism of veterans’ claims and a bureaucratic demand for definitive proof even when 

the law did not require it. This resulted in Gulf War veterans facing disproportionately high denial 

rates, inadequate medical evaluation, and protracted battles to establish service connection for 

legitimate conditions (ranging from PTSD and other mental health issues to chronic multi-

symptom illnesses like CFS, and even straightforward diagnoses like sinusitis or sleep apnea that 

had plausible service links). The culture of denial not only harmed Gulf War veterans but also 

set a troubling precedent that, to some extent, repeated with newer cohorts – a pattern Congress 

aimed to break with the PACT Act. 

For a veteran now pursuing a claim or an appeal (or even a Clear and Unmistakable Error 

(CUE) motion on a past decision), these findings are powerful supporting evidence. They 

demonstrate that an individual denial from, say, 1997 or 2005 was likely not an isolated fair 



judgment on the merits, but quite possibly a product of the systemic problems outlined above. 

For instance, if a Gulf War veteran’s PTSD or chronic fatigue claim was denied in 1997 due to “no 

proof of nexus” or attributed to a personality disorder, one could argue that decision ignored the 

prevailing law or mischaracterized the condition – an unmistakable error given the context that 

even Congress and GAO found widespread misapplication of the rulescongress.gov. A CUE claim 

must show that the correct facts or laws were not applied at the time of the decision. Here, one 

could cite the 1997 House Report or VA’s own 1995–1998 policy changes to show that VA 

adjudicators at the time should have known to consider Gulf War presumptives (38 C.F.R. 

§3.317) or should not have required direct evidence of causationcongress.gov. The “failure to 

properly investigate” (e.g., not ordering a Gulf War exam or not obtaining a medical opinion 

before denying) can be framed as a violation of the duty to assist or even CUE if regulations 

mandated such development. Moreover, the pattern of “over-reliance on PTSD/somatoform” 

diagnosescongress.gov can support an argument that a rating board in the 1990s clearly erred 

by labeling a condition as somatic without evidence, thereby improperly denying service 

connection for physical disability. 

In preparing a legal brief, one can draw direct lines between this evidence and the case at hand. 

For example: “During the period of the veteran’s claim, VA was denying over 80% of Gulf War-

related claims – a rate three times higher than other claims – despite Congressional presumptions 

in placecck-law.com. The GAO concluded this was due to VA’s failure to understand Gulf War 

illnesses and to obtain necessary exams. In the veteran’s case, the 2001 Rating Decision denied 

service connection for chronic fatigue syndrome citing ‘no confirmed diagnosis and no link to 

service,’ even though chronic fatigue is a presumptive Gulf War condition. This denial fits the 

documented pattern of error – VA ignored the Gulf War presumption (38 U.S.C. 1117) and failed 

to schedule a Gulf War protocol exam, an omission identified as common and improper by VA’s 

own 2016 internal review. Therefore, the decision was clearly and unmistakably erroneous in 
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applying the law.” By embedding such citations and facts, the veteran’s counsel can compellingly 

argue that the case is not just a one-off miss, but part of a recognized systematic failure that 

the Board/Court should remedy. 

In sum, the systemic mishandling of Gulf War vets’ disability claims is well-established by official 

records. VA’s pattern of delay and denial – from failing to gather evidence, to reflexively denying 

poorly understood conditions, to communicating decisions inadequately – prompted decades of 

scrutiny and eventually legislative reform (the PACT Act). This context can and should be used to 

support appeals and CUE motions for Gulf War veterans. It demonstrates that many denials were 

not truly based on the merits or the state of medical science, but on institutional resistance. 

Therefore, decision-makers reviewing these cases today have both the facts and the moral 

imperative to correct past errors, in line with the principle that veterans’ benefits law is to be 

interpreted liberally in favor of those who served. The evidence presented here provides a strong 

foundation for such corrective actioncck-law.commilitarytimes.com, helping ensure that Gulf War 

veterans receive the fair treatment and benefits they earned through their service. 

Sources: 

• Government Accountability Office (GAO) reports on Gulf War Illness claims processing

cck-law.com 

• Department of Veterans Affairs internal reviews and training memoranda 

• U.S. Senate and House Committee reports on Gulf War veterans’ illnesses (1997–1998)

congress.govcongress.govcongress.gov 

• Congressional hearing testimony from veteran advocates (Anthony Hardie, etc.)

docs.house.govdocs.house.govmilitarytimes.com 
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• Court rulings: Gutierrez v. Principi (CAVC 2004), Stewart v. Wilkie (CAVC 2018), etc., as 

discussed in context. 

• VA public statements and fact sheets on presumptive policy (e.g., PACT Act information)

va.gov 
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