

hours billed by the Receiver Team during the Third Fee Period averages 9.19 hours per business day (not including federal holidays), and expressed concern that the average was excessive. However, it may not be clear to the investor that during the Third Fee Period the Receiver enlisted the help of as many as 11, but often 6, additional professionals and support staff members (some with fees as low as \$125-\$150 per hour). While the Receiver has worked hard to avoid duplication of efforts, many tasks require the coordination and help of multiple people, and the total hours billed by the Receiver and 6 additional professionals and support staff members averages as little as 1.3 hours per business day per person. Furthermore, in the early portion of the fee period covered by the Third Fee Application (“Third Fee Period”), the Receivership was still in its initial stages and required more activity than later months of the Third Fee Period. As highlighted in the Third Fee Application, there has been a steady decline in the level of attention necessary to maintain the Estate and coordinate with domestic and foreign regulators and law enforcement authorities. *See* Third Fee Application ¶¶ 16, 20.

The Complaint also highlights a perceived discrepancy in the 307.3 hours billed by “paralegals and other support staff,” as stated in the Third Fee Application, and the 774.7 total hours reflected in the invoices of the Receiver’s retained professionals (attached hereto as **Exhibit B**). That “discrepancy” is due to the fact that the two numbers are actually different figures. The invoices reflect the hours billed by all retained professionals in addition to “paralegals and other support staff,” and separately denote each person’s total hours. However, the Receiver manually separated 307.3, the number of hours billed by only paralegals and support staff, to show that nearly 40% of work was delegated to staff with lower rates. *Id.* at ¶ 18.

The investor also pointed out that as of May 7, 2013, there was \$11,557.21 less in the Estate's bank account than would be expected given the amount recovered and the amounts requested in the Receiver's first and second fee applications. That amount represents a small amount of wire transfer fees, offset by nearly \$800 in interest earned, and \$12,326.98 in outstanding expenses due to vendors which were paid during the months of February and March.¹ During the Third Fee Period the Receiver approached the Court regarding outstanding amounts due to vendors, and was advised that it was within his discretion to pay vendors or file a fee application. As the amounts became due well in advance of the date the Receiver planned to file a fee application, the Receiver chose to pay vendors at that time.

Finally, the Complaint expresses opposition to the Receiver's "hourly average rate of 584.66/hr," and compares the rate to the median hourly rate published by the State Bar of Texas in 2011 of \$238 per hour.² The rate published by the State Bar of Texas averages the rates of attorneys of all practice areas and levels of experience, and does not take into account the specialized skill set and experience required to successfully manage a receivership of this complexity. The Receiver's fee applications each detail the "Johnson" factors, which are used by the Fifth Circuit to determine whether the time spent, services performed, expenses incurred, and hourly rates charged by an attorney are reasonable and necessary. *See* Receiver's Unopposed Motion for Approval of First Interim Fee Application and Brief in Support pp. 7-10 ("First Fee Application") [Docket #30]; *see also* Receiver's Unopposed Motion for Approval of

¹ The amounts paid to vendors are as follows:

\$2,575.00 (2/21) to Padgett, Stratemann & Co., LLP for tax accounting services;
\$557.49 (2/25) to Flashback Data for collection and recovery of Defendants' electronically stored information;
\$34.42 (2/26) to DigATX for document management services;
\$8,792.00 (3/07) to TCS Forensics for computer forensics services; and
\$368.07 (3/07) to TCS Forensics for shipping charges.

² The survey referenced in the Complaint is available at State Bar of Texas Department of Research and Analysis, *2011 Hourly Fact Sheet*, http://www.texasbar.com/AM/Template.cfm?Section=Demographic_and_Economic_Trends&Template=/CM/ContentDisplay.cfm&ContentID=20499 (last visited July 29, 2013).

Second Interim Fee Application and Brief in Support ¶¶ 15 (“Second Fee Application”) [Docket #52]; *see also* Third Fee Application ¶ 12. Those factors include the novelty and complication of the issues, the skill required to properly litigate the issues, whether the circumstances imposed time limitations, and the experience, reputation, and ability of the attorney. The Receivership involves unique issues of a primarily international nature, and has required the expertise of an attorney experienced in administering and litigating the issues implicated by an international fraudulent scheme. The Receiver has over 25 years of experience representing receivers including those appointed by the Securities Exchange Commission, the Federal Deposit Insurance Company, the Federal Savings and Loan Insurance Corporation, the Resolution Trust Corporation, and special deputy receivers for insolvent insurers. Furthermore, both the Receiver and a senior associate who devoted significant time in the Receivership’s early months are Certified Public Accountants. The special skill set of the Receiver and members of his team enabled the team to review and trace financial records internally, saving the Estate the significant expense of hiring a forensic accounting firm.

The “Johnson” factors also take into account the amounts involved and results obtained by the Receiver and attorneys. Within days of his appointment, the Receiver and his attorneys contacted a Defendant’s former counsel and were able to obtain voluminous amounts of documents including financial records and Skype transcripts between the Defendant and other individuals of interest. The Receiver believes that those documents, obtained through his quick action and with the help of his attorneys, were of significant assistance to regulatory authorities who ultimately secured approximately \$25 million in Europe. Accordingly, the Receiver believes that the percentage of fees requested thus far should be analyzed as a percentage of the \$25 million secured in Europe as well as the \$1.4 million secured by the Receiver in the United

States. According to that calculation, and subtracting expenses, the total requested fees of the Receiver and his team represent a mere 2.17 percent of amounts recovered and attributable to the Receiver's efforts. Furthermore, the Skype transcripts obtained by the Receiver from the aforementioned Defendant's former counsel directly led the Receiver to his \$712,000 settlement with John Doe. That settlement represented a recovery of 95 cents on the dollar, and was a particularly impressive accomplishment because John Doe is not a United States citizen and does not own property in the United States.

The Receiver is confident that his efforts have contributed substantially to the amounts recovered for the benefit of the ProphetMax Receivership Estate, and he will continue to work diligently and efficiently to obtain the highest possible net recovery for investors. The Receiver encourages investors to continue communicating with his team about this and other issues. He has spoken to many of the investors personally by telephone and email, and will continue to use the Receivership website and Facebook page for the Estate as his primary method of communication. The Receiver will also file a second status report with the Court in October, and at the Court's request will personally email or mail the report to investors in his database. Until then the Receiver will continue to update investors with significant developments as often as possible.

EXHIBIT A

United States District Court
For the Western District of Texas
Austin Division

Civil Action No. A-12-CV-0862-LY

UNITED STATES COMMODITY
FUTURES TRADING COMMISSION,
PLAINTIFF

V.
SEKEN POUSA,
INVESTMENT INTELLIGENCE CORPORATION
D/B/A PROPHETMAX MANAGED FX,
JOEL FRIANT, ELEVATION GROUP, INC.
AND MICHAEL DILLARD,
DEFENDANTS

I, Rosemary Vargas, an aggrieved investor of the ProphetMax scheme, hereby oppose the Receiver's Motion for Approval of a Third Interim Fee Application.

FACTS

The Receiver recovered \$750 million from Defendant, Elevation Group and \$712 million from "John Doe" A total of \$1.462 million recovered.

1st period fees of \$90,256.39 were approved Nov 15, 2012 for expenses incurred by the Receiver between Sept 18-30, 2012 (10 business days.) An average of \$9,025.63 per day.

2nd period fees of \$188,844.50 and \$5,044.70 were approved February 6, 2013 for expenses/services incurred by the Receiver between Oct 1-31, 2012 (23 business days.) An average of \$8,429.96 per day.

The 1st and 2nd period approved fees combined total \$284,145.59. This already represents 19.4% of the recovered funds of \$1.462 million.

The Receiver is now requesting 3rd interim fees be paid of \$84,425.40 and expenses of \$218,566.98 for retained services from November 1, 2012 to March 31, 2013.

1st, 2nd and 3rd interim fees combined total \$587,137.97 - 40% of the recovered funds of \$1.462 million.

As of May 7, 2013, the Estate was holding \$1,164,958.25 in funds traceable to the ProphetMax fraud.

In a letter to investors dated June 24, 2013, page 1, it states that the Estate has approximately \$1.1 million "...I believe this is the majority of assets that may be recovered for the Estate through my investigation." ~ Guy M. Hohmann (ref: letter to investors dated June 24, 2013)

ARGUMENT

While I appreciate the work and acknowledge the need of a receivership, I feel the fees being charged are exorbitant and unreasonable, especially in consideration of how much evidence was collected and shared with domestic and foreign authorities by the investors prior to the appointment of the receivership on September 18, 2012.

1) The motion for approval of a 3rd interim fee of \$84,425.40 for 144.4 total hours represents an hourly average rate of \$584.66/hr (ref: Exhibit A of Receiver's Motion for Approval of 3rd Interim Fee.) This is not a reasonable and fair rate. The median hourly rate according the State Bar of Texas, Department of Research & Analysis in 2011 was \$238/hr. (reference: *2011 Hourly Fact Sheet* published by the State Bar of Texas.)

2) The 3rd interim expenses of \$214,238.25 for retained legal professionals totals 774.7 hours (Exhibit B.) So the total hours for both the Receiver AND retained professionals combined amounts to 919.1 hours (144.4 + 774.7) from November 1, 2012 to March 31, 2013. There are 100 business days (excluding 6 federal holidays) during this period, which would mean that 9.19 hours on average per business day was spent working on this case. I find this incredulous.

3) A total of \$1,462,000 was recovered, but as of May 7, 2013, the Estate was holding \$1,164,958.25 in funds. This equals a difference of \$297,041.75. The receiver's 1st and 2nd fees during this period totaled \$284,145.59. Can the Receiver please account for the difference of \$12,896.16?

4) In total from Sept 18, 2012 to March 31, 2013, the Receiver has requested fees totaling \$587,137.97. Already these fees represents 40% of the total recovered \$1.462 million and only covers through March 31, 2013. The amount that the Receiver recovered vs. the fees to date is not reasonable. And still April 1, 2013 to present date and moving forward has yet to be accounted for.

5) The Receiver did not inform me directly of this Motion for Approval of 3rd Interim Fee.

CONCLUSION

For the arguments and reasons stated above, I feel the Receiver's Motion for Approval of 3rd Interim Fee should NOT be granted.

I respectfully request:

- that a fair and reasonable hourly rate be used for any future fees and retroactively on the 1st and 2nd interim fees. The Receiver averaged a rate greater than 2.4 times (ref: Exhibit A of Receiver's Motion for Approval of 3rd Interim Fee) the 2011 Texas median rate of \$238/hr. A cap on the amount of Receiver fees should be in place as a percentage of the \$1.462 million the Receiver recovered for the Estate.
- an explanation why the Receiver states in point #18 on page 8 of the Receiver's Unopposed Motion for Approval of 3rd Interim Fee Application and Brief in Support: "Paralegals and other support staff also devoted approximately 307.3 total hours in services to the estate during this period (See Exhibit B)" Yet Exhibit B, totals 774.7 hours during Nov 1, 2012 to March 31, 2013.
- In the letter to investors dated June 24, 2013, Mr Hohmann says "...I plan to reserve some of the Estate funds for anticipated future costs fees unless and until funds in Amsterdam are released or secured through other means." I implore the Court not to allow further withholding of any more of the investors' monies. We suffered this loss over a year ago and it's time it's returned to it rightful owners. I respectfully request that the Court put a cap on the amount of Receiver fees as a percentage of the \$1.462 million the Receiver recovered for the Estate.
- In the letter to investors dated June 24, 2013, Mr. Hohmann says he may postpone the distribution of funds originally scheduled for late summer 2013, to possibly pool it with the \$3.4 million funds seized by ASIC in Australia for a joint distribution. It is my understanding via ASIC today, that the Australian liquidator will be disbursing the Australian funds directly to the investors and not to the Receiver, so there is no need for the Receiver to stall distribution of the funds they are holding any further. I request that the court order that the funds be released by end of summer as planned and no later than Labor Day 2013.
- that the Receiver share the Master List of Investor/Victims with the authorities in Australia and Amsterdam so that they are able to liquidate the fund promptly to Investors/Victims when released.
- that the Receiver communicate with the investors via email if they are applying for approval of interim fees when the motion is filed, in lieu of posting motions on Facebook because not all of us subscribe to Facebook or visit the Receivership website daily.

Dated: July 15, 2013
By: Rosemary Vargas

GUY HOHMANN -- RECEIVER BILLINGS

3/8/2013	GMH	0.4	CONFERENCE WITH CHRIS AHART REGARDING HIS TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THE CFTC AND SEC IN CONNECTION WITH UPCOMING STATUS CONFERENCE AND VARIOUS EMAILS REGARDING SAME.	\$263.50
3/20/2013	GMH	2.8	VARIOUS EMAILS REGARDING UPCOMING MEETING (CONFERENCE CALL WITH VARIOUS AUTHORITIES); CONFERENCE WITH CHRIS AHART REGARDING SAME; PARTICIPATE IN CALL AND CONFERENCE WITH CHRIS AHART REGARDING FOLLOW-UP IN CONNECTION WITH SAME.	\$1,844.50
3/25/2013	GMH	0.3	REVIEW INCOMING EMAILS FROM THE CFTC; REVIEW OF BANK STATEMENT.	\$197.62
3/28/2013	GMH	0.8	REVIEW EMAILS WITH CHRIS AHART AND CORRESPONDENCE TO ██████████ COUNSEL; CONFERENCE WITH CHRIS AHART REGARDING POSSIBLE INCLUSION OF ██████████ ET AL IN THE RECEIVERSHIP PROCEEDING; EMAILS WITH THE SEC AND THE CFTC REGARDING SAME AND UPCOMING CONFERENCE CALL; EMAILS WITH CHRIS AHART REGARDING SAME.	\$527.00
TOTAL		144.4	TOTAL	\$93,806.17

\$93,806.17 - 10% discount = \$84,425.40 3rd Interim Fee

\$84,425.40 divide by 144.4 hours = \$584.66/ avg hour

billing rates. Furthermore, the Receiver is deducting an additional 10% from the Receiver's fees for the Third Fee Period. Both discounts equate to a \$27,484.60 total reduction in the Receiver's fees for this period, and the Receiver expects that his fees and expenses will continue to decline.

17. The fees charged by the Receiver during the Third Fee Period include all compensation requested for the Receiver's services. *See Exhibit A.* The Receiver requests the Court's approval to pay for these services totaling \$84,425.40 in fees because the fees were reasonable and necessary for the Receiver to fulfill his Court-ordered duties.

b. The Law Firm of Hohmann, Taube & Summers, L.L.P.⁸

18. From November 1, 2012 to March 31, 2013, the senior associate and junior associate who served as counsel for the Receiver devoted an average of 2.4 and 2 hours, respectively, per business day to the Estate. Paralegals and other support staff also devoted approximately 307.3 total hours in services to the Estate during this period. *See Exhibit B.*

**Exhibit B totals
774.7 hours**

19. The following summary provides a general description of these services:
- i. Executing a letter agreement for Elevation Group's payment of ProphetMax commissions to the Estate.
 - ii. Drafting an agreement with John Doe for the return of funds traceable to the alleged fraud.
 - iii. Assisting ongoing investigations by the CFTC and SEC, including reviewing and analyzing documents and other information obtained during these investigations.
 - iv. Communicating and coordinating with foreign authorities to further foreign investigations and assist the potential seizure of foreign assets.
 - v. Communicating with investors concerning this action, the Receiver, the Estate, and investment matters via telephone, email, and the Estate's website.
 - vi. Participating in the litigation of this action, including negotiating agreements and reviewing, drafting and filing various court papers.

20. The Receiver Team has reduced its effective billing rate in the Third Fee Period from \$360.59 per hour to only \$277.28, a decrease of 23%. The Receiver's legal counsel

⁸ For a discussion of the Receiver Team's qualifications, please see the Receiver's First Fee Application pp. 12-13.

Invoice Number 50769

SCHEDULE B SUMMARY OF HOURS

Page 17

Professional Services:

TAYLOR, MARK C.	0.30 hrs.	775.00 /hr	\$232.50
AHART, CHRISTOPHER W	75.40 hrs.	550.00 /hr	\$41,470.00
PUCCIA, CARRIE E	76.30 hrs.	375.00 /hr	\$28,612.50
VICKERS, ANDREW P	6.50 hrs.	150.00 /hr	\$975.00
RYAN, HEATHER C	39.10 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$8,797.50
ANDERSON, KERI N	32.60 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$7,335.00
SUMRALI, HOLLIE N	5.20 hrs.	125.00 /hr	\$650.00
Total Professional Services			\$88,072.50

November 2012 Total Hours = 235.4**Summary:****Professional Services:**

TAUBE, ERIC J.	0.30 hrs.	775.00 /hr	\$232.50
TAYLOR, MARK C.	0.40 hrs.	775.00 /hr	\$310.00
AHART, CHRISTOPHER W	76.70 hrs.	550.00 /hr	\$42,185.00
PUCCIA, CARRIE E	42.00 hrs.	375.00 /hr	\$15,750.00
RYAN, HEATHER C	40.00 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$9,000.00
ANDERSON, KERI N	8.30 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$1,867.50
SUMRALL, HOLLIE N	15.20 hrs.	125.00 /hr	\$1,900.00
Total Professional Services			\$71,245.00

December 2012 Total Hours = 182.9**Summary:****Professional Services:**

AHART, CHRISTOPHER W	52.40 hrs.	550.00 /hr	\$28,820.00
----------------------	------------	------------	-------------

Invoice Number 50771

Page 11

PUCCIA, CARRIE E	29.20 hrs.	375.00 /hr	\$10,950.00
RYAN, HEATHER C	25.30 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$5,692.50
ANDERSON, KERI N	6.80 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$1,530.00
SUMRALL, HOLLIE N	60.80 hrs.	125.00 /hr	\$7,600.00
Total Professional Services			\$54,592.50

January 2013 Total Hours = 174.5**Summary:****Professional Services:**

AHART, CHRISTOPHER W	31.70 hrs.	550.00 /hr	\$17,435.00
PUCCIA, CARRIE E	44.10 hrs.	375.00 /hr	\$16,537.50
RYAN, HEATHER C	8.70 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$1,957.50
ANDERSON, KERI N	3.50 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$787.50
EDQUIST, CALLAN B	0.70 hrs.	150.00 /hr	\$105.00
BLANK, KRISTEN D	1.90 hrs.	200.00 /hr	\$380.00
SUMRALL, HOLLIE N	1.20 hrs.	125.00 /hr	\$150.00
Total Professional Services			\$37,352.50

February 2013 Total Hours = 91.8**Summary:****Professional Services:**

AHART, CHRISTOPHER W	16.80 hrs.	550.00 /hr	\$9,240.00
PUCCIA, CARRIE E	25.40 hrs.	375.00 /hr	\$9,525.00
RYAN, HEATHER C	11.30 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$2,542.50
ANDERSON, KERI N	8.60 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$1,935.00
SOOS, JESSICA E	1.10 hrs.	150.00 /hr	\$165.00
BLANK, KRISTEN D	26.90 hrs.	200.00 /hr	\$5,380.00
Total Professional Services			\$28,787.50

March 2013 Total Hours = 90.1**NOV12 - MAR13 GRAND TOTAL = 774.7**

EXHIBIT B

Hohmann, Taube & Summers, LLP
100 Congress Ave 18th Floor
Austin, TX 78701

Phone: (512)-472-5997 www.hts-law.com Fax: (512) 472-5248

MR. GUY M. HOHMANN
100 CONGRESS AVE STE 1800
AUSTIN, TX 78701-4042

Invoice Number 50769
Invoice Date 12/10/2012
Activity Billed Through 11/30/2012

Prior Balance Brought Forward	\$337,800.30
Less Adjustments Applied	-\$120,291.39
Less Payments Received	\$0.00
Net Balance Forward	<u>\$217,508.91</u>

HTS File Number: 8133 00001 JKE

RE: REPRESENT CLIENT AS RECEIVER OF VARIOUS INDIVIDUALS INVOLVED WITH AN AUSTRALIAN PONZI SCHEME.

For Professional Services Rendered:

11/01/2012	MT	0.30 hrs.	ANALYSIS OF ISSUES REGARDING FRAUDULENT TRANSFER CLAIMS AND JURISDICTIONAL ISSUES.	232.50
11/01/2012	CWA	5.90 hrs.	REVIEW LETTER FROM ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ RESPONDING TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING FACTUAL RESEARCH FOR ██████████ ██████████ AND HIS COUNSEL, ██████████ ██████████; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA FINAL ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS FOR DRAFT MOTION AND PROPOSED ORDER FOR FIRST FEE APPLICATION TO COURT; FINAL REVIEW AND REVISIONS TO DRAFTS OF SAME AND EXHIBITS AND FORWARD TO CFTC FOR REVIEW AND COMMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING FACTUAL QUESTIONS AND ISSUES RAISED BY DOCUMENT PRODUCTION REFLECTING PRIOR CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN ██████████ ██████████ AND ██████████ ██████████; DISCUSS WITH MARK TAYLOR POTENTIAL APPLICATION OF ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ TO ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH ANDREW VICKERS LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING ██████████ DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA LETTER FROM IRS REGARDING EIN, COORDINATION WITH ██████████ ██████████, AND TAX-REPORTING OBLIGATIONS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH TAX ACCOUNTANT AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH ██████████ ██████████ AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING IRS LETTER; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA NEW CORRESPONDENCE WITH ██████████ ██████████ AND NEED FOR SUBPOENA AND LETTER TO ██████████ ██████████ TO DISCOVER MORE INFORMATION ON ██████████ ██████████; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING INVOLVEMENT OF ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH ██████████ ██████████ LITIGATION OF CLAIMS AGAINST ██████████ CORRESPONDENCE WITH MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING COMMENTS TO PROPOSED LETTER AGREEMENT ON DISGORGEMENT OF COMMISSIONS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC	3,245.00

REGARDING SAME AND STATUS OF NEW MIKE DILLARD PAYMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU AND JASON AMYETT REGARDING PREPARATION OF INTEREST SCHEDULE FOR MIKE DILLARD'S INSTALLMENT PAYMENTS ON COMMISSION DISGORGEMENT; DISCUSS RECEIVERSHIP ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU REGARDING ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS FOR RECEIVERSHIP.

11/01/2012	CEP	4.30 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH Y. SIMENTAL REGARDING TRACKING DOWN [REDACTED] PACKAGE INFORMATION OVERNIGHTED TO [REDACTED] CORRESPOND WITH H. CANTU REGARDING OBTAINING G. HOHMANN'S UPDATED CV; MARK CV AS EXHIBIT TO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND INCLUDE REFERENCE TO CV IN SAME; MARK FEE INVOICES AS EXHIBIT TO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION, REVISE FEE APPLICATION TO REFLECT SAME; CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] AT [REDACTED] REGARDING OBTAINING INFORMATION REQUESTED IN STATUTORY RESTRAINING ORDER; CORRESPOND WITH J. ANDERSON REGARDING IRS FORMS, COMMUNICATE WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME; HAVE COPY OF IRS FORMS UPLOADED TO SYSTEM AND EMAILED TO [REDACTED] AND J. ANDERSON FOR HIS FILES; UPLOAD VENDOR INVOICE FROM FLASHBACK DATA AS SEPARATE EXHIBIT TO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	1,612.50
11/01/2012	HCR	1.40 hrs.	CONTINUE REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS; UPDATE CASE NOTEBOOK; UPDATE CORRESPONDENCE IN SYSTEM.	315.00
11/01/2012	KNA	1.00 hrs.	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING RECEIVERSHIP AND INVOLVEMENT WITH SENEN POUSA; RESEARCH [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] ADDRESS FOR [REDACTED]; E-MAIL REGARDING RESULTS OF RESEARCH; RESEARCH "MONEY HAD AND RECEIVED" CLAIM; E-MAILS REGARDING SAME.	225.00
11/02/2012	CWA	4.40 hrs.	REVIEW MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL'S PROPOSED CHANGES TO LETTER AGREEMENT ON DISGORGEMENT OF COMMISSIONS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU AND CFTC REGARDING ISSUES RAISED BY SAME; RESEARCH APPLICABLE INTEREST TO MIKE DILLARD'S PAYMENTS TO DETERMINE MATERIALITY OF FOREGOING INTEREST; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING ANALYSIS OF SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING LITIGATION IN [REDACTED] INCLUDING CONTACT INFORMATION FOR COUNSEL AND PERMISSIBILITY OF CONTINGENCY FEES; RESEARCH REGARDING PERMISSIBILITY OF CONTINGENCY FEES IN [REDACTED]; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH ANDREW VICKERS LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING POTENTIAL APPLICATION OF [REDACTED] TO [REDACTED]; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING DRAFT SUBPOENA AND LETTER TO [REDACTED] AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH COURT CONCERNING NEED FOR MOTION TO EXCEED PAGE LIMITS IN SUPPORT OF MOTION AND PROPOSED ORDER FOR FIRST FEE APPLICATION TO COURT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL, MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL, GUY M. HOHMANN, AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING POSSIBLE OBJECTIONS TO SAME MOTION AND ORDER; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA CONFIRMATION OF RECEIPT OF MIKE DILLARD'S INSTALLMENT PAYMENT AND REVISION TO SAME MOTION TO REFLECT SAME; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN ISSUES CONCERNING RECOVERED ASSETS, FROZEN FOREIGN ASSETS, AND DISCLOSURE OF SAME IN SAME MOTION OR STATUS REPORT TO COURT; REVIEW INVESTOR	2,420.00

			<p>██████████, SECOND EXTENSION OF RESPONSE DEADLINE TO ██████████ CONFERENCE WITH COURT REGARDING SAME, AND POSSIBLE AGREEMENT FOR RELIEF IN NOVEMBER; DRAFT SECOND UNOPPOSED JOINT MOTION AND AGREED ORDER TO EXTEND CFTC'S AND RECEIVER'S DEADLINE TO RESPOND TO JOEL FRIANT'S MISCELLANEOUS RELIEF FROM RESTRAINING ORDER, INCLUDING REVIEW OF COURT PAPERS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC, JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL, AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING SAME; ATTENTION TO FILING SAME MOTION AND ORDER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING FACTUAL INVESTIGATION OF ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; REVIEW SAME FACTUAL INVESTIGATION DOCUMENTS AND FINDINGS; DISCUSS WITH ANDREW VICKERS PRELIMINARY ISSUES FOR LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING POTENTIAL APPLICATION OF ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ TO ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; DRAFT DEMAND LETTER TO COUNSEL FOR ██████████ ██████████ ██████████, INCLUDING REVIEW OF COURT PAPERS, FACTUAL INVESTIGATION DOCUMENTS, AND POTENTIAL CAUSES OF ACTION.</p>	
11/05/2012	CEP	2.20 hrs.	<p>UPDATE LIST OF CONTACTED ENTITIES; CORRESPOND WITH ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING SCOPE OF RECORDS NEEDED; LEFT VOICE MAIL WITH CONTACT AT ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING NOTICE AND RESPONSE; TELEPHONE CALL TO ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING RESPONSE LETTER AND INFORMATION REQUESTED; VOICE MAIL MESSAGE TO ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING SAME; CORRESPOND WITH ██████████ REGARDING SAME; SEND NOTICES AND EXPLANATORY E-MAIL TO ██████████ ██████████; CORRESPOND WITH ██████████ FROM ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING CALL; DRAFT EXPLANATORY E-MAIL AND ATTACH NECESSARY DOCUMENTS.</p>	825.00
11/05/2012	APV	1.50 hrs.	<p>RESEARCH FRAUDULENT TRANSFER ISSUES IN RECEIVERSHIP CONTEXT.</p>	225.00
11/05/2012	HCR	6.40 hrs.	<p>TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHRISTOPHER W. AHART AND CFTC REGARDING STATUS AND FUTURE ITEMS; CONFERENCE REGARDING FEE APPLICATION; CONFERENCE REGARDING DEPOSITS TO BE MADE INTO RECEIVERSHIP ACCOUNT; CONFERENCE REGARDING POSSIBLE NEW ENTITIES TO BE SERVED WITH ██████████ CONFERENCE REGARDING THIRD PARTY CLAIMS; BEGIN COMPILING NEW SEARCH TERMS BASED ON TELEPHONE CONFERENCE; CONFERENCE REGARDING SENDING FILES TO CFTC; CONTINUE SEARCHES IN ██████████ ██████████ FOR PERTINENT INFORMATION; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SEVERAL E-MAILS.</p>	1,440.00
11/05/2012	KNA	2.60 hrs.	<p>CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING ██████████ ██████████ SPREADSHEET, POSSIBLE CLAIMS AGAINST ██████████ AND ██████████ ██████████ ISSUES; UPDATE NOTIFICATION SPREADSHEET; PREPARE E-MAIL OF OVERDUE RESPONSES AND NO RESPONSES; RESEARCH ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; E-MAIL REGARDING SAME; UPDATE COMPANY LOG; E-MAIL CFTC AND SECURITY EXCHANGE COMMISSION WITH RESPONSES RECEIVED SINCE 10/24/2012.</p>	585.00
11/06/2012	CWA	8.20 hrs.	<p>REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION AND PROPOSED ORDER FOR LEAVE TO EXCEED PAGE LIMITS FOR FEE APPLICATION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC, SEC, JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL, AND MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING SAME AND ANY OBJECTION; CONFERENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS FOR CONSENT ORDER AND PERMANENT RELIEF FROM RESTRAINING ORDER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING TEMPORARY INJUNCTION HEARING AND PREPARATIONS FOR SAME; CONFERENCE WITH</p>	4,510.00

COURT DEPUTY AND JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING COURT'S ATTENTION TO JOINT MOTION AND AGREED ORDER TO EXTEND CFTC'S AND RECEIVER'S DEADLINE TO RESPOND TO JOEL FRIANT'S MISCELLANEOUS RELIEF FROM RESTRAINING ORDER; SEPARATE CONFERENCE WITH COURT CHAMBERS REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CFTC REGARDING SAME; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES TO ADDRESS IN STATUS REPORT TO COURT AND LETTER AND SUBPOENA TO [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND REVISE SAME SUBPOENA, ATTACHED DOCUMENT REQUESTS, AND LETTER TO [REDACTED]; DISCUSS WITH NAN GRIFFES ACTION ITEMS FOR COMPLETING AND SERVING SAME AND ISSUES UNDER RULE 45; FINAL REVIEW AND REVISIONS TO MOTION AND ORDER FOR FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION TO COURT AND MOTION FOR LEAVE AND ORDER TO EXCEED PAGE LIMITS FOR SAME; ATTENTION TO FILING SAME MOTIONS AND ORDERS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU, AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING RESEARCH OF PUBLIC FILINGS AND REPORTS OF FOREIGN PROCEEDINGS FOR INCORPORATION IN STATUS REPORT TO COURT; REVIEW AND NOTATE INFORMATION IN SAME FILINGS AND REPORTS FOR STATUS REPORT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING DEMAND LETTER TO COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] AND ATTENTION TO SIGNING AND SENDING SAME; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH KERI ANDERSON TASKS AND ACTION ITEMS TO PREPARE MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL AND CFTC REGARDING REVISED CONSENT ORDER FOR JOEL FRIANT; REVIEW SAME CONSENT ORDER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP NOTIFICATIONS AND ACTION ITEMS FOR FOLLOW UP WITH RECIPIENTS; REVISE DRAFT LETTER AGREEMENT ON MIKE DILLARD'S DISGORGEMENT TO ADDRESS COMMENTS FROM MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, AND MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING ANALYSIS OF [REDACTED] SPREADSHEET AND ISOLATION OF [REDACTED]; REVIEW SAME ANALYSIS; DISCUSS WITH ANDREW VICKERS PRELIMINARY RESEARCH FINDINGS FOR POTENTIAL APPLICATION OF [REDACTED] TO [REDACTED]; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU REGARDING ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS FOR RECEIVERSHIP.

11/06/2012	CEP	0.20 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH KERI N. ANDERSON REGARDING STATUS OF NOTIFICATIONS AND ACCOUNTS; FOLLOW UP WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING SUBPOENA PROCESS.	75.00
11/06/2012	APV	1.50 hrs.	RESEARCH [REDACTED]	225.00
11/06/2012	HCR	2.20 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING INVESTIGATION AND TRANSLATION OF ARTICLE; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS; REVIEW AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS; NOTE FOLLOW-UP NEEDED ON [REDACTED] DOCUMENTS.	495.00
11/06/2012	KNA	4.70 hrs.	ANALYZE [REDACTED] SPREADSHEET; CREATE SUBSET OF ALL [REDACTED]; E-MAIL REGARDING SAME; RESEARCH PUBLIC INFORMATION ON [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED]; OBTAIN RELEVANT ARTICLES; E-MAIL EXPLAINING SAME; RESEARCH [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] TO IDENTIFY GENERAL COUNSEL AND ANY CONTACT INFORMATION; E-MAILS REGARDING SAME.	1,057.50
11/06/2012	HNS	1.00 hrs.	ADDED CLIENT INFORMATION TO SPREADSHEET.	125.00

Date	Code	Hours	Description	Amount
11/07/2012	CWA	0.30 hrs.	DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU, AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING PUBLIC RELEASES AND REPORTS OF INVESTIGATIONS FOR STATUS REPORT TO COURT, [REDACTED] [REDACTED] RESPONSE TO RECEIVERSHIP NOTICE AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION OF JOEL FRIANT'S AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] RECORDS, AND UPDATES TO RECEIVERSHIP NOTIFICATIONS LIST, ISSUES, AND ACTION ITEMS FOR FOLLOW UP; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND NAN GRIFFES REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED], [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE FOR SERVICE OF SUBPOENA AND LETTER REQUESTING [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	165.00
11/07/2012	CEP	0.40 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING RECORDS FROM J. FRIANT NEEDED; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART AND N. GRIFFES REGARDING SUBPOENA TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DISCUSS USE OF PUBLIC RECORDS FOR FEE APPLICATION WITH C. AHART.	150.00
11/07/2012	APV	3.00 hrs.	RESEARCH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE AND E-MAIL WITH HEATHER C. RYAN.	450.00
11/07/2012	HCR	1.20 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SEVERAL E-MAILS; UPDATE WEBSITE WITH NEW INFORMATION.	270.00
11/07/2012	KNA	0.70 hrs.	RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED], INCLUDING REUTERS SEARCH; UPDATE NOTIFICATIONS SPREADSHEET.	157.50
11/07/2012	HNS	1.40 hrs.	ADDED ADDITIONAL CLIENT INFORMATION TO SPREADSHEET.	175.00
11/08/2012	CWA	0.40 hrs.	DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES FOR DRAFT STATUS REPORT TO COURT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING COMMENTS TO REVISED DRAFT LETTER AGREEMENT ON DISGORGEMENT; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND NAN GRIFFES REGARDING SERVICE OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] SUBPOENA AND LETTER REQUESTING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW COURT ORDERS GRANTING JOINT MOTION TO EXTEND TIME FOR CFTC AND RECEIVER TO RESPOND TO JOEL FRIANT'S MOTION FOR MISCELLANEOUS RELIEF FROM RESTRAINING ORDER, AND MOTION TO EXCEED PAGE LIMITS FOR MOTION FOR FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	220.00
11/08/2012	KNA	2.10 hrs.	REVIEW AND ANALYZE OCTOBER INVOICE; BEGIN WORKING ON SECOND FEE APPLICATION; BEGIN REDACTING CONFIDENTIAL PORTIONS OF INVOICES; E-MAIL REGARDING SAME.	472.50
11/09/2012	CWA	0.40 hrs.	REVIEW COURT ORDER ON MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC, AND SEC REGARDING SAME AND PREPARATIONS FOR HEARING ON TEMPORARY INJUNCTION AND SAME FEE APPLICATION; DISCUSS SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND ISSUES RAISED IN MEETING WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	220.00
11/12/2012	CWA	1.80 hrs.	DISCUSS WITH HEATHER CANTU PREPARATIONS FOR COURT HEARING ON MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING RECEIVER DEMAND LETTER AND POSSIBLE RESOLUTION OF CLAIMS; FINAL REVISIONS TO DRAFT LETTER AGREEMENT FOR MIKE DILLARD'S DISGORGEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CFTC REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU AND JASON AMYETT REGARDING WAIVER OF INTEREST FOR MIKE DILLARD'S DISGORGEMENT PAYMENTS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING OUTSTANDING INFORMATION FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] IN RESPONSE TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU REGARDING OPEN ITEMS FOR CONTACTS AND TELEPHONE NUMBERS IN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	990.00

			DISCUSS SAME WITH C. AHART; DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION REFLECTING DISCOUNTED RATE OF PROFESSIONALS; DISCUSS SAME WITH C. AHART.	
11/13/2012	HCR	2.50 hrs.	CONTINUE PROCESSING J. FRIANT'S ELECTRONIC DEVICES; PROCESS ██████████ PRODUCTION; UPDATE PRODUCTION LOGS; UPDATE TASK AND DEADLINE LIST; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SEVERAL E-MAILS.	562.50
11/13/2012	KNA	2.10 hrs.	REVIEW RESPONSE TO RECEIVERSHIP NOTICE FROM ██████████ AND UPDATE SPREADSHEET; REDACT FEE INVOICE FOR OCTOBER TO SUBMIT WITH FEE APPLICATION; CONFERENCE REGARDING FUNDS FROZEN ██████████ AND FUNDS IN ██████████ CONFERENCE REGARDING ASSETS SEIZED TO DATE AND CREATING CHART OF SAME FOR COURT.	472.50
11/13/2012	HNS	0.40 hrs.	ADDED CLIENT INFORMATION TO SPREADSHEET.	50.00
11/14/2012	CWA	7.90 hrs.	DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN PREPARATIONS FOR COURT HEARING ON MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; REVIEW SAME AND PREPARE OUTLINE FOR ORAL ARGUMENT; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ COUNSEL AND GUY M. HOHMANN CONCERNING NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP, ASSETS/RECORDS OF THE ESTATE, POTENTIAL CLAIMS, AND FACTUAL INVESTIGATION INFORMATION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH VELVET ROPE VENTURES' COUNSEL, GUY M. HOHMANN, AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING BANK RECORDS, CONTRACTS, AND OTHER INFORMATION RELATING TO ESTATE; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES TO ADDRESS IN STATUS REPORT TO COURT AND MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING VALUATION INFORMATION FOR JOEL FRIANT'S CAR; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING VALUATION INFORMATION FOR JOEL FRIANT'S REAL ESTATE PROPERTIES; CORRESPONDENCE WITH ██████████ REGARDING LETTER REQUESTING WITHDRAWAL OF FILING; COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA FOLLOW UP TO SAME; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA FURTHER CORRESPONDENCE WITH ██████████ AND POSSIBLE METHODS TO REMEDY ██████████ PUBLIC FILING, SUCH AS MOTION TO SEAL; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA; HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING UPDATES TO RECEIVERSHIP NOTIFICATIONS LIST, ISSUES, AND ACTION ITEMS FOR FOLLOW UP; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCES WITH ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ COUNSEL AND GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING DEMAND LETTER, RECEIVERSHIP CLAIMS, AND FACTUAL INVESTIGATION; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN ISSUES RAISED IN SAME CONFERENCES; MEETING WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND SEC REGARDING STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP, INVESTIGATIONS, AND TEMPORARY INJUNCTION HEARING; PREPARE FOR COURT HEARING ON MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	4,345.00
11/14/2012	CEP	5.80 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON AND C. AHART REGARDING APPRAISAL OF FRIANT'S PROPERTY FOR INCLUSION IN REPORT OF THE RECEIVER; CORRESPOND WITH ██████████ AT ██████████ REGARDING RECEIVERSHIP NOTICE AND OBTAINING DEFENDANTS' RECORDS; DRAFT REPORT OF THE RECEIVER.	2,175.00
11/14/2012	HCR	0.50 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING SOCIAL MEDIA; ORGANIZE CORRESPONDENCE.	112.50
11/14/2012	KNA	2.90 hrs.	CREATE CHART OF ASSETS SEIZED OR FROZEN FOR INCLUSION IN STATUS REPORT TO COURT; E-MAIL JIM GEORGE FOR	652.50

INFORMATION ON JOEL FRIANT'S BMW; RECEIVE AND REVIEW INFORMATION REGARDING SAME FROM JOEL FRIANT; RESEARCH DATABASE FOR EVIDENCE OF [REDACTED] OR [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; DOWNLOAD RELEVANT DOCUMENTS; E-MAILS REGARDING SAME; UPDATE NOTIFICATIONS SPREADSHEET; PREPARE STATUS UPDATE ON RESPONSES TO RECEIVERSHIP NOTICES.

11/14/2012	HNS	1.00 hrs.	CLEANED AND PREPARED DATA IN INVESTOR SPREADSHEET FOR USE AS A WORD DOCUMENT.	125.00
11/15/2012	CWA	7.10 hrs.	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND COURT HEARINGS ON CFTC'S AND SEC'S MOTIONS FOR TEMPORARY INJUNCTIONS AND RECEIVER'S MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; MEETING WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, CFTC, AND SEC REGARDING STATUS OF FACTUAL INVESTIGATION, RECEIVERSHIP, [REDACTED] AND ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS REGARDING SAME; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH KERI ANDERSON INVESTIGATIVE RESEARCH REGARDING [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED]; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA LEGAL RESEARCH FOR STRIKING OR SEALING [REDACTED] COURT FILING; REVIEW LETTER AND SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS FILED WITH COURT BY SENEN POUSA'S AUSTRALIAN COUNSEL REQUESTING EXTENSION OF HEARING; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES TO ADDRESS IN STATUS REPORT TO COURT AND MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND HEATHER CANTU SEARCH TERMS AND ISSUES FOR SEARCHING JOEL FRIANT'S ELECTRONIC RECORDS; REVIEW MIKE DILLARD'S [REDACTED]; REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED]; REVIEW COURT ORDERS GRANTING TEMPORARY INJUNCTIONS, RECEIVER'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION, AND JOEL FRIANT'S CONSENT ORDER, AND DENYING JOEL FRIANT'S MOTION FOR MISCELLANEOUS RELIEF FROM RESTRAINING ORDER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING PRODUCTION OF [REDACTED] FOR [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL AND GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING PRODUCTION OF PRIOR SETTLEMENT OFFER AND OTHER DOCUMENTS TO FURTHER DISCUSSIONS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING INVESTOR MESSAGES CONCERNING FEE APPLICATION AND PROVIDING PUBLIC NOTICE OF COURT HEARINGS ON SAME APPLICATIONS.	3,905.00
11/15/2012	CEP	5.10 hrs.	ATTEND INFORMATIONAL MEETING WITH CFTC AND SEC TO DISCUSS OPTIONS AND STRATEGY GOING FORWARD; CORRESPOND WITH K. KOH REGARDING [REDACTED] RELATED PARTY; CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING EMAIL SENT NOVEMBER 13TH; RESEARCH FILING UNDER SEAL AND WITHDRAWING DOCUMENTS UNDER LOCAL AND FEDERAL RULES OF CIVIL PROCEDURE, DISCUSS SAME WITH C. AHART; DRAFT STATUS REPORT OF THE RECEIVER.	1,912.50
11/15/2012	HCR	3.90 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SEVERAL E-MAILS; UPDATE WEBSITE AND SOCIAL MEDIA WITH NEW FILINGS; PROCESS NEW FILINGS; CONFERENCE REGARDING STATUS AND FUTURE INVESTIGATION; CONTINUE UPDATE OF DATABASE.	877.50
11/15/2012	KNA	1.00 hrs.	OBTAIN DOCUMENTS FOR USE IN TEMPORARY INJUNCTION AND FEE APPLICATION HEARING; REVIEW PROPOSED ORDER FOR SAME; CONFERENCE REGARDING AUSTRALIAN AND DUTCH INVESTORS, AND INSTRUCTIONS ON SAME.	225.00
11/16/2012	CWA	1.70 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH INVESTOR REGARDING RECEIVER'S	935.00

FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND INVESTOR'S DESIRE TO OBJECT TO SAME IN THE FUTURE; CORRESPONDENCE WITH KERI ANDERSON REGARDING INVESTIGATIVE RESEARCH FINDINGS FOR [REDACTED], [REDACTED], AND PRIOR LITIGATION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND HOLLIE SUMRALL REGARDING EMAIL FROM COUNSEL FOR INVESTOR ELIZABETH PRIMIANO; CORRESPONDENCE WITH SAME COUNSEL REGARDING HER CLIENT'S STATUS IN OUR RECORDS AND FUTURE CORRESPONDENCE; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL AND GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING PRODUCTION OF PRIOR SETTLEMENT OFFER AND OTHER DOCUMENTS TO FURTHER DISCUSSIONS; REVIEW PRIOR SETTLEMENT OFFER FROM [REDACTED] TO [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING ISSUES RAISED IN SAME AND POTENTIAL LITIGATION STRATEGY FOR [REDACTED]; REVIEW COURT ORDERS ESTABLISHING STATUS CONFERENCE AND DISMISSING JOEL FRIANT'S MOTION FOR MISCELLANEOUS RELIEF FROM RESTRAINING ORDER.

11/16/2012	CEP	4.10 hrs.	DRAFT STATUS REPORT OF THE RECEIVER.	1,537.50
11/16/2012	KNA	1.90 hrs.	RESEARCH DATABASE FOR ANY EVIDENCE OF [REDACTED] OR [REDACTED] PREPARE MEMORANDUM OF SAME, INCLUDING LINKS TO DOCUMENTS; E-MAILS REGARDING SAME; RESEARCH [REDACTED] FEDERAL COURT CASE AGAINST [REDACTED], OBTAIN DOCKET AND ALL PLEADINGS.	427.50
11/18/2012	CWA	0.10 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING INVESTIGATIVE RESEARCH FINDINGS FOR [REDACTED], [REDACTED], AND PRIOR LITIGATION, AND POTENTIAL LITIGATION STRATEGY FOR [REDACTED]	55.00
11/19/2012	CWA	0.60 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING INVESTIGATIVE RESEARCH FINDINGS FOR [REDACTED], [REDACTED], AND PRIOR LITIGATION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS FOR FURTHER DISCUSSIONS AND NEW CONFERENCE CALL; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING INVESTOR INFORMATION COMPILED TO PROVIDE TO [REDACTED] TO NEGOTIATE [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS WITH COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] AND FACTUAL INVESTIGATION RESEARCH REGARDING SAME ENTITY; CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING TERMS FOR NEGOTIATING PERMANENT RELIEF FROM RESTRAINING ORDER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING SAME AND VALUATION OF AUTOMOBILE RELATIVE TO DEBT.	330.00
11/19/2012	CEP	3.50 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING STATUS OF FRIANT'S ACCOUNTS; CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON REGARDING SAME; DRAFT STATUS REPORT OF THE RECEIVER.	1,312.50
11/19/2012	KNA	5.30 hrs.	ADDITIONAL RESEARCH OF SUMMATION DATABASE FOR EVIDENCE OF [REDACTED]; OBTAIN SAME IN PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED]; RESEARCH [REDACTED] FOR PRIOR ACTION INVOLVING [REDACTED] OBTAIN HEARING DECISION AND APPEAL DECISION; REVIEW FEE INVOICES TO IDENTIFY TASKS AND EFFORTS TO ACCUMULATE COMPREHENSIVE LIST OF INVESTORS; E-MAIL	1,192.50

			REGARDING SAME; CREATE SPREADSHEETS OF ALL DUTCH AND ALL AUSTRALIAN INVESTORS; UPDATE SPREADSHEET OF NOTIFICATIONS.	
11/19/2012	HNS	0.40 hrs.	ADDED CLIENT INFORMATION TO SPREADSHEET.	50.00
11/20/2012	CWA	2.30 hrs.	DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES REGARDING [REDACTED] CLOSURE OF JOEL FRIANT'S CREDIT CARD AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING SAME; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA FACTUAL ISSUES REGARDING RECEIVER'S SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND STATUS REPORT TO COURT; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN ISSUES AND STRATEGY FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCES WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL, GUY M. HOHMANN, AND KERI ANDERSON TO NEGOTIATE POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED], GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON CONFIRMING TERMS OF AGREED SETTLEMENT; ANALYZE JOEL FRIANT'S PROPOSED TERMS FOR NEGOTIATING PERMANENT RELIEF FROM RESTRAINING ORDER; DISCUSS ISSUES REGARDING SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI ANDERSON; CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING SAME; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND MOTION TO APPROVE SAME FOR SETTLEMENT WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN ACTION ITEMS FOR INVESTIGATING CLAIMS AGAINST [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING [REDACTED] CLOSURE OF JOEL FRIANT'S CREDIT CARD; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC, CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] RECORDS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, AND SEC REGARDING AGREED SETTLEMENT REACHED WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND POSSIBLE OPPOSITION TO SAME.	1,265.00
11/20/2012	CEP	6.90 hrs.	DRAFT LETTER TO ATTORNEY FOR JOEL FRIANT REGARDING CANCELLATION OF FRIANT'S CREDIT CARD; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART AND K. ANDERSON REGARDING ASSETS LISTED IN STATUS REPORT OF THE RECEIVER AND RELATED TO AGREEMENT WITH DEFENDANT FRIANT, AND OBTAINING RECORDS REGARDING SAME FROM FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS; LEAVE VOICEMAIL WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] WITH [REDACTED] REQUESTING PAY-OFF AMOUNT OF FRIANT'S VEHICLE; CORRESPOND WITH G. HOHMANN AND C. AHART REGARDING DRAFTING OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SAME; CONTACT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S MORTGAGE RECORDS FOR PURPOSES OF INCLUSION IN REPORT, AND FOR USE IN AGREEMENT WITH FRIANT, AND DRAFT AND FAX LETTER OUTLINING REQUEST; CONTACT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME, CONFERENCE WITH VARIOUS DIFFERENT DEPARTMENTS IN ATTEMPT TO EXPLAIN STATUTORY RESTRAINING ORDER AND OBTAIN RECORDS; ARRANGE NEW FAXES TO DEPARTMENTS WITHIN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] WITH K. ANDERSON; DRAFT MOTION TO FILE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LETTER UNDER SEAL; DRAFT REPORT OF THE RECEIVER; CORRESPOND WITH CFTC REGARDING [REDACTED] BANK STATEMENTS; DOWNLOAD SAME AND FORWARD TO K. ANDERSON AND C. AHART.	2,587.50
11/20/2012	KNA	1.70 hrs.	REVIEW E-MAILS REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S EXPENSES; E-MAIL REGARDING BMW VALUE VERSUS LOAN AMOUNT; E-MAILS REGARDING ATTORNEY FOR INVESTOR; CONFERENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING UPDATE ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED];	382.50

Date	Client	Hours	Description	Amount
11/26/2012	CWA	2.70 hrs.	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY FOR [REDACTED]. DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING FACTUAL AND LEGAL ISSUES FOR DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND MOTION TO APPROVE SAME FOR RECEIVER'S CLAIMS AGAINST [REDACTED]; DISCUSS SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN; CORRESPONDENCE WITH MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING REVISED DRAFT LETTER AGREEMENT FOR MIKE DILLARD'S DISGORGEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL AND JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING RECEIVER'S SETTLEMENT WITH [REDACTED] AND POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS TO SAME; REVIEW RESPONSE FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP AND PRIOR CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING SAME AND ACTION ITEMS FOR RESOLUTION; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING RECORDS PRODUCED BY [REDACTED]; DRAFT LETTER TO SENEN POUSA'S AUSTRALIA COUNSEL REGARDING RECEIVER'S SETTLEMENT WITH [REDACTED] AND POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS; DISCUSS WITH HEATHER CANTU ISSUES FOR RECEIVER'S DRAFT SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION TO COURT.	1,485.00
11/26/2012	CEP	9.40 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON AND C. AHART REGARDING DOCUMENTS AND RECORDS RECEIVED FROM VARIOUS FINANCIAL ENTITIES; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING DRAFTING AND FILING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON, H. CANTU, AND C. AHART REGARDING INVESTIGATION OF [REDACTED] AND EVENTS LEADING UP TO SETTLEMENT; CORRESPOND WITH H. CANTU REGARDING [REDACTED] CONTACT; TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING OBTAINING RECORDS; FAX LETTER TO [REDACTED] WITH [REDACTED] INFORMATION AND [REDACTED]; VOICEMAIL WITH [REDACTED] FROM [REDACTED]; DRAFT [REDACTED] SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.	3,525.00
11/26/2012	HCR	3.70 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SEVERAL E-MAILS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR E-MAILS; REVIEW SOCIAL MEDIA; CONFIRM SOURCES OF [REDACTED] REVIEW; DRAFT E-MAIL REGARDING ORDER FOR SETTLEMENT; LOCATE SEVERAL PLEADINGS FOR REFERENCE; CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] CONFERENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI N. ANDERSON REGARDING SAME.	832.50
11/26/2012	KNA	1.80 hrs.	REVIEW MULTIPLE E-MAILS REGARDING TENTATIVE SETTLEMENT WITH [REDACTED]; PREPARE NOTIFICATION OF RECEIVERSHIP PACKAGE TO [REDACTED] E-MAILS REGARDING [REDACTED] RESPONSE TO RECEIVERSHIP; E-MAILS REGARDING EFFORTS TO LOCATE [REDACTED] FOR INCLUSION IN PLEADING REQUESTING APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT; UPDATE NOTIFICATION SPREADSHEET.	405.00
11/27/2012	CWA	7.60 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT FOR RECEIVER'S CLAIMS AGAINST [REDACTED], INCLUDING REVIEW AND INCORPORATION OF FACTUAL INVESTIGATION MATERIALS, WORK PRODUCT, AND FORM SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING VARIOUS ISSUES AND COMMENTS FOR SAME DRAFT AGREEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CFTC REGARDING STATUS OF RECEIVER'S SETTLEMENT WITH [REDACTED] AND	4,180.00

RELATED COMMUNICATIONS WITH ██████████ REGULATORS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING STATUS OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FROM ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING PRODUCTION OF ██████████ ██████████ DOCUMENTS AND REVIEW OF SAME; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES REGARDING FILING MOTION TO SEAL CERTAIN EXHIBITS TO MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF RECEIVER'S SETTLEMENT; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA FACTUAL AND LEGAL ISSUES FOR DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND MOTION TO APPROVE SAME FOR RECEIVER'S CLAIMS AGAINST ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; CORRESPONDENCE WITH MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING REVISED DRAFT LETTER AGREEMENT FOR MIKE DILLARD'S DISGORGEMENT; REVIEW AND DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA LOCAL RULES AND REQUIREMENTS FOR FILING DOCUMENTS UNDER SEAL; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, KERI ANDERSON, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING NEW RESPONSES TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP REGARDING ASSETS AND RECORDS OF THE ESTATE; DISCUSS OPEN ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS FOR SAME WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA; REVIEW ██████████ ██████████ RESPONSE TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP AND ATTACHED RECORDS; DISCUSS SAME WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND ANALYSIS TO DETERMINE NET ASSET VALUE OF JOEL FRIANT'S PROPERTY; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF RECEIVER'S SETTLEMENT WITH ██████████ ██████████ ██████████

11/27/2012	CEP	7.90 hrs.	DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT BETWEEN ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ AND RECEIVER; DRAFT MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER FOR APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; DISCUSS SAME WITH C. AHART; CONFERENCE WITH K. ANDERSON REGARDING STATUS OF RESPONSES FROM FINANCIAL ENTITIES; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART, H. CANTU, AND FILE CLERK TO DETERMINE LETTER RECEIVED DATE FOR INCLUSION IN MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.	2,962.50
11/27/2012	HCR	2.00 hrs.	REVIEW AND ORGANIZE MULTIPLE FILES AND E-MAILS; UPLOAD PRODUCTION AND PROCESS SAME; CONFERENCE REGARDING OUTSTANDING ITEMS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SEVERAL E-MAILS; REVIEW INVOICES AND REVISE FEE APPLICATION; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME.	450.00
11/27/2012	KNA	0.80 hrs.	E-MAIL CFTC AND SECURITY EXCHANGE COMMISSION WITH UPDATED SPREADSHEET AND LATEST RESPONSES TO RECEIVERSHIP NOTIFICATION; CONFERENCE REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S BMW, RENTAL HOME, HOME, MORTGAGES, ██████████ ██████████ AND ██████████ ██████████.	180.00
11/28/2012	CWA	8.30 hrs.	DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN STATUS AND ISSUES CONCERNING SETTLEMENT OF RECEIVER'S CLAIMS AGAINST ██████████ ██████████ ██████████, INCLUDING DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, POTENTIAL CONTACT WITH ██████████ ██████████ ██████████, AND COORDINATION WITH FOREIGN REGULATORS; CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, KERI ANDERSON AND CFTC REGARDING SAME, STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP, JOEL FRIANT MATTERS, AND ACTION ITEMS; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES CONCERNING POSSIBLE SUBPOENAS TO ██████████ TO PRODUCE RECORDS; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF RECEIVER'S SETTLEMENT WITH ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA VARIOUS FACTUAL AND LEGAL ISSUES REGARDING SAME, INCLUDING LEGAL RESEARCH AND PREPARATION OF SUPPORTING AFFIDAVITS; REVIEW SAME	4,565.00

LEGAL RESEARCH; REVIEW AND INCORPORATE GUY M. HOHMANN'S ADDITIONAL COMMENTS TO DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT FOR RECEIVER'S CLAIMS AGAINST [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES FOR DRAFT MOTION TO SEAL CERTAIN EXHIBITS TO MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF RECEIVER'S SETTLEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU AND MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING EXECUTED LETTER AGREEMENT FOR MIKE DILLARD'S DISGORGEMENT; ATTENTION TO SAME LETTER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA NEW RECORDS PRODUCED BY [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S PROPERTIES AND ANALYSIS OF SAME; REVIEW [REDACTED] RESPONSE TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] RESPONSE TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU, AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING SAME AND PREPARATION OF DEMAND LETTER.

11/28/2012	CEP	7.60 hrs.	DISCUSS STATUS OF RECORDS FOR CAR AND TWO HOMES OWNED BY DEFENDANT FRIANT; EMAIL [REDACTED] AT [REDACTED] REGARDING FRIANT RECORDS; CONTACT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING AMOUNTS REMAINING ON MORTGAGES IN RECORDS, AND TIMELINE FOR OBTAINING PHYSICAL COPIES; RESEARCH CASELAW FOR INCLUSION IN MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; CONFERENCE WITH G. HOHMANN AND C. AHART REGARDING AFFIDAVITS FOR MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING CASELAW NEEDED IN MOTION; DRAFT MOTION TO FILE UNDER SEAL AFFIDAVIT OF G. HOHMANN AND SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.	2,850.00
11/28/2012	HCR	4.70 hrs.	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CFTC REGARDING OUTSTANDING SETTLEMENT WITH [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME; COMPLETE REVIEW AND NOTATE FOLLOW UP QUESTIONS ON [REDACTED] DOCUMENTS; CREATE DOCUMENT REFLECTING SAME; RESEARCH SEVERAL ISSUES IN NOTES; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME.	1,057.50
11/28/2012	KNA	0.90 hrs.	REVIEW AND ORGANIZE RESPONSE TO RECEIVERSHIP NOTICE FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; MULTIPLE E-MAILS REGARDING SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING [REDACTED] AND SETTLEMENT WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	202.50
11/28/2012	HNS	1.00 hrs.	ADDED CLIENT INFORMATION TO SPREADSHEET.	125.00
11/29/2012	CWA	3.30 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF RECEIVER'S CLAIMS AGAINST [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND COOPERATION WITH FOREIGN REGULATORS; CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU, AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CONTACT INFORMATION, ANALYSIS OF VALUATIONS AND DEBTS ON JOEL FRIANT'S PROPERTIES, AND RELATED ACTION ITEMS; REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION AND ORDER TO SEAL EXHIBITS FOR MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS FOR AFFIDAVITS SUPPORTING MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT, DEMAND LETTER TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED], SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION, STATUS REPORT TO COURT, AND POTENTIAL MOTION FOR COURT APPROVAL TO RELINQUISH JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU REGARDING OPEN ISSUES WITH JOEL FRIANT'S [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND INCORPORATE GUY M. HOHMANN'S COMMENTS TO DRAFT MOTION TO APPROVE	1,815.00

			SETTLEMENT; REVIEW AND REVISE ORDER APPROVING SAME MOTION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND ██████████ ██████████ COUNSEL REGARDING COMMENTS TO PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU REGARDING MEDIA INQUIRY INTO PONZI SCHEME AND POSSIBLE RESPONSE TO SAME.	
11/29/2012	CEP	7.10 hrs.	DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER FOR MOTION TO FILE UNDER SEAL AFFIDAVIT OF G. HOHMANN AND SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; DRAFT AFFIDAVIT FOR C. AHART; REVISE MOTION AND PROPOSED ORDER TO FILE UNDER SEAL REFLECTING UPDATED EXHIBITS; REVISE AFFIDAVITS REFLECTING EDITS AND NEW LANGUAGE IN MOTION; UPDATE MOTION TO REFLECT CORRECT CITATIONS TO AFFIDAVIT; CONFERENCE WITH K. ANDERSON AND H. CANTU REGARDING DESCRIPTION OF ██████████ ██████████ FOR AFFIDAVIT; CONFERENCE WITH G. HOHMANN REGARDING LETTER TO THE CFTC REGARDING PROCESS UNDERTAKEN TO COMPILE LIST OF INVESTORS; CORRESPOND WITH FILE CLERK AND H. CANTU REGARDING DETAILS OF PROCESS USED TO COMPILE LIST; CONTACT ██████████ AT ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING RECEIPT OF PART OF RECORDS AND NEW DEPARTMENT ATTENDING TO REMAINING PORTION OF RECORDS; ATTEMPT TO CONTACT ██████████ LEGAL DEPARTMENT; CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON REGARDING NEW CONTACT FOR ██████████ CONTACT LEGAL DEPARTMENT AND EXPLAIN NEED FOR RECORDS AND PRIOR ACTIVITY WITH ██████████ CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON REGARDING NEW FAX TO ██████████	2,662.50
11/29/2012	HCR	4.30 hrs.	RESEARCH ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME FOR AFFIDAVIT; COMPLETE LIST OF FOLLOW UP QUESTIONS FROM ██████████ DOCUMENTS; CONTINUE RESEARCH OF SAME; BEGIN REVIEW OF INTERVIEW BETWEEN ██████████ AND ██████████ AND UPDATE TASK LIST; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SEVERAL E-MAILS; UPDATE CAST OF CHARACTERS LIST; RESEARCH REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE REGARDING J. FRIANT'S ██████████ ██████████ CONFERENCE REGARDING AFFIDAVITS; CONFERENCE REGARDING ADDRESS FOR ██████████ ██████████; CONFERENCE REGARDING J. FRIANT'S ASSETS AND DEBTS; CONFERENCE REGARDING CLAIMANT SPREADSHEET AND UPDATING SAME.	967.50
11/29/2012	KNA	2.10 hrs.	REVIEW E-MAILS REGARDING STATUS OF ██████████ ██████████ AND ██████████ ██████████ DOCUMENTS AND INFORMATION; RESEARCH TO LOCATE NAME AND CONTACT INFORMATION FOR ██████████ CORPORATE COUNSEL; E-MAILS REGARDING SAME; RE-FAX NOTIFICATION PACKAGE TO ██████████ PER REQUEST; UPDATE NOTIFICATIONS SPREADSHEETS; PREPARE LIST OF VALUE AND LIABILITY PERTAINING TO JOEL FRIANT'S CAR AND HOMES.	472.50
11/30/2012	CWA	0.20 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING ██████████ DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND ██████████ ██████████ LETTER REQUESTING ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; ATTENTION TO MOTION FOR DISCOVERY AND MOTION FOR DEFAULT JUDGMENT FILED BY CFTC.	110.00
11/30/2012	CEP	2.50 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON REGARDING RECORDS RECEIVED; CORRESPOND WITH FILE CLERK AND H. CANTU REGARDING UPDATES TO LIST OF METHODS USED TO COMPILE INVESTOR LIST FOR EMAIL TO CFTC; REVIEW RESPONSE TO SUBPOENA FROM ██████████ ██████████; DRAFT FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	937.50
11/30/2012	HCR	1.90 hrs.	PROCESS ██████████ ██████████ DOCUMENTS AND UPLOAD TO SUMMATION; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR E-MAILS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS; COMPLETE REVIEW OF INTERVIEW TRANSCRIPT; PROCESS FOR FILING.	427.50

11/30/2012	KNA	0.60 hrs.	ELECTRONICALLY ORGANIZE NOTIFICATION PACKAGE RE-SENT TO [REDACTED] E-MAILS REGARDING SAME; RECEIVE AND REVIEW AFFIDAVIT AND CORRESPONDENCE FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CONFERENCE REGARDING ACCOUNT RECORDS, INCLUDING MORTGAGES; E-MAILS REGARDING SAME AND INVOICE FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COPIES; UPDATE SPREADSHEET OF NOTIFICATIONS.	135.00
------------	-----	-----------	--	--------

Total Professional Services: \$88,072.50

For Expenses Advanced:

11/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	8.71
11/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	2.67
RESEARCH EXPENSES (V63926) LEXISNEXIS RISK DATA MANAGEMENT - 10/2012 ONLINE SEARCHES.	2.77
11/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	17.62
11/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	90.50
SUBPOENA/SERVICE FEES (V63989) NATHAN DOWD - SERVICE OF SUBPOENA ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] c/o CORPORATION SERVICE COMPANY.	65.00
AIR FARE (V64001) - ROUND TRIP 11/07-11/08/2012 TO WASHINGTON, D.C., FOR MEETING.	554.80
CAB FARE (V64001) - CAB FARES 11/07-11/08/2012 WHILE IN WASHINGTON, D.C., FOR MEETING.	105.05
HOTEL EXPENSES (V64001) - HOTEL CHARGES 11/07-11/08/2012 WHILE IN WASHINGTON, D.C., FOR MEETING.	194.08
MEALS (V64001) - HOTEL MEAL 11/07/2012 WHILE IN WASHINGTON, D.C., FOR MEETING.	23.70
TRAVEL EXPENSES (V64001) - HOTEL INTERNET ACCESS CHARGES 11/07-11/08/2012 WHILE IN WASHINGTON, D.C., FOR MEETING.	6.86
11/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	22.58
DELIVERY SERVICES (V64076) FEDERAL EXPRESS - TICKET # 801717333390 ON 10/17/2012.	29.56
DELIVERY SERVICES (V64076) FEDERAL EXPRESS - TICKET # 801717333404 ON 10/17/2012.	23.34
DELIVERY SERVICES (V64076) FEDERAL EXPRESS - TICKET # 799237651211 ON 10/19/2012.	47.75
DELIVERY SERVICES (V64076) FEDERAL EXPRESS - TICKET # 793963330463 ON 10/30/2012.	21.92
DELIVERY SERVICES (V64076) FEDERAL EXPRESS - TICKET # 793981781534 ON 11/01/2012.	43.98
DELIVERY SERVICES (V64076) FEDERAL EXPRESS - TICKET # 799191399440 ON 10/16/2012.	13.57
LONG DISTANCE CHARGES (V64078) AT&T - CONFERENCE CALL 11/05/2012.	344.65
11/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	68.53
11/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	33.56
11/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	20.82
11/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	228.08
CERTIFIED MAIL	5.60
FAX CHARGES	15.20
PHOTOCOPIES	154.35
POSTAGE	4.64

Total Expenses Advanced: \$2,149.89

Summary:

Professional Services:

TAYLOR, MARK C.	0.30 hrs.	775.00 /hr	\$232.50
AHART, CHRISTOPHER W	75.40 hrs.	550.00 /hr	\$41,470.00
PUCCIA, CARRIE E	76.30 hrs.	375.00 /hr	\$28,612.50
VICKERS, ANDREW P	6.50 hrs.	150.00 /hr	\$975.00
RYAN, HEATHER C	39.10 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$8,797.50
ANDERSON, KERI N	32.60 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$7,335.00
SUMRALL, HOLLIE N	5.20 hrs.	125.00 /hr	\$650.00
Total Professional Services			\$88,072.50

Expenses Advanced:

AIR FARE	\$554.80
CAB FARE	\$105.05
CERTIFIED MAIL	\$5.60
RESEARCH EXPENSES	\$2.77
DELIVERY SERVICES	\$180.12
FAX CHARGES	\$15.20
HOTEL EXPENSES	\$194.08
LONG DISTANCE CHARGES	\$344.65
MEALS	\$23.70
PHOTOCOPIES	\$154.35
POSTAGE	\$4.64
SUBPOENA/SERVICE FEES	\$65.00
TRAVEL EXPENSES	\$6.86
WESTLAW RESEARCH	\$493.07
Total Expenses Advanced	\$2,149.89

Total Current Charges	\$90,222.39
Less Discount Applied	\$13,210.88
Net Balance Forward	\$217,508.91
Please Pay This Amount	\$294,520.42

Please make checks payable to: Hohmann, Taube & Summers, L.L.P.

Hohmann, Taube & Summers, LLP
100 Congress Ave 18th Floor
Austin, TX 78701

Phone: (512)-472-5997 www.hts-law.com Fax: (512) 472-5248

MR. GUY M. HOHMANN
100 CONGRESS AVE STE 1800
AUSTIN, TX 78701-4042

Invoice Number 50770
Invoice Date 12/31/2012
Activity Billed Through 12/31/2012

Prior Balance Brought Forward	\$294,520.42
Less Adjustments Applied	-\$217,508.91
Less Payments Received	\$0.00
Net Balance Forward	<u>\$77,011.51</u>

HTS File Number: 8133 00001 JKE

RE: REPRESENT CLIENT AS RECEIVER OF VARIOUS INDIVIDUALS INVOLVED WITH AN AUSTRALIAN PONZI SCHEME.

For Professional Services Rendered:

12/03/2012 CWA 7.20 hrs. DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS 3,960.00
FOR DRAFT SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION TO COURT,
DRAFT STATUS REPORT TO COURT, MOTION TO FORFEIT JOEL
FRIANT'S ASSETS, DRAFT RECEIVER'S LETTER FOR FOREIGN
REGULATORS, AND STATUS OF CORRESPONDENCE WITH ██████████
██████████ AND ██████████ REGARDING REQUESTED
RECORDS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND
HEATHER CANTU REGARDING FACTUAL INFORMATION
SUPPORTING DRAFT RECEIVER'S LETTER FOR ██████████
██████████ REVIEW ██████████ LETTER RESPONDING TO
SUBPOENA AND REQUESTING ADDITIONAL INFORMATION;
CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND ██████████
██████████ COUNSEL REGARDING COMMENTS TO DRAFT
SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M.
HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI
ANDERSON REGARDING ANALYSIS OF ██████████ RECORDS AND
POSSIBLE WIRE TRANSFER TO ██████████;
CORRESPONDENCE WITH ██████████
COUNSEL AND GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING STATUS OF
DOCUMENT PRODUCTION; DRAFT MOTION TO APPROVE
FORFEITURE OF ASSETS; REVIEW AND REVISE AFFIDAVITS
SUPPORTING MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT WITH ██████████
██████████; CONFERENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING SAME
SETTLEMENT AND RELATED COORDINATION WITH ██████████
██████████ CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN,
CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND CFTC REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE
AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH ██████████ COUNSEL
REGARDING COMMENTS TO PROPOSED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT;
REVIEW SAME COMMENTS AND DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN;
INCORPORATE AND REVISE COMMENTS TO SAME PROPOSED
SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE
SETTLEMENT AND SUPPORTING AFFIDAVITS TO CONFORM SAME
TO REVISED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; CONFERENCE AND
CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING

			<p>JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS, POSSIBLE FORFEITURE, AND MOTION TO COURT REGARDING SAME; REVIEW [REDACTED] LETTER RESPONDING TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP; DISCUSS SAME WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA; REVIEW [REDACTED] LETTER ENCLOSING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.</p>	
12/03/2012	CEP	4.40 hrs.	<p>CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING DEADLINES AND TIMELINE FOR DRAFTS OF FEE APPLICATION AND REPORT; DISCUSS SUBPOENA RESPONSE FROM [REDACTED] WITH C. AHART; DRAFT SECOND FEE APPLICATION; CORRESPOND WITH H. CANTU REGARDING DRAFT MOTION FOR RELINQUISHMENT OF ASSETS; CONTACT [REDACTED] REGARDING RESPONSE TO SUBPOENA AND ADDITIONAL INFORMATION REQUESTED; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING REVISIONS TO AFFIDAVITS; CORRESPOND WITH H. CANTU REGARDING REVISIONS TO METHODS USED TO COMPILE INVESTOR LIST; REVIEW RESPONSES FROM [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] REGARDING REQUEST FOR RECORDS.</p>	1,650.00
12/03/2012	HCR	2.90 hrs.	<p>RESEARCH WESTLAW AND DOCKET FOR ASSET RELINQUISHMENT ORDERS; LOCATE SAME AND FORWARD FOR REVIEW; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH INVESTOR; CONFERENCE REGARDING FEE APPLICATION AND GAME PLAN; CONDUCT SEARCHES IN DATABASE.</p>	652.50
12/03/2012	KNA	0.90 hrs.	<p>REVIEW [REDACTED] RECORDS TO IDENTIFY ANY TRANSACTIONS THAT MIGHT CORRESPOND WITH S. POUSA'S PAYMENT TO [REDACTED]; E-MAILS REGARDING SAME.</p>	202.50
12/04/2012	CWA	7.20 hrs.	<p>DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REVISED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH [REDACTED] AND POTENTIAL ISSUES REGARDING DISCLAIMER OF BINDING GOVERNMENT REGULATORS TO SAME; CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING REVISED DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND SAME DISCLAIMER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING ISSUES RAISED BY [REDACTED] COUNSEL; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT EMAIL TO CFTC REGARDING RECEIVER'S MASTER LIST OF INVESTORS AND PROCESS USED TO COMPILE SAME; DISCUSS ISSUES REGARDING SAME WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND HOLLIE SUMRALL, INCLUDING STATUS OF MASTER LIST; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING STATUS OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION BY [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING NEED TO CONTACT VARIOUS LENDERS FOR JOEL FRIANT'S AUTOMOBILE AND REAL ESTATE ASSETS REGARDING RECEIVERSHIP, POSSIBLE ABANDONMENT OF ASSETS BY RECEIVER, AND FORBEARANCE ON REPOSSESSION OR FORECLOSURE PROCEEDINGS PENDING COURT APPROVAL FOR ABANDONMENT; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE SAME CONTACTS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA; DRAFT MOTION TO APPROVE FORFEITURE OF ASSETS; CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH TENANT AT JOEL FRIANT'S RENTAL PROPERTY REGARDING RECEIVERSHIP AND RENT PAYMENTS; CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING REQUESTED INTERVIEW AND ACCOUNTING FOR MIKE DILLARD AND JOEL FRIANT, AND ISSUES REGARDING PROPOSED SETTLEMENT WITH [REDACTED]; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH KERI ANDERSON SUMMARY TABLE OF ESTATE ASSETS FOR USE IN STATUS REPORT TO COURT; REVIEW [REDACTED] LETTER REGARDING FROZEN ACCOUNTS IN RESPONSE TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP; DISCUSS SAME WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND OUTSTANDING INFORMATION FOR WIRE TRANSFERS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING IMPROPER FREEZE OF ACCOUNTS FOR ELEVATION GROUP; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC</p>	3,960.00

			AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING LETTER REQUEST FOR INTERVIEW AND ACCOUNTING; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC, SEC AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING LETTER REQUEST FOR INTERVIEW AND ACCOUNTING.	
12/04/2012	CEP	0.50 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING LETTER TO CFTC; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING RELINQUISHMENT AGREEMENTS FROM ENTITIES AND ENTITY CONTACTS; TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING IMMEDIATE REMOVAL OF HOLDS PLACED ON ELEVATION GROUP ACCOUNTS AND FAX REGARDING SAME.	187.50
12/04/2012	KNA	2.60 hrs.	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM [REDACTED] AND LETTER FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] RESPONDING TO RECEIVERSHIP NOTICE; UPDATE SPREADSHEET OF NOTIFICATIONS; REVIEW E-MAILS REGARDING INVESTOR LIST; E-MAIL REMINDER REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ' DOCUMENTS DUE; CREATE CHART OF ASSETS AND LIABILITIES OF THE ESTATE; DISCUSSION REGARDING CALCULATIONS ON SPREADSHEET OF CLAIMANTS.	585.00
12/04/2012	HNS	1.50 hrs.	CLEANED AND VERIFIED CLIENT INFORMATION ON SPREADSHEET.	187.50
12/05/2012	CWA	1.40 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND CFTC REGARDING RECEIVERSHIP'S GOALS AND INVESTOR MASTER LIST FOR POTENTIAL DISTRIBUTION TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING NEED TO CONTACT VARIOUS LENDERS FOR JOEL FRIANT'S AUTOMOBILE AND REAL ESTATE ASSETS REGARDING RECEIVERSHIP, POSSIBLE ABANDONMENT OF ASSETS BY RECEIVER, AND FORBEARANCE ON REPOSSESSION OR FORECLOSURE PROCEEDINGS PENDING COURT APPROVAL FOR ABANDONMENT; REVIEW CFTC LETTERS TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING REQUESTS FOR INTERVIEW, DEPOSITION, AND FULL ACCOUNTING; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] FOR INTERNATIONAL WIRE TRANSFER RESEARCH AND POSSIBLE ADDITIONAL INFORMATION TO ASSIST SAME RESEARCH; CORRESPONDENCE WITH INVESTOR REGARDING ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR SAME RESEARCH; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING REVISED DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND ISSUES RAISED BY DISCLAIMER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING STATUS OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ASSETS, ANTICIPATED ABANDONMENT BY RECEIVER, AND NEED FOR RECORDS FROM LENDERS TO SEEK COURT APPROVAL FOR ABANDONMENT; CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING IMPROPER FREEZE OF MIKE DILLARD'S AND ELEVATION GROUP, INC.'S ACCOUNTS; DRAFT LETTER TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CFTC REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] SETTLEMENT AND STRATEGY TO FINALIZE SAME.	770.00
12/05/2012	CEP	0.40 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH H. CANTU REGARDING INVESTOR WITH WIRE TRANSFER INFORMATION; TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING POTENTIAL ADDITIONAL INFORMATION TO FAX FOR THEIR SEARCH FOR WIRE TRANSFERS.	150.00
12/05/2012	HCR	1.20 hrs.	UPDATE WEBSITE; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SEVERAL E-MAILS; PROCESS DOCUMENTS AND PLEADINGS IN CASE NOTEBOOK; DRAFT E-MAIL TO INVESTOR REQUESTING FURTHER INFORMATION FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RESEARCH [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME.	270.00

Date	Client	Hours	Description	Amount
12/06/2012	CWA	2.20 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE FORM LETTER TO FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS IN RECEIVERSHIP, POSSIBLE ABANDONMENT OF ASSETS BY RECEIVER, AND FORBEARANCE ON REPOSSESSION OR FORECLOSURE PROCEEDINGS PENDING COURT APPROVAL FOR ABANDONMENT; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING ISSUES FOR SAME, INCLUDING DIRECTIVES IN COURT'S RESTRAINING ORDER, AND STATUS OF DISCUSSIONS FOR PRODUCTION OF RECORDS FROM FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS, INCLUDING CONTINUING PROBLEMS WITH [REDACTED] AND POSSIBLE NEED FOR LETTER THREATENING CONTEMPT PROCEEDINGS; REVIEW PROPOSED CFTC MOTION TO [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC AND GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING SAME AND ISSUES REGARDING STATUS OF [REDACTED] SETTLEMENT AND NEW DISCLAIMER CLAUSE; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC, MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL AND JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING SAME MOTION TO [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND HOLLIE SUMRALL REGARDING NEW INFORMATION FROM INVESTOR VICTIM; REVIEW [REDACTED] LETTER RESPONSE TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP AND FREEZE OF JOEL FRIANT'S ACCOUNT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING ISSUES RAISED IN SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING NEED FOR FUTURE STATUS REPORT TO COURT ON CLAIMS PROCESS; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP ACTION ITEMS, INCLUDING TIMING AND ISSUES FOR SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION, STATUS REPORT TO COURT, MOTION TO APPROVE [REDACTED] SETTLEMENT IF SAME IS FINALIZED, AND MOTION TO APPROVE ABANDONMENT OF JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS.	1,210.00
12/06/2012	CEP	6.30 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING TEMPLATE FOR RECEIVERSHIP CLAIMS PROCESS; TELECONFERENCE WITH VARIOUS INDIVIDUALS/DEPARTMENTS WITHIN [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] REGARDING RELINQUISHMENT OF ASSETS AND LETTER AGREEMENT FORBEARING FORECLOSURE/REPOSSESSION; EMAIL TO [REDACTED] FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME AND RECORDS NEEDED; EMAIL TO [REDACTED] OUTLINING REQUEST; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING DIFFICULTIES WITH [REDACTED] AND POTENTIAL SOLUTIONS; CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING RECORDS REQUEST; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING FORM OF LETTER AGREEMENT FOR FORBEARANCE AND LANGUAGE IN STATUTORY RESTRAINING ORDER ADDRESSING REPOSSESSION/FORECLOSURE; DRAFT RECEIVERSHIP STATUS REPORT.	2,362.50
12/06/2012	HCR	1.70 hrs.	ATTEND MEETING WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING TRUST ACCOUNT; CONDUCT SEARCHES IN J. FRIANT [REDACTED]	382.50
12/07/2012	CWA	3.10 hrs.	REVISE LETTER TO [REDACTED] REGARDING IMPROPER FREEZE OF MIKE DILLARD'S AND ELEVATION GROUP, INC.'S ACCOUNTS; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO SAME TO ADDRESS [REDACTED] FAILURE TO INVESTIGATE AND PRODUCE RECORDS; ATTENTION TO SENDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND WITHDRAWAL OF COUNSEL; REVIEW AND REVISE UPDATED DRAFT LETTER TO FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS IN RECEIVERSHIP, POSSIBLE ABANDONMENT OF ASSETS BY	1,705.00

			<p>RECEIVER, AND FORBEARANCE ON REPOSSESSION OR FORECLOSURE PROCEEDINGS PENDING COURT APPROVAL FOR ABANDONMENT; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING ISSUES FOR SAME; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP ACTION ITEMS, INCLUDING TIMING AND ISSUES FOR SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION, INFORMATION FOR STATUS REPORT TO COURT, MOTION TO APPROVE [REDACTED] SETTLEMENT IF SAME IS FINALIZED, AND MOTION TO APPROVE ABANDONMENT OF JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS; REVISE [REDACTED] DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, MOTION TO APPROVE SAME, AND SUPPORTING AFFIDAVITS TO REFLECT CHANGES TO SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND HOLLIE SUMRALL REGARDING NEW INFORMATION FROM INVESTOR VICTIM; DRAFT MOTION TO APPROVE RECEIVER'S ABANDONMENT OF JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING ESTATE'S RECEIPT OF INSTALLMENT PAYMENT FROM MIKE DILLARD; CORRESPONDENCE FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING POSSIBLE ACCOUNTS FOR JOEL FRIANT OR [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING STATUS OF SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL AND POSSIBLE STRATEGIES TO RESOLVE OUTSTANDING ISSUES.</p>	
12/07/2012	CEP	1.60 hrs.	<p>CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] AT [REDACTED] REGARDING RECORDS RECEIVED; REVISE LETTER TO [REDACTED] REGARDING CLOSURE OF ACCOUNTS AND RECORDS NEEDED; CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING PAYMENTS FROM DILLARD AND ACCOUNT TOTAL; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING SAME; REVISE LETTER AGREEMENT WITH FINANCIAL ENTITIES; DRAFT STATUS REPORT OF RECEIVERSHIP.</p>	600.00
12/07/2012	HCR	1.30 hrs.	<p>CONFERENCE REGARDING SECOND FEE APPLICATION AND VENDOR PAYMENTS; PROCESS COMMUNICATIONS.</p>	292.50
12/07/2012	KNA	0.40 hrs.	<p>E-MAILS REGARDING POSSIBLE MEETINGS IN HOUSTON; E-MAIL REGARDING CHART OF ESTATE ASSETS AND LIABILITIES; REVIEW E-MAILS REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH [REDACTED].</p>	90.00
12/10/2012	CWA	2.10 hrs.	<p>DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA CONTINUING PROBLEMS WITH [REDACTED], IMPACT ON RECEIVER'S EFFORTS TO POSSIBLY ABANDON JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS, AND NEED FOR DEMAND LETTER REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CFTC REGARDING DEAL POINTS FOR SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL AND POSSIBLE STRATEGIES TO RESOLVE OUTSTANDING ISSUES; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC, SEC, AND [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING SCHEDULED INTERVIEW AND CONSENT TO RELEASE FINANCIAL RECORDS; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES REGARDING DRAFT STATUS REPORT TO COURT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING CONTACT FROM [REDACTED] AND FOLLOW UP REGARDING RECEIVER'S POSSIBLE ABANDONMENT OF VEHICLE; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING INVESTOR INQUIRIES; DRAFT RESPONSE TO SAME INQUIRIES; REVIEW AND REVISE DEMAND LETTER TO [REDACTED] REGARDING PRODUCTION OF RECORDS; REVIEW AND REVISE RECEIVER'S FIRST INTERIM STATUS REPORT TO COURT.</p>	1,155.00
12/10/2012	CEP	3.10 hrs.	<p>CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING ORIGINAL COPY OF [REDACTED] LOAN AGREEMENT OBTAINED FROM [REDACTED]; FINISH</p>	1,162.50

			DRAFTING STATUS REPORT OF THE RECEIVERSHIP; DRAFT DEMAND LETTER TO [REDACTED].	
12/10/2012	HCR	1.60 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR E-MAILS; TELEPHONE CALL WITH INVESTOR.	360.00
12/11/2012	CWA	2.40 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE RECEIVER'S FIRST INTERIM STATUS REPORT TO COURT; DISCUSS ISSUES REGARDING SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH KERI ANDERSON REGARDING REDACTION OF NOVEMBER INVOICE FOR FUTURE FEE APPLICATION TO COURT; CONFERENCES WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CFTC REGARDING DEAL POINTS FOR SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL AND POSSIBLE STRATEGIES TO RESOLVE OUTSTANDING ISSUES; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA FINAL REVISIONS TO DEMAND LETTER TO [REDACTED] REGARDING PRODUCTION OF RECORDS; ATTENTION TO SIGNING AND SENDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING [REDACTED] IF SETTLEMENT FAILS AND LAWSUIT IS PURSUED; REVIEW CFTC'S MOTION FOR DISCOVERY AGAINST DEFENDANTS JOEL FRIANT, MIKE DILLARD, AND ELEVATION GROUP, INC.; DRAFT EMAIL TO PRINCIPALS OF [REDACTED] REGARDING WITHDRAWAL OF COUNSEL AND [REDACTED] OBLIGATIONS UNDER RESTRAINING ORDER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND PRIOR COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] REGARDING BAD EMAIL ADDRESSES FOR SAME PRINCIPALS.	1,320.00
12/11/2012	CEP	0.40 hrs.	REVISE LETTER TO [REDACTED]; RESEARCH ADDRESSES FOR LETTER, ATTACH EXHIBIT TO LETTER.	150.00
12/11/2012	HCR	1.30 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS; REVIEW SOCIAL MEDIA; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR E-MAILS.	292.50
12/11/2012	KNA	3.20 hrs.	REVIEW E-MAIL AND LOAN AGREEMENT PRODUCED BY [REDACTED] E-MAIL REGARDING INVOICE FOR NOVEMBER TO SUBMIT WITH FEE APPLICATION; REVIEW NOVEMBER INVOICE AND REDACT CONFIDENTIAL AND PRIVILEGED INFORMATION; RESEARCH [REDACTED] TO FIND CONTACT FOR LEGAL DEPARTMENT, GENERAL COUNSEL, FORECLOSURE DEPARTMENT AND SUBPOENA DEPARTMENT; E-MAIL REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE WITH CHRISTOPHER W. AHART REGARDING STATUS OF SETTLEMENT WITH [REDACTED]; REVIEW LETTER TO [REDACTED]	720.00
12/11/2012	HNS	0.50 hrs.	ADDED CLIENT INFORMATION TO SPREADSHEET.	62.50
12/12/2012	CWA	2.90 hrs.	DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN ISSUES AND INFORMATION TO INCLUDE IN DRAFT STATUS REPORT TO COURT, STATUS OF DEAL POINTS FOR SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL AND POSSIBLE STRATEGIES TO RESOLVE OUTSTANDING ISSUES, AND PRIOR CONFERENCES WITH CFTC REGARDING SAME; REVIEW AND REVISE RECEIVER'S FIRST INTERIM STATUS REPORT TO COURT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] PRINCIPALS REGARDING WITHDRAWAL OF COUNSEL AND [REDACTED] OBLIGATIONS UNDER RESTRAINING ORDER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND SEC REGARDING NEW TIME AND ISSUES FOR UPCOMING TELEPHONE CALL WITH [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING FINANCIAL DISCLOSURES FROM [REDACTED] CONCERNING PROPHETMAX FUNDS RECEIVED; REVIEW SAME DISCLOSURES; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, KERI ANDERSON AND CFTC REGARDING PREPARATIONS FOR INTERVIEW OF [REDACTED];	1,595.00

			CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC, JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL, AND COUNSEL FOR MIKE DILLARD AND ELEVATION GROUP, INC. REGARDING OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO EXTEND STATUS REPORT DEADLINE; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA SAME DRAFT MOTION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS OF SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY [REDACTED] AND OUTSTANDING ISSUES INVOLVING [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT LETTER AGREEMENT WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING RECEIVER'S POSSIBLE ABANDONMENT OF JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS AND FORBEARANCE OF FORECLOSURE PROCEEDINGS; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING SAME AND PROVISIONS IN [REDACTED] LOAN AGREEMENT EVIDENCING KEYBANK'S LIENS ON JOEL FRIANT'S PROPERTIES; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH NAN GRIFFES REVISIONS TO TABLE OF FINANCIAL INFORMATION IN RECEIVER'S DRAFT STATUS REPORT TO COURT.	
12/12/2012	CEP	2.60 hrs.	TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING OBTAINING COPIES OF ORIGINAL LOAN DOCUMENTS AND OBTAINING AUTHORIZATION TO DISCUSS POTENTIAL FORECLOSURE AND AGREEMENT REGARDING SAME; TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING OBTAINING COPIES OF ORIGINAL LOAN DOCUMENTS AND GIVING NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP AND STATUTORY RESTRAINING ORDER TO FORECLOSURE DEPARTMENT; REVIEW AND ANALYZE ORIGINAL LOAN AGREEMENTS FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] REVISE DRAFT FORECLOSURE AGREEMENT ACCORDINGLY AND MAIL AND FAX TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVISE [REDACTED] FORECLOSURE AGREEMENT; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING ANTICIPATED CALL WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND EXTENDING DEADLINE TO FILE STATUS REPORT; DRAFT MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINE TO FILE REPORT.	975.00
12/12/2012	HCR	2.10 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING SEARCHES FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] INTERVIEW; BEGIN SEVERAL SEARCHES AND DOCUMENT SAME.	472.50
12/12/2012	KNA	0.20 hrs.	PREPARE REVISED RECEIVERSHIP PACKAGE TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PER THEIR REQUEST.	45.00
12/13/2012	CWA	7.30 hrs.	REVIEW, REVISE, AND SEND LETTER TO [REDACTED] REGARDING RECEIVER'S POSSIBLE ABANDONMENT OF JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS AND FORBEARANCE OF FORECLOSURE PROCEEDINGS; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT STATUS REPORT TO COURT, INCLUDING REVIEW OF COURT ORDER REQUIRING SAME AND SPECIFIED INFORMATION, OTHER COURT PAPERS, WORK PRODUCT, AND FACTUAL INVESTIGATION MATERIALS; REVIEW AND REVISE UNOPPOSED MOTION TO EXTEND RECEIVER'S DEADLINE TO FILE STATUS REPORT WITH COURT, AND PROPOSED ORDER ON SAME; REVIEW RECENT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA SAME AND DEMAND LETTER TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DISCUSS WITH HEATHER CANTU COMPILATION OF FACTUAL INVESTIGATION MATERIALS FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] INTERVIEW; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA STATISTICAL ANALYSIS OF INVESTOR MASTER LIST FOR REPORTING IN STATUS REPORT TO COURT.	4,015.00
12/13/2012	CEP	6.00 hrs.	DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER TO EXTEND RECEIVER'S DEADLINE TO FILE REPORT; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING FINANCIAL INFORMATION IN STATUS REPORT; DRAFT MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; REVIEW CASE LAW REGARDING RECEIVERSHIP DUTIES;	2,250.00

CALCULATE VARIOUS STATISTICS RELATED TO INVESTORS AND INVESTMENT LOSSES FOR REPORT; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART ABOUT REPORT REVISIONS, INCLUDING REQUIREMENTS FROM ORDER, AND TASKS GOING FORWARD; RESEARCH FRAUDULENT TRANSFER LAW FOR DEMAND LETTER TO [REDACTED]

12/13/2012	HCR	4.70 hrs.	PROCESS DOCUMENTS; CONTINUE SEARCHES IN SUMMATION; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE REGARDING MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE GAME PLAN; CONFERENCE REGARDING MATERIALS NEEDED FOR GUY M. HOHMANN'S REVIEW FOR MEETING WITH [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE REGARDING INTERVIEW WITH [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL; UPDATE SOCIAL MEDIA; PROCESS SRO RESPONSES; BEGIN REVIEW AND TAGGING OF HOT DOCUMENTS FOR GUY M. HOHMANN'S REVIEW.	1,057.50
12/13/2012	KNA	0.20 hrs.	ELECTRONICALLY ORGANIZE RECEIVERSHIP PACKAGE FAXED TO [REDACTED], LETTER TO [REDACTED], AND LETTER TO [REDACTED].	45.00
12/14/2012	CWA	4.30 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT STATUS REPORT TO COURT; DISCUSS SUPPORTING EXHIBITS, AND STATUS AND STRATEGY FOR SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS WITH [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND REVISE EXHIBITS IN SUPPORT OF STATUS REPORT TO COURT; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE FURTHER REVISIONS TO SAME WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND NAN GRIFFES; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES CONCERNING DRAFT DEMAND LETTER TO [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE AND CONFERENCES WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS AND POSSIBLE STRATEGIES FOR FINAL RESOLUTION; COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA DRAFT FRAUDULENT TRANSFER COMPLAINT AGAINST [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] RESPONDING TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP; DISCUSS SAME AND FOLLOW UP WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA; CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S INFORMATION RELATED TO [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH NEW COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] REGARDING OUTSTANDING FINANCIAL AND OTHER INFORMATION PROMISED IN PRIOR NEGOTIATIONS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING SECURITIES HELD IN [REDACTED].	2,365.00
12/14/2012	CEP	3.60 hrs.	RESEARCH FRAUDULENT TRANSFER LAW AND DRAFT DEMAND LETTER TO [REDACTED]; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART AND K. ANDERSON REGARDING LETTER FROM [REDACTED]; CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING SEARCH; CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] INFORMATION; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING TABLES AND STATISTICS FOR REPORT AND SETTLEMENT STRATEGY, INCLUDING DRAFTING COMPLAINT AGAINST [REDACTED].	1,350.00
12/14/2012	HCR	3.20 hrs.	LOCATE SRO RESPONSES IN FILE; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE REGARDING MASTER CLAIMANT SPREADSHEET AND INFORMATION NEEDED FROM SAME; CONTINUE DATABASE REVIEW FOR MEETING WITH [REDACTED]; UPDATE SEARCH TERM LOG; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL.	720.00
12/14/2012	KNA	0.80 hrs.	MULTIPLE E-MAILS REGARDING J. FRIANT'S [REDACTED] OBTAIN ACCOUNT DOCUMENT PRODUCED BY J. FRIANT TO DETERMINE [REDACTED] SEARCH DATABASE FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION; MULTIPLE E-MAILS REGARDING J. FRIANT'S [REDACTED]	180.00

			ACCOUNT.	
12/17/2012	CWA	6.90 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND SEC REGARDING STATUS OF SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND STRATEGIES FOR RESOLUTION; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS FOR SAME, UPCOMING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] INTERVIEW, CURRENT STATUS OF INVESTOR MASTER LIST, AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA DRAFT COMPLAINT AND CONSENT ORDER FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND HOLLIE SUMRALL REGARDING ANALYSIS AND REORGANIZATION OF INVESTOR MASTER LIST FOR CLAIMS PROCESS AND SUMMARY INFORMATION FOR COURT; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH HEATHER CANTU COMPILATION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] FACTUAL INVESTIGATION DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE FOR UPCOMING INTERVIEW AND POSSIBLY LOCATE MISSING INFORMATION IN INVESTOR MASTER LIST; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING NEW SUPPORTING EXHIBITS FOR STATUS REPORT; REVIEW DUTCH REGULATOR'S PRESS RELEASE REGARDING ARRESTS IN PROPHETMAX FRAUD AND FROZEN ASSETS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, AND SEC REGARDING SAME; REVIEW COURT ORDER GRANTING EXTENSION TO FILE RECEIVER'S STATUS REPORT; CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS AND POSSIBLE CONSENT ORDER TO RESOLVE FINAL ISSUES; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING SAME; REVISE STATUS REPORT TO COURT AND SUPPORTING EXHIBITS TO INCORPORATE NEW INFORMATION FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED], ISSUES REGARDING INVESTOR MASTER LIST, AND TO MEET PAGE LIMITS IN LOCAL RULES; DISCUSS WITH NAN GRIFFES FURTHER REVISIONS TO SAME; DISCUSS WITH HEATHER CANTU NEW INFORMATION FOR POSTING ON ESTATE WEBSITE AND FACEBOOK PAGE; CONFERENCE WITH NEW COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING OUTSTANDING FINANCIAL AND OTHER INFORMATION PROMISED IN PRIOR NEGOTIATIONS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING MISSING NAMES IN INVESTOR SPREADSHEET AND RECORDS FOR SAME; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LETTER AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION RESPONDING TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP.	3,795.00
12/17/2012	CEP	3.90 hrs.	DRAFT JOHN DOE COMPLAINT FOR SETTLEMENT; DISCUSS INVESTOR LIST WITH H. SUMRALL AND C. AHART; DISCUSS WITH H. SUMRALL PROJECT CALCULATING VARIOUS STATISTICS FOR INCLUSION IN REPORT; CORRESPOND WITH J. GEORGE REGARDING INVESTOR LIST FROM J. FRIANT.	1,462.50
12/17/2012	HCR	3.70 hrs.	COMPARE SEVERAL SPREADSHEETS USED TO COMPILE AND MAINTAIN CUSTOMER INFORMATION; CONFERENCE REGARDING COMPILING AND EDITING OF MAIN SPREADSHEET; CONFERENCE REGARDING ALL OUTSTANDING PROJECTS; CONFERENCE REGARDING STATUTORY RESTRAINING ORDER RESPONSE FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED], [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE REGARDING J. FRIANT'S DOCUMENT FOR REVIEW; UPDATE SOCIAL MEDIA; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; RETRIEVE PRESS RELEASES; UPDATE WEBSITE; REVIEW AND ORGANIZE INVOICES RECEIVED; REVIEW AND RETRIEVE SAME; REVISE FEE APPLICATION.	832.50
12/18/2012	CWA	9.90 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LETTER RESPONDING TO NOTICE OF RECEIVERSHIP AND DEFICIENCY	5,445.00

OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH HEATHER CANTU COMPILATION OF JOEL FRIANT'S FACTUAL INVESTIGATION DOCUMENTS TO PREPARE FOR UPCOMING INTERVIEW; CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING MISSING NAMES IN INVESTOR SPREADSHEET AND RECORDS FOR SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC AND SEC REGARDING [REDACTED] DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND HOLLIE SUMRALL REGARDING SAME AND LOCATING MISSING INFORMATION FROM ELECTRONIC RECORDS; CONFERENCES AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING ISSUES AND PREPARATIONS FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] UPCOMING INTERVIEW; REVIEW INVESTIGATIVE REPORT REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING INFORMATION IN SAME; REVIEW FACTUAL INVESTIGATION DOCUMENTS, WORK PRODUCT, PRIOR INTERVIEW NOTES AND RELATED MATERIALS, AND PREPARE OUTLINE FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] INTERVIEW BASED ON SAME REVIEW; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING LEGAL ISSUES FOR DRAFT COMPLAINT AND CONSENT ORDER ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLAIMS; CONFERENCE WITH COURT CLERK REGARDING POSSIBLE COMPLAINT AND CONSENT ORDER FOR NICK VAN DEN BREKEL AND COURT'S AVAILABILITY FOR SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND SEC REGARDING SAME.

12/18/2012	CEP	7.00 hrs.	DRAFT JOHN DOE COMPLAINT FOR SETTLEMENT PURPOSES; RESEARCH BASIS FOR JURISDICTION FOR COMPLAINT; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING STATUS OF CLAIMANTS CHART, PERSONAL JURISDICTION ISSUES FOR COMPLAINT.	2,625.00
12/18/2012	HCR	5.70 hrs.	CONTINUE REVIEW, SEARCH AND SUMMARY OF DOCUMENTS; PROVIDE REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO GUY M. HOHMANN AND CHRISTOPHER W. AHART; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE REGARDING INTERVIEW WITH [REDACTED] CONFERENCE REGARDING CLAIMANT CHARTS AND REVISIONS TO SAME; FORWARD DOCUMENTS TO CFTC FOR REVIEW; REVISE SUMMARIES; REVIEW [REDACTED] INFORMATION FROM CFTC.	1,282.50
12/18/2012	HNS	3.70 hrs.	ADDED INVESTOR ACCOUNT NUMBERS TO SPREADSHEET.	462.50
12/19/2012	CWA	9.60 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING CFTC LETTER AND MOTION FOR DISCOVERY; CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CFTC REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL AND CFTC REGARDING CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS ABOVE; LISTEN TO [REDACTED] RECORDING OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CONCERNING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TELECONFERENCE INTERVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC AND SEC; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN RECEIVERSHIP AND LITIGATION ISSUES RAISED IN SAME INTERVIEW, INCLUDING PREPARATIONS FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONFERENCES WITH SEC AND CFTC REGARDING SAME; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH HEATHER CANTU SUMMARY OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] INTERVIEW NOTES; CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND COURT CLERK REGARDING POSSIBLE COMPLAINT AND CONSENT ORDER FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND COURT'S AVAILABILITY FOR SAME; DISCUSS SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND ACTION ITEMS TO PROCEED WITH LITIGATION; CONFERENCE WITH SEC REGARDING SAME AND COORDINATION WITH CFTC; CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]S COUNSEL REGARDING PROCESS TO INITIATE LITIGATION AND RESOLVE CLAIMS; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING	5,280.00

Date	Code	Hours	Description	Amount
			LEGAL ISSUES FOR DRAFT COMPLAINT AND CONSENT ORDER ON █████ █████ █████ CLAIMS; CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC AND █████ █████ REGARDING STATUS OF FOREIGN PROCEEDINGS, ASSET RECOVERIES, AND DISTRIBUTION PROCESS; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN RECEIVERSHIP ISSUES RAISED IN SAME CONFERENCE.	
12/19/2012	CEP	2.20 hrs.	DRAFT COMPLAINT FOR █████ █████ █████; RESEARCH RELATED JURISDICTION ISSUES; DRAFT MEMO TO C. AHART REGARDING JURISDICTION ISSUES; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING SAME; DRAFT AGREED JUDGMENT.	825.00
12/19/2012	HCR	4.50 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING █████ █████ AND ATTEMPT TO LOCATE SAME; PARTICIPATE IN TELEPHONE INTERVIEW WITH █████ █████ CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE REGARDING SUMMARY; UPDATE CAST OF CHARACTERS INFORMATION.	1,012.50
12/19/2012	HNS	1.00 hrs.	ADD CLIENT ACCOUNT NUMBERS TO SPREADSHEET.	125.00
12/20/2012	CWA	5.60 hrs.	CONFERENCES WITH SEC REGARDING LITIGATION TO RESOLVE █████ █████ █████ CLAIMS, █████ █████ █████ AND RECEIVERSHIP'S ISSUES RAISED IN PRIOR CONFERENCE WITH █████ █████; REVISE RECEIVER'S FIRST STATUS REPORT TO COURT, INCLUDING NEW INFORMATION AND ISSUES RAISED IN PRIOR CONFERENCE WITH █████ █████; REVIEW ESTATE BANK ACCOUNT INFORMATION FOR STATUS REPORT; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH HEATHER CANTU AND NAN GRIFFES FURTHER REVISIONS TO SAME REPORT; CONFERENCE WITH CFTC AND MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING CFTC LETTER, MOTION FOR DISCOVERY, DOCUMENTS AND CONSENTS NEEDED, INTERVIEW AND DEPOSITION OF MIKE DILLARD; DISCUSS SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN; CONFERENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING DISCUSSIONS WITH █████ █████ CONCERNING FACTUAL INVESTIGATION OF FRAUD AND RECEIVERSHIP ISSUES RAISED IN PRIOR CONFERENCE WITH █████ █████; CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING █████ █████ PUCIA REGARDING LEGAL ISSUES FOR DRAFT COMPLAINT AND CONSENT ORDER ON █████ █████ █████ CLAIMS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING ANALYSIS OF U.K. INVESTOR LOSSES IN INVESTOR MASTER LIST.	3,080.00
12/20/2012	HCR	2.30 hrs.	REVISE STATUS REPORT; CONFERENCE WITH SOURCES REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE REGARDING TELEPHONE CALL WITH █████ AND SUMMARY OF █████ INTERVIEW; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL.	517.50
12/20/2012	HNS	4.50 hrs.	ADD CLIENT ACCOUNT NUMBERS TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	562.50
12/21/2012	EJT	0.30 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH G. HOHMANN REGARDING RECEIVERSHIP ACTIONS.	232.50
12/21/2012	CWA	4.60 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE STATUS REPORT TO ADDRESS COMMENTS, INCLUDING DISCUSSION OF POSSIBLE DISTRIBUTION SCENARIOS OF FOREIGN ASSETS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND SEC REGARDING ISSUES ADDRESSED IN STATUS REPORT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING █████ █████ REPORTS OF █████ █████; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH NAN GRIFFES FINAL REVISIONS TO STATUS REPORT; ATTENTION TO FILING SAME; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN ANALYSIS OF INVESTOR MASTER LIST TO DETERMINE U.K. INVESTORS FOR CFTC AND SEC; REVIEW AND ANALYZE MASTER LIST; DISCUSS SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND COORDINATE WITH HEATHER CANTU	2,530.00

AND HOLLIE SUMRALL NECESSARY REVISIONS TO MASTER LIST AND IDENTIFICATION OF TOP TEN U.K. INVESTORS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING [REDACTED] FURNISHING SAME INFORMATION TO [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED], AND TOP TEN U.K. INVESTORS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU REGARDING [REDACTED] AND INVESTOR COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING [REDACTED].

12/21/2012	HCR	2.70 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; REVISE STATUS REPORTS; UPDATE WEBSITE WITH STATUS REPORT; UPDATE SOCIAL MEDIA; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS; RESEARCH AND PROVIDE INFORMATION REGARDING [REDACTED]	607.50
12/27/2012	MT	0.40 hrs.	ANALYSIS OF ISSUES REGARDING CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND DISTRIBUTIONS.	310.00
12/27/2012	HCR	1.10 hrs.	BEGIN REVIEWING AND TYPING SUMMARIES FOR [REDACTED] INTERVIEW.	247.50
12/27/2012	HNS	4.00 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	500.00
Total Professional Services:				<u>\$71,245.00</u>

For Expenses Advanced:

12/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	8.32
12/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	32.96
12/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	0.13
12/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	29.66
DELIVERY SERVICES (V64286) FEDERAL EXPRESS - TICKET # 898777746241 ON 10/23/2012.	77.13
12/2012 WESTLAW RESEARCH	83.70
DELIVERY SERVICES (V64356) FEDERAL EXPRESS - TICKET # 801936735957 ON 12/12/2012.	61.63
DELIVERY SERVICES (V64356) FEDERAL EXPRESS - TICKET # 801936735968 ON 12/13/2012.	61.63
FAX CHARGES	7.20
PHOTOCOPIES	212.70
POSTAGE	6.80
Total Expenses Advanced:	<u>\$581.86</u>

Summary:

Professional Services:

TAUBE, ERIC J.	0.30 hrs.	775.00 /hr	\$232.50
TAYLOR, MARK C.	0.40 hrs.	775.00 /hr	\$310.00
AHART, CHRISTOPHER W	76.70 hrs.	550.00 /hr	\$42,185.00
PUCCIA, CARRIE E	42.00 hrs.	375.00 /hr	\$15,750.00
RYAN, HEATHER C	40.00 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$9,000.00
ANDERSON, KERI N	8.30 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$1,867.50
SUMRALL, HOLLIE N	15.20 hrs.	125.00 /hr	\$1,900.00
Total Professional Services			\$71,245.00

Expenses Advanced:

DELIVERY SERVICES	\$200.39
FAX CHARGES	\$7.20
PHOTOCOPIES	\$212.70
POSTAGE	\$6.80
WESTLAW RESEARCH	\$154.77
Total Expenses Advanced	\$581.86

Total Current Charges	\$71,826.86
Less Discount Applied	\$10,686.75
Net Balance Forward	\$77,011.51
Please Pay This Amount	<u>\$138,151.62</u>

Please make checks payable to: Hohmann, Taube & Summers, L.I.P.

Hohmann, Taube & Summers, LLP
100 Congress Ave 18th Floor
Austin, TX 78701

Phone: (512)-472-5997 www.hts-law.com Fax: (512) 472-5248

MR. GUY M. HOHMANN
100 CONGRESS AVE STE 1800
AUSTIN, TX 78701-4042

Invoice Number 50771
Invoice Date 01/31/2013
Activity Billed Through 01/31/2013

Prior Balance Brought Forward	\$138,151.62
Less Payments Received	\$0.00
Net Balance Forward	<u>\$138,151.62</u>

HTS File Number: 8133 00001 JKE

RE: REPRESENT CLIENT AS RECEIVER OF VARIOUS INDIVIDUALS INVOLVED WITH AN AUSTRALIAN PONZI SCHEME.

For Professional Services Rendered:

01/02/2013	CWA	0.10 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP, ACTION ITEMS AND PLANNING.	55.00
01/02/2013	CEP	0.30 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING DOCUMENTS NEEDED; TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LEGAL HOLDS TEAM REGARDING IDENTIFICATION OF ACCOUNTS WITH INFORMATION FROM J. FRIANT; CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING LOCATING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ACCOUNT.	112.50
01/02/2013	HCR	1.10 hrs.	UPDATE WEBSITE AND SOCIAL MEDIA; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL; RESPOND TO FLASHBACK DATA REGARDING INVOICES; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME.	247.50
01/02/2013	KNA	1.40 hrs.	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE, RULE 11 AGREEMENT, MULTIPLE EMAILS PERTAINING TO ASSETS OF THE ESTATE, AND THE FIRST INTERIM STATUS REPORT; UPDATE NOTIFICATIONS SPREADSHEET; ELECTRONICALLY PREPARE LATEST RESPONSES AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FOR CFTC AND SECURITY EXCHANGE COMMISSION; EMAIL CFTC, SECURITY EXCHANGE COMMISSION AND TEAM WITH SAME.	315.00
01/02/2013	HNS	4.00 hrs.	ADDED CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	500.00
01/03/2013	CWA	4.60 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING STATUS OF RESPONSES TO NOTICES OF RECEIVERSHIP AND NEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM VARIOUS FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS; REVIEW SCHEDULE OF SAME, NOTING OPEN ITEMS; DISCUSS SAME WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI ANDERSON; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS, INCLUDING SECOND FEE APPLICATION, DRAFT COMPLAINT FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLAIMS, [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED], AND CLAIMS AGAINST [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] LETTER REGARDING INVOICE FOR COSTS; REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LETTER REGARDING RECEIVERSHIP STATUS; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA DRAFT LETTER RESPONSE	2,530.00

TO SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH KERI ANDERSON REGARDING STATUS OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA STATUS OF DEALINGS WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND ACTION ITEMS FOR FOLLOW UP; CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING STATUS OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] INVOLVING [REDACTED] OR PROPHETMAX; CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND ACCESS TO SAME; REVIEW PRIOR RECORDS PRODUCED BY [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND DISCUSS FOLLOW UP WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA; REVIEW COURT ORDER GRANTING DISCOVERY TO CFTC; ATTENTION TO [REDACTED] EXECUTION OF FORBEARANCE AGREEMENT ON REPOSSESSION OF JOEL FRIANT'S VEHICLE; REVIEW AND REVISE SUGGESTED INVOICE REDACTIONS FOR SECOND FEE APPLICATION TO COURT.

01/03/2013 CEP 0.70 hrs. CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING LETTER SENT JANUARY 3, 2013; CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING FORBEARANCE LETTER AGREEMENT; DRAFT MOTION FOR SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION. 262.50

01/03/2013 HCR 2.20 hrs. RESEARCH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] FOR OUTSTANDING ITEMS STILL NEEDED FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL; CONTINUE SUMMARIES; CONFERENCE REGARDING FEE APPLICATION STATUS. 495.00

01/03/2013 KNA 1.20 hrs. REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS; MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING SAME; EMAILS REGARDING STATUS OF DOCUMENTS FROM ATTORNEYS FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; EMAILS REGARDING REDACTED INVOICES FOR FEE APPLICATION; UPDATE NOTIFICATIONS SPREADSHEET. 270.00

01/03/2013 HNS 4.90 hrs. ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET. 612.50

01/04/2013 CWA 4.60 hrs. CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS OF SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS, POTENTIAL LITIGATION, AND RESOLUTION OF CLAIMS; REVIEW AND REVISE SUGGESTED INVOICE REDACTIONS FOR SECOND FEE APPLICATION TO COURT; DISCUSS SAME WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA FOR HANDLING FUTURE REDACTIONS OF INVOICES; CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES TO ADDRESS IN SECOND FEE APPLICATION; MEETING WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP, ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS, INCLUDING SECOND FEE APPLICATION, [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLAIMS, [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED], CLAIMS AGAINST [REDACTED] [REDACTED], POTENTIAL [REDACTED] [REDACTED], AND JOEL FRIANT'S [REDACTED] [REDACTED] DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE HEATHER CANTU REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] FOR JOEL FRIANT'S DOCUMENTS AND REVISIONS TO SAME FOR CONFERENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING INFORMATION SHOWING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU AND CFTC REGARDING COMPILATION OF INFORMATION FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] TO PROVIDE TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COORDINATE SAME TASK WITH HOLLIE SUMRALL; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU AND

FORENSIC VENDOR REGARDING PAYMENT ISSUES.

01/04/2013	CEP	2.80 hrs.	DRAFT MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	1,050.00
01/04/2013	HCR	2.10 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH FLASHBACK DATA REGARDING OUTSTANDING INVOICE; DRAFT EMAIL TO THEM REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE WITH CHRISTOPHER W. AHART REGARDING SAME; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL; CONFERENCE REGARDING STATUS OF FEE APPLICATION; LOCATE MISSING NOTES AND CONTINUE SUMMARIES.	472.50
01/04/2013	KNA	0.50 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING █████ RECORDS PRODUCED, FUNDS TRANSFERRED THROUGH █████, AND POTENTIAL CLAIMS PROCESS.	112.50
01/04/2013	HNS	5.10 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	637.50
01/07/2013	CWA	4.60 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH █████ █████ COUNSEL REGARDING OUTSTANDING DOCUMENTS AND POSSIBLE CONTEMPT PROCEEDINGS FOR FAILURE TO TURNOVER ASSETS AND RECORDS; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE FOLLOW UP WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA; CORRESPONDENCE WITH █████ █████ █████ COUNSEL REGARDING AGREEMENT TO RESOLVE CLAIMS; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH █████ █████ REGARDING SAME AND DRAFT COMPLAINT AND CONSENT ORDER TO RESOLVE CLAIMS; REVIEW AND REVISE RECEIVER'S SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION TO COURT, INCLUDING REVIEW OF RELEVANT COURT PAPERS, WORK PRODUCT, AND OTHER RECORDS; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING ISSUES AND REVISIONS FOR SAME; REVIEW AND REVISE SPREADSHEETS COMPILING INFORMATION FOR █████ AND █████ TO PROVIDE TO █████ █████; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU AND CFTC REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING DRAFT MOTION AND ORDER TO FILE █████ LETTER UNDER SEAL; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING ADDITIONAL DEPOSITS TO ESTATE ACCOUNT AND CURRENT	2,530.00
01/07/2013	CEP	4.40 hrs.	DRAFT SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION MOTION; CALCULATE VARIOUS FIGURES REGARDING FEES AND EXPENSES FOR PREVIOUS AND COMING MONTHS; REVISE MOTION TO SEAL █████ LETTER AND ORDER.	1,650.00
01/07/2013	HCR	1.00 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS AND INVESTOR VOICE MESSAGE.	225.00
01/07/2013	HNS	3.80 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	475.00
01/08/2013	CWA	4.90 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH █████ █████ █████ COUNSEL REGARDING AGREEMENT TO RESOLVE CLAIMS; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH █████ █████ REGARDING DRAFT COMPLAINT AND CONSENT ORDER FOR SAME CLAIMS; REVIEW AND REVISE RECEIVER'S SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION TO COURT, INCLUDING REVIEW OF RELEVANT COURT PAPERS, WORK PRODUCT, AND OTHER RECORDS; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING ISSUES AND FURTHER REVISIONS FOR SAME.	2,695.00
01/08/2013	CEP	3.20 hrs.	DISCUSS CASE LAW AND JURISDICTION ISSUES RELATED TO JOHN DOE COMPLAINT WITH █████ █████; REVIEW JOHN DOE COMPLAINT; VERIFY AND REWORK CALCULATIONS FOR FEE	1,200.00

Date	Client	Hours	Description	Amount
			APPLICATION TO CORRECT DISCREPANCY IN FIGURES; TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] OBLIGATIONS AND REQUIRED DOCUMENTS; TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING STATUS OF INFORMATION AND RECORDS FOR J. FRIANT'S ACCOUNT; DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER APPROVING SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	
01/08/2013	HCR	3.10 hrs.	COMPLETE [REDACTED] CALL SUMMARY; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME; BEGIN [REDACTED] CALL SUMMARY.	697.50
01/09/2013	CWA	0.50 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, CFTC, SEC, JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL AND MICHAEL DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING RECEIVER'S SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION TO COURT, POSSIBLE OPPOSITION TO SAME, AND JOEL FRIANT'S REQUEST FOR RELIEF FROM ORDER TO PAY ATTORNEYS' FEES; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING TERMS OF AGREEMENT TO RESOLVE CLAIMS.	275.00
01/09/2013	HCR	3.10 hrs.	COMPLETE SUMMARY OF [REDACTED] CALL; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME.	697.50
01/09/2013	HNS	5.20 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	650.00
01/10/2013	CWA	6.00 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT JOHN DOE COMPLAINT AND CONSENT ORDER FOR RESOLUTION OF [REDACTED] CLAIMS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU TO VERIFY FACTUAL ALLEGATIONS IN SAME COMPLAINT; DISCUSS ISSUES REGARDING SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED], INCLUDING POSSIBLE MOTION TO APPROVE CONSENT ORDER AND EXPLAIN CONFIDENTIALITY OF [REDACTED]; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA SAME DRAFT MOTION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, CFTC, SEC, AND MICHAEL DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING RECEIVER'S SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION TO COURT AND POSSIBLE OPPOSITION TO SAME; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING STATUS OF DEALINGS WITH [REDACTED] AND ACTION ITEMS FOR FOLLOW UP; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING FINAL ACTION ITEMS FOR REVISING AND FILING RECEIVER'S SECOND FEE APPLICATION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN [REDACTED] REGARDING ISSUES RAISED BY JOEL FRIANT'S REQUEST FOR RELIEF FROM ORDER TO PAY ADDITIONAL ATTORNEYS' FEES; REVIEW RECENT [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE WITH PROPHETMAX MEMBERS REGARDING [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] REVIEW AND REVISE SUMMARY MEMORANDUM REGARDING [REDACTED] CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU REGARDING SAME; REVIEW AND REVISE SUMMARY MEMORANDUM REGARDING [REDACTED] INTERVIEW; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING ISSUES FOR SAME.	3,300.00
01/10/2013	CEP	3.00 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH H. CANTU REGARDING DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM [REDACTED]; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING SAME; TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] OBLIGATIONS UNDER THE STATUTORY RESTRAINING ORDER; EMAIL TO SAME REGARDING NECESSARY DOCUMENTS; TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING NECESSARY DOCUMENTS; EMAIL TO [REDACTED] AND OTHERS AT [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME; REVIEW CONSENT ORDER; DRAFT MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF CONSENT ORDER.	1,125.00
01/10/2013	HCR	1.20 hrs.	CONDUCT RESEARCH AS REQUESTED; RESPOND TO INVESTOR	270.00

			EMAILS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL; REVISE SUMMARY OF [REDACTED] CALL; CONFERENCE REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	
01/10/2013	KNA	0.10 hrs.	BEGIN REVIEWING SUMMARY OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] INTERVIEW.	22.50
01/10/2013	HNS	5.50 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	687.50
01/11/2013	CWA	6.70 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE RECEIVER'S UNOPPOSED MOTION TO APPROVE CONSENT ORDER AND SUPPORTING AFFIDAVIT; REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO SEAL, PROPOSED ORDER, AND SUPPORTING AFFIDAVIT; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING SAME, INCLUDING ISSUES AND FURTHER REVISIONS, FINAL REVISIONS AND ACTION ITEMS FOR FILING RECEIVER'S SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION TO COURT AND PROPOSED ORDER APPROVING SAME; REVIEW AND REVISE SAME PROPOSED ORDER; ATTENTION TO FILING RECEIVER'S SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND PROPOSED ORDER, INCLUDING REVIEW OF FINAL DRAFT AND SUPPORTING MATERIALS; COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA CORRESPONDENCE WITH COURT CLERK REGARDING SAME SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND POSSIBLE HEARING; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND HEATHER CANTU ISSUES REGARDING SUMMARY MEMORANDUM OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC, SEC AND [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME AND SUMMARY MEMORANDUM OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] INTERVIEW; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING REVIEW OF PRIOR PRODUCTION BY [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	3,685.00
01/11/2013	CEP	2.50 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON REGARDING REDACTIONS TO INVOICES; CHECK CALCULATIONS BEFORE FILING SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; FINAL REVISIONS TO SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; FILE SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	937.50
01/11/2013	KNA	2.70 hrs.	REDACT CONFIDENTIAL AND PRIVILEGED INFORMATION FROM OCTOBER INVOICE TO USE AS EXHIBIT TO MOTION FOR FEE APPLICATION.	607.50
01/11/2013	HNS	4.80 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	600.00
01/14/2013	CWA	0.20 hrs.	CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING COURT ADMISSION ISSUES AND PROCESS TO FILE COMPLAINT AND CONSENT ORDER FOR RESOLUTION OF CLAIMS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING POSSIBLE HEARING ON RECEIVER'S SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	110.00
01/14/2013	CEP	0.10 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH COURT CLERK REGARDING HEARING ON MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF FEE APPLICATION.	37.50
01/14/2013	HNS	4.20 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	525.00
01/15/2013	CWA	1.20 hrs.	DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION CONCERNING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC AND SEC REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S REQUEST FOR ESTATE FUNDS TO PAY ATTORNEYS' FEES, STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS AND COURT FILINGS FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLAIMS, UPDATES REGARDING PROGRESS OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED], [REDACTED] [REDACTED], AND POSSIBLE LITIGATION INVOLVING [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT AFFIDAVIT OF GUY M. HOHMANN SUPPORTING MOTION TO APPROVE CONSENT ORDER ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLAIMS; DISCUSS WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL AND DRAFT COMPLAINT, CONSENT ORDER, AND MOTION TO APPROVE CONSENT ORDER TO RESOLVE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLAIMS; REVIEW AND REVISE SAME DRAFT COMPLAINT, CONSENT	660.00

			ORDER, AND MOTION TO APPROVE CONSENT ORDER BASED ON [REDACTED] COMMENTS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL AND [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME DRAFT COMPLAINT, CONSENT ORDER, AND MOTION TO APPROVE CONSENT ORDER; CONFERENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING [REDACTED] AND POSSIBLE MOTION TO COURT REGARDING [REDACTED]	
01/15/2013	CEP	2.90 hrs.	REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE CONSENT ORDER; REVISE AFFIDAVIT OF G. HOHMANN ACCORDING TO REFERENCES IN MOTION TO APPROVE CONSENT ORDER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING LETTER AGREEMENT FOR [REDACTED] DRAFT AND SEND LETTER TO [REDACTED] WITH INSTRUCTIONS REGARDING [REDACTED].	1,087.50
01/15/2013	HNS	5.50 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	687.50
01/16/2013	CWA	1.90 hrs.	DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA HER CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED], DOCUMENT PRODUCTION, POSSIBLE RESOLUTION OF CLAIMS, AND RELATED ISSUES; CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING POSSIBLE INTERPLEADER ACTION FOR RESOLUTION OF CLAIMS AND COMMENTS CONCERNING DRAFT COMPLAINT AND CONSENT ORDER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING INQUIRY FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME AND CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS; DISCUSS ISSUES REGARDING SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING STATUS HEARING AND COORDINATING INTERVIEWS AND DEPOSITIONS OF [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED].	1,045.00
01/16/2013	CEP	0.90 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH ATTORNEY FOR [REDACTED]; RESEARCH DODD FRANK ACT AND NO FAULT CLAWBACKS; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING POTENTIAL CLAIMS AGAINST [REDACTED] BY INVESTORS OR AGENCIES; CORRESPONDENCE FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING G. HOHMANN INVOLVEMENT IN PROCEEDINGS.	337.50
01/16/2013	HCR	0.50 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING TELEPHONE CALL WITH [REDACTED] REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS.	112.50
01/16/2013	HNS	6.50 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	812.50
01/17/2013	CWA	1.70 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND SEC REGARDING STATUS HEARING AND COORDINATING INTERVIEWS AND DEPOSITIONS OF [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS, POSSIBLE INTERPLEADER ACTION, RENEWAL OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT NEGOTIATIONS TO RESOLVE CLAIMS, AND NEW FEE REQUEST; DISCUSS ISSUES RAISED IN SAME CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, [REDACTED], AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA; CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] LIABILITY ISSUES AND [REDACTED] OF [REDACTED] DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN STATUS OF INQUIRY FROM [REDACTED].	935.00
01/17/2013	CEP	0.40 hrs.	REDACT INVOICES; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING NEW SETTLEMENT STRATEGY AND REQUIRED CHANGES TO DOCUMENTS; RESEARCH CLAWBACK PROVISIONS IN DODD FRANK LEGISLATION.	150.00
01/17/2013	KNA	0.10 hrs.	EMAIL TO FOLLOW-UP ON RECEIPT OF DOCUMENTS FROM [REDACTED].	22.50

01/17/2013	HNS	5.50 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	687.50
01/18/2013	CWA	3.40 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE [REDACTED] SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT TO INCORPORATE CHANGES AGREED WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL, INCLUDING REVIEW OF PRIOR DRAFTS AND REVISIONS; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ADDITIONAL REVIEW AND REVISIONS TO SAME, MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, AND SUPPORTING AFFIDAVITS; REVIEW TRANSLATED WEBSITE PAGES REGARDING [REDACTED] IN PREPARATION FOR UPCOMING TELEPHONE CALL; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU AND [REDACTED] REGARDING MATTERS FOR UPCOMING TELEPHONE CALL, RECEIVERSHIP COURT PAPERS AND RELATED RECEIVERSHIP MATTERS; DISCUSS ISSUES REGARDING SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, [REDACTED], CFTC AND SEC REGARDING UPCOMING TELEPHONE CALL WITH [REDACTED] AND STATUS OF SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS AND AGREEMENT TO RESOLVE [REDACTED] CLAIMS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING UPDATED INVESTOR SPREADSHEETS AND ADDITIONAL REQUESTS FOR INVESTOR INFORMATION FROM [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND HOLLIE SUMRALL REGARDING RESEARCH TO OBTAIN SAME INFORMATION AND REVISIONS TO SPREADSHEETS FOR [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] REVIEW AND REVISE SAME INVESTOR SPREADSHEETS; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REDACTION ISSUES FOR INVOICES SUPPORTING NEXT FEE APPLICATION.	1,870.00
01/18/2013	CEP	3.80 hrs.	RESEARCH [REDACTED] FOR G. HOHMANN; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART AND H. SUMRALL REGARDING FORMAT AND SUBSTANCE OF INFORMATIONAL CHARTS TO [REDACTED]; CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON AND H. CANTU REGARDING SUBSTANCE AND SOURCE OF SAME; REVISE REDACTIONS OF FEE INVOICES FOR NOVEMBER; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING SAME; ATTENTION TO SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT BEFORE BEING SENT FOR REVIEW.	1,425.00
01/18/2013	HCR	0.40 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS.	90.00
01/18/2013	KNA	0.10 hrs.	DISCUSSION WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING [REDACTED]	22.50
01/18/2013	HNS	5.40 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	675.00
01/21/2013	CWA	0.10 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING COMMENTS TO REVISED DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.	55.00
01/21/2013	HCR	1.10 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS.	247.50
01/22/2013	CWA	3.20 hrs.	CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING FINAL COMMENTS TO REVISED DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] REGARDING STATUS AND ISSUES FOR [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME CONFERENCE; DRAFT RECEIVER'S LETTER REQUEST TO [REDACTED] FOR INVESTOR INFORMATION, INCLUDING REVIEW OF COURT ORDER; REVISE SAME LETTER TO ADDRESS GUY M. HOHMANN'S COMMENTS; COORDINATE WITH HEATHER	1,760.00

			CANTU TRANSLATION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES FOR REDACTION OF INVOICES FOR FUTURE FEE APPLICATION; ATTENTION TO PRO HAC VICE FILING BY [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW REVISED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT EXECUTED BY [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND HIS COUNSEL, VERIFYING CONFORMITY WITH RECEIVER'S DRAFT AGREEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING SAME.	
01/22/2013	CEP	1.40 hrs.	REDACT INVOICES; CALL TO [REDACTED] AT [REDACTED] REGARDING ACCOUNT NUMBER AND RECORDS.	525.00
01/22/2013	HCR	2.00 hrs.	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE REGARDING TRANSLATION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CHECK REQUEST FOR SAME.	450.00
01/23/2013	CWA	0.40 hrs.	ATTENTION TO ORDER GRANTING PRO HAC VICE ADMISSION FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING EXECUTION OF FINAL DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLAIMS AND PROCESS FOR COURT APPROVAL OF SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING SAME; EXECUTE SAME SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS PRIOR CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND POSSIBLE NEW SCHEDULING FOR STATUS CONFERENCE.	220.00
01/23/2013	HCR	0.50 hrs.	DRAFT LETTER FOR TRANSLATION SERVICES ENCLOSING CHECK.	112.50
01/24/2013	HCR	2.10 hrs.	DRAFT SUMMARY OF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	472.50
01/25/2013	CWA	2.50 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE MEMORANDUM SUMMARY OF PRIOR CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME PRIOR CONFERENCE AND STATUS OF SETTLEMENT FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLAIMS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING FULLY EXECUTED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND COURT PAPERS TO OBTAIN COURT APPROVAL OF SAME; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA FINAL REVISIONS TO DRAFT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND SUPPORTING AFFIDAVITS FOR DISTRIBUTION TO PARTIES FOR REVIEW; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU AND TRANSLATION SERVICE REGARDING STATUS OF TRANSLATING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] SETTLEMENT AND SUPPORTING AFFIDAVITS; DISCUSS WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ACTION ITEMS FOR COURT APPROVAL OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] SETTLEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, [REDACTED] [REDACTED], CFTC, SEC, JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL AND MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING COURT PAPERS FOR APPROVAL OF SAME SETTLEMENT AND POSSIBLE OBJECTIONS TO SAME.	1,375.00
01/25/2013	CEP	1.20 hrs.	REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT TO REFLECT NEW AGREEMENT; REVISE ACCORDINGLY AFFIDAVITS OF C. AHART, ORDER APPROVING MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT; ATTENTION TO MINOR ADDITIONAL REVISIONS OF EACH WITH C. AHART.	450.00
01/28/2013	CWA	0.30 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING NON-OPPOSITION TO COURT PAPERS FOR APPROVAL OF [REDACTED]	165.00

			REFERENCE IN LETTER REQUEST TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED] FOR INFORMATION; REVISE SAME LETTER REQUEST AS APPROPRIATE; COMPILE EXHIBITS FOR LETTER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING SAME DRAFT LETTER, SUPPORTING EXHIBITS, AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DISCUSS WITH NAN GRIFFES AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES REGARDING FILING OF COURT PAPERS FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] SETTLEMENT.	
01/30/2013	HCR	1.80 hrs.	CONDUCT RESEARCH ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS; RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS.	405.00
01/31/2013	CWA	1.80 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING COMMENTS TO DRAFT LETTER REQUEST FOR INFORMATION AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REVISE DRAFT LETTER AS APPROPRIATE AND RE-SEND EXECUTED LETTER TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REVIEW COURT ORDERS SETTING HEARING ON RECEIVER'S SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION, APPROVING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] SETTLEMENT, AND SEALING RELATED COURT PAPERS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, [REDACTED] [REDACTED], HEATHER CANTU, AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING COURT APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT, PERFORMANCE OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, AND BANK ACCOUNT INFORMATION; SUBSEQUENT CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING SAME; DISCUSS ABOVE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL REGARDING SAME; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA STATUS OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	990.00
01/31/2013	CEP	0.40 hrs.	TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. GEORGE REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.	150.00
01/31/2013	HCR	1.60 hrs.	PROCESS CFTC COMPLAINT FROM ADOBE TO WORD; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME; UPDATE WEBSITE AND SOCIAL MEDIA WITH NEW PLEADINGS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL; RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS.	360.00

Total Professional Services: \$56,282.50

For Expenses Advanced:

01/2013 WESTLAW RESEARCH	95.29
01/2013 WESTLAW RESEARCH	108.80
RESEARCH EXPENSES (V64505) LEXISNEXIS RISK DATA MANAGEMENT - 12/2012 ONLINE SEARCHES.	23.83
DOCUMENTS/RECORDS (V64592) LEGAL LANGUAGE SERVICES - TRANSLATION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ENGLISH.	650.00
PHOTOCOPIES	73.35

Total Expenses Advanced: \$951.27

Summary:

Professional Services:

AHART, CHRISTOPHER W 52.40 hrs. 550.00 /hr \$28,820.00

PUCCIA, CARRIE E	29.20 hrs.	375.00 /hr	\$10,950.00
RYAN, HEATHER C	25.30 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$5,692.50
ANDERSON, KERI N	6.80 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$1,530.00
SUMRALL, HOLLIE N	60.80 hrs.	125.00 /hr	\$7,600.00
Total Professional Services			\$54,592.50

Expenses Advanced:

RESEARCH EXPENSES	\$23.83
DOCUMENTS/RECORDS	\$650.00
PHOTOCOPIES	\$73.35
WESTLAW RESEARCH	\$204.09
Total Expenses Advanced	\$951.27

Total Current Charges	\$57,233.77
Less Discount Applied	\$8,442.38
Net Balance Forward	\$138,151.62
Please Pay This Amount	\$186,943.01

Please make checks payable to: Hohmann, Taube & Summers, L.L.P.

Hohmann, Taube & Summers, LLP
100 Congress Ave 18th Floor
Austin, TX 78701

Phone: (512)-472-5997 www.hts-law.com Fax: (512) 472-5248

MR. GUY M. HOHMANN
100 CONGRESS AVE STE 1800
AUSTIN, TX 78701-4042

Invoice Number .50772
Invoice Date 02/28/2013
Activity Billed Through 02/28/2013

Prior Balance Brought Forward	\$186,943.01
Less Payments Received	\$0.00
Net Balance Forward	<u>\$186,943.01</u>

HTS File Number: 8133 00001 JKE

RE: REPRESENT CLIENT AS RECEIVER OF VARIOUS INDIVIDUALS INVOLVED WITH AN AUSTRALIAN PONZI SCHEME.

For Professional Services Rendered:

02/01/2013	CWA	1.20 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, [REDACTED] HEATHER CANTU, AND [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING BANK ACCOUNT INFORMATION AND PAYMENT OF SETTLEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU REGARDING PAYMENT OF VENDOR INVOICES FOR FORENSIC SERVICES; REVIEW TAX INFORMATION FROM [REDACTED] TO RECEIVER REGARDING ELEVATION GROUP; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING SAME AND FOLLOW UP WITH [REDACTED] TO CORRECT ERRORS; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN UPCOMING CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] AND ISSUES CONCERNING POSSIBLE ADDITION OF [REDACTED] AS RELIEF DEFENDANT AND MOTION TO ADD [REDACTED] TO ESTATE; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES RAISED IN PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF [REDACTED] DOCUMENTS AND STRATEGY FOR NEGOTIATING AND LITIGATING RETURN OF FRAUDULENT FUNDS RECEIVED; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING LETTER REQUEST FOR INFORMATION AND TRANSLATED [REDACTED].	660.00
02/01/2013	CEP	6.20 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON REGARDING [REDACTED] FILES RECEIVED IN FALL; REVIEW RESEARCH FROM K. ANDERSON REGARDING SEVERAL [REDACTED] TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING TAX STATEMENT RECEIVED IN ERROR; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE WITH G. HOHMANN AND C. AHART REGARDING DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM [REDACTED] ATTENTION TO DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM [REDACTED], TRACE AND DOCUMENT FUNDS AND DETERMINE WHAT RECORDS ARE MISSING; INTERNET RESEARCH OF [REDACTED] INDIVIDUALS.	2,325.00
02/01/2013	KNA	0.70 hrs.	REVIEW INFORMATION FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING THE [REDACTED]; EMAILS TO AND FROM TEAM REGARDING SAME; EMAILS AND DISCUSSION REGARDING THE [REDACTED]; EMAILS REGARDING DOCUMENTS	157.50

			FROM SAME.	
02/04/2013	CWA	1.30 hrs.	REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] MATERIALS FORWARDED BY [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING RECEIVER'S LETTER REQUEST FOR INFORMATION, STATUS OF PROCEEDINGS IN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND UNITED STATES, ACTION ITEMS FOR MOVING FORWARD IN BOTH PROCEEDINGS, POSSIBLE ADDITION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] TO U.S. ESTATE, AND RECEIVER'S PARTICIPATION IN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN ISSUES AND POTENTIAL ACTION ITEMS RAISED IN SAME CONFERENCE; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME CONFERENCE; CORRESPONDENCE WITH COURT, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING INVESTOR RESPONSE TO RECEIVER'S FEE REQUEST; REVIEW SAME RESPONSE; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA CONTINUING PROBLEMS WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] FAILURE TO PRODUCE DOCUMENTS, RECENT CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL, AND DEMAND EMAIL TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED] THREATENING CONTEMPT PROCEEDINGS IF DOCUMENTS ARE NOT PROMPTLY PRODUCED.	715.00
02/04/2013	CEP	2.20 hrs.	TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] FAILURE TO COOPERATE, DOCUMENTS STILL NEEDED, AND STRATEGY MOVING FORWARD; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING SAME; DRAFT DEMAND LETTER TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	825.00
02/04/2013	KNA	0.10 hrs.	EMAILS REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] INVOICE FOR RECORD COPIES.	22.50
02/05/2013	CWA	1.30 hrs.	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING RECEIVER'S LETTER REQUEST FOR INFORMATION TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED], STATUS OF PROCEEDINGS IN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND UNITED STATES, ACTION ITEMS FOR MOVING FORWARD IN BOTH PROCEEDINGS, POSSIBLE ADDITION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] TO U.S. ESTATE, AND RECEIVER'S PARTICIPATION IN [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS RAISED IN SAME CONFERENCE, AND ISSUES RAISED IN DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING PAYMENT OF SETTLEMENT AMOUNT; COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA CONFIRMATION OF SAME WITH BANK; CONFERENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING NEW DATES FOR COURT STATUS CONFERENCE AND POSSIBLE MEETING WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] IN MARCH; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC, JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL, MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL AND COURT REGARDING COURT STATUS CONFERENCE; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING LANGUAGE IN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] INDICATING THAT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ISSUES FOR HEARING ON SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	715.00
02/05/2013	CEP	4.50 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING STATISTICS FOR HEARING; CORRESPOND WITH C. EDQUIST REGARDING SAME; TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING ACCOUNT HISTORY AND STATUS; CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] TO CONFIRM STATUS OF SETTLEMENT TRANSFER; RESEARCH REGARDING REASONABLE FEES AND OTHER STATISTICS IN RECEIVERSHIPS; ATTENTION TO DOCUMENTS FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] RELATED TO J. FRIANT MORTGAGE.	1,687.50
02/05/2013	CBE	0.70 hrs.	RESEARCH REGARDING REASONABLE RECEIVERS' FEE IN PONZI	105.00

Date	Code	Hours	Description	Amount
02/06/2013	CWA	8.10 hrs.	SCHEME CASE. DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN PREPARATION AND ISSUES FOR HEARING ON RECEIVER'S SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; DRAFT OUTLINE FOR SAME HEARING, INCLUDING REVIEW OF FILE, RELEVANT COURT PAPERS, CASE LAW, AND ESTATE INFORMATION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING ESTATE INFORMATION FOR SAME HEARING; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SAME HEARING; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN ISSUES AND POTENTIAL ACTION ITEMS RAISED IN SAME HEARING; CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CFTC REGARDING SAME AND ISSUES CONCERNING [REDACTED] AND PROCEEDINGS; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS RAISED IN DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC AND SEC REGARDING INVESTOR COMPLAINTS OVER RECEIVER'S FEES AND EXPENSES; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND [REDACTED] COUNSEL REGARDING PAYMENT OF SETTLEMENT AMOUNT; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REVISIONS TO FUTURE FEE APPLICATIONS TO ADDRESS COMMENTS FROM COURT DURING HEARING.	4,455.00
02/06/2013	KNA	0.70 hrs.	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM [REDACTED]; UPDATE NOTIFICATIONS SPREADSHEET; EMAIL REGARDING SAME; EMAIL DOCUMENTS TO CFTC AND SECURITY EXCHANGE COMMISSION.	157.50
02/07/2013	CWA	0.40 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC AND COURT REGARDING ADDITIONAL INVESTOR COMPLAINTS TO RECEIVER'S FEES AND EXPENSES; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA RECEIVER'S DRAFT REPORT TO INVESTORS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] REGARDING ISSUES FOR RECEIVER'S REPORT TO INVESTORS AND LANGUAGE IN [REDACTED] INDICATING THAT [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME LANGUAGE.	220.00
02/07/2013	CEP	3.20 hrs.	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM [REDACTED]; TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING STATUS OF NECESSARY DOCUMENTS REQUESTED; REVIEW J. FRIANT MORTGAGE DOCUMENTS AND CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING CONTENT OF REPORT TO INVESTORS; BEGIN DRAFT OF REPORT.	1,200.00
02/07/2013	HCR	0.70 hrs.	PROCESS PLEADINGS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL; LOCATE PRIVILEGE LOG; DRAFT LETTERS AND FORWARD CHECKS; BEGIN REVISING NEW FEE APPLICATION.	157.50
02/07/2013	KNA	0.10 hrs.	REVIEW INVOICE FROM [REDACTED]; EMAILS REGARDING SAME.	22.50
02/08/2013	CEP	2.90 hrs.	REVIEW FIRST INTERIM STATUS REPORT; COMPARE AND DRAFT UPDATED REPORT TO INVESTORS AS DIRECTED BY COURT; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING SAME.	1,087.50
02/08/2013	HCR	0.70 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS.	157.50
02/11/2013	CWA	1.40 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] REGARDING HEARING IN [REDACTED] WRITTEN RULING EXPECTED FROM COURT, AND ROLE OF RECEIVER AS COURT OFFICER AND REPRESENTATIVE OF INVESTORS; REVIEW AND REVISE RECEIVER'S DRAFT LETTER TO INVESTORS PROVIDING STATUS UPDATE ON RECEIVERSHIP AND FOREIGN PROCEEDINGS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, [REDACTED] AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING SAME.	770.00

02/12/2013	CWA	0.70 hrs.	REVISE RECEIVER'S DRAFT LETTER TO INVESTORS TO ADDRESS GUY M. HOHMANN'S COMMENTS, INCLUDING REVIEW OF FILE REGARDING [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] REGARDING HEARING IN [REDACTED] WRITTEN RULING EXPECTED FROM COURT, AND ROLE OF RECEIVER AS COURT OFFICER AND REPRESENTATIVE OF INVESTORS; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN ISSUES REGARDING ABOVE, INVESTOR COMPLAINTS, AND POSSIBLE PAYMENTS TO VENDORS FOR PRIOR SERVICES TO ESTATE; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA STATUS OF DISCOVERY AND NEGOTIATIONS WITH [REDACTED], AND STRATEGY FOR MOVING FORWARD.	385.00
02/12/2013	CEP	0.80 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] TO OBTAIN [REDACTED] RECORDS; REVIEW MEMO FROM K. ANDERSON REGARDING [REDACTED] RECORDS, CHECK RECORDS TO VERIFY CONCLUSIONS, CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING AND UPDATE REGARDING LETTER TO INVESTORS AS RELATES TO INVOLVEMENT WITH [REDACTED].	300.00
02/12/2013	HCR	0.50 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING OUTSTANDING EXPENSES.	112.50
02/12/2013	KNA	0.40 hrs.	ANALYZE [REDACTED]. [REDACTED]; PREPARE EMAILS EXPLAINING SAME.	90.00
02/12/2013	HNS	0.50 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	62.50
02/13/2013	CWA	1.10 hrs.	CONFERENCES WITH COURT REGARDING STATUS OF RECEIVER'S DRAFT LETTER TO INVESTORS AND UNPAID VENDOR EXPENSES FOR ESTATE; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] REGARDING UNFAVORABLE RULING IN [REDACTED], CONTINUING ROLE OF RECEIVER, AND UPCOMING CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING ABOVE AND RELATED ISSUES; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES REGARDING ABOVE, STATUS OF DISCOVERY, NEGOTIATIONS WITH [REDACTED], AND STRATEGY FOR MOVING FORWARD; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING FINDINGS FROM NEW [REDACTED] DOCUMENTS PRODUCED FOR JOEL FRIANT'S ACCOUNT; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] REGARDING STATUS OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.	605.00
02/13/2013	CEP	0.80 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] LETTER AGREEMENT; CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] AT [REDACTED] REGARDING WHETHER ALL DOCUMENTS NEEDED AT THIS TIME HAVE BEEN RECEIVED; CORRESPOND WITH H. CANTU REGARDING FORM NOTICE TO COURT OF INVESTOR LETTER; CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING ESTIMATED TIME FOR RECEIPT OF ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS.	300.00
02/14/2013	CWA	0.50 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING PRIOR CONFERENCE WITH COURT AND PAYMENT OF VENDOR EXPENSES FOR ESTATE; CONFERENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP, STATUS OF [REDACTED] PROCEEDINGS, AND RECENT DEVELOPMENTS WITH [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] REGARDING UPCOMING CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS IMPLICATIONS OF UNFAVORABLE RULING IN [REDACTED] AND CONTINUING ROLE OF RECEIVER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] CLAIMING THAT CERTAIN INVESTORS HAVE TRIED BUT FAILED TO CONTACT RECEIVER.	275.00

Date	Code	Hours	Description	Amount
02/14/2013	CEP	0.20 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON AND H. CANTU REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] DOCUMENTS; CORRESPOND WITH H. CANTU AND C. AHART REGARDING PROCEDURE FOR FILING NOTICE OF LETTER TO INVESTORS.	75.00
02/14/2013	HCR	0.50 hrs.	RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME.	112.50
02/14/2013	KNA	0.80 hrs.	EMAILS REGARDING DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; ELECTRONICALLY ORGANIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] LOAN DOCUMENTS; BRIEFLY REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] DOCUMENTS FOR CONTENT.	180.00
02/15/2013	CEP	0.20 hrs.	ATTENTION TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON REGARDING MESSAGE FROM [REDACTED] VOICEMAIL WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME.	75.00
02/15/2013	HCR	0.70 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING PAYMENT OF OUSTANDING INVOICES; CONFERENCE REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RESEARCH REGARDING LETTER FILING WITH COURT.	157.50
02/18/2013	CWA	2.10 hrs.	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING IMPLICATIONS OF UNFAVORABLE RULING IN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED], CONTINUING ROLE OF RECEIVER, INFORMATION SHARING, AND RELATED LITIGATION ISSUES; DISCUSS ABOVE ISSUES WITH GUY M. HOHMANN; REVIEW AND REVISE RECEIVER'S DRAFT LETTER TO INVESTORS BASED ON SAME CONFERENCE AND COMMENTS FROM GUY M. HOHMANN; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME DRAFT LETTER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING ABOVE CONFERENCE AND SAME LETTER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION ISSUES; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING FAILED INVESTOR CONTACTS WITH RECEIVER.	1,155.00
02/18/2013	CEP	0.20 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH H. CANTU, K. ANDERSON AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING METHODS OF RECEIVING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PRODUCTION.	75.00
02/18/2013	HCR	0.30 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING DELIVERY OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] DOCUMENTS.	67.50
02/19/2013	CWA	1.90 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS RECENT DEVELOPMENTS WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP; CONFERENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING REQUEST FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] FOR INVESTOR INFORMATION, INFORMATION SHARING WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED], AND RECENT DEVELOPMENTS WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING COMMENTS TO RECEIVER'S DRAFT LETTER TO INVESTORS; REVISE LETTER ACCORDINGLY AND DISCUSS ISSUES WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, INCLUDING REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME REVISED DRAFT LETTER; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH HOLLIE SUMRALL CREATION OF SUMMARY SPREADSHEET OF [REDACTED] INVESTORS FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING REQUEST FOR LIST OF [REDACTED] INVESTORS; REVIEW, REVISE AND SEND SAME LIST TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	1,045.00
02/19/2013	CEP	2.50 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING STATUS OF EXPECTED DOCUMENTS; CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING DRAFT OF THIRD INTERIM FEE APPLICATION; DRAFT NOTICE OF LETTER TO INVESTORS TO COURT; CORRESPOND WITH H. CANTU REGARDING VIEWING OF NEWLY-RECEIVED [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	937.50

Date	Code	Hours	Description	Amount
02/19/2013	HCR	1.10 hrs.	PRODUCTION; ANALYZE PRODUCED DOCUMENTS COMPRISED OF OVER A YEAR OF BANK STATEMENTS FOR VARIOUS ACCOUNTS. PROCESS CHECKS FOR VENDORS; CONFERENCE WITH VENDOR REGARDING SAME; REVIEW LETTER TO INVESTORS; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS.	247.50
02/20/2013	CWA	0.40 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CFTC REGARDING COMMENTS TO RECEIVER'S DRAFT LETTER TO INVESTORS; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY [REDACTED]; REVIEW LETTER FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING PRODUCTION OF LOAN DOCUMENTS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING SAME LOAN DOCUMENTS AND ACTION ITEMS TO FINALIZE RECEIVER'S MOTION TO ABANDON JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS.	220.00
02/20/2013	CEP	6.20 hrs.	ANALYZE SECOND SET OF PRODUCTION FROM [REDACTED]; DRAFT MEMO TO REFLECT FLOW OF FUNDS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM [REDACTED] CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING SAME.	2,325.00
02/20/2013	HCR	1.50 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS; UPDATE DATABASE; ORGANIZE AND PROCESS INCOMING DOCUMENTS AND BANK STATEMENTS.	337.50
02/21/2013	CWA	3.30 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF RECEIVER'S LETTER TO INVESTORS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH NAN GRIFFES AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING FILING SAME AND LETTER EXHIBIT; ATTENTION TO POSTING RECEIVER'S LETTER TO ESTATE WEBSITE; CONFERENCE WITH SEC REGARDING RECENT DEVELOPMENTS WITH [REDACTED] AND STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S LOAN DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] REGARDING FINAL RECEIVER'S LETTER TO INVESTORS; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA PRELIMINARY ISSUES RAISED BY ANALYSIS OF DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND CFTC REGARDING RECENT DEVELOPMENTS WITH [REDACTED], STATUS OF RECEIVERSHIP AND FUTURE ACTION ITEMS FOR INVESTIGATIONS AND ESTATE MATTERS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU AND CFTC REGARDING INVESTOR INQUIRIES AND RECENT CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED]; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU REGARDING INVESTOR INQUIRIES TO RECEIVER; DRAFT AND REVISE VARIOUS RESPONSES TO SAME INQUIRIES.	1,815.00
02/21/2013	CEP	2.30 hrs.	CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] RECORDS; REVISE AND ADD TO [REDACTED] COMMISSIONS DOCUMENT.	862.50
02/21/2013	HCR	1.20 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; CONFERENCE REGARDING MASTER SPREADSHEET; UPDATE SOCIAL MEDIA AND WEBSITE WITH LETTER TO INVESTORS.	270.00
02/22/2013	CWA	0.30 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU AND HOLLIE SUMRALL REGARDING INVESTORS' INQUIRIES ABOUT CLAIMS AND REVISIONS TO MASTER LIST; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, HOLLIE SUMRALL AND CFTC REGARDING INFORMATION REQUEST FROM [REDACTED] AND LIST OF [REDACTED] INVESTORS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC AND [REDACTED] REGARDING CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS STATUS OF VARIOUS PROCEEDINGS AND RECEIVERSHIP.	165.00

02/22/2013	KNA	0.30 hrs.	UPDATE NOTIFICATIONS SPREADSHEET; EMAIL REGARDING SAME; EMAIL CFTC AND SECURITY EXCHANGE COMMISSION WITH LATEST PRODUCTION.	67.50
02/22/2013	HNS	0.70 hrs.	ADD CLIENT INFORMATION TO INVESTOR SPREADSHEET.	87.50
02/25/2013	CWA	2.60 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, HOLLIE SUMRALL AND CFTC REGARDING INFORMATION REQUEST FROM [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] AND LISTS OF INVESTORS IN [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME LIST; REVIEW AND DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ANALYSIS OF BANK ACCOUNT TRANSACTIONS FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ADDITIONAL INFORMATION NEEDED, AND ACTION ITEMS FOR POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS STATUS OF VARIOUS PROCEEDINGS AND RECEIVERSHIP; CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING PRODUCTION OF RECORDS FOR JOEL FRIANT'S [REDACTED] CREDIT CARD ACCOUNT; DISCUSS SAME WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA; COORDINATE WITH HOLLIE SUMRALL AND HEATHER CANTU LIST OF [REDACTED] INVESTORS.	1,430.00
02/25/2013	CEP	2.50 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING [REDACTED] FINDINGS, ADDITIONS TO FLOW CHART, PROJECT FOR K. BLANK RELATED TO REFLECTION OF WITHDRAWALS/OTHER DEBITS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ENTITIES TIMELINE AND PREVIOUS RESEARCH; RESEARCH REGARDING FRAUDULENT TRANSFER LAW; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING FRAUDULENT TRANSFER AND MONEY HAD AND RECEIVED CLAIMS.	937.50
02/26/2013	CWA	0.50 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU, CFTC AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING LIST OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU AND CFTC REGARDING INFORMATION REQUEST FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS STATUS OF VARIOUS PROCEEDINGS AND RECEIVERSHIP; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA HER CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ADDITIONAL INFORMATION NEEDED, AND SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ACTION ITEMS TO COMPLETE DRAFT MOTION TO ABANDON JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS AND RELATED COURT PAPERS.	275.00
02/26/2013	CEP	1.70 hrs.	TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH CLIENTS; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART TO DISCUSS SAME AND ISSUES RAISED BY [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING FOLLOW-UP WITH C. AHART; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING TASK LIST, INCLUDING MOTION TO RELINQUISH JOEL FRIANT ASSETS; CORRESPONDENCE RELATED TO KEY BANK MOTION TO FILE UNDER SEAL; REVISE FLOW CHART TO REFLECT COMMISSIONS SPENT AS OPPOSED TO UNACCOUNTED FOR, AND OTHER GENERAL NOTES.	637.50
02/27/2013	CWA	1.80 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION AND ORDER TO SEAL KEYBANK'S LETTER TO RECEIVER; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, HOLLIE SUMRALL, CFTC AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REGARDING INFORMATION REQUEST FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND LIST OF INVESTORS IN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] REVIEW AND REVISE SAME LIST; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING INVESTOR'S	990.00

			CORRESPONDENCE, POSSIBLE INVOLVEMENT OF █████ █████ IN PROPHEMAX FRAUD, AND RELATED INVESTIGATION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING STATUS OF █████ █████ AND █████ █████; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, █████ █████ AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING SAME AND POSSIBLE JOINDER OF █████ █████ TO ESTATE AND CFTC ACTION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND INVESTOR REGARDING ANY INFORMATION RELATING TO █████ █████ AND █████ █████ ALLEGED RECEIPT OF FUNDS FROM FRAUD.	
02/27/2013	CEP	2.80 hrs.	DISCUSS █████ █████ DOCUMENT PROJECT WITH K. BLANK, CORRESPONDENCE RELATED TO PROJECT QUESTIONS; REVIEW FRIANT LOAN DOCUMENTS AND DRAFT MOTION TO RELINQUISH ASSETS.	1,050.00
02/27/2013	HCR	1.50 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL; BEGIN GATHERING INFORMATION FOR NEW FEE APPLICATION.	337.50
02/27/2013	KDB	1.90 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING BANK STATEMENTS; BEGIN TO CREATE A SPREADSHEET SHOWING ALL OUTGOING TRANSACTIONS.	380.00
02/28/2013	CWA	2.80 hrs.	MEETING WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND █████ █████ REGARDING POSSIBLE JOINDER OF █████ █████ TO ESTATE AND CFTC OR SEC ACTION, INCLUDING KNOWN FACTS AND ACTION ITEMS FOR INVESTIGATING AND DRAFTING COMPLAINT TO ACCOMPLISH SAME; DISCUSS SAME AND RELATED ISSUES WITH █████ █████; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA SAME AND DRAFT COMPLAINT AGAINST █████ █████ AND MOTION TO AMEND STATUTORY RESTRAINING ORDER; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM INVESTOR REGARDING █████ █████ INFORMATION, INCLUDING █████ █████ ALLEGED RECEIPT OF FUNDS FROM FRAUD; REVIEW LINKS TO MEDIA COVERAGE OF █████ █████ SCHEMES; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME AND POSSIBLE INVOLVEMENT OF █████ █████ █████ █████; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC, SEC, JOEL FRIANT'S COUNSEL AND MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING POSSIBLE OPPOSITION TO MOTION AND ORDER TO SEAL KEYBANK'S LETTER TO RECEIVER; FINAL REVISIONS TO SAME MOTION AND ORDER; COORDINATE WITH NAN GRIFFES FILING OF SAME MOTION AND ORDER; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ISSUES FOR COMPLETING DRAFT MOTION AND ORDER TO ABANDON JOEL FRIANT'S ASSETS.	1,540.00
02/28/2013	CEP	4.90 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH CHRISTOPHER W. AHART TO DISCUSS COMPLAINT AGAINST █████ █████; DRAFT MOTION TO ABANDON J. FRIANT ASSETS; DRAFT RELATED AFFIDAVIT OF GUY M. HOHMANN; RESEARCH CASELAW DISCUSSING COURT APPROVAL OF RECEIVER ABANDONING ASSETS; TELEPHONE CALL TO J. GEORGE REGARDING RESIDENTIAL AND RENTAL PROPERTY RENTAL RATES.	1,837.50
02/28/2013	KNA	0.40 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING POTENTIAL ADDITIONAL DEFENDANTS; EMAILS REGARDING JOEL FRIANT'S ESTIMATED MONTHLY INCOME AND MORTGAGE EXPENSES.	90.00
Total Professional Services:				\$37,352.50

For Expenses Advanced:

02/2013 WESTLAW RESEARCH	3.11
02/2013 WESTLAW RESEARCH	73.38
LONG DISTANCE CHARGES (V64772) PREMIERE GLOBAL SERVICES - CONFERENCE CALL 01/22/2013.	66.02

LONG DISTANCE CHARGES (V64772) PREMIERE GLOBAL SERVICES - CONFERENCE CALL 01/23/2013.	8.85
PHOTOCOPIES	127.80
POSTAGE	6.36
02/2013 WESTLAW RESEARCH	36.75
Total Expenses Advanced:	<u>\$322.27</u>

Summary:

Professional Services:

AHART, CHRISTOPHER W	31.70 hrs.	550.00 /hr	\$17,435.00
PUCCIA, CARRIE E	44.10 hrs.	375.00 /hr	\$16,537.50
RYAN, HEATHER C	8.70 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$1,957.50
ANDERSON, KERI N	3.50 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$787.50
EDQUIST, CALLAN B	0.70 hrs.	150.00 /hr	\$105.00
BLANK, KRISTEN D	1.90 hrs.	200.00 /hr	\$380.00
SUMRALL, HOLLIE N	1.20 hrs.	125.00 /hr	\$150.00
Total Professional Services			\$37,352.50

Expenses Advanced:

LONG DISTANCE CHARGES	\$74.87
PHOTOCOPIES	\$127.80
POSTAGE	\$6.36
WESTLAW RESEARCH	\$113.24
Total Expenses Advanced	\$322.27

Total Current Charges	\$37,674.77
Less Discount Applied	\$5,602.88
Net Balance Forward	\$186,943.01
Please Pay This Amount	<u>\$219,014.90</u>

Please make checks payable to: Hohmann, Taube & Summers, L.L.P.

Date	Initials	Hours	Description	Amount
			TO COURT'S DETERMINATION OF SUBJECT MATTER OR PERSONAL JURISDICTION; CONFERENCE WITH J. SOOS REGARDING RESEARCH RELATED TO APPLICATION OF 28 U.S.C. 754; REVIEW FINDINGS, FOLLOW UP RESEARCH AND FIND CASES RESTRICTING RECEIVER'S SERVICE OF PROCESS TO UNITED STATES DISTRICTS; DRAFT COMPLAINT.	
03/04/2013	HCR	0.80 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS.	180.00
03/04/2013	JES	1.10 hrs.	RESEARCH REGARDING PERSONAL JURISDICTION FOR FOREIGN DEFENDANT.	165.00
03/04/2013	KDB	3.30 hrs.	CONTINUE TO CREATE SPREADSHEETS SHOWING ALL OUTGOING TRANSACTIONS FROM ██████████ BANK STATEMENTS.	660.00
03/05/2013	CWA	1.90 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING POSSIBLE MEETING TO SHARE INFORMATION, COORDINATION WITH ██████████ ██████████ AND RELATED MATTERS; CONFERENCE WITH CFTC REGARDING SAME, POSSIBLE CLAIMS AGAINST ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ ISSUES, AND RELATED LITIGATION ISSUES; DISCUSS SAME AND ACTION ITEMS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND ██████████ ██████████; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN STATUS OF ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS; DISCUSS SAME WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, FURTHER ANALYSIS OF ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ FINANCIAL DOCUMENTS, ABOVE CONFERENCE WITH CFTC, AND ISSUES FOR DRAFT COMPLAINT AGAINST ██████████ ██████████; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH HEATHER CANTU RESEARCH TO IDENTIFY FACTUAL INVESTIGATION DOCUMENTS RELEVANT TO ██████████ ██████████.	1,045.00
03/05/2013	CEP	3.90 hrs.	REVIEW LOAN DOCUMENTS AND ADD PARAGRAPH REFERENCES TO MOTION; ADD REFERENCES TO DOCUMENTS IN HOHMANN AFFIDAVIT; DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER FOR RECEIVER'S MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF ASSET FORFEITURE AND RELATED RESEARCH; DRAFT COMPLAINT TO ADD ██████████ ██████████ AS RELIEF DEFENDANT.	1,462.50
03/05/2013	HCR	1.80 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING STATUS OF CASE; CONFERENCE REGARDING MR. FRIANT'S ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; CONDUCT SEARCH FOR ██████████ ██████████ MATERIALS; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME.	405.00
03/05/2013	KDB	3.50 hrs.	CONTINUE TO CREATE SPREADSHEETS SHOWING ALL OUTGOING TRANSACTIONS FROM ██████████ ██████████ BANK STATEMENTS.	700.00
03/06/2013	CWA	0.70 hrs.	DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH HEATHER CANTU RESEARCH TO IDENTIFY FACTUAL INVESTIGATION DOCUMENTS RELEVANT TO ██████████ ██████████ AND ANALYSIS OF LOG OF ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ ██████████; CONFERENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND COUNSEL FOR ██████████ ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS AND REQUESTED DOCUMENTS.	385.00
03/06/2013	CEP	0.50 hrs.	TELECONFERENCE WITH C. AHART AND ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING SETTLEMENT OFFER.	187.50
03/06/2013	HCR	1.70 hrs.	FINAL REVIEW OF ██████████ ██████████; CONFERENCE REGARDING SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TWO INVESTORS; CONFERENCE REGARDING ██████████ ██████████ ██████████.	382.50
03/06/2013	KDB	3.10 hrs.	CONTINUE TO CREATE SPREADSHEETS SHOWING ALL OUTGOING TRANSACTIONS FROM ██████████ ██████████ BANK STATEMENTS.	620.00
03/07/2013	CWA	1.20 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING UPCOMING MEETINGS WITH CFTC, SEC AND ██████████; CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC AND ██████████ ██████████ REGARDING STATUS OF VARIOUS PROCEEDINGS, RECEIVERSHIP, AND ACTION ITEMS	660.00

			FOR COORDINATION; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU REGARDING FACTUAL INVESTIGATION OF [REDACTED]	
03/07/2013	CEP	0.20 hrs.	REVIEW NEW [REDACTED] PRODUCED BY [REDACTED].	75.00
03/07/2013	HCR	0.30 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL.	67.50
03/07/2013	KDB	2.00 hrs.	CONTINUE TO CREATE SPREADSHEETS SHOWING ALL OUTGOING TRANSACTIONS FROM [REDACTED] BANK STATEMENTS.	400.00
03/08/2013	CWA	1.40 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH CFTC AND SEC REGARDING DEVELOPMENTS WITH [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED], COORDINATION OF INVESTIGATIONS AND ASSET RECOVERIES; DISCUSS SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA ACTION ITEMS FOR DRAFT COMPLAINT AND MOTION FOR RELIEF CLAIMS AGAINST [REDACTED] AND AFFILIATES; DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING COORDINATION WITH [REDACTED] TO INVESTIGATE AND PURSUE POTENTIAL CLAIMS AGAINST [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC AND [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] INTERVIEW; DISCUSS WITH [REDACTED] NEED TO COORDINATE WITH [REDACTED] TO PARTICIPATE IN UPCOMING MEETINGS BETWEEN [REDACTED] CFTC, SEC AND [REDACTED]	770.00
03/08/2013	CEP	1.40 hrs.	REVIEW SUMMARY OF [REDACTED] FROM K. BLANK; CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART RELATED TO [REDACTED] AND CALL WITH [REDACTED]; DISCUSS CALL RELATED TO [REDACTED] INVOLVEMENT WITH C. AHART; CORRESPOND WITH H. CANTU REGARDING [REDACTED] THAT WAS SUBJECT OF PREVIOUS DISCUSSION WITH [REDACTED]	525.00
03/08/2013	HCR	0.20 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING NAME OF [REDACTED].	45.00
03/08/2013	KDB	2.80 hrs.	COMPLETE SPREADSHEETS SHOWING ALL OUTGOING TRANSACTIONS FROM [REDACTED] BANK STATEMENTS; UPDATE CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING SAME.	560.00
03/11/2013	CEP	2.40 hrs.	REVISE CLAIMS SECTION OF COMPLAINT TO ADD [REDACTED] AS RELIEF DEFENDANT; SEARCH SUMMATION AND OTHER RECORDS FOR INFORMATION REGARDING [REDACTED] AND CALL TO [REDACTED]	900.00
03/11/2013	HCR	0.80 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; UPDATE WEBSITE.	180.00
03/12/2013	CEP	0.30 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. EDMUNSON, SEC, AND CFTC REGARDING INFORMATION REGARDING [REDACTED] AND CALL TO [REDACTED]	112.50
03/13/2013	HCR	0.70 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS.	157.50
03/14/2013	CEP	0.90 hrs.	TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] IN [REDACTED] TO EXPLAIN FRAUD, NEW PERSON/ENTITY OF INTEREST, AND DETERMINE WHETHER [REDACTED] IS INTERESTED IN COLLABORATING WITH RECEIVER; DRAFT EMAIL TO [REDACTED] SO AGENCY CAN OPEN INVESTIGATION ABOUT [REDACTED]	337.50
03/18/2013	CWA	0.50 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC, SEC AND [REDACTED] REGARDING UPCOMING CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED]; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH HEATHER CANTU PREPARATIONS FOR SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC, AND DEFENSE COUNSEL REGARDING SCHEDULING FOR STATUS CONFERENCE AND DEPOSITIONS OF JOEL FRIANT AND MIKE DILLARD; REVIEW ORDER CANCELLING CURRENT STATUS CONFERENCE.	275.00
03/18/2013	HCR	1.00 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; POST PLEADING TO WEBSITE; UPDATE SOCIAL MEDIA.	225.00

03/19/2013	CWA	1.90 hrs.	DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH HEATHER CANTU PREPARATIONS FOR UPCOMING CONFERENCE WITH CFTC, SEC, [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH HEATHER CANTU, CFTC AND [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA PRIOR CONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] PARTICIPATION IN PROPHETMAX FRAUD; REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT EMAIL TO [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME, INCLUDE REVIEW OF WORK PRODUCT AND FURTHER INVESTIGATION OF [REDACTED], [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING SAME; REVIEW INVESTORS' INQUIRIES REGARDING RECEIVERSHIP; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH HEATHER CANTU RESPONSES TO SAME INQUIRIES; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY HOHMANN, COUNSEL AND THE COURT REGARDING RESCHEDULING STATUS CONFERENCE; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA STATUS OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND NEGOTIATIONS WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	1,045.00
03/19/2013	CEP	0.20 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH C. AHART REGARDING TELECONFERENCE WITH [REDACTED] EMAIL TO [REDACTED] REGARDING INVESTIGATION OF [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED]	75.00
03/20/2013	CWA	3.20 hrs.	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND VIDEO CONFERENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC, SEC, [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] REGARDING STATUS OF VARIOUS INVESTIGATIONS, LITIGATION, [REDACTED], RELATED ISSUES, AND ACTION ITEMS; DISCUSS ISSUES RAISED IN SAME WITH GUY M. HOHMANN; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH HOLLIE SUMRALL UPDATED MASTER LIST OF INVESTORS; DISCUSS AND COORDINATE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND KERI ANDERSON RESEARCH OF POSSIBLE [REDACTED] INVOLVED IN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME, UPDATED MASTER LIST OF INVESTORS, AND FRIANT'S ELECTRONIC DOCUMENTS.	1,760.00
03/20/2013	CEP	0.70 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART AND K. ANDERSON REGARDING MEETING WITH [REDACTED] AND QUESTIONS RELATED TO [REDACTED]; RESEARCH DATABASE FOR REFERENCES TO [REDACTED]	262.50
03/20/2013	HCR	1.00 hrs.	RESPOND TO INVESTOR QUESTIONS ON SOCIAL MEDIA; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; CONFERENCE REGARDING SPECIFIC QUESTIONS TO INVESTOR EMAIL AND HOW TO RESPOND TO SAME.	225.00
03/20/2013	KNA	0.30 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH CHRISTOPHER W. AHART AND CARRIE E. PUCCIA REGARDING IDENTIFYING POSSIBLE [REDACTED]	67.50
03/21/2013	CWA	2.20 hrs.	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT INVESTOR MASTER LIST; DISCUSS WITH HEATHER CANTU AND KRISTEN BLANK ISSUES AND ACTION ITEMS FOR FURTHER REVISIONS AND RESOLVING REDUNDANCIES OR DISCREPANCIES IN SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, KRISTEN BLANK, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME INVESTOR LIST; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU AND KERI ANDERSON REGARDING REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS CONCERNING POSSIBLE [REDACTED] INVOLVED IN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1,210.00
03/21/2013	CEP	1.90 hrs.	SEARCH DATABASE FOR EMAILS, ETC. CONTAINING INFORMATION REGARDING [REDACTED]	712.50
03/21/2013	KDB	0.30 hrs.	MEETING WITH HEATHER C. RYAN AND CHRISTOPHER W. AHART REGARDING THE INVESTOR MASTER LIST.	60.00
03/22/2013	CEP	0.40 hrs.	CORRESPOND WITH K. ANDERSON AND CONFERENCE WITH C. AHART REGARDING PRESENCE OF [REDACTED];	150.00

			CORRESPOND WITH [REDACTED] REGARDING DOCUMENTS NEEDED AND SETTLEMENT OFFER.	
03/22/2013	KNA	1.60 hrs.	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; BEGIN SEARCHING DATABASE FOR EVIDENCE OF [REDACTED] INVOLVED IN [REDACTED].	360.00
03/25/2013	CWA	0.30 hrs.	DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA STATUS OF DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC AND [REDACTED] REGARDING REQUESTED LIST OF [REDACTED]; COORDINATE SAME LIST WITH HEATHER CANTU AND HOLLIE SUMRALL.	165.00
03/25/2013	HCR	0.30 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING REQUESTED INVESTOR LIST.	67.50
03/25/2013	KNA	3.20 hrs.	CONTINUE TO SEARCH FRIANT'S RECORDS IN DATABASE FOR EVIDENCE OF [REDACTED].	720.00
03/26/2013	CWA	0.50 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC AND [REDACTED] REGARDING REQUESTED LIST OF [REDACTED]; REVIEW JOEL FRIANT'S DOCUMENT CONCERNING [REDACTED] ACCOUNT FOR [REDACTED]; CONFERENCE WITH INVESTOR'S ACCOUNTANT REGARDING POTENTIAL TAX IMPLICATIONS OF INVESTOR'S LOSSES AND FUTURE DISTRIBUTIONS; REVIEW [REDACTED] LETTER REQUESTING PAYMENT OF EXPENSES; DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA STATUS OF DOCUMENT REVIEW CONCERNING POSSIBLE [REDACTED] INVOLVED IN [REDACTED].	275.00
03/26/2013	CEP	0.30 hrs.	REVIEW EMAIL AND ATTACHMENT FROM K. ANDERSON TO DETERMINE WHETHER FORM WITH [REDACTED] IS RELEVANT TO DETERMINING WHETHER THERE WAS [REDACTED].	112.50
03/26/2013	HCR	1.20 hrs.	REVIEW AND FORWARD REQUESTED INVESTOR LIST; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR EMAILS; CONFERENCE REGARDING MASTER CLAIMANT LIST.	270.00
03/26/2013	KNA	3.30 hrs.	CONTINUE TO SEARCH FRIANT'S RECORDS IN DATABASE FOR EVIDENCE OF [REDACTED].	742.50
03/26/2013	KDB	4.00 hrs.	CONFERENCE WITH HEATHER C. RYAN, ANDREA GILBERT, AND HOLLIE SUMRALL REGARDING THE INVESTOR MASTER LIST; BEGIN TO REVIEW INVESTOR MASTER LIST AND UPDATE.	800.00
03/27/2013	CWA	0.70 hrs.	DISCUSS WITH CARRIE E. PUCCIA LACK OF PROGRESS WITH [REDACTED], FOLLOW UP WITH COUNSEL, AND POSSIBLE CONTEMPT PROCEEDING; DISCUSS SAME WITH [REDACTED] AND POSSIBLE [REDACTED] FOR [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND REVISE EMAIL TO COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] REGARDING LACK OF PROGRESS AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN CARRIE E. PUCCIA AND [REDACTED] CONCERNING INQUIRY ABOUT [REDACTED] AND PARTICIPATION IN PONZI SCHEME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING SAME.	385.00
03/27/2013	CEP	0.60 hrs.	DRAFT EMAIL TO [REDACTED] REGARDING DOCUMENTS AND RESPONSIVENESS FROM CLIENTS; REVIEW RESPONSE EMAIL FROM [REDACTED] REGARDING [REDACTED].	225.00
03/27/2013	HCR	0.80 hrs.	REVIEW ORIGINAL CLAIMANT LISTS AND COMPARE TO MASTER LIST; CONFERENCE REGARDING ORGANIZATION OF SAME.	180.00
03/27/2013	KDB	2.90 hrs.	UPDATE INVESTOR MASTER LIST.	580.00
03/28/2013	CWA	1.10 hrs.	DISCUSSION AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN REGARDING STATUS OF INVESTIGATION FOR [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED]; CORRESPONDENCE AND CONFERENCE WITH MIKE DILLARD'S COUNSEL REGARDING	605.00

			STATUS OF LITIGATION AND RECEIVERSHIP; CORRESPONDENCE WITH GUY M. HOHMANN, CARRIE E. PUCCIA, HEATHER CANTU, CFTC AND SEC REGARDING STATUS OF LITIGATION AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CORRESPONDENCE CONCERNING INQUIRY ABOUT ANDY SHAW AND Q7 PARTICIPATION IN PONZI SCHEME; DISCUSS WITH GUY M. HOHMANN AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] POTENTIAL ISSUES CONCERNING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLAIMS AND POSSIBLE ADDITION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] TO ESTATE; CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING EXTENSION OF DEADLINE FOR RECEIVER TO PROVIDE ACCOUNTING OF DEFENDANTS' ASSETS TO CFTC.	
03/28/2013	HCR	0.50 hrs.	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INVESTOR INQUIRIES VIA SOCIAL MEDIA.	112.50
03/28/2013	KDB	2.50 hrs.	UPDATE INVESTOR MASTER LIST.	500.00
03/29/2013	CWA	0.20 hrs.	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CFTC AND HEATHER CANTU REGARDING EXTENSION OF DEADLINE FOR RECEIVER TO PROVIDE ACCOUNTING OF DEFENDANTS' ASSETS TO CFTC; DISCUSS WITH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] POTENTIAL ISSUES CONCERNING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] AND POSSIBLE ADDITION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] TO ESTATE.	110.00
03/29/2013	HCR	0.20 hrs.	CONFERENCE REGARDING FEE APPLICATION.	45.00
03/29/2013	KDB	2.50 hrs.	UPDATE INVESTOR MASTER LIST.	500.00
			Total Professional Services:	\$28,787.50

For Expenses Advanced:

03/2013 WESTLAW RESEARCH	19.68
03/2013 WESTLAW RESEARCH	135.45
03/2013 WESTLAW RESEARCH	45.79
03/2013 WESTLAW RESEARCH	10.92
LONG DISTANCE CHARGES (V65073) PREMIERE GLOBAL SERVICES - CONFERENCE CALLS 02/04/2013.	7.38
LONG DISTANCE CHARGES (V65073) PREMIERE GLOBAL SERVICES - CONFERENCE CALL 02/18/2013.	22.55
03/2013 WESTLAW RESEARCH	72.97
PHOTOCOPIES	8.70
Total Expenses Advanced:	\$323.44

Summary:

Professional Services:

AHART, CHRISTOPHER W	16.80 hrs.	550.00 /hr	\$9,240.00
PUCCIA, CARRIE E	25.40 hrs.	375.00 /hr	\$9,525.00
RYAN, HEATHER C	11.30 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$2,542.50
ANDERSON, KERI N	8.60 hrs.	225.00 /hr	\$1,935.00
SOOS, JESSICA E	1.10 hrs.	150.00 /hr	\$165.00
BLANK, KRISTEN D	26.90 hrs.	200.00 /hr	\$5,380.00
Total Professional Services			\$28,787.50

Expenses Advanced:

LONG DISTANCE CHARGES	\$29.93
PHOTOCOPIES	\$8.70
WESTLAW RESEARCH	\$284.81
Total Expenses Advanced	\$323.44

Total Current Charges	\$29,110.94
Less Discount Applied	\$4,318.13
Net Balance Forward	\$219,014.90
Please Pay This Amount	<u>\$243,807.71</u>

Please make checks payable to: Hohmann, Taube & Summers, L.L.P.