
FRENCH DIP
Prime rib of beef, slow roasted,
thinly sliced, on a French
baguette; with our onion soup
for dipping 11.99

BUILD-YOUR-OWN-BURGER
Fresh ground beef hand
pressed burger, charbroiled,
served on a grilled potato roll
with lettuce and tomato 8.99

Add the for following .75 each:
Cheese - American, Swiss or
Jack/Cheddar
Sauteed mushrooms
Sauteed onions
Bacon
Avocado 

MEATBALL SUB
Meatballs with marinara,
covered with a blend of melted
cheeses; served on a toasted
roll 8.99

FRIED HADDOCK SANDWICH
A fresh haddock filet fried
golden brown and served on a
grilled potato roll with lettuce,
tomato & mayo 11.99

ROAST TURKEY SANDWICH
Oven-roasted white meat
turkey, Swiss cheese, bacon,
lettuce, tomato & mayo served
on multi-grain marble rye 9.99

MOUNT OSSIPEE
Chicken salad, crisp bacon,
sliced tomato and Monterrey
Jack/Cheddar cheeses on
oatmeal molasses bread, then
lightly grilled 10.99

CHICKEN BLT
Grilled boneless chicken breast
& crisp bacon with lettuce,
tomato & herb mayo on a
baguette 10.99

BLACKENED CHICKEN
CAESAR WRAP
Blackened chicken breast,
romaine lettuce, and caesar
dressing wrapped in a flour
tortilla 10.99

FRIED CLAMS
Fresh whole belly clams,
breaded and fried golden
brown, served with french fries &
cole slaw 14.99

SCALLOPS & PENNE
Pan-seared scallops sauteed
with garlic, shallots, mushrooms
& capers in a white wine cream
sauce, tossed with penne pasta
15.99

FRIED HADDOCK
Fresh haddock filet fried golden
brown, served with french fries &
coleslaw 12.99

BAKED HADDOCK
Fresh haddock baked with
white wine and butter, topped
with seasoned bread crumbs
and finished with lobster sauce;
served with mashed potatoes &
chef's vegetable 13.99

MARINATED STEAK TIPS
Marinated beef tips charbroiled
with sauteed peppers & onions,
our house-made barbeque
sauce, served with mashed
potatoes & chef's vegetable
12.99

Consumer Advisory: Consumption of undercooked meat, poultry,
eggs, or seafood may increase the risk of food-borne illnesses.


