Town of Dalton

Upton & Hatfield, LLP
10 Centre Street
Concord, NH 03301
603-224-7791
Tax ID No. 02-0218790

October 8, 2024
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240861
756 Dalton Road
Dalton, NH 03598
Statement
Matter Running
Date Bill Number/Description Bill Amount Paid Amount Balance
240861.1 - General Representation
10/08/24 170498 6,417.00 6,417.00
Matter Balance Due 6,417.00

Total Balance Due

6,417.00




Upton & Hatfield, LLP

10 Centre Street

Concord, NH 03301
603-224-7791
Tax ID No. 02-0218790

Town of Dalton

756 Dalton Road
Dalton, NH 03598

CLIENT: 240861 - Dalton, Town of
Matter: 240861.1 General Representation

Date Profesional Services
09/05/24 NCM Work on Town issues; exchange e-mail with prior
counsel;

09/10/24 NCM  Work on Town issues;

09/11/24 NCM  Receive and review personnel policy; review and
begin consideration and analysis of issues with
Policy;

09/11/24 NCM  Receive and review e-mail from Town regarding
HB1221; _

09/12/24 NCM  Receive and review e-mail from Town regarding
HB1221; consider and analyze question; prepare and
outline response;

09/16/24 NCM  Work on Town issues; exchange e-mail with Town;

09/17/24 NCM  Work on Right to Know issues for Town;

09/18/24 NCM Receive, review, and consider redactions and
exemptions for right-to-know responsive documents

for Town;

~ 09/18/24 NCM  Telephone conference with Clients; outline issues
&\« m:a:mxﬁm.ﬁmvm“

09/19/24 NCM  Work on updated legislative issues for the Town;
telephone conference with Town re same;

09/20/24 NCM  Receive, review, and consider additional conservation

Offices also in:

Peterborough
Portsmouth

October 8, 2024
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Reference No. 170498

Amount
253.00
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Client Ref: 240861 - 240861.1 October 8, 2024

Reference No. 170498 . Page 2
Date Profesional Services Hours Amount
commission documents; prepare response to
commission;
09/23/24 NCM  Work on right-to-know issues for Town; receive, 2.10 483.00

review, and work on property acquisition issues for
Town; exchange e-mail with Town regarding issues
and concerns;

09/25/24 NCM  Receive and review DTC right-to-know responses; 1.50 345.00
exchange e-mail with Town;
09/26/24 NCM Receive, review, and consider additional documents 2.20 506.00
and issues raised re conservation commission;
09/30/24 NCM  Work on personnel policy issues for Town; exchange  2.50 575.00
e-mails with Town regarding same;
Total for Professional Services 27.90 _ $6,417.00
Total for Services and Expenses $6,417.00
Prior Balance 184.00
Payments Since Last Bill -184.00

Amount Due $6,417.00




Town of Dalton

Upton & Hatfield, LLP

10 Centre Street
Concord, NH 03301
603-224-7791
Tax ID No. 02-0218790

November 8, 2024

240861
756 Dalton Road
Dalton, NH 03598
Statement
Matter Running
Date Bill Number/Description Bill Amount Paid Amount Balance
240861.1 - General Representation
11/08/24 170958 8,717.00 8,717.00
Matter Balance Due 8,717.00

Total Balance Due

8,717.00




i

Upton & Hatfield,

10 Centre Street

Concord, NH 03301
603-224-7791
Tax ID No. 02-0218790

Town of Dalton

756 Dalton Road
Dalton, NH 03598

CLIENT: 240861 - Dalton, Town of
Matter: 240861.1 General Representation

LLP

OY:....Offices.also.in:
Peterborough
Portsmouth

November 8, 2024
Reference No. 170958

Date Profesional Services Hours Amount

09/05/24 NCM  Work on Town issues; exchange e-mail with prior 1.10 253.00
counsel regarding file materials;

09/10/24 NCM  Review and consider upcoming Town concerns and 1.10 253.00
issues; work on setting up file;

09/11/24 NCM  Receive and review personnel policy from Town 1.80 414.00
Administrator; review and begin consideration and
analysis of issues with Policy;

09/11/24 NCM Receive and review e-mail from Town Administrator ~ 0.20 46.00
regarding HB1221;

09/12/24 NCM  Receive and review e-mail from Town Planning 2.50 575.00

Board Chair regarding HB1221; consider and analyze

question; prepare and outline response;

09/16/24 NCM  Work on Town issues regarding regarding HB 1221 2.40 552.00
and personnel policy ; exchange e-mail with Town

Planning Board Chair;

09/17/24 NCM Receive and review e-mail from Town Administrator 1.20 276.00
regarding Right-to-know issues; work on Right to

Know issues for Town; — ¢y/jetfes

09/18/24 NCM Receive, review, and consider redactions and 1.80 414.00
exemptions for right-to-know responsive documents
for Town Administrator; exchange same with Town

Administrator;

HBI>>
09/19/24 NCM  Work on updated _m@_m_m:<m _wmcmm for the Town; 2.30 529.00
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Client Ref: 240861 - 240861.1 November 8, 2024
Reference No. 170958 Page 2

Date Profesional Services ﬁ?z?? eb.\m Hours Amount
telephone conference with Town re same; 1 _
(324

09/20/24 NCM  Receive, review, and consider additional conservation  2.40 552.00
commission documents from Town Selectboard
member Dubreuil; prepare response and additional
considerations to Town;

09/23/24 NCM  Work on right-to-know issues for Town; receive, 2.10 483.00
review, and work on property acquisition issues for
Town; receive and review e-mail from Town
Administrator regarding issues and concerns;

09/25/24 NCM  Receive and review additional DTC right-to-know 1.50 345.00
responses from Town Administrator; exchange e-mail
with Town Administrator;

09/26/24 NCM Receive, review, and consider additional documents 2.20 506.00
and e-mails regarding DCC from Selectboard
member Dubreuil; review and consider issues;

09/30/24 NCM  Work on personnel policy issues for Town; exchange  2.50 575.00
e-mails with Town Administrator regarding same;
T 10/01/24 ZO_<_ Receive, review, and exchange e-mail with Town 2.30 529.00
Administrator regarding deed repurchasing; study Lyt E (I35 A
h and review tax deeds and draft documents; \&w\%\‘%\« @ (A 3y
, : 0
10/02/24 NCM  Receive additional documents from Town regarding - 1.20 276.00 | (har= ©
conservation commission; analyze same; e
10/10/24 NCM :Receive and review additional follow-up information 1.40 322.00
, from Town Administrator regarding road agent
concerns with personnel policy; review and work on
guidance;
10/17/24 NCM . Receive and consider e-mail from Town 0.40 92.00
Administrator regarding Casella agreement to cover
T S e e . & .. . - . . e e ,,:\: - \.m
10/22/24 NCM  Review remaining personnel policy issues; exchange  2.70 621.00 %\Ci&»
8- Bm__ with Town Administrator regarding the same; Iy | b
T 10122124 /_O_<_ mx03m3mm e-mail and analysis with Town 1.30 299. oo/ _@g "
S Administrator regarding road-agent-issues; —————__ \
10/28/24 NCM  Review and work on DCC issue appeal issue for \ 322. ow\
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Client Ref: 240861 - 240861.1 November 8, 2024

Reference No. 170958 A Page 3 ,
Date : Profesional Services Hours Amount EE
Town; receive and review e-mail from Town _\f W
‘ Administrator ﬂm@ma_:@ the same; - :wl
10/30/24 NCM  Exhange e-mails with ._.o<<: Administrator Emma_:@ 230 483.00 uu a\}
< I DCC and Tan Letter; prepare draft Tan letter for : A W\
Vﬁv Town; Wt Y4 i,\_,ﬂ_
| W) % ,M__M?
Total for Professional Services 37.90 $8,717.00 %;»
Total for Services and Expenses $8,717.00 Vq A
Prior Balance 184.00 U\/aﬁ h
Payments Since Last Bill : -184.00 -

Amount Due $8,717.00



