
PAINTING 
WORKSHOPS

(02) 4030 5889
CALL US FOR MORE INFO

contactus@dukesrestaurantandbar.com.au​

https://www.dukesrestaurantandbar.com.au/

CONTEMPORARY
PAINTING 

NIBBLES AND
DRINKS

9 Day Street, East Maitland NSW 2323

THE ARTIST THE ARTWORK
Nina is a proud Aboriginal woman with
connections to Anaiwan and Dunghutti areas
of NSW while currently living and working on
the lands of the Wonnarua Nation. She is a
mother, wife, artist, teacher, designer, and
business owner. Nina is a High School Visual
Arts educator of 22 years with Fine Arts
training at Newcastle School of Art and
Education and Fine Arts training at the
University of Newcastle. She paints murals
for local schools and commission artworks,
exhibits  collaborative projects, presents at
conferences and facilitates Art and Cultural
Art workshops. 

Workshop participants will complete a
painting on canvas to keep. They will be
gifted a contemporary Aboriginal artwork
composition designed by Nina for the
specific workshop with common symbols
and art elements. Stories will be shared and
some cultural learning will happen. 

THE VENUE
Located in the heart of East Maitland, Duke's
Restaurant & Bar is offering a bespoke
artmaking and cuisine experience. Set in one
of Maitland's stunning heritage buildings, you
can enjoy a casual dining experience while
learning about contemporary Aboriginal art
techniques.

We would like to acknowledge the
Traditional Owners of the lands of the

Wonnarua Nation. We pay our respects to
the Elders past, present and emerging, for

they hold the memories, the traditions,
the culture and hopes of Aboriginal and

Torres Strait Islander peoples in this
beautiful area.

PRICE $ PP

NUMBERS 6-15
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