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  Moving  
Made 
Simple



Y o u r  
F u l l - S e r v i c e  

C o m p a n y

De-clutter & clean

Donation services

House cleaning

Home improvement 

Deferred maintenance

Estate sale / online auction

Home staging

Free consultation 
with Mark

Landscaping

Home sale services

Packing & moving

A l l  y o u r  n e e d s  
u n d e r  o n e  r o o f !

Contact Us: 804-237-8585
www.MarkAdamsTeam.com



Our  C ompany

Moving Made Simple eases the
moving and estate processes by
taking these often overwhelming tasks
and breaking them down into bite-
size pieces. Every client’s need is
different, so in addition to their real
estate services, Mark Adams and his
team can provide contractors, movers,
cleaning services, and an auction
company, if needed.



Our Story

My team and I started this company
after I experienced the moving
process with my own mother after my
father died. It was even more
emotional than we expected, and
although we are real estate
professionals, the amount of planning
was overwhelming. We could only
imagine how difficult this process
could be for someone without a
trusted advisor. We felt the call to
provide support and reassurance to
seniors and their families, and so, we
created Moving Made Simple.

Mark Adams, and his mother,
Martha Adams, and his uncle, Les
pictured below.



What Our Customers Say

My husband and I finally decided we
wanted to live in a retirement

community. Mark did so much more
than sell our house! They had  

contractors do repairs, provided a
mover, and had our home

professionally cleaned. We never
expected the process to be so fast
and painless. Mark and Lisa were

considerate of the emotional aspects
of older clients having to discard 45+
years of accumulation and leave their

home of 30+ years.

George and Nancy Plunkett
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