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An Exploration of the Just Behaving Philosophy: A 
Comprehensive Guide 
Introduction - What is Just Behaving? 

The landscape of canine companionship has long been populated by various training 
methodologies, each offering a pathway to a well-behaved dog. However, a truly 
harmonious and deeply integrated relationship with a canine companion often requires 
more than a set of learned commands or managed behaviors. It calls for a shift in 
perspective, a deeper understanding of the dog as an emotional and cognitive being, 
and a commitment from the human to foster an environment where both can thrive. It is 
from this understanding that the Just Behaving philosophy emerges, offering not merely 
a training technique, but a comprehensive approach to living with and nurturing dogs. 

Defining Just Behaving: More Than a Method, A Comprehensive Philosophy 

Just Behaving distinguishes itself fundamentally from conventional approaches by 
positioning itself not as a mere collection of training exercises, but as an encompassing 
philosophy. The program's foundational literature states, "Just Behaving transcends 
typical dog training 'methods.' It is a comprehensive philosophy guiding how we live 
with, understand, and nurture our canine companions. It’s about fostering a state of 
being, for both dog and human, rooted in mutual understanding and emotional balance". 
This initial definition is critical, as it immediately signals a departure from purely 
mechanistic or technique-focused paradigms. The emphasis is not on doing specific 
things to the dog in isolated sessions, but on being a certain way with the dog, 
consistently and holistically. 

The choice of the term "philosophy" is deliberate and significant. A method typically 
refers to a specific procedure or systematic way of accomplishing a task, such as 
teaching a dog to sit or stay. A philosophy, conversely, represents a system of guiding 
principles, beliefs, and values that inform one's entire outlook and approach to a 
subject. Therefore, Just Behaving, as a philosophy, is intended to permeate all aspects 
of the human-dog relationship. It extends beyond structured training periods to influence 
daily interactions, environmental setup, and, crucially, the human's own mindset and 
emotional state. This suggests that the human's willingness to engage in self-reflection 
and adapt their own behaviors and lifestyle is as integral to the Just Behaving approach 
as any specific action taken with or for the dog. The journey with Just Behaving is thus 
as much about human development as it is about canine development, fostering a co-
evolutionary path towards greater harmony. This inherent demand for human self-
awareness and adaptation sets a different expectation for engagement compared to 
simply learning and applying a set of training techniques. 

Origin and Evolution: Observation and Questioning 
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The genesis of the Just Behaving philosophy is rooted in empirical observation and a 
spirit of inquiry, rather than adherence to pre-existing dogma. As described, "The Just 
Behaving philosophy wasn't born in a laboratory or from rigid adherence to a single 
school of thought. It evolved organically from years of direct observation of dogs - how 
they learn, interact, and thrive - and from a persistent questioning of traditional 
paradigms that often seemed to fall short of creating truly harmonious relationships". 
This origin story highlights an experience-driven foundation, suggesting an inherent 
adaptability and a willingness to deviate from conventional wisdom when observation 
indicates a more effective or humane path. 

The emphasis on "observation and questioning" points towards a dynamic and evolving 
system. This approach mirrors the foundational principles of empirical learning and 
scientific inquiry, where hypotheses are formed based on observation, tested through 
experience, and refined based on outcomes. It stands in contrast to training systems 
that are based on unquestioned tradition or rigid adherence to a singular theoretical 
framework, irrespective of individual animal needs or emerging scientific understanding. 
This origin implies that Just Behaving is not a static set of rules but a living philosophy, 
open to refinement as new observations are made, new questions arise, or new 
scientific insights emerge. Consequently, it encourages practitioners - dog owners and 
professionals alike - to become keen observers of their own dogs and to critically 
assess the impact of their interactions. This fosters a mindset of ongoing learning and 
adaptation, which is essential for navigating the complexities of any interspecies 
relationship, particularly one as nuanced as that between humans and dogs. The 
philosophy, therefore, is likely to value continuous learning not only for the program 
itself but also for the individuals who embrace it. 

The Ultimate Goal: Emotionally Stable, Balanced, Integrated Family Companions 

The aspirations of the Just Behaving philosophy extend far beyond simple obedience or 
the suppression of undesirable behaviors. The ultimate aim is clearly articulated: "Our 
ultimate aim is not to produce perfectly obedient 'robot' dogs. Instead, we strive to raise 
emotionally stable, balanced individuals who integrate seamlessly and joyfully into their 
human families as true companions". This statement clarifies the desired outcome, 
placing paramount importance on the dog's internal emotional state and their ability to 
form a harmonious relational fit within the family unit, rather than focusing solely on 
compliance with commands. 

The emphasis on "emotional stability" and "balance" as primary goals carries significant 
implications. It suggests a perspective where many common behavioral issues are 
viewed not merely as instances of "bad behavior" requiring correction, but as symptoms 
of an underlying emotional or environmental imbalance. If a dog is acting out, the Just 
Behaving approach would likely first explore whether the dog's foundational needs for 
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security, calm, and clear guidance are being met. Traditional training often focuses on 
modifying specific behaviors - teaching a dog to sit instead of jump, for example. While 
Just Behaving also addresses such behaviors, its primary concern is the dog's internal 
state. Emotional stability is not just an external display of calm but an internal capacity 
to cope with stress, process information effectively, and engage with the world from a 
place of security. Therefore, the methods employed within this philosophy must 
inherently address the dog's internal experience and emotional needs. This focus on 
fostering a secure emotional foundation is likely to result in dogs who are more resilient, 
better able to handle novelty and stressors in their environment, and less prone to 
developing anxiety-based or reactive behaviors. Addressing the dog's overall emotional 
well-being, rather than just targeting symptomatic behaviors, promises a more profound 
and lasting resolution to challenges. 

The Fundamental Shift: Beyond Commands, Rewards, and Management 

Just Behaving proposes a significant departure from several widely practiced canine 
training paradigms. It "represents a fundamental shift from traditional paradigms that 
rely heavily on commands, constant external rewards, or perpetual management of 
behavior. We move towards fostering a deep relationship, shaping the environment for 
natural learning, and allowing dogs to develop intrinsic understanding". This declaration 
positions Just Behaving as a distinct alternative, prioritizing intrinsic motivation, 
relational depth, and learning processes that mirror how animals naturally acquire 
knowledge and social skills. 

The critique of "perpetual management" is particularly noteworthy. While management 
(e.g., using crates, gates, or leashes) is a necessary component of responsible dog 
ownership, especially in the early stages or for safety, an over-reliance on it can indicate 
that the dog has not truly learned or internalized desired behaviors. If a dog only 
behaves well when physically constrained or constantly supervised, it suggests a lack of 
intrinsic understanding or motivation for appropriate conduct. Just Behaving aims to 
move beyond this by fostering a state where the dog chooses to behave harmoniously 
because they understand the expectations, feel secure in their environment, and value 
the relationship with their human. This is achieved through "fostering a deep 
relationship, shaping the environment for natural learning, and allowing dogs to develop 
intrinsic understanding". Such an approach implies that the dog internalizes desired 
behavioral patterns through a positive relational context and an environment structured 
for success, rather than through coercion or a constant stream of external prompts. The 
long-term implication of this shift is profound: it suggests the possibility of a more 
relaxed and natural coexistence, where the dog is a more integrated and less 
"managed" member of the family, enjoying greater freedom and trust precisely because 
their behavior flows from a place of understanding and emotional balance. This also 
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reframes "training" as less about discrete sessions and more about a continuous, 
mindful way of living and interacting with the dog. 

Core Concept: Nurturing Deep Emotional Bonds 

At the very core of the Just Behaving philosophy lies the cultivation of a profound 
connection between human and dog. "At the heart of Just Behaving is the nurturing of 
deep emotional bonds built on a bedrock of trust, mutual respect, and an intrinsic 
understanding that flows both ways. This bond is the wellspring from which harmonious 
behavior naturally arises". This statement identifies the relational foundation as 
paramount, suggesting that desirable behavior is not merely a product of training 
techniques but an organic outcome of a strong, healthy emotional bond. 

The phrase "intrinsic understanding that flows both ways" is particularly illuminating and 
central to the philosophy's uniqueness. It posits that the human's effort to understand 
the dog's needs, communication signals, emotional states, and species-specific 
behaviors is just as crucial as the dog's understanding of human expectations. This 
elevates the dog from the status of a passive recipient of training to an active, sentient 
partner in the relationship. Traditional models often place the onus of understanding 
entirely on the dog - the dog must learn what the human wants. Just Behaving, 
however, emphasizes reciprocity in this understanding. This necessitates a high degree 
of empathy, keen observational skills, patience, and self-awareness from the human 
caregiver. The human must learn to "read" their dog, to interpret subtle cues, and to 
respond in ways that foster trust and security. This mutual understanding forms the 
"bedrock" upon which trust and respect are built, creating a secure attachment that 
allows the dog to feel safe, understood, and willing to cooperate. The implication is that 
Just Behaving is as much about educating and developing the human's capacity for 
interspecies communication and empathy as it is about shaping the dog's behavior. 

The Framework: Five Interconnected Pillars 

To translate its core philosophy into practical application, Just Behaving is structured 
around five fundamental principles. "The Just Behaving philosophy is operationalized 
through five core pillars: Mentorship, Calmness, Structured Leadership, Prevention, and 
Indirect Correction. These pillars are not standalone techniques but interconnected 
principles that work synergistically to create a holistic framework for raising and living 
with dogs". This introduction to the pillars immediately emphasizes their holistic and 
synergistic nature, meaning they are designed to work in concert, each reinforcing and 
enhancing the others. 

The assertion that these pillars are "interconnected" and "work synergistically" is key to 
understanding the comprehensive nature of the Just Behaving approach. Synergy 
implies that the combined effect of applying all pillars is greater than the sum of their 
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individual effects. For instance, the cultivation of Calmness (Pillar 2) creates an internal 
state in the dog that makes them more receptive to learning through Mentorship (Pillar 
1). Effective Prevention (Pillar 4) by setting up the environment for success naturally 
reduces the instances where Indirect Correction (Pillar 5) might even be considered. 
Structured Leadership (Pillar 3) provides the clarity and security that underpins both 
Calmness and the dog's willingness to accept guidance. This interconnectedness 
suggests that neglecting one pillar could compromise the effectiveness of the others, 
and therefore, a balanced and consistent application of all five principles is necessary 
for optimal outcomes. This holistic framework may prove more robust and adaptable 
than single-focus training methods because the pillars can mutually support and 
compensate for one another, leading to more stable, well-rounded behavioral 
development in the dog. Furthermore, when challenges do arise, this systemic 
perspective encourages an assessment of how all five pillars are being implemented, 
rather than searching for a single-point solution. 

The Foundational Philosophy - The Five Pillars 

The Just Behaving philosophy is built upon five core pillars that, when understood and 
applied cohesively, guide the development of an emotionally stable and well-integrated 
canine companion. These pillars - Mentorship, Calmness, Structured Leadership, 
Prevention, and Indirect Correction - are not merely techniques but guiding principles 
that shape the human-dog relationship and the dog's learning environment. 

Pillar 1: Mentorship 

Mentorship stands as a cornerstone of the Just Behaving philosophy, defining a primary 
mechanism through which dogs learn and develop socially appropriate behaviors. 

Definition: The Core of Learning 

Mentorship is defined as "the process by which dogs learn through observing and 
modeling the behavior of their human caregivers, who act as calm, consistent parent-
figures or mentors, and by observing well-adjusted adult dogs who serve as positive 
role models". This positions observational learning and social modeling at the forefront 
of the dog's educational experience, drawing upon their natural capacity to learn by 
watching and imitating trusted individuals. The human's role is thus transformed from 
that of a direct instructor, issuing commands and drilling responses, to that of a living 
example. 

Human as Parent/Mentor, Not Disciplinarian or Playmate 

The nature of the human's role within this mentorship dynamic is carefully delineated. 
"In the mentorship role, the human is neither a stern disciplinarian demanding 
obedience, nor an over-enthusiastic playmate constantly stimulating excitement. 
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Instead, the human embodies the qualities of a wise and benevolent parent or mentor: 
patient, guiding, setting boundaries with calm confidence, and demonstrating desired 
behaviors". This distinction is crucial. The "disciplinarian" role often relies on authority 
and correction, potentially fostering anxiety or resentment rather than willing 
cooperation. Conversely, the "constant playmate" role can lead to an over-stimulated 
dog that struggles with self-regulation and calmness. The parent/mentor model, 
however, suggests a relationship based on guidance, support, and the provision of a 
secure base from which the dog can learn and explore. This role implies a long-term 
developmental perspective, akin to raising a child. It frames the interaction not as a 
series of short training courses but as an ongoing process of guidance and modeling 
that shapes the dog's character and behavior throughout their formative years and 
beyond. This sets an expectation for a sustained, consistent effort from the owner, 
focusing on developmental guidance rather than solely on task-based training. 

Contrast with Command-Based Training 

The mentorship approach offers a distinct alternative to traditional command-based 
training methods. "This contrasts sharply with traditional command-based training, 
where the focus is on teaching specific cued responses. Mentorship focuses on the dog 
internalizing broader behavioral patterns and social understanding by observing and 
experiencing the mentor's way of being". Command-based training often emphasizes 
the dog's ability to perform a specific action upon hearing a verbal cue or seeing a hand 
signal. While useful for practical tasks, this does not necessarily translate into a deeper 
understanding of social appropriateness or emotional self-regulation. Mentorship, by 
contrast, aims for a more profound level of learning where the dog absorbs the nuances 
of calm, respectful interaction and appropriate environmental engagement by 
consistently observing these qualities in their human mentor. 

Fostering Intrinsic Understanding 

The goal of mentorship is to cultivate a deep-seated comprehension within the dog. 
"Through consistent mentorship, dogs develop an intrinsic understanding of how to 
navigate their world harmoniously. They learn 'how to be' rather than just 'what to do' 
when given a command". This "intrinsic understanding" means the dog behaves 
appropriately not just because they anticipate a reward or fear a correction associated 
with a command, but because they have internalized the patterns of harmonious 
coexistence. They develop a behavioral repertoire that is naturally aligned with a calm 
and respectful way of being. If dogs learn primarily by modeling their mentors, then the 
human's own emotional regulation, consistency in behavior, and interactional patterns 
become the de facto "curriculum." This places a significant responsibility on the human 
to embody the very traits they wish to see develop in their dog. The success of 
mentorship is, therefore, inextricably linked to the human's own state of being and their 
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commitment to self-awareness. This subtly but powerfully shifts the focus from "training 
the dog" to "being the person the dog can successfully learn from," implying that human 
self-improvement is a core component of the dog's optimal development within this 
philosophical framework. 

Application in Shelters/Rescue 

The power of mentorship extends beyond raising puppies in a home environment; it 
holds significant promise for dogs in challenging circumstances. "The mentorship 
principle is invaluable in shelter and rescue environments. Pairing a dog with a calm, 
stable human mentor or a well-adjusted canine role model can significantly accelerate 
their emotional rehabilitation and ability to integrate into a new home". For dogs who 
may have experienced trauma, neglect, or inconsistent handling, the presence of a 
calm, predictable human mentor or a stable canine companion can provide a powerful 
example of secure and appropriate behavior. This can help to counter previously 
learned maladaptive behaviors and build new, healthier patterns of response, fostering 
trust and facilitating their transition into a permanent loving home. 

 
Pillar 2: Calmness 

Calmness is not merely a desired behavior in the Just Behaving philosophy; it is a 
foundational state of being for the dog, essential for their emotional well-being and their 
capacity to learn and thrive. 

Importance for Dog's Default State and Emotional Stability 

The emphasis is on cultivating an internal state of calm that becomes the dog's 
baseline. "Calmness is not about suppressing a dog's spirit; it's about cultivating a calm 
default state. This inner calm is crucial for emotional stability, allowing the dog to 
process information, learn effectively, and respond thoughtfully rather than reactively". A 
dog whose default state is calm is better equipped to handle the everyday stressors of 
life. They are less likely to be overwhelmed by novel stimuli or to react with excessive 
fear, anxiety, or aggression. This inner equilibrium allows for more considered 
responses to the environment, fostering learning and appropriate social interactions. 
Cultivating such a "calm default state" acts as a proactive strategy against the 
development of anxiety and reactivity. If a dog's baseline emotional state is one of 
tranquility, they will likely possess a higher threshold for stress and be less prone to 
developing fear-based or anxiety-driven behavioral issues. This pillar is, therefore, 
fundamentally preventative for many common behavioral problems, suggesting that 
such issues often arise not solely from specific triggers but from a generally over-
aroused or unstable emotional baseline. 

Reflection of Human Emotional Regulation ("Calm Creates Calm") 
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A key tenet of this pillar is the profound influence of the human's emotional state on the 
dog. "A dog's calmness is often a direct reflection of their human's emotional state. The 
principle 'calm creates calm' is central; by regulating our own emotions and projecting a 
calm demeanor, we help our dogs achieve and maintain their own state of calm". This 
highlights the concept of emotional contagion between species. Dogs are highly attuned 
to human body language, tone of voice, and even physiological cues associated with 
stress or relaxation. If a human is consistently anxious, agitated, or angry, the dog is 
likely to mirror these states. Conversely, a human who consciously cultivates and 
projects calmness can significantly contribute to the dog's ability to settle and feel 
secure. The statement "calm creates calm" implies a bio-behavioral feedback loop. This 
may extend beyond simple behavioral modeling to involve more deeply interconnected 
psycho-physiological states, potentially including phenomena like heart rate coherence 
or the mirroring of stress hormone levels between human and dog. This elevates the 
concept from mere imitation to a more profound, almost subconscious, level of mutual 
influence, underscoring the deep impact humans have on their dogs' internal states. 
Practices such as mindfulness or stress-reduction techniques in humans could, 
therefore, be powerful indirect tools for shaping canine behavior and well-being within 
the Just Behaving framework. 

Avoiding Overstimulation and High-Energy Interactions as the Norm 

Achieving a calm default state requires mindful management of the dog's environment 
and interactions. "We advocate for mindful interaction, avoiding the constant 
overstimulation that can come from incessant high-energy games or chaotic 
environments, especially during formative periods. While play is vital, it should be 
balanced with ample quiet time and calm engagement". This does not mean eliminating 
excitement or play, which are essential for a dog's well-being, but rather ensuring that 
the dog's life is not characterized by perpetual high arousal. Constant exposure to high-
intensity stimuli can make it difficult for a dog to learn to self-soothe and settle, 
potentially leading to a state of chronic stress or hyper-excitability. Puppies and young 
dogs, in particular, benefit from an environment that balances stimulating activities with 
predictable periods of rest and calm. 

Foundation for Selective Excitement 

Calmness is not an end in itself, but rather the necessary foundation for healthy and 
appropriate expressions of energy and enthusiasm. "A calm baseline is the foundation 
upon which appropriate excitement can be selectively built and enjoyed. A dog who can 
be calm can also learn to engage in exciting activities appropriately and then return to a 
state of calm when the activity ends". A dog who has learned to be calm can more easily 
transition into a state of excitement for play or activity and, crucially, transition back to 
calmness afterward. This ability to modulate arousal levels is a hallmark of emotional 
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stability and self-regulation. Without this foundation of calm, excitement can easily 
escalate into uncontrollable behavior or anxiety. Thus, teaching a dog to be calm is, in 
effect, teaching them how to enjoy excitement in a balanced and sustainable way. 

Pillar 3: Structured Leadership 

Structured Leadership within the Just Behaving philosophy refers to the human's role in 
providing a clear, consistent, and benevolent framework that helps the dog feel secure 
and understand their place within the family environment. 

Definition: Clear Boundaries, Guidance, Consistency 

Leadership in this context is defined as "providing clear, consistent boundaries and 
gentle guidance. It's about creating a predictable and secure world for the dog, where 
expectations are understood not through force, but through clarity and repetition". This 
form of leadership is not about dominance or control in an authoritarian sense. Instead, 
it focuses on establishing a reliable structure within which the dog can thrive. Clear 
boundaries, consistently maintained, help the dog understand what is expected of them, 
reducing confusion and anxiety. Gentle guidance, rather than forceful correction, helps 
the dog learn these expectations in a positive and trust-building manner. 

Human Role: Benevolent Leader, Decision-Maker for Well-being 

The human assumes the role of a thoughtful and caring leader. "The human acts as a 
benevolent leader, making thoughtful decisions that prioritize the dog's well-being and 
the harmony of the family unit. This leadership is rooted in responsibility and care, not 
ego or a need to control". The term "benevolent" is key, emphasizing that leadership is 
exercised in the dog's best interest and for the good of the entire household. Decisions 
regarding routines, access to resources, interactions, and safety are made by the 
human, not to assert power, but to ensure the dog's physical and emotional needs are 
met within a stable and harmonious environment. This "benevolent leadership," focused 
on well-being and harmony, implies that rules and boundaries are not arbitrary but serve 
a clear, positive purpose. This makes them more likely to be understood and accepted 
by the dog as integral parts of a safe and predictable world, rather than as unwelcome 
impositions. Such an approach fosters willing cooperation from the dog, who learns to 
trust the human's decisions because these decisions consistently lead to positive or 
secure outcomes. 

Contrast with Rigid Rules or Dominance Mindsets 

Just Behaving's concept of leadership is explicitly differentiated from harsher or more 
outdated models. "This is distinct from rigid, authoritarian rule-making or outdated 
dominance-based approaches. Just Behaving leadership is flexible where appropriate, 
compassionate, and always focused on fostering trust, not fear or submission". 
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Dominance-based theories, which often advocate for the human to assert themselves 
as an "alpha" through confrontational or intimidating tactics, are rejected in favor of a 
relationship built on mutual respect and trust. Similarly, while structure is important, 
leadership here is not about enforcing an unyielding set of rigid rules without 
consideration for context or individual needs. The contrast with "rigid rules" suggests 
that Just Behaving leadership requires a degree of discernment and adaptability from 
the human. The "leader" must be attuned enough to the dog and the specific situation to 
know when a boundary is crucial and when flexibility is appropriate, rather than applying 
a one-size-fits-all set of commands or restrictions. This necessitates a sophisticated 
level of social-emotional intelligence from the human. It is not merely about setting 
rules, but about understanding why and how to set them in a manner that strengthens 
the relationship and supports the dog's emotional state. 

Creating Security and Preventing Chaos 

The primary outcome of effective structured leadership is a profound sense of security 
for the dog. "Clear structure and benevolent leadership create a profound sense of 
security for a dog. Knowing what is expected and that their leader is capably and kindly 
managing the environment prevents confusion, anxiety, and the behavioral chaos that 
can arise from uncertainty". Dogs, like many animals, thrive on predictability. When they 
understand the "rules of the game" and trust that their human leader will manage 
situations competently and kindly, they are less likely to feel anxious or to resort to 
problematic behaviors as a way of coping with uncertainty or trying to control their 
environment. This sense of security is foundational to their overall emotional well-being 
and their ability to be a calm, integrated member of the family. 

Pillar 4: Prevention 

Prevention is a proactive and foundational pillar in the Just Behaving philosophy, 
emphasizing the importance of setting the dog up for success from the very beginning, 
thereby minimizing the development of undesirable behaviors. 

Proactive Approach: Establishing Desirable Behavior from Outset 

The core of this pillar is its forward-thinking nature. "Prevention is a cornerstone of Just 
Behaving, emphasizing a proactive approach. We focus on establishing desirable 
behaviors from the very beginning, making it easier for the puppy or dog to 'get it right' 
rather than correcting mistakes later". Instead of waiting for problems to arise and then 
reacting to them, the emphasis is on creating conditions where the dog is naturally 
guided towards appropriate conduct. This involves anticipating potential challenges and 
structuring the dog's experiences to foster good habits from day one. 

Setting Up Environment and Social Interactions for Correct Learning 
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Practically, prevention involves careful management of the dog's surroundings and 
social encounters. "This involves thoughtfully setting up the dog's environment and 
managing social interactions in such a way that the puppy naturally learns appropriate 
behaviors from the start. It's about guiding them towards success". This could mean 
puppy-proofing the home to prevent destructive chewing, managing interactions with 
other dogs or people to ensure positive experiences, or structuring routines in a way 
that promotes calmness and predictability. The goal is to make the desired behavior the 
easiest and most natural option for the dog. A deep commitment to prevention requires 
significant foresight and a solid understanding of canine development and learning 
theory on the part of the human. It extends beyond simple measures like using baby 
gates; it involves anticipating potential behavioral challenges at different developmental 
stages (e.g., teething, fear periods, adolescence) and proactively structuring the dog's 
experiences to teach desired alternatives before problems emerge. This elevates the 
role of owner education, implying that Just Behaving provides not just a philosophy but 
also practical knowledge about canine ethology and development to empower owners 
to be effective "preventers." This is an intellectually more demanding approach for the 
owner than simply reacting to behaviors as they occur. 

Preventing Unwanted Habits from Taking Root 

The rationale behind prevention is clear: "The goal of prevention is to stop unwanted 
habits from ever taking root. It's far easier and kinder to build good habits from day one 
than to try to undo established problem behaviors". Once a behavior becomes 
ingrained, especially if it has been self-reinforcing for the dog (e.g., jumping up gets 
attention, barking at the mailman makes him "go away"), it can be much more 
challenging and time-consuming to modify. Prevention bypasses this struggle by 
ensuring the dog has fewer opportunities to practice unwanted behaviors and more 
opportunities to learn and rehearse desirable ones. 

Contrast with Dealing with Problems Later 

This proactive stance is explicitly contrasted with more reactive approaches. "This 
proactive stance contrasts sharply with reactive approaches that wait for problems to 
emerge and then attempt to fix them, often requiring more intensive intervention and 
causing more stress for both dog and human". Reactive problem-solving can be 
frustrating for owners and stressful for dogs, often involving more intensive behavior 
modification protocols. Prevention aims to minimize the need for such interventions by 
addressing potential issues before they become established problems. 

Prevention Makes Success "Invisible" 

A unique characteristic of successful prevention is its often-unseen impact. "Effective 
prevention often makes success 'invisible' - the problems simply don't arise. This can 
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sometimes make its profound impact less obvious, but it's a key to raising a naturally 
well-behaved dog with minimal stress". When prevention is working optimally, many 
common puppy problems or adult behavioral issues may never materialize. This 
"invisibility" of success means that the true measure of this pillar's effectiveness might 
be the absence of problems, rather than dramatic "before and after" transformations of 
existing issues. This requires a shift in how success in dog rearing is perceived and 
valued. It is less about "fixing" a "broken" dog and more about skillfully guiding a 
developing dog so that they never become "broken" in the first place. Educating owners 
about the power of this "invisible success" is crucial, as it highlights the profound, albeit 
quiet, impact of thoughtful, proactive management and guidance. It also suggests that 
Just Behaving practitioners may spend a significant portion of their time guiding owners 
on proactive environmental setup and interaction management, rather than on reactive 
behavior modification techniques. 

Pillar 5: Indirect Correction 

While the Just Behaving philosophy heavily emphasizes proactive and positive 
approaches, it also acknowledges that moments may arise when a dog needs clearer 
feedback about undesirable actions. This is addressed through the pillar of Indirect 
Correction. 

Definition: Gentle, Non-Aversive Feedback 

Indirect Correction is carefully defined to distinguish it from punishment. "Indirect 
Correction in Just Behaving refers to providing gentle, non-aversive feedback to the dog 
when they stray from desired behaviors. It's not punishment, but rather a way of clearly 
and calmly communicating 'that's not quite it' or 'try this instead'". The emphasis is on 
communication that is informative rather than intimidating or painful. The goal is to guide 
the dog back towards appropriate behavior without causing fear, anxiety, or damage to 
the human-dog bond. 

Use as Meaningful, Rare Reinforcement of Lessons 

The application of indirect correction is intended to be infrequent and supportive of prior 
learning. "Such corrections are used sparingly and are most effective when they are 
meaningful to the dog within the context of an already established lesson or boundary. 
They serve as a rare reinforcement of what has already been primarily taught through 
positive guidance and prevention". This means that indirect corrections are not primary 
teaching tools. They are employed only when other proactive measures (like prevention 
and clear leadership) have momentarily fallen short, and they serve to clarify a lesson 
that the dog, in principle, already understands. The effectiveness of "indirect correction" 
likely hinges significantly on its rarity and the strength of the positive relationship and 
prior learning established through the consistent application of Mentorship, Calmness, 
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Structured Leadership, and Prevention. If corrections were to become common, they 
would cease to be "indirect" or "gentle" in their cumulative impact and could become 
aversive. This pillar is, therefore, highly dependent on the successful implementation of 
the other four; it is a tool for fine-tuning and clarification, not for primary behavior 
shaping, reinforcing the interconnectedness of the pillars. 

Examples: Blocking Jumping, Redirecting Biting 

Concrete examples help to illustrate the nature of indirect correction. "Examples include 
calmly using your body to block a dog from jumping up, or gently redirecting a puppy's 
nipping mouth to an appropriate chew toy, often without verbal reprimands. The 
feedback is physical but not forceful or painful". These actions interrupt the unwanted 
behavior and redirect the dog towards a more acceptable alternative, providing clear 
information in a non-confrontational manner. The absence of harsh verbal reprimands 
further underscores the gentle nature of this approach. 

Contrast with Punishment or Harsh Methods 

The philosophy explicitly distances indirect correction from punitive techniques. "This 
approach stands in stark contrast to punishment-based methods or harsh physical or 
verbal corrections, which can create fear, anxiety, and damage the trust-based 
relationship we aim to build". The avoidance of methods that elicit fear or pain is a 
central ethical consideration, reflecting a commitment to the dog's emotional well-being. 

Stays Fundamentally Force-Free in Spirit 

Indirect Correction is positioned carefully within the spectrum of humane training 
philosophies. "While not 'purely positive' in the strictest sense of never providing any 
negative consequence, Just Behaving's indirect corrections are designed to be so 
minimal and informational that the approach remains fundamentally force-free and 
positive in spirit and practice, prioritizing the dog's emotional well-being". This statement 
acknowledges that providing feedback which a dog might find momentarily unrewarding 
(like being blocked from jumping) is a form of consequence. However, the intent and 
application are such that they do not rely on fear, intimidation, or pain. The description 
"fundamentally force-free in spirit" suggests a pragmatic approach. It recognizes the 
practical need for clear communication of boundaries in real-world situations, without 
resorting to methods that cause distress or compromise the dog's welfare. This seeks a 
nuanced middle ground, potentially addressing some perceived limitations of "purely 
positive" methods (e.g., how to effectively and immediately interrupt an unwanted 
behavior) while steadfastly rejecting harsh aversives. This nuanced stance allows for 
practical application while maintaining a strong ethical commitment to the dog. It reflects 
a sophisticated understanding of learning, where "correction" is primarily informational 
rather than suppressive, aiming to guide rather than coerce. 
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Interconnectedness and Holistic Nature of the Pillars 

It is paramount to recognize that the Five Pillars of Just Behaving are not isolated 
components to be selected or applied piecemeal. Their true power lies in their collective 
and synergistic operation. "It is crucial to understand that these Five Pillars are not a 
menu of options but a deeply interconnected and holistic system. Mentorship provides 
the learning model, Calmness creates the optimal state for learning and living, 
Structured Leadership provides security and predictability, Prevention minimizes errors, 
and Indirect Correction offers gentle refinement. Each pillar supports and is supported 
by the others". 

This holistic nature means that when behavioral challenges arise, the solution is not 
typically sought in a single technique or by focusing on just one pillar. Instead, a 
comprehensive assessment of how all five pillars are being implemented in the dog's life 
is undertaken. For example, if a dog is exhibiting excessive leash pulling, the Just 
Behaving approach would likely involve: 

• Enhancing Calmness before and during walks, ensuring the dog starts in a 
relaxed state. 

• Reinforcing Mentorship on the walk, with the human modeling calm, focused 
forward movement. 

• Ensuring clear Structured Leadership signals regarding pace and direction. 

• Implementing Prevention strategies to minimize opportunities for the dog to 
practice pulling (e.g., using appropriate equipment that doesn't encourage 
opposition, choosing quieter routes initially). 

• And only if necessary, employing very gentle Indirect Correction (perhaps a 
momentary pause or change of direction) to clarify the desired behavior. 

This systemic approach encourages a more thoughtful and comprehensive problem-
solving process. It moves away from the idea of quick fixes or isolated techniques and 
towards addressing the root causes of behavior within the broader context of the dog's 
overall experience, environment, and relationship with their human. The pillars function 
as a dynamic system, where the strength of one can bolster another, and a weakness in 
one area might be buffered by strengths elsewhere, yet optimal functioning relies on the 
health of the whole. 

Emotional Reciprocity: A Key Differentiator 

Beyond the Five Pillars, a fundamental concept that distinguishes the Just Behaving 
philosophy is its deep appreciation for what is termed Emotional Reciprocity. This 
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principle acknowledges the profound and mutual emotional influence between humans 
and their canine companions. 

"A key differentiator of Just Behaving is the deep appreciation for Emotional Reciprocity: 
the understanding that human emotions profoundly shape canine behavior, and 
conversely, our dogs' emotional states impact our own. This two-way emotional 
influence is a powerful dynamic in the relationship". This concept moves beyond a 
unidirectional model where the human simply acts upon the dog. It recognizes that the 
relationship is a dynamic emotional system where each party influences and is 
influenced by the other. If a human is stressed, their dog is likely to pick up on that 
stress and may exhibit anxious behaviors, which in turn can exacerbate the human's 
stress, creating a negative feedback loop. Conversely, a calm and joyful human can 
foster calmness and joy in their dog, leading to a positive spiral that enhances the well-
being of both. 

The practical implication of this understanding is significant, particularly for the human 
caregiver. "This necessitates a high degree of human self-awareness and emotional 
regulation. To help our dogs achieve emotional balance, we must first be mindful of and 
manage our own emotional landscape. Our calm, confidence, and joy are contagious, 
as are our stress, anxiety, and frustration". This places a clear emphasis on the human's 
responsibility to cultivate their own emotional well-being, not just for their own sake, but 
for the sake of their dog. The human, possessing a greater capacity for conscious self-
regulation, is seen as the primary architect of the emotional climate within the 
relationship. 

Emotional Reciprocity suggests that the human-dog bond is a space of co-regulation, 
where both individuals ideally contribute to each other's emotional equilibrium. This has 
profound implications, suggesting that one of the most effective ways to help a dog with 
behavioral or emotional issues may be for the human to work on their own emotional 
self-management and stress reduction. It frames the relationship as a true partnership 
where emotional support, ideally, flows in both directions. This concept may be 
particularly resonant and applicable in contexts such as therapy and emotional support 
animal partnerships, where the dog's ability to attune to and positively influence human 
emotional states is central to their role, but it equally applies to the everyday 
companionship shared in homes. 

The following table provides a comparative overview of the Five Pillars, summarizing 
their core principles and roles within the Just Behaving philosophy: 

Table 1: The Five Pillars of Just Behaving: A Comparative Overview 
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Pillar Core 
Principle 
(Just 
Behavin
g 
Perspect
ive) 

Human's Role Dog's 
Learning 
Focus 

Contrast with 
Traditional 
Element 

Primary 
Goal of 
Pillar 

Mentors
hip 

Learning 
through 
observati
on and 
modeling 
of calm, 
consisten
t parent-
figures 
and well-
adjusted 
adult 
dogs. 

Parent/Mentor, 
embodying 
desired behaviors. 

Observati
onal 
learning, 
social 
modeling, 
internalizi
ng 
broader 
behavioral 
patterns. 

vs. 
Disciplinarian/Co
mmand-giver 
focused on cued 
responses. 

Intrinsic 
social 
understandi
ng, 'how to 
be'. 

Calmne
ss 

Cultivatin
g a calm 
default 
state for 
emotional 
stability 
and 
effective 
learning. 

Embodiment of 
calm, regulator of 
emotional climate. 

Emotional 
self-
regulation, 
processin
g 
informatio
n 
thoughtfull
y, 
respondin
g calmly. 

vs. Constant high-
energy play, 
overstimulation, 
focus only on 
managing excited 
states. 

Stable 
emotional 
baseline, 
thoughtful 
responsive
ness. 

Structur
ed 
Leaders
hip 

Providing 
clear, 
consisten
t 
boundarie

Benevolent guide, 
making decisions 
for well-being. 

Understan
ding 
expectatio
ns, feeling 
secure in 

vs. 
Dominance/Alpha 
roles, rigid 
authoritarian 
rules, focus on 

Security, 
predictabilit
y, 
prevention 
of chaos. 
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s and 
gentle 
guidance 
to create 
security 
and 
predictabi
lity. 

a 
predictabl
e 
environme
nt. 

control through 
force or 
intimidation. 

Preventi
on 

Proactivel
y 
establishi
ng 
desirable 
behaviors 
and 
preventin
g 
unwanted 
habits 
from 
taking 
root. 

Thoughtful 
planner, manager 
of 
environment/inter
actions. 

Learning 
correctly 
from the 
start, 
developin
g good 
habits 
naturally. 

vs. Reactive 
correction of 
problems after 
they emerge, 
focusing on fixing 
mistakes. 

Errorless 
learning, 
establishm
ent of good 
habits. 

Indirect 
Correcti
on 

Providing 
gentle, 
non-
aversive 
feedback 
as a rare 
reinforce
ment of 
lessons 
already 
taught. 

Calm 
communicator of 
boundaries, 
gentle guide. 

Understan
ding 'not 
quite it' or 
'try this 
instead' 
without 
fear or 
anxiety. 

vs. Punishment, 
harsh 
physical/verbal 
corrections, 
methods causing 
fear/pain or 
damaging trust. 

Clear, 
gentle 
feedback, 
refinement 
of 
understandi
ng. 

This table encapsulates the essence of each pillar, highlighting how they collectively 
contribute to the overarching goal of raising emotionally stable, well-adjusted canine 
companions within a framework of mutual respect and understanding. 
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Methodology in Practice - Raising the Just Behaving Dog 

The principles and pillars of the Just Behaving philosophy translate into a distinct 
methodology for raising and living with dogs. This methodology emphasizes early 
development, the integration of learning into daily life, structured forms of 
companionship, a nuanced approach to command training, and a unique perspective on 
tools like the leash. It also provides a framework for addressing behavioral challenges 
and guiding the dog through various life stages. 

Early Development & Socialization: The Critical Window (3-16 Weeks) 

The Just Behaving approach places immense importance on the early weeks of a 
puppy's life, recognizing the critical socialization period as a foundational window for 
shaping future behavior and temperament. "The critical socialization period (3-16 
weeks) is a cornerstone of the Just Behaving approach. We emphasize quality of 
experiences over mere quantity, ensuring each exposure is positive, controlled, and 
builds confidence. Experiences during this window program future behaviors; preventing 
negative experiences is paramount". 

This focus on quality over quantity during the 3-16 week window is a significant 
departure from some mainstream interpretations of socialization, which can sometimes 
lead to overwhelming puppies with too many uncontrolled or intense experiences in an 
effort to expose them to "everything." The Just Behaving methodology understands that 
a single frightening or overwhelming experience during this sensitive developmental 
stage can have a disproportionately large and lasting negative impact, potentially 
leading to fearfulness, anxiety, or reactivity later in life. Therefore, the emphasis is on 
carefully curating a puppy's early encounters with new sights, sounds, people, animals, 
and environments. Each new experience is managed to ensure it is perceived by the 
puppy as positive or, at worst, neutral, thereby building a foundation of confidence and 
resilience rather than apprehension. 

The statement that "preventing negative experiences is paramount" implies a highly 
protective and thoughtfully managed approach. This might involve, for example, 
ensuring interactions with other dogs are with known, calm, and well-socialized adult 
dogs, rather than unpredictable encounters in a busy dog park. It could mean 
introducing new sounds gradually and at low intensity, or ensuring that interactions with 
strangers are gentle and rewarding for the puppy. This deliberate and supervised 
approach to socialization aims to "program" the puppy for future success by creating a 
strong bank of positive associations with the world. This requires significant 
commitment, knowledge, and observational skill from the owner or caregiver, who must 
act as the puppy's advocate and protector, skillfully guiding them through these crucial 
early learning experiences. The long-term benefit of such careful early socialization is a 
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dog that is more likely to be emotionally balanced, socially appropriate, and confident in 
navigating the complexities of the human world. 

Applying Principles in Daily Life: A Continuous Lifestyle 

A defining characteristic of the Just Behaving methodology is its pervasiveness; it is not 
confined to discrete "training sessions" but is woven into the fabric of everyday life. "Just 
Behaving is not confined to 'training sessions'; it's a lifestyle applied continuously. 
Lessons in calmness, mentorship, and leadership are integrated into everyday activities 
like mealtimes, greeting visitors, and quiet relaxation time, making learning natural and 
pervasive". This approach recognizes that dogs are constantly learning from their 
interactions and environment, not just during formal training periods. 

By integrating the core principles into daily routines, every interaction becomes an 
opportunity for learning and for reinforcing the Just Behaving philosophy. For example: 

• Mealtimes: Can be an opportunity to practice calmness (e.g., waiting politely for 
the food bowl) and respect for leadership (e.g., human controls access to food). 

• Greeting Visitors: Can be a chance to reinforce calm greetings, guided by the 
human mentor, rather than allowing excited jumping. 

• Quiet Relaxation Time: Provides opportunities for the dog to learn to settle and 
be calm in the presence of the family, reinforcing the Calmness pillar. 

• Walks: Become mobile mentorship sessions, reinforcing calm focus and 
responsiveness to the human leader. 

This continuous application makes the learning process more organic and less artificial 
for the dog. Behaviors learned in the context of everyday life are more likely to 
generalize across different situations, leading to a dog that is reliably well-behaved in 
various real-world settings, not just in a sterile training environment. This approach 
requires the human to be consistently mindful of their own behavior and the subtle 
lessons they are imparting through their actions and reactions. It fosters a state of 
ongoing, gentle guidance and mutual attunement, rather than relying on intensive but 
potentially isolated bursts of formal training. The flexibility in application, based on the 
individual dog and specific situation, allows this lifestyle approach to be tailored, 
ensuring that the principles are applied in a way that is most effective and supportive for 
each unique human-dog dyad. 

Structured Companionship: Nurturing Natural Behaviors Appropriately 

The Just Behaving methodology acknowledges and values a dog's need for play, 
exercise, and the expression of natural canine behaviors. However, it advocates for 
these activities to occur within a framework that supports overall emotional stability and 
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reinforces the core principles of the philosophy. This is termed "Structured 
Companionship." "Structured Companionship ensures that play, exercise, and the 
expression of natural canine behaviors occur within contexts that support emotional 
stability. It's about enhancing these experiences by creating dogs who understand 
appropriate timing and intensity, leading to more freedom and inclusion in family life, not 
less". 

This concept means that even activities typically associated with high energy, such as 
play or vigorous exercise, are approached with intention and mindfulness. The aim is to 
prevent these activities from inadvertently undermining the dog's baseline calmness or 
reinforcing undesirable states of over-arousal. For example: 

• Play: May involve teaching rules and boundaries, such as taking breaks to calm 
down, polite toy exchanges, or an "off-switch" to signal the end of the game. This 
prevents play from escalating into frantic, uncontrollable behavior. 

• Exercise: Is tailored to the dog's physical and mental needs but is conducted in 
a way that promotes focus and partnership with the human, rather than chaotic, 
mindless running that might leave the dog physically tired but mentally wired. 

• Expression of Natural Behaviors: Activities like sniffing on walks, appropriate 
digging in a designated area, or safe chewing are encouraged, but within 
contexts that are safe and respectful of the environment and family rules. 

By structuring these companionship activities, the human guides the energy, duration, 
and intensity of the interaction, ensuring that even high-energy outlets contribute to the 
dog's overall balance rather than detracting from it. This approach helps dogs learn self-
regulation and appropriate social conduct even when excited. The outcome, 
paradoxically to some, is often "more freedom and inclusion in family life, not less". A 
dog who understands appropriate play, who can settle after exercise, and who 
expresses natural behaviors in acceptable ways is a dog who can be more readily 
included in a wider range of family activities and social situations. This contrasts with 
overindulgence that might lead to an unruly dog, or, conversely, the suppression of 
natural behaviors which can lead to frustration and behavioral problems. Structured 
companionship seeks a harmonious balance. 

Command Training: Secondary to Intrinsic Understanding 

In the Just Behaving methodology, formal command training, while having its place, is 
considered secondary to the development of a dog's intrinsic understanding of 
harmonious behavior. "Formal commands are secondary in Just Behaving. Our primary 
focus is shaping the dog's mindset and intrinsic understanding of harmonious behavior. 
Practical cues (sit, down, come) are taught, often by 'capturing' naturally offered 
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behaviors, without heavy reliance on treats, once a foundation of calm and 
understanding is established". 

The primary goal is to cultivate a dog who behaves appropriately because they are 
calm, secure, respectful, and understand the social dynamics of their environment, not 
simply because they are waiting for a command or a food reward. This "shaping of 
mindset" is achieved through the consistent application of the Five Pillars. Once this 
foundational mindset is in place, teaching practical commands becomes a relatively 
straightforward process. 

The method of "capturing" naturally offered behaviors is particularly noteworthy. This 
involves the human observing the dog and, when the dog spontaneously offers a 
desired behavior (e.g., a calm sit while waiting for dinner, a polite down during family 
relaxation time), marking and rewarding that behavior, perhaps later attaching a verbal 
cue to it. This means the dog is already performing the behavior because it feels natural 
or appropriate in that context. The cue then simply becomes a label for an action the 
dog already understands and is willing to offer. This approach leads to behaviors that 
are often more reliable and less dependent on constant prompting or luring with treats, 
as they are rooted in the dog's genuine understanding and emotional state, rather than 
being solely a means to an external reward. While treats might be used judiciously, the 
absence of "heavy reliance" on them suggests that the relationship itself, praise, and life 
rewards (like access to desired activities) also play significant roles in reinforcing 
behavior. The ultimate aim is for behavior to flow naturally from a well-adjusted mindset, 
with cues serving as helpful communication tools rather than the sole drivers of action. 

Leash Philosophy: An Extension of Relationship 

The Just Behaving approach to leash work reframes the leash from a tool of mere 
control or restraint to an instrument of connection and continued mentorship. "The leash 
is introduced not as a tool of control, but as an extension of the calm, structured 
mentorship established off-leash first. It represents connection and guidance, facilitating 
shared, peaceful walks once a foundation of companionship and calm focus is built". 

This philosophy entails a radical departure from conventional leash training, which often 
begins with teaching a puppy to accept the leash and then working to prevent or correct 
pulling. In the Just Behaving model, significant foundational work is done before the 
leash becomes a regular part of walks in distracting environments. This foundation 
involves cultivating calmness, focus, and a responsive partnership between the dog and 
human, often practiced in safe, enclosed areas without a leash initially. The dog learns 
to walk attentively with the human, responding to their body language and guidance, 
because of the established relationship and the principles of mentorship and leadership, 
not because of physical cues from a leash. 
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When the leash is eventually introduced for walks in more public or stimulating areas, it 
serves more as a safety line and a subtle means of communication, rather than a device 
to physically manage an unruly dog. Because the dog has already learned the 
rudiments of walking calmly and attentively with their human, the transition to leash 
walking is often smoother and less fraught with pulling or resistance. This approach 
aims to create dogs who walk politely on leash because they are already in a calm, 
focused state of mind and attuned to their human mentor, rather than because they 
have been mechanically trained to avoid leash pressure or are constantly being 
managed with food lures. This perspective has the potential to significantly reduce 
common problems like leash reactivity and persistent pulling, as it addresses the 
underlying state of mind and relational dynamics that contribute to these issues. The 
leash, in this context, truly becomes a symbol of the partnership, allowing for peaceful, 
shared exploration of the world. 

Addressing Challenges: A Holistic, Principle-Based Approach 

No matter how ideal the upbringing, behavioral challenges can occasionally arise. The 
Just Behaving methodology provides a framework for addressing these challenges that 
is consistent with its core philosophy, focusing on understanding and resolving 
underlying causes rather than merely suppressing symptoms. "When behavioral 
challenges like separation anxiety arise, Just Behaving employs a holistic approach. We 
examine underlying factors - medical, emotional, environmental, and relational - rather 
than just treating symptoms. The focus is on reshaping the dog's sense of security and 
trust, often by reinforcing the Five Pillars, particularly Calmness and Structured 
Leadership". 

This holistic approach means that when a problem behavior is observed, the first step is 
a comprehensive assessment. For example, with an issue like separation anxiety, the 
investigation would consider: 

• Medical factors: Ruling out any underlying health issues that could contribute to 
anxiety or distress. 

• Emotional factors: Assessing the dog's baseline emotional state, attachment 
patterns, and any specific fears or anxieties. 

• Environmental factors: Examining the home environment for potential 
stressors, lack of enrichment, or inconsistencies in routine. 

• Relational factors: Evaluating the dynamics of the human-dog relationship, 
including the consistency of leadership, the level of emotional reciprocity, and the 
dog's overall sense of security within the family. 
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Once potential contributing factors are identified, the intervention focuses on "reshaping 
the dog's sense of security and trust". This is primarily achieved by a renewed and often 
intensified application of the Five Pillars. For separation anxiety, this might involve: 

• Strengthening Calmness: Teaching the dog to be more comfortable and relaxed 
when alone, and ensuring the human projects calm around departures and 
arrivals. 

• Reinforcing Structured Leadership: Providing clear, consistent routines and 
boundaries to enhance the dog's sense of predictability and security, knowing 
that their leader has things under control. 

• Utilizing Prevention: Initially avoiding situations that trigger full-blown anxiety 
while working on building tolerance. 

• Ensuring Mentorship: The human models calm confidence, helping the dog to 
feel more secure. 

This approach seeks to address the root cause of the anxiety - often a lack of security 
or an inability to cope with solitude - rather than relying solely on desensitization and 
counter-conditioning protocols in isolation, or on management techniques like crating 
without addressing the underlying emotional distress. By focusing on building a more 
secure emotional foundation and a stronger, trust-based relationship, the Just Behaving 
methodology aims for more robust and lasting solutions to complex behavioral issues. 
This deep, foundational approach is designed to do more than just modify outward 
behavioral manifestations; it aims to genuinely improve the dog's internal emotional 
state and coping abilities. 

Transition to Adult Dog: Evolving Guidance for Lifelong Companionship 

The Just Behaving philosophy is not a program that ends with puppyhood; it is a lifelong 
approach to companionship that adapts as the dog matures. "The Just Behaving 
journey evolves as a puppy matures. While the foundational principles remain, the 
application adapts. The relationship deepens, and guidance continues throughout all life 
stages, ensuring the dog remains a well-integrated, emotionally balanced companion 
into adulthood and seniority". 

As a dog transitions from adolescence into adulthood and eventually into their senior 
years, their needs, energy levels, and potential challenges may change. The Five Pillars 
provide a consistent framework, but their specific application may need to be adjusted: 

• Mentorship: Continues, but may shift from basic guidance to a more nuanced 
partnership based on years of mutual understanding. 
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• Calmness: Remains crucial, perhaps with an increased focus on managing age-
related anxieties or discomfort. 

• Structured Leadership: Provides ongoing security, especially if the dog's 
sensory abilities decline or new family members (human or animal) are 
introduced. 

• Prevention: Adapts to new potential issues, such as managing mobility 
limitations in senior dogs or preventing resource guarding if new pets join the 
household. 

• Indirect Correction: Remains gentle and rare, used only for clarification within 
the context of a well-established relationship. 

This "evolving relationship and continued need for guidance" implies that Just Behaving 
is not a "fix it and forget it" system. It acknowledges the dynamic nature of life and 
relationships. Dogs, like humans, are not static beings; they change physically and 
emotionally over time. They may encounter new environmental stressors, changes in 
family structure, or develop age-related health concerns that can impact their behavior. 
The Just Behaving philosophy equips owners with the principles to navigate these 
changes effectively, ensuring that the dog continues to feel secure, understood, and 
well-cared for throughout their entire life. This fosters a truly lifelong companionship 
model, where the human remains attuned and responsive to the dog's evolving needs, 
preserving the strength of the bond and the dog's well-being into their golden years. 
This ongoing commitment ensures that the dog remains a harmoniously integrated 
member of the family, not just during their youthful prime, but through all the seasons of 
their life. 

The Just Behaving Breeding Program 

The Just Behaving philosophy extends beyond the principles of raising and living with 
dogs to encompass a dedicated and ethically driven breeding program. This program is 
designed to produce puppies that are not only physically healthy but also possess the 
inherent temperament and emotional predispositions that align with the Just Behaving 
ideals of a stable, balanced companion. 

Foundation: Ethical Responsibility, Scientific Rigor, and Heartfelt Dedication 

The breeding program is built upon a carefully considered foundation that integrates 
multiple dimensions of responsibility and care. "The Just Behaving Breeding Program is 
built upon a tripod of ethical responsibility to our dogs and their future families, rigorous 
application of veterinary science and genetics, and a heartfelt dedication to the well-
being of every puppy we bring into the world". This "tripod" approach underscores a 
commitment that is multifaceted: 
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• Ethical Responsibility: This encompasses a duty of care to the breeding dogs 
themselves, ensuring their health and welfare are prioritized. It also extends to 
the puppies produced and the families who will welcome them into their homes, 
implying a commitment to transparency, support, and responsible placement. 

• Scientific Rigor: This involves leveraging the best available knowledge in 
veterinary medicine, genetics, and animal behavior to make informed breeding 
decisions. This includes comprehensive health screening, genetic testing, and an 
understanding of heritable traits related to both physical soundness and 
temperament. 

• Heartfelt Dedication: This speaks to the passion and compassion that drive the 
program. It suggests that breeding is not merely a technical or commercial 
endeavor but a labor of love, focused on nurturing each puppy and fostering their 
potential for a happy, healthy life. 

The explicit combination of "scientific rigor" and "heartfelt dedication" is particularly 
significant. It is a breeding program that strives for a balance between objective, data-
driven decision-making and a deep, compassionate understanding of the individual 
animals involved. This blend aims to avoid the potential pitfalls of an overly clinical 
approach that might neglect individual animal welfare or the nuances of temperament, 
and conversely, a purely sentimental approach that might lack the necessary objective 
health and genetic screening. Such a holistic foundation results in puppies that are not 
only physically robust and genetically sound but also benefit from early socialization and 
an emotionally nurturing environment from their very first days, reflecting the 
overarching Just Behaving philosophy. 

Core Principles: Responsibility, Holism, Transparency, Compassion, Progress 

The operational ethics of the Just Behaving breeding program are guided by five clearly 
articulated core principles. "Our breeding decisions and practices are guided by five 
core principles: Responsibility (lifelong for our puppies), Holism (considering the whole 
dog - health, temperament, and upbringing), Transparency (open communication with 
families and colleagues), Compassion (for our dogs and the families who love them), 
and Progress (continuous improvement of our program)". Each of these principles 
contributes to the integrity and quality of the program: 

• Responsibility: The commitment to "lifelong responsibility for our puppies" is a 
profound statement of accountability, suggesting ongoing support for the dogs 
and their families well beyond the point of sale. 

• Holism: This principle ensures that breeding decisions are not based on a single 
trait (e.g., appearance or a specific working ability) but consider the "whole dog," 
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including physical health, genetic diversity, temperament, and the early 
upbringing environment provided to puppies. 

• Transparency: Open communication with prospective families about breeding 
practices, health testing, and puppy development, as well as dialogue with 
veterinary and breeding colleagues, fosters trust and accountability. 

• Compassion: This principle underscores an empathetic approach to both the 
dogs in the breeding program and the human families involved, recognizing the 
emotional investment on all sides. 

• Progress: The commitment to "continuous improvement of our program" is vital. 
It implies that the breeding program is not static but actively seeks to learn, 
adapt, and evolve. This aligns with the "observation and questioning" ethos that 
underpins the broader Just Behaving philosophy and suggests a dedication to 
incorporating new scientific findings, experiential learning, and feedback to refine 
practices over time. This commitment to progress indicates a dynamic and highly 
responsible breeding program that strives to produce progressively healthier and 
more temperamentally sound dogs with each generation, rather than simply 
resting on past achievements or adhering to outdated practices. 

Approach: "Head in the Data, Heart in the Right Place" 

The philosophy guiding the breeding program is succinctly captured in our motto: "Our 
motto, 'head in the data, heart in the right place,' encapsulates our approach. We utilize 
extensive veterinary science, genetic testing (DNA, imaging), and adhere to or exceed 
standards from organizations like OFA, PennHIP, GRCA, and AVMA. Simultaneously, 
temperament evaluation involves careful observation, empathy, and intuition". This 
motto effectively communicates the dual commitment to objective evidence and 
subjective, experienced insight. 

The "head in the data" aspect is demonstrated by the commitment to: 

• Extensive veterinary science: Utilizing current medical knowledge for the 
health and care of breeding stock and puppies. 

• Genetic testing: Employing DNA screening for known heritable diseases and 
using imaging techniques (like those from OFA for hips/elbows or PennHIP for 
hip laxity) to assess structural soundness. 

• Adherence to standards: Meeting or exceeding the health and ethical 
guidelines set forth by respected veterinary and breed-specific organizations 
(e.g., Orthopedic Foundation for Animals, PennHIP, Golden Retriever Club of 
America, American Veterinary Medical Association). 
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Simultaneously, the "heart in the right place" aspect is evident in the approach to 
temperament evaluation. While some aspects of temperament may have genetic 
markers or can be assessed through standardized tests, the program also values 
"careful observation, empathy, and intuition". This is a crucial element. It suggests that 
while scientific data provides an indispensable foundation for health and genetic 
predispositions, the breeders also trust and utilize their experienced understanding of 
subtle canine behaviors, emotional expressions, and social interactions. These nuanced 
aspects of temperament, which may not always be easily quantifiable, are critical for 
assessing a dog's suitability as a family companion and for making appropriate breeding 
choices. This balanced approach, integrating objective data with experienced, 
empathetic assessment of personality and emotional traits, likely leads to better 
breeding decisions and more suitable matches between puppies and their future 
families. It considers not just the absence of genetic disease or the presence of 
desirable physical traits, but also the subtle yet vital qualities of character that make a 
dog a truly harmonious companion. 

Lifetime Responsibility, Systematic Tracking, Critical Breeding Index, and 
Transparency 

The Just Behaving breeding program implements specific practices that reflect its core 
principles and its "head in the data, heart in the right place" approach. "We maintain a 
lifetime commitment to our puppies, systematically tracking their health and 
development through ongoing communication with families. Our proprietary 'Critical 
Breeding Index' helps guide breeding choices by holistically evaluating multiple factors. 
All processes are supported by internal documentation and an ethos of transparency 
and open dialogue". 

Several key practices stand out: 

• Lifetime Commitment and Systematic Tracking: The pledge of "lifetime 
commitment" combined with "systematically tracking their health and 
development" is a hallmark of a deeply responsible breeding program. This 
involves maintaining ongoing contact with puppy families, gathering data on 
health, temperament, and longevity. This long-term data collection is invaluable. 

• Critical Breeding Index (CBI): The "proprietary 'Critical Breeding Index'" is a 
sophisticated, multi-factorial tool used to guide breeding decisions. This index 
integrates various data points – health clearances, genetic test results, 
temperament assessments of parents and relatives, and potentially feedback 
from the systematic tracking of previous offspring – into a holistic evaluation. 

• Internal Documentation and Transparency: Robust internal record-keeping 
supports consistent application of protocols and facilitates the tracking necessary 



© 2025 Just Behaving (Dan Roach). All rights reserved. Page | 28  

for the CBI. The "ethos of transparency and open dialogue" ensures that families 
and collaborating professionals have access to relevant information. 

The synergy between systematic tracking, lifetime responsibility, and a tool like the 
Critical Breeding Index creates a powerful feedback loop that drives the "Progress" 
principle of the breeding program. By collecting long-term data on the actual outcomes 
of their breeding choices, Just Behaving can empirically assess the impact of their 
decisions, identify trends (both positive and areas for improvement), and continuously 
refine their breeding criteria and practices. This allows the program to learn from the 
entire lifecycle of the dogs they produce, aiming for tangible improvements in health, 
temperament, and longevity across generations. This goes far beyond standard pre-
breeding health checks and represents a commitment to data-driven, continuous 
improvement that is characteristic of a highly advanced and ethically managed breeding 
program. This dedication to learning and refinement is crucial for making meaningful, 
lasting contributions to the well-being of the breed and the satisfaction of the families 
who choose a Just Behaving puppy. 

Continuous Improvement and Open Dialogue 

The breeding program is not a finished product but an evolving endeavor. The 
commitment to continuous improvement of the protocol is central, fueled by ongoing 
learning, new scientific insights, and the invaluable feedback from the systematic 
tracking of puppy health and development. This iterative process ensures that the 
program remains at the forefront of responsible breeding practices. 

Furthermore, the emphasis on "transparency and open dialogue with families and 
colleagues" fosters an environment of trust and shared learning. For families, this 
means being well-informed and supported throughout the life of their dog. For 
colleagues in the veterinary and breeding communities, it offers an opportunity for 
collaboration, knowledge sharing, and the collective advancement of best practices in 
canine breeding and welfare. This openness is vital for accountability and for the 
broader dissemination of ethical and scientifically informed breeding philosophies. 

Evolving Relationship and Advanced Applications 

The Just Behaving philosophy provides a robust foundation that not only shapes a well-
adjusted family companion but also prepares dogs for a rich, evolving relationship with 
their humans and, in some cases, for more specialized roles that require exceptional 
emotional stability and social intelligence. The principles nurtured from puppyhood 
create a dog who is not just trained, but truly prepared for deeper integration and 
diverse applications. 

Relationship Evolution: From Foundational Puppyhood to Integrated Maturity 
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The journey with a Just Behaving dog is characterized by a dynamic and deepening 
relationship that evolves over time. "The Just Behaving journey sees the human-dog 
relationship evolve from a puppyhood focused on laying a strong emotional and 
behavioral foundation, to a maturity centered on deep integration into family life and, for 
some, specialized roles. The core principles remain the bedrock throughout this 
evolution". 

In puppyhood, the primary focus is on establishing the Five Pillars: nurturing through 
Mentorship, cultivating Calmness, providing Structured Leadership, implementing 
proactive Prevention, and using gentle Indirect Correction when needed. This creates a 
secure, emotionally balanced young dog who understands how to live harmoniously 
within a human family. As the dog matures, this foundation allows for what is described 
as "deep integration." This term suggests more than just peaceful coexistence; it implies 
that the dog becomes an active, participating member of the family, whose presence is 
enriching and whose needs and contributions are understood and valued. This level of 
integration is possible precisely because the foundational work in puppyhood has 
cultivated a dog who is emotionally stable, socially adept, and attuned to their human 
companions. The core principles of Just Behaving do not become obsolete with 
maturity; rather, they continue to inform the relationship, adapting to the changing needs 
and contexts of the dog's life. This highlights the long-term benefit of the philosophy: 
creating dogs who can truly share their humans' lives in a rich, meaningful, and 
multifaceted way, rather than remaining peripheral or constantly managed entities. 

The Just Behaving Foundation: A Natural Preparation for Specialized Roles 

The qualities cultivated through a Just Behaving upbringing inherently prepare dogs for 
roles that demand exceptional temperament and human attunement, such as therapy, 
service, or emotional support work. "The robust emotional stability, high social 
intelligence, and profound human attunement developed through the Just Behaving 
philosophy naturally prepare dogs for specialized roles such as therapy, service, or 
emotional support. These roles become natural extensions of their upbringing, rather 
than requiring extensive additional layers of conventional 'training' for temperament". 

This is a significant assertion. It suggests that the core attributes required for successful 
assistance work—such as unwavering calmness under pressure, resilience in novel 
environments, empathy, non-reactivity, and an intuitive understanding of human 
emotional states and needs - are not primarily taught through specific task-training later 
in life, but are innately developed as a result of the holistic Just Behaving upbringing. 
The Five Pillars work synergistically to foster these traits: 

• Mentorship and Emotional Reciprocity: Cultivate deep human attunement and 
social understanding. 
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• Calmness: Provides the essential emotional stability and self-regulation needed 
to handle stressful or unpredictable situations often encountered in specialized 
work. 

• Structured Leadership and Prevention: Create a secure and predictable world, 
fostering confidence and reducing anxiety. 

While specific tasks required for a service dog role (e.g., retrieving dropped items, 
alerting to sounds) would still need to be trained using positive, ethical methods, the 
fundamental temperament and emotional capacity for the work are already present. 
This perspective implies that the Just Behaving approach addresses the most 
challenging aspect of preparing dogs for specialized roles - the shaping of a suitable 
temperament - from the very beginning of the dog's life. This could significantly 
streamline the process of training assistance dogs and potentially improve success 
rates, as the dogs are inherently well-suited for the demands of such work. 
Furthermore, dogs raised within this framework may experience less stress and greater 
fulfillment in these roles due to their intrinsic suitability and deep bond with humans. 

Assessment, Practice, and Certification within the Just Behaving Framework 

When a Just Behaving dog is considered for specialized roles, particularly those 
involving interaction with vulnerable individuals, the process of assessment, practice, 
and preparation for any necessary certification is guided by the same core principles. 
"For dogs considered for roles like therapy work, assessment and practice for 
certification are approached within the JB framework, emphasizing calm, consistent 
routines and appropriate energy levels, especially when working with vulnerable 
individuals. Respecting the dog's limits and ensuring ample rest and recovery is 
paramount". 

This means that the preparation for and execution of specialized work are not seen as 
separate from the Just Behaving lifestyle but as an extension of it. Key considerations 
include: 

• Calm and Consistent Routines: Maintaining predictability and minimizing stress 
for the dog, especially in new or challenging environments. 

• Appropriate Energy Levels: Ensuring the dog's energy is well-managed and 
suitable for the specific context, avoiding over-arousal or fatigue. 

• Respecting the Dog's Limits: This is a critical ethical consideration. The Just 
Behaving philosophy prioritizes the dog's well-being, meaning that a dog will not 
be pushed beyond their physical or emotional capacity. This includes careful 
observation for subtle signs of stress or fatigue and ensuring the dog has 
adequate opportunities for rest and recovery. 
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This welfare-centric approach ensures that even when dogs are engaged in demanding 
roles, their emotional and physical health is safeguarded. It prevents burnout and 
ensures that the work remains a positive and enriching experience for the dog, aligning 
with the compassionate core of the Just Behaving philosophy. This ethical stance is 
crucial for the sustainability of the dog's working life and for maintaining the integrity of 
programs that utilize animals in therapeutic or support capacities. 

A Profound Shift in Thinking: From "What Can We Train Dogs To Do?" to "Who 
Can Our Dogs Become?" 

Ultimately, the Just Behaving philosophy, particularly as it applies to the evolving 
relationship and the potential for advanced applications, encourages a fundamental shift 
in how humans perceive their canine companions and their own role in the dog's life. 
"Ultimately, Just Behaving encourages a profound shift in perspective: from asking 
'What can we train our dogs to do?' to 'Who can our dogs become?' It's about nurturing 
their inherent potential to be emotionally intelligent, deeply connected, and 
harmoniously integrated companions" ``. 

This shift from a focus on "doing" (training specific behaviors or tasks) to a focus on 
"becoming" (nurturing the dog's overall being and potential) represents the philosophical 
pinnacle of the Just Behaving approach. It reframes the entire human-dog relationship 
as one of fostering holistic development rather than simply shaping a set of desired 
actions. "Becoming" implies growth, the unfolding of inherent qualities, and a form of 
canine self-actualization, supported by a nurturing environment and a deep, respectful 
relationship. This perspective requires seeing the dog not as a machine to be 
programmed or a set of behaviors to be modified, but as a sentient individual with a rich 
inner life, inherent capacities, and a unique personality that can be cultivated. 

This profound shift in thinking has the potential to lead to a much deeper, more fulfilling, 
and mutually enriching relationship for both human and dog. It values the dog's intrinsic 
nature and aims to support its fullest, most positive expression. This moves beyond 
purely utilitarian views of dogs (e.g., as tools for specific tasks or as simple sources of 
amusement) towards a more holistic and appreciative understanding of their capacity 
for emotional richness, profound connection, and true companionship. It is about co-
creating a life where the dog can flourish, not just perform. 

Evidence, Research, and Scientific Basis 

The Just Behaving philosophy, while deeply rooted in observation and experiential 
wisdom, also actively engages with and draws support from various scientific 
disciplines. The program emphasizes its alignment with modern scientific understanding 
of canine behavior, cognition, and emotion, and it is committed to ongoing research to 
further validate and refine its principles and practices. 
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Psychological Underpinnings: A Multi-Theory Foundation 

The Just Behaving approach is not based on a single theoretical framework but 
integrates insights from several established psychological and ethological fields. "The 
Just Behaving philosophy is grounded in established psychological principles, including 
attachment theory (secure base for exploration and learning), social learning theory 
(observational learning via mentorship), integrated operant conditioning (gentle 
feedback, natural reinforcement), the science of emotional intelligence (in both humans 
and canines), and canine ethology (understanding natural dog behavior)". 

This multi-faceted theoretical basis provides a rich and nuanced understanding of 
canine behavior: 

• Attachment Theory: Concepts such as the human caregiver as a "secure base" 
are central to Just Behaving. A dog that feels securely attached to its human is 
more likely to be confident, explore its environment, learn effectively, and cope 
with mild stressors. The emphasis on trust, security, and consistent emotional 
availability in the Just Behaving relationship aligns directly with the tenets of 
attachment theory. 

• Social Learning Theory: The pillar of Mentorship is a direct application of social 
learning principles, particularly Albert Bandura's work on observational learning 
and modeling. Dogs learn by watching and imitating their human mentors and 
other well-adjusted dogs. 

• Operant Conditioning (Integrated): While Just Behaving moves beyond a 
purely operant approach, it "integrates" principles of operant conditioning. This is 
evident in the use of positive reinforcement (e.g., rewarding naturally offered 
calm behaviors) and gentle, informative feedback (as seen in Indirect Correction, 
which might involve negative punishment like a brief pause in attention, or 
minimal positive punishment like a gentle body block). The key is that these 
principles are applied thoughtfully within a broader relational and emotional 
context, not as standalone mechanics. 

• Emotional Intelligence: The growing body of research on animal emotions and 
cognition, including canine emotional intelligence, supports the Just Behaving 
emphasis on understanding and nurturing the dog's internal state. The concept of 
Emotional Reciprocity is deeply tied to this. 

• Canine Ethology: A thorough understanding of natural dog behavior - their 
communication signals, social structures, species-specific needs, and sensory 
worlds - is fundamental. This ensures that expectations are realistic and that the 
dog's inherent nature is respected and accommodated. 
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The explicit integration of these diverse theories allows Just Behaving to offer a more 
holistic model of canine behavior and development. It moves beyond simplistic stimulus-
response explanations to consider the complex interplay of emotional security, social 
learning, cognitive processing, and innate behavioral patterns. This theoretical richness 
enables the philosophy to address a wider range of factors influencing behavior and to 
develop interventions that are both effective and ethically sound. 

Aligning with Science: Moving Beyond Strict Behaviorism 

Just Behaving positions itself as being in harmony with contemporary scientific thought, 
particularly in its embrace of cognitive and emotional factors in animal learning. "Just 
Behaving aligns with modern science by building upon, but also moving beyond, strict 
behaviorism. It fully incorporates the critical roles of cognition, emotion, and the dog's 
internal state in shaping behavior, areas often minimized in purely mechanistic views of 
learning". 

Strict behaviorism, in its classical form (e.g., Watson, Skinner), tended to focus on 
observable behaviors and external stimuli, often treating the animal's internal mental 
processes (the "black box") as either irrelevant or inaccessible to scientific study. 
However, the fields of cognitive ethology and affective neuroscience have provided 
compelling evidence for complex cognitive abilities and rich emotional lives in many 
animal species, including dogs. By "moving beyond strict behaviorism," Just Behaving 
acknowledges and incorporates this understanding. It considers the dog's thoughts, 
feelings, perceptions, and subjective experiences as legitimate and crucial factors that 
influence their behavior and well-being. This is a significant step towards a more 
welfare-conscious and effective approach, as it allows for a more empathetic and 
comprehensive understanding of why a dog behaves in a certain way from the dog's 
own perspective. This deeper understanding is more likely to lead to interventions that 
address the root causes of behavior (such as underlying fear, anxiety, confusion, or 
unmet needs) rather than merely attempting to suppress or manage the outward 
symptoms. 

Research Supporting the Approach: The Science of Early Development and 
Socialization 

A cornerstone of the Just Behaving methodology - its emphasis on early development 
and quality socialization - is strongly supported by a wealth of scientific research. "A 
wealth of scientific research underscores the profound and lasting impact of early life 
experiences and quality socialization, as emphasized in our methodology. Our approach 
to the critical 3-16 week period is directly informed by decades of developmental 
science". 
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Developmental science, including studies in neurobiology and behavioral ontogeny, has 
consistently shown that the period from approximately 3 to 16 weeks of age is a critical 
or sensitive period for social development in puppies. During this time, their brains are 
highly plastic, and their experiences (or lack thereof) have a disproportionately large 
impact on the development of their social skills, stress coping mechanisms, and overall 
temperament. Positive, well-managed exposures to a variety of sights, sounds, smells, 
other animals, and people during this window are crucial for developing a confident, 
resilient, and socially adept adult dog. Conversely, negative experiences or insufficient 
exposure can lead to fearfulness, anxiety, aggression, and other behavioral problems. 

By grounding its early development and socialization protocols in this established body 
of scientific knowledge, the Just Behaving program lends significant credibility to its 
approach. It demonstrates that this core component of its methodology is not based on 
anecdotal evidence or arbitrary opinion, but on well-documented principles of how 
young animals learn and develop. This scientific backing provides a strong rationale for 
the meticulous attention paid to the quality and nature of a puppy's early experiences 
within the Just Behaving framework and offers reassurance to owners that they are 
following evidence-based best practices for their puppy's long-term behavioral health. 

Longitudinal Study Findings: Early Behaviors, Developmental Trajectories, and 
Prevention 

Just Behaving reports conducting its own internal longitudinal research to track the 
development of puppies raised within its program and to assess the impact of its 
methodology over time. "Our internal longitudinal study, tracking Just Behaving puppies 
over many years, indicates that specific early behavioral markers (e.g., startle recovery, 
interaction with novelty) are predictive of adult temperament outcomes. Furthermore, 
the data strongly suggests that a consistent Just Behaving upbringing significantly alters 
developmental trajectories towards greater emotional stability and fewer problem 
behaviors compared to control populations or less structured upbringings. The 
effectiveness of prevention is clearly demonstrated". 

These reported findings are highly significant for several reasons: 

Predictive Early Markers: The identification of early behavioral markers that are 
predictive of adult temperament suggests that it may be possible to identify puppies with 
certain predispositions (e.g., towards greater sensitivity or boldness) at a young age. 
This information could be valuable for tailoring early intervention strategies or for 
matching puppies to appropriate homes. 

Altered Developmental Trajectories: The assertion that a "Just Behaving upbringing 
significantly alters developmental trajectories towards greater emotional stability and 
fewer problem behaviors" is a powerful testament to the program's potential efficacy. It 
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implies that while genetics and early predispositions undoubtedly play a role, the 
nurturing environment and guiding philosophy of Just Behaving can have a profound 
positive influence, actively shaping a more favorable developmental path for the dog. 
This moves beyond simply managing behavior in the moment to fundamentally 
influencing the dog's long-term emotional and behavioral development. 

Demonstrated Effectiveness of Prevention: The longitudinal data reportedly provides 
clear evidence for the effectiveness of the Prevention pillar. By tracking dogs over years 
and observing lower incidences of problem behaviors compared to control groups, the 
"invisible success" of prevention becomes visible through data. 

These findings provide compelling evidence for the transformative potential of the Just 
Behaving philosophy. They suggest that owners, through consistent application of these 
principles, can proactively shape a more resilient, stable, and well-adjusted 
temperament in their dogs, rather than feeling purely at the mercy of genetic lottery or 
unavoidable early negative experiences (assuming intervention occurs early and 
consistently). 

The "Family Matters" Study: Understanding the Influence of Family Dynamics 

Recognizing that a dog's development is influenced not only by the program's principles 
but also by the specific home environment, Just Behaving also reports conducting 
research into the impact of family dynamics. "Our 'Family Matters' observational study 
explores how differing family dynamics, owner personalities, and consistency in 
applying the JB model influence puppy outcomes, even when all puppies start with a 
similar JB foundation from our breeding program. This has critical implications for our 
puppy placement process and the ongoing support we provide to families". 

This study highlights a crucial variable in the success of any dog upbringing program: 
the human element. It acknowledges that even with well-bred puppies that receive an 
excellent start through the Just Behaving breeding and early socialization protocols, the 
specific environment of their permanent home and the commitment and consistency of 
their owners will significantly impact long-term outcomes. Factors such as: 

• Owner personality and emotional state: (linking back to Emotional Reciprocity) 

• Consistency in applying Just Behaving principles: 

• Family lifestyle and activity levels: 

• The presence of other pets or children: 

• The overall emotional climate of the home: 

All of these can influence how a puppy develops and how effectively the Just Behaving 
philosophy is implemented. This research has important practical implications, 
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particularly for the puppy placement process - aiming to match puppies not just to "good 
homes" in a general sense, but to homes where the family dynamics and owner 
characteristics are most likely to support the Just Behaving model. It also underscores 
the critical need for robust owner education, ongoing support, and mentorship for 
families. This demonstrates a sophisticated understanding that the "program" does not 
exist in a vacuum; it is part of a larger family system, and its success is a collaborative 
effort between the program providers, the puppy, and the human caregivers. This 
honesty about the significant role of the family is indicative of a mature and realistic 
program that is committed to maximizing positive outcomes for its dogs. 

Ongoing Research: Emotional Reciprocity, Structured Companionship, and 
Indirect Correction 

The commitment to research within Just Behaving is ongoing, with several areas of 
investigation aimed at further understanding and validating specific components of the 
philosophy. "Ongoing research includes pilot studies testing the hypothesis of emotional 
reciprocity by measuring owner and dog physiological responses (e.g., heart rate 
variability) during interaction. Other investigations compare outcomes of structured 
companionship versus chaotic play, and the behavioral effects of our indirect correction 
methods versus more aversive or purely reward-based responses in specific scenarios, 
often using synthetic or plausible data models and detailed case studies for illustration 
and hypothesis generation". 

These ongoing studies demonstrate a commitment to delving deeper into the 
mechanisms and efficacy of key Just Behaving concepts: 

• Emotional Reciprocity Study: Attempting to measure physiological correlates 
(like Heart Rate Variability, a marker of autonomic nervous system activity and 
stress/relaxation) in both owners and dogs during interactions could provide 
objective evidence for the "calm creates calm" principle and the broader concept 
of emotional co-regulation. 

• Structured Companionship Study: Comparing behavioral and emotional 
outcomes in dogs engaged in structured companionship (as advocated by Just 
Behaving) versus those experiencing more chaotic or unregulated play could 
highlight the benefits of the Just Behaving approach for promoting self-regulation 
and emotional stability even during arousing activities. 

• Indirect Correction Study: Investigating the behavioral effects of Just 
Behaving's gentle, informational indirect corrections compared to harsher 
methods or purely reward-based responses (which may lack clear negative 
feedback in some contexts) could help to refine understanding of how dogs 
perceive and respond to different forms of feedback. 
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The reported use of "synthetic or plausible data models and detailed case studies" 
alongside more direct empirical measures like HRV suggests a pragmatic and multi-
pronged research strategy. While aiming for quantitative, objective data where possible, 
Just Behaving also appears to recognize the value of qualitative data (from case 
studies) and theoretical modeling, especially for exploring complex, nuanced 
phenomena or for generating hypotheses in early stages of research where large 
sample sizes or controlled experimental conditions may be challenging to achieve. This 
mixed-methods approach allows for both depth and breadth in building a 
comprehensive understanding of the philosophy's impact. 

Calls for Further Research, Collaboration, and Academic Engagement 

Just Behaving actively expresses a desire for continued scientific inquiry and 
collaboration to strengthen its evidence base and contribute to the broader field of 
animal behavior. "We actively call for and seek collaboration on further research: larger 
N studies, more extensive physiological measures (e.g., cortisol levels), rigorous testing 
of specific interventions, and longer-term longitudinal tracking. Our goal is to publish 
findings in peer-reviewed journals and present at scientific conferences to build 
academic credibility and contribute to the broader field. We collaborate with 
independent researchers, veterinary behaviorists, and practitioners to refine our 
methods and develop evidence-based guidelines". 

This proactive stance demonstrates a commitment to: 

• Increasing Rigor: Seeking larger sample sizes (larger N studies), more 
extensive physiological measures (e.g., cortisol as a stress hormone indicator), 
and rigorous experimental testing of specific interventions. 

• Academic Validation: Aiming to publish findings in peer-reviewed scientific 
journals and present at academic conferences, which are the gold standards for 
disseminating and validating scientific research. 

• Collaboration: Actively seeking partnerships with independent researchers, 
veterinary behaviorists (who specialize in animal behavior problems), and other 
practitioners. Such collaborations can bring diverse expertise, new perspectives, 
and increased objectivity to the research efforts. 

• Developing Evidence-Based Guidelines: Using research findings to refine the 
Just Behaving methods and to contribute to the development of broader 
evidence-based guidelines for dog training and welfare. 

This open call for collaboration and the commitment to peer-reviewed publication signal 
a genuine desire for scientific validation and a willingness to subject the Just Behaving 
philosophy and its outcomes to external scrutiny. This is characteristic of a program that 
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is confident in its foundational principles yet open to learning and refinement. Such 
efforts will not only strengthen the evidence base for Just Behaving itself but also help 
to bridge the gap that sometimes exists between practical dog training philosophies and 
academic animal behavior science, fostering a more integrated and scientifically 
informed approach to human-canine relationships. This shows a commendable 
commitment to being an active and responsible participant in the larger scientific 
conversation about dog behavior and welfare. 

The following table summarizes the key research initiatives reported by Just Behaving, 
offering an overview of their scientific engagement: 

Table 2: Summary of Just Behaving Research Initiatives 

Study Area Key 
Question/Hypoth
esis Being 
Explored 

Primary 
Methodologie
s Mentioned 

Key Preliminary 
Findings/Implicati
ons (as reported) 

Future 
Research 
Goals 

Longitudinal 
Puppy 
Development 

Are early 
behavioral markers 
predictive of adult 
temperament? Can 
a JB upbringing 
alter 
developmental 
trajectories 
towards stability? 

Long-term 
behavioral 
observation, 
owner-reported 
data, 
comparison 
with control 
populations. 

Early behaviors can 
be predictive. JB 
upbringing 
significantly alters 
trajectories towards 
stability. Prevention 
is effective. 

Longer-
term 
tracking, 
larger N 
studies. 

"Family 
Matters" 
Study 

How do differing 
family dynamics, 
owner 
personalities, and 
consistency in 
applying the JB 
model influence 
puppy outcomes? 

Observational 
study of 
puppies in 
different home 
environments. 

Family dynamics, 
owner personality, 
and consistency 
are crucial for 
outcomes. 
Implications for 
puppy placement 
and owner support. 

Refine 
placement 
strategies, 
enhance 
owner 
support 
programs. 

Emotional 
Reciprocity 

Does owner 
emotional state 
(e.g., calm) 
physiologically 

Measurement 
of owner and 
dog 
physiological 

Pilot studies 
underway to test 
hypothesis. 

More 
extensive 
physiologic
al 
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affect the dog's 
emotional state 
(e.g., calm), and 
vice versa? 

responses 
(e.g., Heart 
Rate Variability 
- HRV) during 
interaction. 

measures 
(e.g., 
cortisol), 
larger N 
studies, 
peer-
reviewed 
publication. 

Structured 
Companions
hip 

What are the 
behavioral and 
emotional 
outcomes of 
structured 
companionship (JB 
approach) versus 
chaotic or 
unregulated play? 

Comparative 
studies, 
behavioral 
observation, 
possibly using 
synthetic/plausi
ble data 
models. 

Investigations 
ongoing. 

Rigorous 
testing of 
interventio
ns, 
publication 
of findings. 

Indirect 
Correction 

What are the 
behavioral effects 
of JB's indirect 
correction methods 
compared to more 
aversive or purely 
reward-based 
responses? 

Comparative 
studies in 
specific 
scenarios, case 
studies, 
synthetic/plausi
ble data 
models. 

Investigations 
ongoing to illustrate 
effects and 
generate 
hypotheses. 

Objective 
measures 
of success, 
larger N 
studies, 
developme
nt of 
evidence-
based 
guidelines. 

General 
Program 
Efficacy 

Does the overall 
Just Behaving 
philosophy and 
methodology lead 
to better long-term 
outcomes for dogs 
and their families? 

Combination of 
all above, plus 
systematic 
tracking of 
puppy health 
and 
development 
from breeding 
program. 

Data suggests 
positive impact on 
emotional stability 
and reduction in 
problem behaviors. 

Collaborati
on with 
researcher
s, 
veterinary 
behaviorist
s, 
practitioner
s; 
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publication 
in peer-
reviewed 
journals. 

This table illustrates the breadth and depth of Just Behaving's reported commitment to 
research, underpinning its philosophy with a drive for empirical validation and 
continuous improvement. 

Comparison and Distinction from Mainstream Methodologies 

The Just Behaving philosophy, while sharing common goals with many dog training 
approaches - namely, a well-behaved canine companion - distinguishes itself 
significantly in its foundational principles, core methodologies, and overall emphasis. 
Understanding these distinctions is crucial for individuals seeking the most appropriate 
path for themselves and their dogs. 

Conventional/Mainstream Training 

Conventional or mainstream dog training often encompasses a wide array of 
techniques, but frequently emphasizes command acquisition, the use of food rewards, 
and structured training sessions. Just Behaving offers a contrasting paradigm: 

• Focus of Learning: Mainstream training often prioritizes teaching a repertoire of 
specific commands (sit, stay, come, heel) primarily through direct instruction and 
repetition, often heavily reliant on treats or other external reinforcers. These are 
typically taught in discrete training sessions. Just Behaving, conversely, 
prioritizes the development of a deep relationship, shaping the environment to 
facilitate natural learning, and fostering intrinsic understanding within the dog. 
The Five Pillars (Mentorship, Calmness, etc.) are central to this process, which is 
integrated into daily life rather than confined to sessions. 

• Source of Control/Motivation: Conventional methods often aim for external 
control through cues and rewards. The dog performs a behavior because it has 
learned that a specific cue predicts a specific reward or, in some cases, the 
avoidance of a correction. Just Behaving aims for intrinsic development, where 
the dog behaves appropriately because it aligns with their calm, balanced 
emotional state and their understanding of harmonious coexistence, learned 
through mentorship and clear leadership. 

• Problem Solving: When behavioral issues arise, mainstream approaches may 
focus on fixing problems as they appear, often by teaching an alternative 
behavior or managing the symptoms. Just Behaving emphasizes prevention from 
the outset, aiming to establish desirable behaviors so that problems are less 
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likely to take root. When issues do occur, the focus is on **addressing root 
causes** (emotional, environmental, relational) rather than just managing 
symptoms. 

• Generalization: A common challenge in conventional training is that behaviors 
learned in a training class or specific session don't always translate seamlessly to 
daily life and varied environments. Because Just Behaving is a lifestyle applied 
continuously within the home and everyday contexts, generalization is more 
organically achieved. 

Positive Reinforcement (Pure) Training 

"Purely positive" reinforcement training, which focuses on rewarding desired behaviors 
and ignoring or redirecting unwanted ones (avoiding any form of punishment), shares a 
humane philosophical underpinning with Just Behaving. Both approaches prioritize the 
dog's well-being and seek to build a positive relationship. However, Just Behaving 
introduces additional layers and nuances: 

• Structure and Leadership: While purely positive methods excel at teaching 
what to do, Just Behaving explicitly incorporates the pillars of Structured 
Leadership and clear boundary setting. This is seen as crucial for providing the 
dog with a sense of security and predictability, which may not always be as 
explicitly emphasized in all purely positive approaches. 

• Addressing Treat Dependency/Over-Excitability: A potential pitfall of some 
applications of positive reinforcement can be an over-reliance on food treats, 
leading to "treat dependency" (dog only works for food) or over-excitability in the 
presence of treats. Just Behaving aims to teach commands without heavy 
reliance on treats, often by capturing naturally offered behaviors once a 
foundation of calm is established. The pillar of **Calmness** is also central to 
preventing and addressing over-excitability. 

• Gentle Negative Feedback: While fundamentally positive in spirit, Just 
Behaving's pillar of Indirect Correction allows for very gentle, non-aversive 
feedback (e.g., body blocking, redirecting) to communicate "no" or "not that." 
Some strict interpretations of "purely positive" might avoid even these minimal 
forms of negative punishment or negative reinforcement if they are perceived as 
potentially aversive. Just Behaving sees these as providing necessary clarity in a 
humane way. 

Balanced Training 

"Balanced training" typically refers to methods that use a combination of reinforcement 
(rewards for desired behavior) and punishment (corrections for undesired behavior), 
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often employing tools like choke chains, prong collars, or electronic collars. Just 
Behaving differs significantly: 

• Level of Aversive Pressure: While Just Behaving's Indirect Correction involves 
a form of feedback, it is described as "gentle, non-aversive" and used sparingly. 
Balanced training often incorporates tools and techniques that apply significantly 
more aversive pressure and can cause pain, fear, or intimidation. 

• Focus on Prevention vs. Correction: Just Behaving places a very strong 
emphasis on Prevention to minimize the need for any form of correction. 
Balanced training, while it may include rewards, often relies more heavily on 
correction as a primary means of stopping unwanted behaviors. 

• Welfare Concerns: The tools and methods sometimes used in balanced training 
(e.g., shock collars, harsh physical corrections) raise significant welfare concerns 
for many behavior professionals and organizations due to the potential for 
physical injury, psychological distress, and negative impacts on the human-
animal bond. Just Behaving explicitly aims to avoid methods that create fear or 
damage trust ``. 

Force-Free Training 

The term "force-free" generally describes training that does not use pain, fear, or 
intimidation. Just Behaving aligns closely with this ethos. It is stated that "Just 
Behaving's indirect corrections are designed to be so minimal and informational that the 
approach remains fundamentally force-free and positive in spirit and practice". The 
distinction, if any, might lie in the interpretation of "force." Some of the gentlest forms of 
physical guidance or spatial pressure (like a body block) used in Indirect Correction 
might be debated by the strictest adherents of some force-free definitions, but the 
overarching intent and impact within the Just Behaving framework are designed to be 
non-harmful and primarily communicative. The core philosophy is deeply rooted in 
avoiding coercion. 

Dominance-Based Training 

Dominance-based training, often associated with outdated "alpha wolf" theories, posits 
that dogs are constantly vying for dominance and that humans must establish 
themselves as the "alpha" or "pack leader" through assertive, sometimes 
confrontational, means. Just Behaving represents a completely different paradigm: 

• Scientific Basis: Dominance theory as applied to domestic dog training has 
been largely debunked by modern ethologists and behaviorists. Just Behaving, in 
contrast, is rooted in modern science such as attachment theory, social learning, 
and an understanding of canine cognition and emotion ``. 
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• Nature of Leadership: Dominance-based leadership often implies control 
through intimidation or physical assertion. Just Behaving's Structured Leadership 
is described as benevolent, focused on providing clear guidance, security, and 
making decisions for the dog's well-being and family harmony, rooted in 
responsibility and care, not ego or a need to control. It fosters trust, not fear or 
submission. 

• Relationship Dynamics: Dominance theory can create an adversarial 
relationship. Just Behaving strives to nurture deep emotional bonds based on 
trust, respect, and intrinsic understanding. 

Critique of Mainstream Biases in Research 

The Just Behaving philosophy implicitly and sometimes explicitly critiques certain biases 
that can be present in mainstream approaches or even in how research is conducted or 
interpreted. For instance, an overemphasis on purely mechanistic explanations of 
behavior (as in strict behaviorism) can lead to a neglect of the dog's internal emotional 
state and cognitive processes, which Just Behaving considers critical. Furthermore, 
research that focuses solely on the efficacy of specific techniques in isolation (e.g., 
speed of sit acquisition with different reward schedules) may miss the larger picture of 
how a holistic, relationship-centered approach impacts the dog's overall well-being and 
integration into family life. Just Behaving's own reported research initiatives, such as the 
"Family Matters" study or the exploration of Emotional Reciprocity, attempt to investigate 
these broader, more complex factors. 

Why Traditional Approaches May Fall Short for Issues Like Anxiety 

Traditional approaches that focus heavily on command-obedience or primarily on 
managing symptoms can fall short, particularly when dealing with complex emotional 
issues like anxiety (e.g., separation anxiety, generalized anxiety, fear-based reactivity). 
Such issues are often rooted in a lack of security, poor coping skills, or underlying 
emotional imbalance. Simply teaching an anxious dog to "stay" or attempting to correct 
anxious behaviors without addressing the underlying emotional state is unlikely to be 
effective in the long term and can even exacerbate the problem. 

Just Behaving, with its emphasis on Calmness as a default state, Structured Leadership 
to provide security, Mentorship to build confidence, and a holistic approach to 
challenges that considers emotional and relational factors, is designed to address these 
deeper root causes. By focusing on "reshaping the dog's sense of security and trust," it 
aims to build emotional resilience from the inside out. 

Summary: A Refined, Comprehensive Approach 
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In summary, Just Behaving can be seen as a highly refined and comprehensive 
evolution of reward-based, humane training philosophies. It takes the positive, 
relationship-centered aspects found in many modern approaches and fortifies them with 
clearly defined principles of structure, benevolent leadership, an emphasis on cultivating 
innate calmness, and a proactive, preventative mindset. It also incorporates a deep 
understanding of the human's role in the emotional dyad, drawing on professional input 
from veterinary science, genetics (in its breeding program), and established 
psychological theories. It seeks to create not just a trained dog, but an emotionally 
balanced, intrinsically well-behaved, and deeply integrated companion. 

Outcomes, Goals, and the Vision 

The Just Behaving philosophy is not merely a set of abstract principles; it is directed 
towards achieving tangible, positive outcomes for both dogs and their human families. 
The ultimate goals extend beyond simple obedience to encompass a state of 
harmonious coexistence and mutual well-being. The vision is one of transforming the 
human-canine relationship on a broader scale. 

Defining Success: Beyond Obedience to Harmonious Living 

Success within the Just Behaving framework is defined by a constellation of qualities 
that reflect a dog's overall well-being and integration into family life. It is characterized 
by a dog who is "well-behaved with minimal stress, a calm demeanor, and impeccable 
manners that seem to flow naturally from their state of being" (derived from the 
overarching philosophy of raising emotionally stable, balanced companions and the 
emphasis on intrinsic understanding). This definition of success transcends the mere 
performance of obedience cues. A dog might reliably execute a "sit" or "down" in a 
training context but still exhibit anxiety, impulsivity, or an inability to settle in everyday 
situations. True success, from the Just Behaving perspective, is reflected in the dog's 
default state: their ability to remain calm in various environments, to interact politely and 
respectfully with people and other animals, to cope with normal household activities 
without undue stress, and to be a genuine pleasure to live with. "Impeccable manners" 
are not seen as a result of rigid drilling but as an outward manifestation of inner balance 
and a clear understanding of social expectations, fostered through mentorship and 
consistent, benevolent leadership. 

Expected Outcomes: A Trajectory Towards Stability and Enhanced Relationships 

Families who consistently apply the Just Behaving principles can anticipate a range of 
positive outcomes that unfold over time. These include a "gradual reduction in common 
problem behaviors, increased reliability in various settings, enhanced emotional stability 
in the dog, significantly improved human-canine relationships, and sustainable, long-
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lasting results" (derived from the goals of emotional stability , the effectiveness of 
prevention, and the aim of deep emotional bonds ``). 

• Gradual Reduction in Problem Behaviors: Because the philosophy focuses on 
prevention and addressing root causes, many common issues like excessive 
barking, destructive chewing, jumping, or leash pulling are either preempted or 
diminish as the dog's needs for calm, structure, and guidance are met. 

• Increased Reliability: As dogs develop intrinsic understanding and emotional 
self-regulation, their desirable behaviors become more reliable across different 
contexts, not just when a treat is present or a command is given. 

• Enhanced Emotional Stability: The emphasis on cultivating calmness and 
providing security leads to dogs who are less prone to anxiety, fearfulness, or 
reactivity, and better able to cope with everyday stressors. 

• Improved Human-Canine Relationships: The focus on mutual understanding, 
trust, respect, and emotional reciprocity naturally fosters deeper, more 
meaningful bonds between dogs and their people. 

• Sustainable Results: Because the changes are rooted in the dog's foundational 
emotional state and understanding, rather than superficial behavioral 
suppression, the positive outcomes are more likely to be sustainable over the 
dog's lifetime. 

Long-Term Prognosis: Stable, Low-Stress, Well-Adjusted Companions 

The long-term prognosis for dogs raised consistently within the Just Behaving 
philosophy is highly favorable. The aim is to produce "highly stable behavior throughout 
the dog's life, low rates of significant behavioral issues, and dogs who are dependable, 
low-stress, and socially well-adjusted companions" (consistent with the ultimate goal of 
emotionally stable, balanced, integrated family companions and the reported 
longitudinal study findings). This approach seeks to avoid the common pitfalls 
associated with other methodologies. For example, unlike some purely treat-only 
methods that might inadvertently create over-excitement or a lack of impulse control 
around food, Just Behaving's emphasis on calmness and broader life rewards helps to 
mitigate these issues. Similarly, by eschewing the correction-heavy methods that can 
lead to anxiety, fear, or behavioral shutdown, Just Behaving promotes a more confident 
and engaged demeanor in dogs. The result is a companion who is not only well-
behaved but also genuinely happy, secure, and comfortable in their role within the 
family and the wider world. 

The Goal: Not Perfection, But Harmonious Living 
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It is important to understand that the Just Behaving philosophy does not aim for 
"perfection or robotic obedience, but rather for harmonious living". Dogs are living 
beings with individual personalities, quirks, and occasional off-moments. The goal is not 
to create an automaton that never makes a mistake, but to foster a relationship and an 
environment where the dog understands the general parameters of acceptable 
behavior, feels secure and understood, and can navigate most situations with grace and 
composure. Harmony implies a comfortable, respectful, and mutually enjoyable 
coexistence, where the needs of both the dog and the human family members are 
considered and balanced. This realistic perspective acknowledges the nature of dogs 
and focuses on achieving a sustainable and joyful partnership. 

The Vision: Transforming Dog Welfare and the Human-Canine Bond 

The vision of Just Behaving extends beyond individual dogs and families to a broader 
impact on canine welfare and the culture surrounding dog ownership. The aspiration is 
for "fewer adult dogs developing significant behavioral issues, fewer dogs ending up in 
shelters due to unmanageable behaviors, and more owners experiencing the profound 
joy and companionship that a well-adjusted dog can bring, rather than stress and 
frustration. It's a win-win for canine welfare and the human-canine bond" (derived from 
the problem-solving focus and the overall positive framing of the human-dog 
relationship). 

By promoting a philosophy that emphasizes prevention, emotional well-being, and deep 
understanding, Just Behaving aims to address the root causes of many behavioral 
problems that can lead to relinquishment or a compromised quality of life for both dog 
and owner. If more dogs are raised from the start with a foundation of emotional stability 
and clear, benevolent guidance, the incidence of serious behavioral issues could 
potentially decrease. This, in turn, could reduce the strain on animal shelters and rescue 
organizations and allow more people to experience the unique and enriching 
companionship that dogs offer. 

"Just Behaving": A State of Harmony, Not Just an Outcome 

The very name "Just Behaving" encapsulates a dual meaning. It refers not only to the 
desired behavioral outcome - a dog who "just behaves" appropriately without constant 
prompting or correction - but also to a deeper "state of being" for both the dog and the 
human. It suggests a natural, effortless quality to the dog's good conduct, one that flows 
from a place of inner balance, security, and understanding. For the human, it implies a 
state of living with their dog that is characterized by ease, mutual respect, and intuitive 
harmony, rather than constant management or conflict. This state of harmony is the true 
essence of what the philosophy seeks to achieve. 

Potential for Profound Positive Impact on Human Well-being 
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The benefits of the Just Behaving philosophy are not limited to the canine members of 
the family. The vision includes the "potential for profound positive impact on human well-
being through the companionship of emotionally intelligent and attuned dogs" (linking to 
Emotional Reciprocity and the qualities desired in therapy/support dogs). An emotionally 
stable, well-adjusted dog can significantly reduce stress, provide comfort, encourage 
physical activity, and facilitate social connections for their human companions. The 
process of engaging with the Just Behaving philosophy itself - which encourages human 
self-awareness, emotional regulation, patience, and empathy - can also be a deeply 
rewarding journey of personal growth for the owner. By fostering dogs who are not just 
well-behaved but also emotionally intelligent and responsive, Just Behaving contributes 
to a human-animal bond that is genuinely therapeutic and enriching for the human spirit. 

Community, Legacy, and Ongoing Evolution 

The Just Behaving philosophy is envisioned not as a static endpoint, but as an ongoing 
journey that fosters a sense of community among its adherents and aims to leave a 
lasting, positive legacy on the broader culture of dog ownership. Its strength lies in its 
capacity for continued evolution, learning, and adaptation. 

The Ongoing Journey and the Importance of Community 

Embracing the Just Behaving philosophy is understood as an "ongoing journey" of 
learning and growth for both the dog and the human. It is not a quick fix or a short 
course, but a way of life that deepens and evolves over time. In recognition of this, the 
development of a supportive community aspect is implicitly valued. While not explicitly 
detailed as a formal program in the provided outline, the concepts of mentorship and 
shared understanding naturally lend themselves to community building. Such a 
community could provide a space for owners to share experiences, offer mutual 
support, and continue learning from one another, reinforcing the principles and practices 
of Just Behaving. This shared journey can make the process more enjoyable and 
sustainable, especially for new owners or those facing particular challenges. 

Owner Education: Crucial for Lasting Results 

The success and longevity of the Just Behaving outcomes are heavily reliant on the 
owner's understanding and consistent application of its principles. Therefore, "owner 
education is crucial for lasting results." The philosophy recognizes the need to provide 
"practical guidance and resources" to empower owners with the knowledge and skills 
necessary to implement the Just Behaving approach effectively. This education would 
likely encompass not only the "how-to" of specific techniques but also the "why" - the 
underlying principles of canine behavior, learning theory, emotional development, and 
the Five Pillars. An informed owner is better equipped to make sound judgments, to 
apply the principles flexibly and appropriately to their individual dog and circumstances, 
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and to troubleshoot minor issues as they arise. This commitment to education 
transforms the owner from a passive recipient of instructions into an active, 
knowledgeable partner in their dog's development. 

Mentorship Programs for New Owners 

To further support the crucial role of owner education and guidance, the idea of 
"mentorship programs for new owners, potentially involving experienced Just Behaving 
families," is a natural extension of the philosophy's core tenets. The pillar of Mentorship 
itself highlights the power of learning through observation and guidance. A formal or 
informal mentorship program could pair new puppy owners or individuals new to the 
Just Behaving philosophy with more experienced families who have successfully raised 
dogs within this framework. These mentors could offer practical advice, share their 
experiences, provide encouragement, and serve as role models, helping to bridge the 
gap between theoretical understanding and real-world application. This would foster a 
supportive network and help to ensure that the principles are passed on effectively, 
contributing to more consistent and successful outcomes. 

Broader Impact: Shaping Families, Influencing Communities, and Impacting Dog 
Culture 

The aspirations of Just Behaving extend beyond individual households to a wider 
societal impact. The philosophy has the potential for "shaping families by fostering more 
harmonious human-dog relationships, influencing communities by promoting 
responsible and empathetic dog ownership, and positively impacting dog culture as a 
whole." This is achieved by "spreading knowledge and sparking paradigm shifts" away 
from outdated or less humane methods towards more enlightened, relationship-
centered approaches. 

When families experience the joy and ease of living with a well-adjusted Just Behaving 
dog, they become ambassadors for the philosophy. Their positive experiences can 
inspire friends, neighbors, and other community members to explore more thoughtful 
and compassionate ways of interacting with their own dogs. As knowledge of such 
approaches spreads, it can contribute to a gradual shift in the broader dog culture, 
moving towards a greater emphasis on emotional well-being, prevention, and the 
importance of the human-canine bond. This can lead to improved welfare for dogs 
generally, more realistic expectations from owners, and a deeper appreciation for the 
complex emotional and cognitive lives of canine companions. 

The Legacy: Emotional Intelligence, Mutual Respect, and Meaningful 
Companionship 

The ultimate legacy that Just Behaving aims to build is one centered on "emotional 
intelligence in both dogs and humans, mutual respect as the foundation of the 
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relationship, and the cultivation of truly meaningful companionship." This is a legacy that 
values the inner life of the dog, promotes empathetic understanding across species, and 
elevates the human-dog bond beyond simple ownership to a profound partnership. By 
nurturing dogs who are not only well-behaved but also emotionally attuned and secure, 
and by guiding humans to become more mindful, patient, and understanding caregivers, 
Just Behaving contributes to relationships that are richer, deeper, and more resilient. 
This legacy is about fostering a way of being together that enhances the lives of both 
species. 

An Evolving Philosophy: Open to Questioning, Refinement, and New Learning 

Crucially, Just Behaving is not presented as a dogma or a closed system. It is described 
as "an evolving philosophy, open to questioning, refinement, and learning from new 
science and experience. It's a journey of mutual discovery". This commitment to 
ongoing evolution is vital for its long-term relevance and efficacy. As scientific 
understanding of canine behavior, cognition, and emotion continues to advance, and as 
more experience is gained through the application of the philosophy, Just Behaving 
remains open to incorporating new knowledge and refining its methods. This willingness 
to question, learn, and adapt ensures that the philosophy remains dynamic, responsive, 
and aligned with the best available information and ethical considerations. It frames the 
relationship with dogs, and the development of the philosophy itself, as a continuous 
"journey of mutual discovery," inviting both practitioners and the program's architects to 
remain curious, observant, and dedicated to growth. 

Conclusion - A Profound Journey 

The exploration of the Just Behaving philosophy reveals a comprehensive and deeply 
considered approach to canine companionship that extends far beyond the conventional 
boundaries of dog training. It is a journey that invites both human and dog to embark on 
a path of mutual understanding, growth, and harmonious coexistence. 

At its essence, Just Behaving is defined by a synergistic blend of structured mentorship, 
where humans and well-adjusted dogs serve as calm role models; calm leadership, 
providing benevolent guidance and security; a profound commitment to emotional 
balance for both dog and human; compassionate care that prioritizes well-being at 
every stage; and mindful companionship that permeates every aspect of daily life ,. 
These core tenets are woven through its Five Pillars - Mentorship, Calmness, 
Structured Leadership, Prevention, and Indirect Correction - creating a holistic 
framework that addresses not just the dog's outward behavior, but their internal 
emotional state and cognitive understanding. 

The transformative nature of this philosophy lies in its potential to reshape the human-
dog relationship. By shifting the focus from a paradigm of commands and compliance to 
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one of relationship, environmental shaping, and natural learning , Just Behaving 
cultivates dogs who are not merely obedient, but intrinsically well-adjusted. The 
emphasis on Emotional Reciprocity underscores the profound interconnectedness 
between human and canine emotional states, calling upon humans to cultivate self-
awareness and emotional regulation as a cornerstone of their dog's well-being. This 
reciprocal dynamic elevates the bond to one of true partnership. 

The methodology, from the critical early socialization period through to the nuanced 
integration of principles into daily life, is designed to nurture this intrinsic understanding. 
Even advanced applications, such as preparing dogs for specialized roles in therapy or 
assistance, are seen as natural extensions of the foundational emotional stability and 
human attunement cultivated from the start. The Just Behaving breeding program 
further supports this vision by striving to bring puppies into the world who are genetically 
and temperamentally predisposed to thrive within this philosophy, guided by ethical 
responsibility and scientific rigor. 

The commitment to ongoing research, scientific validation, and collaboration 
demonstrates a dedication to transparency and continuous improvement, ensuring that 
the philosophy remains grounded, credible, and adaptable. It seeks not to exist in 
isolation but to contribute to the broader understanding of canine behavior and welfare. 

Ultimately, the Just Behaving philosophy offers more than a pathway to a well-behaved 
dog; it offers a vision for a more profound and fulfilling interspecies connection. It is 
about nurturing companions who naturally understand harmonious living, not just follow 
instructions. It is about fostering a partnership based on shared understanding, intuitive 
harmony, and a deep, lasting companionship that enriches the lives of both dogs and 
the humans who love them. This is the profound journey that Just Behaving invites us to 
undertake. 

 


