
SUMMER CAMP

JUNE 30th-AUGUST 1st
Grades: K-8th

$50/week sibling discounts

Monday-Friday 8AM-3PM 
Early Drop Off 7AM

***
Aftercare 3pm-5pm

(Aftercare is $25/wk per family)

1 hour of
daily skills
tutoring

Camp includes one hour
of instructed learning in
grade-level math or ELA.

Summer Fun 
Camp AST4Y enrollment
comes with admission to
museums and trampoline
parks, plus arts and crafts
and physical activities.

Library Visits

Camp AST4Y visits the main
branch of the public library
once weekly and lets
students check out new
books to read.

Students learn that reading
can be a fun leisurely
activity.

Team
Activities

On our bowling trip, campers
get the chance to work in
teams and make new friends
while having a good time.

Connect to
Nature

Campers will experience
nature up close and
personal. 

We tour the Bluebonnet
Swamp to visit live animals
and extinct species at
LSU’s Natural History
Museum.

Apply at:
www.afterschooltutoring4you.com/camp


