
THE END of one path forms the beginning of 
another. This is not just our philosophy but 
our story. Trail’s End is a true-born Kentucky 
Bourbon aged in charred new American Oak 
barrels. It then travels west to Oregon 
where it’s finished with Oregon Garryana
Oak and glacier-fed spring water. What 
emerges is an instant classic.



TRAIL’S END 10-YEAR KENTUCKY 
STRAIGHT BOURBON WHISKEY

FINISHED IN OREGON OAK CASKS

A select few barrels of 10-year Kentucky 
Bourbon follow the spiritual path of the 
Oregon Trail. Here we finish our bourbon in 
toasted Oregon Garry Oak casks to heighten 
the notes of vanilla and spice. Glacier-fed 
spring water from Mt. Hood completes the 
vision of our master distiller: A rare bourbon 
with hallmarks of age and heritage that 
flourishes with a provenance of its own. 

TASTE: Initial introduction of caramel, 
vanilla, cherry, and roasted corn with a 
foundation of warm, earthy notes of 
summer pine and high desert moss. Bitter 
orange and delicate hints of lilac are hidden 
beneath the vanilla and oak.

AROMAS: Considerably less opening bite 
with the introduction of Garryana Oak. 
Focused aromas of vanilla, caramel, and 
cherry, with warm summer pine at the end.

52.5% alc/vol  – 105 Proof

AWARDS & ACCOLADES
•Gold - SIP Awards (2022)

•Gold - San Francisco World Spirits 
Competition (2022)


