
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

7/8”x8”x72” Grader Blade; Surface Hardened; STD Hwy Pattern 

Punched, 5/8" Bolt
100 $176.75 $17,675.00 $178.00 $17,800.00

7/8”x8”x84” Grader Blade; Surface Hardened; STD Hwy Pattern 

Punched, 5/8" Bolt
100 $206.01 $20,601.00 $205.00 $20,500.00

5” Moldboard Shoes; 12” Hole Punched for Use on Front Plows and 

Wings; Approx 65° Angle from the Ground for Use with Carbide 

Cutting Edge, 5/8 Bolt

150 $173.35 $26,002.50 $124.30 $18,645.00

12" Mushroom Plow Shoes with 3 holes; 5/8" Bolt 50 $182.54 $9,127.00

FRIEGHT CHARGE

TOTAL BID PRICE

DELIVERY

*WINTER EQUIPMENT QUOTING 1" THICK FOR SUB FOR 7/8" GRADER BLADE (same as prior years)

6 WEEKS

$64,278.50
3-4 WEEKS (BLADES)                        

8 WEEKS (SHOES)

$66,072.00

NO BID

GOGEBIC COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2025 GRADER, UNDERBODY, & SIDEPLOW BLADES (CUTTING EDGES)

BID OPENING: 06/04/2025 10:00 A.M CST

WINTER EQUIPMENT 

COMPANY, INCITEM DESCRIPTION

BID QNTY

H&L MESABI

NO BID

ST REGIS 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID


