GOGEBIC COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2020 GRADER, UNDERBODY, & SIDEPLOW BLADES (CUTTING EDGES)

BID OPENING: 3/6/2020 10:00 A.M CST

WINTER EQUIPMENT HEIGHTS TRUCK ROLAND MACHINERY
ITEM DESCRIPTION COMPANY, INC EQUIPMENT SCHULTS EQUIPMENT COMPANY H&L MESABI CHEMUNG SUPPLY ST REGIS CULVERT,INC

BID QNTY | uNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE  TOTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
gf;:;ﬁ“g”‘,?é;frader Blade; Surface Hardened; STD Hwy Pattern 400 $118.47 $47,388.00]  QUOTED ALTERNATIVE $126.65 $50,660.00| $138.50 $55,400.00]  $131.00 $52,400.00]  $99.00 $39,600.00] QUOTED ALTERNATIVE
g’:}nzzé ! X;;?‘B‘Ofrader Blade; Surface Hardened; STD Hwy Pattern 50 $138.21 $6,910.50| QUOTED ALTERNATIVE $147.42  $7,371.00| $161.58 $8,079.00| $153.00 $7,650.00] $116.50 $5,825.00] QUOTED ALTERNATIVE
7/8"x5"x36" Top Beveled Wing Blade; Heavy Duty Carbide Inserted
and Armored Steel Layer Welded on Surface; STD Hwy Pattern 90 $195.73 $17,615.70] $185.43 $16,688.70] $265.00 $23,850.00| $402.73 $36,245.70| $313.00 $28,170.00] $223.85 $20,146.50] $269.52 $24,256.80
Punched
7/8"x5"x48” Top Beveled Wing Blade; Heavy Duty Carbide Inserted
and Armored Steel Layer Welded on Surface; STD Hwy Pattern 90 $260.98 $23,488.20] $247.24 $22,251.60] $350.00 $31,500.00] $509.79 $45,881.10] $418.00 $37,620.00] $298.45 $26,860.50] $359.36 $32,342.40
Punched
5" Moldboard Shoes; 12" Hole Punched for Use on Front Plows and
Wings; Approx 65° Angle from the Ground for Use with Carbide 10 $125.48 $1,254.80 $72.75 $727.50 NO BID $62.16 $621.60 $75.00 $750.00 NO BID NO BID
Cutting Edge
8” Moldboard Shoes; 12" Hole Punched for Use on Wings; Approx NO BID NO BID NO BID
80° Attach Angle from the Ground for Use with Carbide Cutting Edge 10 $142.55 $1,425.50] $136.50 $1,365.00 $88.61 $886.10] $110.00 $1,100.00
14” Plow Shoes, (see attached drawing) 80 $194.86 $15,588.80] $195.00 $15,600.00 NO BID $91.06 $7,284.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID

FRIEGHT CHARGE
TotaLBiD PRICE|  $113,671.50 $56,632.80 $113,381.00 $154,398.30 $127,690.00 $92,432.00 $56,599.20
DELIVERY 3-4 WEEKS 3-5 WEEKS 4 WEEKS 6 WEEKS 5-6 WEEKS 3-5 WEEKS 10-12 WEEKS




