
Total Bid

12" Round 15" Round 18" Arch Price

U.P. Concrete Pipe $9.85 $11.80 $14.85 $26,499.75

St. Regis Culvert, Inc. $15.60 $19.95 $26.40 $44,779.85

ASDCO $10.00 $12.50 $18.60 $29,867.25

ETNA Supply $11.62 $14.53 $18.83 $32,683.95

Cadillac Culvert $8.05 $9.78 $12.15 $21,577.00

P.K. Forest Farms

Contech

Paynter Equipment & 

Culvert

Miller Products & 

Supply

GOGEBIC COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2020 ALUMINIZED T2 STEEL CULVERT PIPE

BID OPENING 3/6/2020 10:00 a.m. CST

At the Board's regular meeting, held on Monday, March 9, 2020, the Culvert bid was awarded to 

Cadillac Culvert.

NO BID (NO RESPONSE)

NO BID (NO RESPONSE)

NO BID (NO RESPONSE)

NO BID (NO RESPONSE)

BIDDER
Size


