GOGEBIC COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2026 WEST END: LOCAL PULVERIZING & HMA PAVING SERVICES
BID OPENING 03/18/2026 10:00 AM CST

VANDERHAGEN ROAD SNOW STRASSE LANE OLSON ROAD BEAGLE CLUB ROAD PRESQUE ISLE STREET
PITLIK & WICK INC PITLIK & WICK INC PITLIK & WICK INC PITLIK & WICK INC PITLIK & WICK INC
APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID
ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT QTY  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $0.00 MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $0.00 JMOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $0.00 |MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $0.00 JMOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $5.000.00 $5.000.00|
HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 15510 Svd $0.00 JMACHINE GRADING. MODIFIED 16 STA $0.00 JHMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 12.540 Svd $0.00 |HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 15.490 Svd $0.00 JHMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 3.520 Svd $2.50 $8.800.00|
[APPROACH. CL II. 3 INCH 180 Svd $0.00 JAPPROACH. CL II. 3 INCH 240 Svd $0.00 [MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $0.00 |MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $0.00 JAGGREGATE BASE 260 Ton $33.10 $8.606.00|
SHOULDER. CL II. 3 INCH 2.390 Svd $0.00 | SHOULDER. CL II. 3 INCH 330 Svd $0.00 [APPROACH. CL II. 3 INCH 460 Svd $6.60 $3.036.00|
HMA SURFACE. REM 210 Svd $0.00 JHMA. APPROACH 60 Ton $0.00 SHOULDER. CL II. 3 INCH 590 Svd $9.75 $5.752.50|
HMA. APPROACH 40 Ton $0.00|HMA. 4EL 400 Ton $0.00 HMA SURFACE. REM 30 Svd $21.00 $630.00)
HMA. 4EL 2170 Ton $0.00 [MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $0.00 HMA. APPROACH 10 Ton $170.00 $1.700.00|
TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $0.00 HMA. 4EL 490 Ton $106.50 $52.185.00)
Curb Slo. HMA 340 Foot $1.50 $510.00,
Manhole Adiust. Modified 3 Each $1.200.00 $3.600.00|
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Water Valve Adiust. Modified 1 Each $750.00 $750.00)
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $3.250.00 $3.250.00|
TOTAL BID $0.00 TOTAL BID $0.00 TOTAL BID $0.00 TOTAL BID $0.00 TOTAL BID $93,819.50
NORTHWOODS PAVING NORTHWOODS PAVING NORTHWOODS PAVING NORTHWOODS PAVING NORTHWOODS PAVING
APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID
ary. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT QTY _ UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT aty. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum  $2.600.00 $2,600.00 [ MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $326.00 $326.00 | MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $325.00 $325.00 | MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $325.00 $325.00 [MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $325.00 $325.00|
HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 15,510 Svd $1.10 $17.061.00 [IMACHINE GRADING, MODIFIED 16 STA $92.77 $1,484.32 | HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 12,540 Svd $0.69 $8.652.60 |[HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 15.490 Svd $0.68 $10.533.20 |HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 3520 Svd $0.9¢ $3.449.60|
[APPROACH. CL II, 3 INCH 180 Svd $2.94 $529.20 JAPPROACH, CL II. 3 INCH 240 Svd $7.57 $1,816.80 | MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $168.72 $168.72 | MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $112.48 $112.48 |AGGREGATE BASE 260 Ton $22.00 $5.720.00|
SHOULDER, CL II. 3 INCH 2.390 Svd $2.94 $7.026.60 | SHOULDER, CL II. 3 INCH 330 Svd $7.57 $2,498.10 [APPROACH. CL II. 3 INCH 460 Svd 8425 $1.955.00|
HMA SURFACE. REM 210 Svd $2.10 $441.00 |HMA. APPROACH 60 Ton $117.39 $7.043.40 SHOULDER, CL II. 3 INCH 590 Svd 8425 $2.507.50|
HMA. APPROACH 40 Ton $110.00 $4,400.00 [HMA, 4EL 400 Ton $90.66 $36,264.00 HMA SURFACE. REM 30 Svd $3.09 $92.70|
IMA, 4EL 2170 Ton $85.88 $186.359.60 | MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $168.72 $168.72. HMA, APPROACH 10 Ton $129.49 $1.294.90|
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $168.72 2 HMA. 4EL 490 Ton $96.54 $47.304.60
Curb Slp, HMA' 340 Foot $340.00|
Manhole Adiust. Modified 3 Each $618.63 $1.855.89|
Water Valve Adiust. Modified 1 Each $140.60 $140.60|
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $112.48 $112.48|
TOTAL BID $218,586.12 TOTAL BID $49,600.34 TOTAL BID $9,146.32 TOTAL BID $10,970.68 TOTAL BID $65,098.27
PAYNE & DOLAN PAYNE & DOLAN PAYNE & DOLAN PAYNE & DOLAN PAYNE & DOLAN
APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID AAPPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID
ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT QTY  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum  $25.000.00 $25.000.00 [MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum  $13.000.00 $13.000.00| MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $6.000.00 $6.000.00 [ MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $5.500.00 $5.500.00 [MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $11.500.00 $11.500.00
HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 15510 vd $1.85 $28 693 50 [MACHINE GRADING. MODIFIED 16 STA $390.00 $6.240.00 | HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 12,540 Svd $2.15 $26.961.00 |[HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 15.490 Svd $1.95 $30.205.50 |HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 3520 Svd $2.40 $8.448.00|
[APPROACH. CL 11 3 INCH 180 Svd 87.15 $1.287.00|APPROACH. CL II. 3 INCH 240 Svd §7.15 $1.716.00 | MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $1.900.00 $1.900.00 [MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $1.900.00 $1.900.00 [AGGREGATE BASF 260 Ton $39.00 $10.140.00|
SHOULDER. CL II. 3 INCH 2390 Svd $6.00 $14.340.00 |SHOULDER. CL II. 3 INCH 230 Svd $11.00 $3.630.00] [APPROACH. CL 11 3 INCH 460 Svd 87.30 $3.358.00|
HMA SURFACE. REM 210 Svd $6.50 $1.365.00 |[HMA. APPROACH 60 Ton $175.00 $10.500.00 SHOULDER. CL Il 3 INCH 590 Svd 87.65 $4.513.50|
HMA. APPROACH 40 Ton $175.00 $7.000.00 [HMA. 4FI 400 Ton $118.00 847.200.00 HMA SURFACE. REM 30 Svd $16.65 $499.50|
1A 4FL 2170 Ton $113.00 $245.210.00 |MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum  $1.900.00 $1.900.00| HMA. APPROACH 10 Ton $175.00 $1.750.00|
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum  $1.900.00 0 HMA. 4Fl 490 Ton $113.00 $55.370.00|
Curb Sin. HMA 240 Foot 81.00 $340.00|
Manhole Adiust. Modified 3 Fach $850.00 $2.550.00|
Water Valve Adiust. Modified 1 Fach $600.00 $600.00|
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $1.900.00 $1.900.00|
TOTAL BID $324,795.50 TOTAL BID $84,186.00 TOTAL BID $34,861.00 TOTAL BID $37,605.50 TOTAL BID $100,969.00
ANGELO LUPPINO ANGELO LUPPINO ANGELO LUPPINO ANGELO LUPPINO ANGELO LUPPINO
APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID
ary. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT QTY _ UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT aty. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $400.00 $400.00 [ MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $400.00 $400.00 | MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $400.00 $400.00 | MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $400.00 $400.00 [MOBILIZATION 1 Tsum 00.
HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 15,510 Svd $1.43 $22,179.30 [IMACHINE GRADING. MODIFIED 16 STA $100.00 $1,600.00 | HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 12,540 Svd $1.46 $18.308.40 | HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 15.490 Svd $1.43 $22.150.70 JHMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 3520 Syd $1.81 $6,371.20
[APPROACH. CL II. 3 INCH 180 Svd $4.50 $810.00 JAPPROACH. CL II. 3 INCH 240 Svd $4.50 $1,080.00 | MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $400.00 $400.00 | MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $400.00 $400.00 | AGGREGATE BASE 260 Ton $25.25 $6,565.00
SHOULDER, CL II, 3 INCH 2,390 Svd $3.20 $7,648.00 SHOULDER, CL II, 3 INCH 330 Syd $3.20 $1,056.00 [APPROACH, CL II, 3 INCH 480 Syd $5.50 $2,530.00
HMA SURFACE, REM 210 Syd $16.00 $3,360.00 |[HMA, APPROACH 60 Ton $144.00 $8,640.00 SHOULDER, CL II, 3 INCH 590 Sya o $2,950.001
HMA, APPROACH 40 Ton $144.00 $5,760.00 |[HMA, 4EL 400 Ton $75.01 $30,004.00 HMA SURFACE, REM 30 Sya o $150.00
\ 2,170 Ton $75.01 $162,771.70 [MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $400.00 $400.00 HMA, APPROACH 10 fon $150.00 $1,500.001
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $800.00 $800.00| HMA, 4EL 490 fon s $44,700.00
Curb Sip, HMA 340 +oot S0 3135000
Manhole Adjust, Modified 3 tacn 20w S6U0.LY
Water Valve Adjust, Modified 1 tacn 350 350.00]
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum SbUL.LU S6UL.LY
TOTAL BID $203,729.00 TOTAL BID $43,180.00 TOTAL BID $19,108.40 TOTAL BID $22,950.70 TOTAL BID $67,276.20
STUBBEN STREET MARENESCO CEMETERYS GRANDVIEW LANE
PITLIK & WICK INC PITLIK & WICK INC PITLIK & WICK INC
APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID
ary. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT QTY  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum  $5.000.00 $5,000.00 | MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum  $5,000.00 $5.000.00 | MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $0.00]
SHOULDER. CL II. 3 INCH 530 Svd $6.75 $3,677.50 [SHOULDER. CL II. 3 INCH 1140 Svd $4.50 $5,130.00 [HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 3.140 Svd $0.00]
HMA. 4EL 490 Ton $112.00 $54,880.00 JHMA, 4EL. 350 Ton $122.00 $42.700.00 JAPPROACH. CL II. 3 INCH 90 Svd $0.00]
Manhole Adiust. Modified 3 Each $1.500.00 $4.500.00 [MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum  $2.475.00 $2,475.00 [ SHOULDER. CL II. 3 INCH 490 Svd $0.00]
|Water Valve Adiust. Modified 1 Each $750.00 $750.00| HMA SURFACE. REM 310 Svd $0.00]
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum  $2.950.00 $2.950.00| HMA. APPROACH 50 Ton $0.00]
IMA. 4EL 440 Ton $0.00]
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $0.00]
NO BID
TOTAL BID $71,657.50] TOTAL BID $55.305.00 TOTAL BID $0.00
NORTHWOODS PAVING NORTHWOODS PAVING NORTHWOODS PAVING
APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID
ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT QrY __ UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT. PRICE AMOUNT
MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $325.00 $325.00 | MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $325.00 $325.00 [MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $325.00 $325.00
SHOULDER. CL II. 3 INCH 530 Svd $5.02 $2.660.60 | SHOULDER. CL II. 3 INCH 1140 Svd $2.98 $3.397.20 [HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 3140 Svd $0.98 $3.077.20|
HMA. 4EL 490 Ton $93.91 $46.015.90 [HMA, 4EL. 350 Ton $99.37 $34.779.50 |JAPPROACH. CL I1. 3 INCH 90 Svd $6.25 $562.50
Manhole Adiust. Modified 3 Each $618.63 $1.855.89 | MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $112.48 $112.48 | SHOULDER. CL II. 3 INCH 490 Svd $6.25 $3.062.50|
Water Valve Adiust. Modified 1 Each $140.60 $140.60 HMA SURFACE. REM 310 Svd $1.86 $576.60|
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $112.48 $112.48) HMA. APPROACH 50 Ton $132.17 $6.608.50|
IMA. 4EL 440 Ton $93.16. $40.990.40
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $112.48 $112.48|
TOTAL BID $51,110.47 TOTAL BID $38.,614.18 TOTAL BID $55.315.18
PAYNE & DOLAN PAYNE & DOLAN PAYNE & DOLAN
APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID
ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT QrY __ UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT. PRICE AMOUNT
MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum  $12,500.00 $12,500.00  MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum  $8,500.00 $8,500.00 | MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum $14,500.00 $14,500.00
SHOULDER, CL II, 3 INCH 530 syd $7.65 $4,054.50 [ SHOULDER, CL I, 3 INCH 1140 Syd $7.65 $8,721.00|HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 3140 Syd $2.45 $7,693.00|
HMA, 4EL 490 Ton $113.00 $55,370.00 [HMA, 4EL. 350 Ton $113.00 $39,550.00 JAPPROACH, CL II, 3 INCH %0 Syd $11.90 $1,071.00|
Manhole Adjust, Modified 3 Each $850.00 $2,550.00 | MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum  $1,900.00 $1,900.00 ]SHOULDER, CL II, 3 INCH 490 Syd $7.65 $3,748.50|
Water Valve Adjust, Modified 1 Each $600.00 $600.00 $0.00 JHMA SURFACE, REM 310 Syd $6.50 $2,015.00|
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum  $1,900.00 $1,900.00 $0.00 HMA, APPROACH 50 Ton $175.00 $8,750.00|
HMA, 4EL 440 Ton $117.00 $51,480.00
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $1,900.00 $1,900.00|
TOTAL BID $76,974.50 TOTAL BID $58,671.00 TOTAL BID $91,157.50




At the Board's reqular meeting on Tuesdav. March 24, 2026 they awarded the 2026 West End Pulverzing & HMA Paving Services to Anaelo Luppino.

ANGELO LUPPINO ANGELO LUPPINO ANGELO LUPPINO
APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID APPROX UNIT BID
ary. UNIT PRICE AMOUNT QTY _ UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ary UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum  $400.00 $400.00 [ MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum  $40000 $400.00| MOBILIZATION 1 Lsum 540000 $400.00)
SHOULDER, CL II, 3 INCH 530 Syd 8378 $2,003.40 | SHOULDER, CL II, 3 INCH 1140 Syd $3.78 $4,309.20 |[HMA BASE CRUSHING AND SHAPING 3140 Syd $1.81 $5,683.40/
HMA, 4EL 490 Ton $6261 $40,478.90  HMA, 4EL 350 T $8261  $28,91350|APPROACH, CLII, 3INCH 0 Syd $450 $405.00
Manhole Adjust, Modified 3 Each $200.00 $600.00 | MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $400.00 $400.00 | SHOULDER, CL II, 3 INCH 490 Syd $3.20 $1,568.00|
Water Valve Adjust, Modified 1 Each  $50.00 $50.00) $0.00 {HMA SURFACE, REM 310 Syd $5.00 $1,550.00
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $400.00 $400.00 $0.00 JHMA, APPROACH 50 Ton $144.00 $7,200.00|
) 440 Ton $7501  $33,00440
MAINTAINING TRAFFIC 1 Lsum $400.00 $400.00
TOTAL BID $43,932.30 TOTAL BID $34,022.70 TOTAL BID $50.210.80
PITLIK & WICK $220,782.00 |NOT ALL ITEMS BID
NORTHWOODS PAVING $498,441.56
PAYNE & DOLAN $809,220.00
ANGELO LUPPINO




