
John, me, me 4 Please add Julie and I to the FRE email list. - Excellent, thank you John! Sent from my iPhone On May 25, 2021, at 2:21 PM, John Burns <fallriverjwb@gmail.com> wrote:   5/25/21

me FRE HOA Financial Statement 
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4/8/21

John, me, k 4 Excel spreadsheet with emails - Thanks! Sent from Mail for Windows 10 From: Mike Sent: Saturday, March 27, 2021 10:23 PM To: k Korzun Subject: Fwd: Excel spreadsheet with emails Kay - This is…

2020 FRE Dues …

3/28/21

John, me 2 My resignation letter - John - I have received your resignation letter and feedback. I will be home tomorrow and available virtually any time to receive the FRE HOA Treasurer records t

HOA Resignatio…

3/20/21

John, k 2 Budget - John – Thanks so much for sending this out. I had just two comments: - There is a question in your notes about needing insurance. As I read ORS 94.675, it sound

Budget work sh…

3/15/21

John, me, me 3 Preliminary Budget Worksheet - ---------- Forwarded message --------- From: John Burns <fallriverjwb@gmail.com> Date: Sun, Mar 7, 2021 at 8:37 PM Subject: Preliminary Budget Worksheet T…

Budget work sh… SRD needs wor… Budget work sh…

3/15/21

alicewilly14a 2016 2017 HOA financial report - Mike, Attached is the last HOA financial report I have seen.

FALL RIVER EST…

2/24/21

FIRSTSUPPORT You have been sent a secure message - First Interstate Bank sent you a secure message The first time you access it you’ll be asked to enter your email address and create a password. You can …   1/26/21

me, Pala, me 8 FRE HOA Year End Financials - I don't see the missing months off hand... Sorry On Tue, Jan 26, 2021 at 1:27 PM Mike <armstromike@gmail.com> wrote: Maybe - however I don't have time to dig f…

053119_063020… 4th Qtr Financi… 2020 Form 1120…

1/26/21

me, John 4 Treasurer Documentation - John. Your comment of having an issue of being yelled at in an email seems silly to me. I was not yelling, so - as you suggest - please do not assume. I was sim   1/23/21

John, me 2 1st Interstate access - I noticed that I missed your call. Thanks for the heads up John. Mike Armstrong Fall River Estates HOA President 15148 Fall River Drive East Bend, OR 97707 arms   1/14/21

fowldsfam, me 2 re: Financial Auditor - Thank you Lori! Mike Armstrong Fall River Estates HOA President 15148 River Loop Drive East 541-480-7892 Armstromike@gmail.com   11/30/20

John Burns Reimbursement form - Here you go.

FRE reimburse…

11/20/20

John, me 3 2nd Qtr Financial Statement - FYI - NEAL ---------- Forwarded message --------- From: John Burns <fallriverjwb@gmail.com> Date: Fri, Jul 10, 2020 at 11:33 AM Subject: 2nd Qtr Financial State… 7/12/20

From Any time Has attachment To Advanced search

1–31 of 31

label:fre-hoa-fre-hoa-financial-statements IMG_4681.jpg Open withOpen with

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/#inbox
https://www.google.com/intl/en/about/products?tab=mh
https://accounts.google.com/SignOutOptions?hl=en&continue=https://mail.google.com&service=mail

