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My Current
 Read

Mama Bear Tip: 

My kids (current) 
favorite book

 The Three Bears, Blondie, and Their Spaghetti

Ideas for Dad

Choose Bright 
Colored Swimsuits

Magnetic
 Belt

Dry Erase 
Desk organizer

Thin 
Wallet

Stacey performed on screen and
on stage before becoming a

schoolteacher, children’s author,
and globetrotter. Now based in the

UK as a Creative Consultant
focusing on editing and design,
Stacey enjoys collaborating with
authors worldwide to create life-
affirming and inclusive content.

Committed to excellence with the
belief that small changes are

significant, Stacey goes the extra
mile to transform projects into

success stories. Please check out
some of her collaborations below

and email
FSpublications@outlook.com to
arrange a free consultation and

quote.

Stacey Gittens: 
Creative Consultant

faithfulstories.com

https://faithfulstories.com/
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Greetings! I'm Izzy B. I love telling
stories. I love drawing. I love to

laugh, so being an author seemed
like a no-brainer. I started writing
and illustrating books in the first

grade. My first story was called My
Pet Dog and it won the First Grade

Young Author award. I won the
same award every year of school

until I was no longer a Young
Author! I fell in love with books and

creating them. On my journey to
become an author I decided to try
my hand at teaching. It's one of the
few jobs that allows you to scatter
books on the floor and roll in them.

School is also a great place to
cultivate wonderful new story

ideas, and I love the excitement of
seeing students learn something
new. Now I'm no longer teaching,
and I'm making books full time! I'm

also the dad of two awesome
kiddos, Gideon and Maxx. I have an
amazing wife named Autumn, two
tough cats named Poe and Calli, a

loving dog named Benji, and a
creepy pet spider named Sparkles.
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