
Your Network Is Our BusinessTM

 

   

NOVACOM 
CONCEALMENT SYSTEMS 

Novacom Concealment Systems 
(NCS) provides products and 
services for the wireless 
telecommunications industry.  
Our NovaCell, NovaCore  and 
NovaPanel products are made of 
RF transparent materials and are 
built to last.  Our products are 
beautiful and the Spanish tile or 
tree bark looks as good as the real 
stuff yet provides your site with 
the RF performance you require. 
 
RF TRANSPARENT CONCEALMENT 
 
•     Design and Manufacturing 
•     Photo Simulations 
•     In-house Engineering 
•     Permitting 
•     Installation services or 

support 
•     Site Maintenance  
 
Our experienced team of 
fabricators, engineers, CAD 
designers, project managers and 
installers has what it takes to 
support your cell site concealment 
needs from start to finish.   
 
ONE STOP SHOP  
With NCS you get the experience 
of an in-house Engineering Firm, 
coupled with the skills of a 

General Contractor. We can take 
your project from concept to 
reality and do it all through one 
company. Since we are the 
engineers, everything fits together 
upon arrival on site and we can 
install or oversee the installation 
of your order making the process 
seamless and complete.  
 
Additionally, we provide 
equipment platforms, antenna 
mounts and hardware, decking, 
ladders, handrails, walkways, or 
whatever materials you need to 
complete the project.  And our 
product is Proudly Made in the 
USA! 
 
OUR TEAM 
Novacom has been a successful 
service provider to the wireless 
telecom industry since 2001.  The 
NCS division provides the 
products and services that allow 
you to rely on ONE Company for 
your cell site concealment 
projects.  We have dedicated 
teams ready to provide all your 
need at very competitive prices. 
 
Call us today to set up a meeting 
and learn more about our 
products and services or send us 
your requests and we’ll come see 
you. 
 



	
  
	
  
	
  
	
  
	
  

	
  
	
  
	
  

  
Novacom 

NovaPanel™ Foam 
FRP 

Sheet StealthSkin™† 
Stealth™ 

Core† 
Chopped 

Fiberglass 
Hand laid 
Fiberglass 

Hazardous Material        

 
Requires Face 
Mask/Sleeves/Gloves  √ √   √ √ 

 No Haz Waste Created √   √ √   

Constructability        

 Easy to Change in the Field √  √     

 Requires Special Tools  √ √   √ √ 

Effective RF Ranges        

 700 MHz-1900 MHz √ √ √ √ √   

 700 MHz-2.2GHz √ √  √ √ √ √ 

 700 MHz-7 GHz √ √   √   

 600 MHz-84 GHz √ √  √    

Sizes Available        

 Custom √ √  √  √ √ 

 4x8 √  √ √ √   

 4x10 √   √ √   

 4x12 √   √    

 4x18 √   √    

Compression Strength 2018 14 * 20  * * 

Flammability Rating UL 94 VO NA VO HB VO * * 

Microwave Performance        

 Excellent √       

 Good  √  √ √   

 Poor      √ √ 

 Failure   √     

Independently PIM Tested    * *   

 Pass √ √      

 Fail   √   √ √ 

Independently RF Tested     *   

 Yes √       

 No    √    

Availability        

 Lead-Time 2d 6w 2d 6w 6w 6w 6w 

 No. of Dist Centers 3 * * 2 2 * * 

 Nationwide √  √ √ √   

Free Shipping** √       

Comparative System Cost LOW High Med. Med. Med. High High 

Green Product        

 
Made from 15% Post 
Industrial Waste √       

 Recyclable Material √       
 

* No Data Available 
** Minimum Order Required      
™ Trademarks of their respective Companies     
†	
   	
  Stealth	
  Concealment,	
  Stealth	
  Skin	
  V	
  are	
  registered	
  trademarks	
  of	
  their	
  respective	
  company’s	
  

NovaPanel 
Concealment System 
PRODUCT COMPARISON SHEET 
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