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Industrial Energy alongside Engie Resources, has secured Priddy Wind as a renewable 
energy source for the Historical Society of Pennsylvania, located in Philadelphia, PA. 
This comes as Industrial Energy continues to build out their renewable energy program 
for museums throughout the country.  
 
“It is very exciting to be working with an organization like the Historical Society. The 
amount of history they have archived in there is amazing. We are very happy to be able 
to provide them with an easy to access, site specific renewable product, which will 
greatly assist in their green initiatives.” said Christian Amabile from Industrial Energy.  
  
 
“The Historical Society of Pennsylvania, founded in 1824, is one of the nation’s largest 
archives of historical documents. We are proud to serve as Philadelphia’s Library of 
American History, with over 21 million manuscripts, books, and graphic images 
encompassing centuries of US history. HSP serves more than 4,000 on-site researchers 
annually and millions more around the globe who use its online resources. HSP is also 
a leading center for the documentation and study of ethnic communities and immigrant 
experiences in the 20th century, and one of the largest family history libraries in the 
country. Through educator workshops, research opportunities, public programs and 
lectures throughout the year, we strive to make history relevant and exhilarating to all.” 

 

Industrial Energy is one of the longest tenured energy advisors in the industry. We 
represent supply of energy for businesses, via strategic partnerships, which have 
afforded us access to proprietary solutions and contractual arrangements for our clients.   

Our company leadership has over 35 years of experience in providing supply, strategy, 
and full coverage, and we function in the form of on-staff energy advisors, to best assist 
our customers and end users. 

Our group has also led in the area of renewable energy supply, with site-specific PPAs 
and VPPAs. (Power Purchasing Agreements and Virtual Power Purchasing 
Agreements). Industrial Energy has renewable supply availability across the country. 
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