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• Clinical psychologist associate and consultant of 
Eunoia

• Served as a head administrator of a private 
counselling centre for 7 years

• Trained in Existential and Mindfulness-based 
approaches and Cognitive Behaviour Therapy

• Extensive clinical training with underprivileged 
populations and worked with survivors of domestic 
violence in Malaysia

• Project manager of a financial institution funded 
project where she conducted a series of capacity 
building workshop for mental health professionals to 
develop their skills in dealing with abused and 
traumatised population.
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• Clinical psychologist trained in Cognitive Behaviour 
Therapy (CBT), Adlerian Therapy and Acceptance & 
Commitment Therapy

• A university lecturer who enjoys promoting the 
healthy expression of emotions and the building of 
self-esteem

• Expert in Dramatherapy and enjoys using creative
mediums such as LEGO®, clay and sand tray in his 
therapy sessions

• Extensive work experience in projects funded by 
financial institutions and Yayasan where he 
facilitated family youth support programme with the 
aim of building relationships with the aim of building 
relationships between youth and parents through 
interactive workshops

• Trained children in executive functioning camp to 
have better attention, decision making and planning 
skills through interactive game-based activities
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Calm in the Storm: Managing Change Gracefully

7

Things WITHIN My Control

Things OUTSIDE My Control
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Things WITHIN My Control

Things OUTSIDE My Control

The Ways 
Your Family 

BehaveThe Ways You 
Respond & 

Interact with 
Family 

Members
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Things WITHIN My Control

Things OUTSIDE My Control

Boss

Work 
Attitude

Work Culture

Icons extracted from www.flaticon.com

Career Plan

http://www.flaticon.com/
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Things WITHIN My Control

Things OUTSIDE My Control

Personal Hygiene

Financial Planning

Staying at Home

Wide Spread of Virus

Economy Slides

Annoying Behaviour 
of Family Members

Ignore Annoying Behaviour

Extension of 
Movement Control?

Stay Connected



© 2020 Eunoia. All rights reserved

Calm in the Storm: Managing Change Gracefully

12

Sushi Train Metaphor by Dr. Russ Harris

Acknowledge & 
Observe

“Park” Your 
Emotions

Reconstruct 
& Focus
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Things WITHIN My Control

Things OUTSIDE My Control

Routine

Fun Time

Stay Connected

Reach Out
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Your feedback for this webinar matters. 

Scan the QR code below to submit your feedback! 


