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 GFBI Ministries 

 

REGISTRATION FOR COURTS OF HEAVEN RETREAT 
 
 
Full Name:    Date:  

 Last First M.I.   
 

Address:   

 Street Address Apartment/Unit # 
 

    

 City State ZIP Code 
 

Phone:  Email  

 
 

Tampa Retreat for 2020 
 
Who: Jackie and Dan Hanselman authors of Silencing the Accuser, 3rd Edition and Valerie Williams 
 
This international team teaches you how to break the power of generational iniquities and release 
generational blessings to your family.   Freedom and transformation can be yours. Further information 
available at God's Foundation Builders 
 
Where:    Bethany Retreat Center  in Lutz, Fl.  
 
When: July  10 - 12th from Friday morning at 10 am to Sunday at 4 pm  
 
You are invited to participate in an intense time of impartation, strategy, and application in the Courts of 
Heaven.  If your heart is humble, you will learn how to be effective in the Courts of Heaven as you discern 
your role, your authority, and apply the protocols of heaven for your family, church, and nation.  The best 
part about operating in prayer from the Mercy Court of Heaven is that you are praying from the Courts of 
Heaven without the interference of  darkness of this present age. I recommend that you fast and pray for this 
season of being set aside with the Lord. The schedule will be flexible as we follow the leading of the Holy 
Spirit balancing the large gatherings with small groups and quiet time.   .   
 
Everyone needs to complete their DNA at possible sites Ancestry.com or 23 and Me.  This information will 
assist you in fine tuning your personal work. We will focus on personal issues in the bloodline . Hopefully, 
you will begin to understand why you are not fulfilling your destiny.  Everything you learn can be applied in 
prayer for you church, city, and nation.  
 
If you plan on attending, please begin working Silencing the Accuser and watching the videos with 
corresponding teachings on the website. Those who register will participate in an organized zoom call to 
prepare you for this important time of transformation.  Information for the zoom call will be posted on the 
Current Info under Registration for the Tampa Retreat 
 
$100 deposit with the registration.  Send to GFBI Ministries, PO Box 998, Moravian Falls, NC. 28654 
 
I agree to pay the full amount of the retreat by June 10th, a month prior to the retreat.   _____initial 
I acknowledge that my deposit will be forfeited if payment is not completed.                  _____ initial 
This deposit can be transferred to another person.  
 

http://www.lulu.com/spotlight/GFBI
https://godsfoundationbuilders.com/
https://bethanycenterfl.org/
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You should plan on arriving between 8 and 9:30  on July 10th for registration and introductions.  You can 
make private arrangements with the Bethany Retreat Center the night before or after the organized retreat 
knowing there will be no food services. Each building has a gathering room with a small refrigerator, Keurig, 
and microwave.  
 
Arrival  ________________________.  Departure ___________________________ 
 
Do you have a roommate?   Yes        Who ____________________________________  

 

 

Check your preference for rooms – rate includes meals and incidentals 

  
              RATE   DEPOSIT DUE 

 
_______Couple rate    $579 - $200 = $379            Due _______initial 
 
_______Shared rate  $289.50  - $100  = $189.50  Due _______initial 
  

______ Single rate     $433  - $100  = $333           Due_______ initial 

 
______ Day Users  $110 - $50 =  $60            Due ______initial 
 

 
Day User    
 
Lunch and Dinner and incidentals   Total Cost: $110   $50 deposit for food    
  
You need to commit to the 3 days. Since the training is line upon line, please recognize the value of the 
sequential teaching and personal prayer time. This is not a conference or a seminar.  Because we are 
flexible in following the Holy Spirit, there could be evening events.  
 
Do you have any dietary restrictions?    YES                 NO.     
 
_____________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Other Information: 
 
Do you play a musical instrument or psalm?   Yes  ______________________        No  
 
Are you willing to assist with times of worship?  Yes           No.   
 
 
This year I was convicted by the Lord not to participate in any ungodly trading floors by charging for ministry.  
What He has freely given, I give to you. What the Lord ordains, He provides.  We trust the Lord will move 
your hearts to support that which has value in your life.  Donations can be made through PayPal to 
godsfoundationbuilders@gmail.com or by check.  
 
In preparation, begin working Silencing the Accuser and watching the videos with corresponding teachings 
on the God's Foundation Builders. A zoom call will be arranged in April to prepare you for this important time 
of transformation.   
 
 

Signature 

 

https://www.paypal.com/us/home
mailto:godsfoundationbuilders@gmail.com
http://godsfoundationbuilders.com/
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Signature:  Date:  

 
Prayerfully consider what you hope to receive from this time of separation unto the Lord.  Intentionality is 
very important.  Please write a description so that we can stand with you in prayer.  
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