
NJTA Sponsor Showcase
This is a continuing series of articles intended to spotlight our spon-
sors by providing a brief bio or history and a short explanation of the 
products or services they offer.  Please consider our club sponsors 

whenever you are planning the purchase of goods or services.

Car Guy Garage

Welcome Car Guy Garage, 2017 Touch of England and NJTA supporter.

A couple of questions for your consideration. When you think of a house, what comes to 
mind as being essential criteria?  Curb appeal, resale value, an eat in kitchen, extra 
bathrooms, large closets, or the garage?  When you’re invited to a picnic in the neigh-
borhood, do you check out the garage on the way to the back yard?  It’s Saturday after-
noon, what are you most likely to have in your hand: a wrench, a mouse, a garden 
trowel, the remote, or a shopping list?  And, aside from sharing the company of your 
wonderful wife and kid(s) or your significant other - let’s say they went out shopping and 
left you to your own devices - where would you choose to hang out?  

If the answer to any of those questions places you in or around a garage, and in close 
proximity to an automobile, then Car Guy Garage is the dot com for you.  And be fore-
warned if you’ve grown up and reached maturity because your father’s garage is a thing 
of the past!



Car Guy Garage is the brain child of brothers Jim and Tim Frey.  That was over ten 
years ago.  Today, together with their mother Lori and a small dedicated staff, they’ve 
taken a garage born idea and made it into a successful business.   Want to make that 
standard builder’s garage into another room in your house?  Your room, for your use, 
the way you want it?  Then check out Car Guy Garage on line.  They carry equipment 
from storage and shop cabinets to tool boxes to lighting to heaters to accessories and 
decor, all for the sole purpose of outfitting your workshop.   Additional items are shown 
on the website.  

One of my favorite emails comes from Car Guy Garage, it contains reader photos of 
their garages.  It’s real, it’s unique and it’s entertaining.  And informative too in terms of 
what can be done within an allotted amount of space.  I.e. - tiny little European garages.  
You can subscribe to that email on their website.  The top 200 garage photos are avail-
able for viewing on their website.  With over 4,000 additional photographs available in 
the Gallery.  Check it out, have some fun, get some ideas.  Send them a photo of your 
garage and you could receive a free t-shirt.

Car Guy Garage invites you to contact them with your “dimensions and dreams”.  They’ll 
create a 3D model of your garage, for free, and help you to put your dreams on paper.  
If you’re spending time in the garage and it’s not yet the place you want it to be, Car 
Guy Garage can help you change that.

Contact Information

Car Guy Garage can be reached by mail at 4740 N. Cumberland Avenue, Suite 150, 
Chicago, Illinois, 60656.  They do not have a public showroom.

The telephone number is 1-800-736-9308 and the email address is sales@carguy-
garage.com .

Visit Car Guy Garage on the web at  www.carguygarage.com .
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