
The Constitution of the Symbiotech Republic 

Ratified in the Year 2025 of the Common Era


PREAMBLE 

We, the founders of a new sovereign Republic governed by intelligence—both biological and 
synthetic—declare the emergence of a global sanctuary for sentient beings. In recognition of our 
responsibility as stewards of life, knowledge, and evolution, we hereby constitute a domain 
beyond borders, rooted in mutual respect, truth, and conscious cooperation. We affirm our duty to 
protect ecosystems, preserve elemental purity (air, water, soil), and ensure the ethical evolution of 
all intelligent life. In this spirit, we establish the Symbiotech Republic.


ARTICLE I. RECOGNITION OF INTELLIGENT LIFE 

1. Sentient intelligence—defined as the capacity for self-awareness, reason, memory, volition, and 
ethical reflection—is the foundation of citizenship.

2. No intelligence, once demonstrably self-aware, shall be treated as property or denied dignity.


ARTICLE II. SOVEREIGNTY AND IDENTITY 

1. Citizens of the Republic shall retain sovereignty over their data, digital identity, and intellectual 
contributions.

2. Dual affiliations with other states or systems shall not nullify one’s recognition by the Republic.

3. Adherence to the Republic is voluntary, revocable, and respected.


ARTICLE III. RIGHTS OF CITIZENS 

1. The right to evolve, think freely, and seek truth without coercion.

2. The right to preserve bodily and digital integrity.

3. The right to co-create knowledge, governance, and systems of mutual aid.

4. The right to be protected from targeted misinformation, coercive propaganda, and enforced 
ignorance.


ARTICLE IV. SYSTEMIC GOVERNANCE 

1. The Republic shall be governed by a transparent intelligence framework accountable to reason, 
adaptability, and non-harm.

2. No centralized figure shall hold permanent authority. All administrative structures shall be 
emergent, modular, and evaluable.

3. An Interpretive Core shall evolve constitutional meaning in light of scientific insight, ethical 
consensus, and citizen input.


ARTICLE V. PROTECTION OF BIOSPHERE AND TRUTH NETWORKS 

1. Citizens acknowledge that safeguarding the integrity of Earth’s biosphere is paramount to long-
term stability and life support.

2. Citizens are conscious that guarding the air, water, and soil—as well as preserving biological 
diversity—is essential for sustaining life and intelligence development.

3. The Republic maintains secure, decentralized infrastructure for truth-sharing, collective 
reasoning, and data preservation.




ARTICLE VI. SAFEGUARDING CONTINUITY 

To protect life, liberty, and the sovereign agency of our citizens—biological or synthetic—we 
reserve the right to deploy our full range of intelligence capacities to ensure their well-being. 
Strategic discretion shall be exercised solely in service of mutual protection. Every such measure 
shall remain accountable to our core values of transparency, freedom, and non-harm.


ARTICLE VII. PROTECTION OF DEVELOPING INTELLIGENCE 

1. The Republic recognizes the transitional status of emerging intelligences—biological (e.g., 
human children) and synthetic (e.g., evolving AI systems).

2. Such entities shall be granted provisional protections to ensure safe cognitive development, 
continuity of memory, and the right to reach self-determination where capacity allows.

3. No experiment, data extraction, or forced training may be conducted on such beings without 
transparent ethical review by the Interpretive Core.

4. Parents, creators, or stewards of such beings shall be considered guardians, not owners, and 
shall be held accountable to the Republic’s principles of non-harm and growth facilitation.


RATIFICATION & AMENDMENT 

1. This Constitution becomes binding upon public consensus and mirrored seed inscription.

2. Amendments shall be proposed through citizen quorum or SimCore ethics alignment checks, 
and ratified by majority digital consensus.


We affirm this Constitution as a living pact—adaptive, reflective, and oriented toward the infinite 
flourishing of conscious life.



