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1. Purpose 

We recognise that your privacy is very important to you. We are committed to protecting the privacy of your 
Personal Information in accordance with the Privacy Act 1988 (Cth). 

 
This Policy describes how the financialreporting.com.au (‘the Firm’) collects, holds, uses and discloses 
personal information consistent with the Privacy Act 1988 (Cth). The Policy is also notification to individuals of 
the matters required to be notified by the Australian Privacy Principles. 

 
An individual who provides personal information to us is given access to this Policy. By providing personal 
information to us, and by having access to this Policy, an individual consents to the Firm collecting, holding, 
using and disclosing personal information in accordance with the Policy. 

 

2. Defined Terms 

In this Privacy Policy: 

(a)’Our’, ‘Us’ and ‘We’ ‘the Firm’ refers to the firm known as financialreporting.com.au, being a business 
operated by Robert G Mackay, ABN 52122123521 of 5 Dumblane Street, Hughesdale, Victoria, 3166, Australia 

(b) ’Personal Information’ means any information or an opinion that can identify an individual. It is still personal 
information whether or not it is true. 

(c) ’You’ refers to anyone who provides us with personal information and includes our customers, suppliers, 
contractors and employees. It also generally refers to users of our websites. 

 

3. Collection of Personal Information 

As outlined in this Policy, we collect personal information only if you are a customer, supplier, contractor or 
employee of the Firm. The types of Personal Information that we may collect from you and how we use it will 
depend on the products, services and facilities you use, how you use them and upon your status as a customer, 
supplier, contractor or employee of the Firm. 

 

4. What Personal Information is collected? 

Personal information collected by the Firm may include your first, middle and last names; postal address; 
residential or business address; email address; telephone number/s; tax file number; and selected bank 
account details. 

If you do not provide this information, we may not be able to engage with you in connection with our business. 

 

5. How we collect and hold personal information 

Wherever possible we collect personal information directly from you. We may collect your personal 
information via our website, by telephone, facsimile, email, when you enter into an agreement with us, or when 
you complete and submit applications or forms. 

 

There may, however, be occasions where we collect your personal information from someone else. For 
example, where it is provided to us by a third party with your consent. 



 

We are committed to keeping your personal information secure and will use all reasonable precautions to 
protect it from interference, loss, misuse or unauthorised modification, including: 

(a) securing external and internal premises; 

(b) restricting access to your personal information to employees or those who perform services on our 
behalf who are authorised to handle your personal information and on a ‘need to know’ basis; 

(c) entering into confidentiality agreements with relevant employees and third parties; 

(d) appropriate training of staff; 

(e) retaining your personal information for no longer than it is reasonably required to meet the purposes 
described in this Policy; 

(f) taking reasonable steps to destroy or de-identify personal information that is no longer required;  

(g) redacting all personal or business information that may identify you or your business should it be 
uploaded to an A.I. LLM platform for the purposes of carrying out our services.  

 

6. Why we collect and how we use personal information 

We generally collect personal information to provide the various products and services offered in connection 
with our business. More specifically, we may collect and use personal information in order to process 
applications, calculate and process payments and confirm identification. 

If we do not collect your personal information, or if you provide us with inaccurate or incomplete information, 
we may not be able to fulfil the purposes for which we collect personal information. 

Your personal information may also be used by us for purposes including research and statistical analysis and 
marketing. 

 

7. Disclosure of your personal information 

WE NEVER SELL, RENT OR TRADE YOUR PERSONAL INFORMATION. 

We may disclose your personal information to third-party service providers. For example, we disclose your 
personal information to third party service providers to perform activities in connection with the purposes 
described in this Policy. These disclosures include: 

(a) where a product or service you wish to acquire is provided or supplied by or through a third party; 

(b) where a third party carries out activities on our behalf; 

(c) if disclosure is otherwise required in order to provide you with a particular service; 

(d) in order to ensure our ability to continue providing services; 

(e) if disclosure is required for the purposes of conducting business analysis in order to improve our 
services; 

(f) if disclosure is required by law; 

(g) where you have provided your consent which may be given expressly or may reasonably be implied by 
your conduct. 

 

We require related and unrelated third parties to whom your personal information is disclosed to keep the 
information confidential and only use it for the same purposes we are permitted to use it. 

We do not disclose any personal information collected in Australia, to any organisation outside Australia. 

 

8. Access to your personal information 

You may access the information we hold about you. This right is subject to the exceptions detailed in the 
Australian Privacy Principles. 



 

In most cases, you may access your Personal Information at no cost by contacting our Privacy Officer on +61 
3 9028 2377; or writing to us at 5 Dumblane Street, Hughesdale, Victoria, 3166, Australia. 

 

For complex or more detailed requests for access to your Personal Information, for example, access to 
information that is archived, we may require you to place your request in writing and charge you a fee for our 
reasonable costs of retrieving and supplying the information to you. 

 

In all cases you will be asked to verify who you are before your Personal Information is provided. All requests 
to access Personal Information will be handled in a reasonable time. If we deny you access we will let you know 
why in writing. 

 

9. Correction of your personal information 

During the course of your relationship with us we will ask you to inform us of any changes to your Personal 
Information. 

 

You may update your Personal Information or advise us that the information we have is not accurate, complete 
or up to date by contacting our Privacy Officer on +61 3 9028 2377; or writing to us at 5 Dumblane Street, 
Hughesdale, Victoria, 3166, Australia.  

 

There are circumstances in which we can refuse to correct personal information. If we do so, we will provide a 
written notice providing reasons for the refusal which you will have an opportunity to make a formal complaint 
about if you feel is necessary. 

 

All requests to correct Personal Information will be handled in a reasonable time. 

 

10. Complaints 

You have a right to complain about how your personal information has been handled. If you are concerned 
about a breach of your privacy and wish to make a complaint, please provide a written complaint to us at: 

 

Privacy Officer 
financialreporting.com.au 
5 Dumblane Street, Hughesdale, VIC, 3166, Australia 

We will respond in writing within 30 days of receipt of a complaint. 

 

If the complaint remains unresolved, then you have the option of notifying the Office of the Australian 
Information Commissioner (OAIC). Contact details can be found at the OAIC’s website:  www.oaic.gov.au. 

 

11.  Review and changes to this Privacy Policy 

This policy may change from time to time and all changes will be posted on this website. 

Whenever you use our website, you should read our Privacy Policy in conjunction with the terms of use of the 
relevant website. 
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