
Sunrise Park Neighborhood Organization 
Candidate Statements for 2021 Board of Directors 

7 Open Positions 

Bob Peterson:  N. Farrell Drive.  I have been a part-time resident of Sunrise Park since 
November, 2011.  In October, 2019 I became a permanent resident after moving from Chicago. I 
volunteered for SPNO’s Modernism Tour and committee work.  Since I am now a full-time 
resident I would like to be more involved on the board. 

Brad Dunkin:  N. Debby Drive.  I feel honored and privileged having been elected to serve on 
the SPNO Board the past four years. I'm also the Secretary/Communications Officer. I would 
sincerely enjoy, with your endorsement, continuing to serve our wonderful Sunrise Park 
Neighborhood and being an integral part of the consortium of Palm Springs neighborhoods.  
   
Byron Radcliffe:  N. Orchid Tree Lane. As a new full-time resident of the Sunrise Park, I 
would like to be an active member of our neighborhood to help make improvements and address 
concerns of our fellow Sunrise Park residents as we revitalize our community network post-
COVID.  

John Cummings:  E. Terry Lane.  After 45 years of living in San Francisco, I pulled up roots 
two years ago and moved to Palm Springs.  I’m interested in serving on the board of our 
neighborhood organization in order to become more involved in our community and to get to 
know some of the folks in the neighborhood. 

Kathy Cohn:  N. Debby Drive.  I’ve served as vice chair of our Board and representative to 
ONE-PS and it’s 49 neighborhoods since 2014, a means for connecting with our City 
government. Our Modernism Tours, parades, picnics and socials bring us together as neighbors. I 
hope to continue working on behalf of SPNO neighborhood. 

Ken Nelson:  N. Burton Way.  I enjoy my current role on the Board, and would love to continue 
on the board.   I love Sunrise Park and hope that we can keep it updated and a good place to live.  
I’m semi-retired and live with my husband of over 34 years. 

Marty Danielson:  E. Belding Drive.  I have lived in Sunrise Park since 1996 and watched it 
become one of the quintessential stand out Palm Springs communities.  I seek to serve as a team 
member, focusing on our neighborhood interests, needs and concerns, as well as educational, 
recreational and social opportunities.  I have served on Village Fest, PSMODCOM, and Desert 
Business Association Boards. 

*One candidate has withdrawn and his name removed.


