
Warfare Prayer to Break Curses  

 

Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, I come boldly before Your throne of grace. I 
enter by the blood, I war by the Spirit, and I decree by the Word. 

 

Today, I rise in apostolic authority and prophetic fire and confront every 
demonic curse—spoken, written, inherited, or transferred. Let the voice of the 
blood of Jesus speak louder than every word curse released against my life, 
my bloodline, my destiny, and my purpose. 

 

I decree: Every curse is reversed. Every hex is nullified. Every spell is 
shattered. 

No incantation or divination shall prosper against me (Numbers 23:23), for I 
am the redeemed of the Lord—and I say so! 

 

I break and renounce every generational curse—from my mother’s bloodline 
and my father’s bloodline—back to ten generations and beyond. I sever every 
legal right that the enemy has used to gain access through iniquity and 
idolatry. I command every demonic spirit operating through generational 
curses to be uprooted now in the name of Jesus. 

 

 I release the fire of God to burn every satanic altar erected against me. Let the 
hammer of the Lord smash every covenant not made by God (Jeremiah 23:29). 
Let the whirlwind of the Lord scatter every demonic alliance, every soul tie, 
every ungodly covenant that holds my destiny hostage. 

 

I decree and declare: 



 

• Every curse of poverty becomes a blessing of abundance. 

• Every curse of sickness becomes a testimony of healing. 

• Every curse of delay becomes divine acceleration. 

• Every curse of barrenness becomes supernatural fruitfulness. 

• Every curse of rejection becomes acceptance in the Beloved. 

 

I silence every witchcraft voice speaking against my name in the spirit. I 
reverse every word spoken in envy, anger, or jealousy. Let those curses return 
to the camp of the enemy, sevenfold, unless they repent (Psalm 79:12). 

 

Lord, I call upon the breaker anointing (Micah 2:13)—go before me and shatter 
every gate of brass and cut in sunder every bar of iron. Let there be a divine 
unblocking of blessings that have been hindered through curses. 

 

I bind the strongman behind every curse and command it to release my family, 
my finances, my mind, my health, and my ministry. I evict every unclean spirit 
assigned to enforce the curse and command them to go to the pit in Jesus’ 
name. 

 

Let the blood of Jesus cleanse my DNA, my soul, my subconscious, and my 
environment. I plead the blood over my children, my home, my marriage, my 
ministry, my future. 

 



From this day forward, I walk in the blessing of Abraham. I align myself with 
the covenant of Christ, and I declare: No curse can stand against the 
anointing. No bondage can resist the breaker. No lie can overturn the truth. 

 

I seal this prayer in the blood of Jesus, and I decree: 

It is finished. It is broken. It is done. In Jesus’ mighty name. Amen and Amen! 

 


