
Beaver Paul <beaverpaul1@gmail.com>

Re: Statement of Account for BDA
1 message

CHER <csackville@bdaltd.ca> Fri, Jun 18, 2021 at 4:19 PM
To: Beaver Paul <beaverpaul1@gmail.com>

Hi Beaver. 


yes this is correct.  Total $ 33,562.50 for April and May 2021 as per your attachments


Thank you.


cheryl.


> On Jun 18, 2021, at 3:11 PM, Beaver Paul <beaverpaul1@gmail.com> wrote:

> 

> Hi Cher,

> 

> Please review the attached invoices to ensure I have a copy of all outstanding BDA invoices the total of which is
$33,562.50. 

> 

> -- 

> Beaver Paul, Partner

> Germain Paul & Associates

> 418.360.3911

> 

> <BDA April 30 3225-2.pdf><BDA May 31 3225-1XTRA.pdf>
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