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PROPERTY MAINTENANCE 

The weather has finally reached the ideal time of year 
for exterior property maintenance. March will kick off 
the yearly architectural control walk through. The 
most common issues found last year were firewalls 
that needed cleaned/painted, damaged or missing 
shingles, villas that needed painted, trees/bushes/
grass that needed trimmed/cut, and damaged or miss-
ing screens. Please take some time to look around 
your villa exterior and see if any of these items need 
attention and help keep our neighborhood looking 
nice. Architectural control enforcement was the single 
most time consuming item of the board’s time to get 
corrected last year so please help us proactively ad-
dress these items. Should you have any questions, 
send us an email and we are more than happy to assist 
where we can. 

HELP NEEDED 

The board struggled through much of 2023, having 3 
members step down and only two positions filled. 5 of 
the 6 current members work full time jobs so it is very 
difficult for us to keep up with all the emails, architec-
tural control, financials, and attorney situations. We 
are looking for other community members to help as-
sist. If you are interested in joining the board or just 
helping out from time to time, please let us know via 
email or stop by the next board meeting. The board 
does as much volunteering as we can to keep HOA ex-
penses as low as possible but it is not sustainable. If 
we are unable to find volunteers, we will likely need to 
start paying to outsource some things which will raise 
our community expenses. 

NOVEMBER FINANCIALS 
Beginning Balance:  $27,161 
Ending Balance:  $27,540 
Delinquencies:            $  4,864 

YOUR HOA BOARD MEMBERS 
Cindy Perry April Murphy 
Shawn James John Porath  
Alex Parent Debbie Behnke 

MONTHLY DUES AND SPECIAL ASSESSMENT 

Resource Property Management (RPM) who serves as 
our property management company for the financials 
of our community recently sent out a notice that there 
will be a new portal to pay your dues online. The HOA 
board was not aware of this change until each of us 
received the notification in the mail, just like all other 
community members. The old portal has been down 
for a couple weeks and we’ve been told that the new 
portal will be in place by February 1st. RPM will mail 
each homeowner a letter on how to access the new 
portal in January. While this is not ideal for many of us, 
the board would like to communicate that we are 
equally as frustrated with their changeover as you may 
be. We have communicated to RPM that there should 
be no late fees assessed for the month of January due 
to this switchover. The new monthly amount for 2024 
is $40.95 per month ($491.40 per year). You are still 
able to pay via check, money order, or ACH while we 
wait for the new portal to be up and running. 

The special assessment that passed in November will 
be $200 per villa, due November 1, 2024. RPM will be 
mailing out a separate correspondence for the special 
assessment. If you chose, you may pay the lump sum 
ahead of time or make smaller payments throughout 
the year, as long as the full $200 is paid by November 
1, 2024. 

We have been experiencing issues with RPM and it is 
on the board’s agenda in 2024 to research other prop-
erty management companies in hopes that we can find 
one that is able to give us better service. RPM is more 
cost effective than a couple we have already reached 
out to, but the service level just isn’t what we expect it 
to be. If anyone has suggestions on property manage-
ment companies, please send us an email. 

MONTHLY BOARD MEETING 

Next Meeting: January 18, 7PM at the clubhouse 

Annual Meeting: February 15, 7:30PM at the clubhouse 

Their was no monthly meeting held in December as the 
board was on recess for the holidays. 
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