
Art at 
Padgate

What do I 
know?

A practical and theory test 
will allow you to 

demonstrate your learning 
before you move into Year 

8 to expand and enrich 
your Art knowledge 

further.

Critical 
thinking
Forming your own opinion 
on your own and others 
work. Sharing your views 
through discussion, debate 
or questions and answers.

Weaving
How can your knowledge 
of colour inspire your own 
practical  textile outcome.

Textile
sWhat do you know about 
the textile industry? Look 
at how the cotton mills of 
the North West shaped the 
area you live in today.Van Gogh

Learn how Vincent Van 
Gogh developed his 

impasto painting, explore 
how his emotions affected 

his artwork, and what 
made him so famous? Pointillism

Refine your painting skills 
by learning how to paint 
like the great master 
George Seurat.

Media
Develop your practical 

skills by using a range of 
media. Pencil, pens, 

coloured pencils and water 
colour paints. Kandinsky

Learn about the artist 
Wassily Kandinsky and 
how his abstract art can 
influence and inspire your 
own creative responses.Colour

Explore, experiment and 
learn about how the colour
wheel will form the basis of 

your colour knowledge.

Baseline 
test
Mark making, formal 
elements and recording 
are fundamental to any 
artists learning journey. 
You will build on your 
knowledge and skills from 
previous years.

Year 7 
Learning 
journey


