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• From Geoengineered 
Transhumanism 

                                 - Elana Freeland:

Graphene Based Hydrogel is basically an 
AI-controlled neuroelectronic 
swarm intelligence system. Before 
entering the body it is a non-metallic 
chemical agent, but with the body 
heat and contact with hydrogen, it 
becomes extremely biomagenetic 
and capable of absorbing energy 
from electromagnetic waves in the 
5G band, thus oxidizing rapidly and 
acting as a free radical that can 
quicken THROMBOSIS ( blood 
clotting), myocarditis, and 
pericarditis in 5G 
environments. Graphene is 
programmable - for example , how it 
seeks out vital organs ( brain and 
heart) according to their frequency, 
electromagnetic fields, temperature, 
etc. Graphene produces a magnetic 
filed mental fog that prevention the 
inoculated from thinking clearly or 
comprehending what they are 
reading or seeing.
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