
Healthy Quick Meals for Working Moms 

 

After a long day, dinner can often feel like the hardest meal to prepare. These quick 
and healthy recipes are designed to simplify your evenings without sacrificing 
flavor or nutrition. From comforting one-pan dishes to vibrant bowls and stir-fries, 
there's something here to please everyone in your family. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



One-Pan Baked Salmon and Veggies 

Ingredients: 2 salmon fillets, 1 cup broccoli florets, 1 cup baby carrots, 1 tbsp 
olive oil, 1 tsp garlic powder, salt and pepper. 

Instructions: 

Preheat oven to 400°F (200°C). 

Place salmon and veggies on a baking sheet. 

Drizzle with olive oil and season with garlic powder, salt, and pepper. 

Bake for 15-20 minutes or until salmon is cooked through. 

Turkey and Veggie Stir-Fry 

Ingredients: 1 lb ground turkey, 2 cups mixed vegetables (e.g., bell peppers, 
zucchini, snap peas), 2 tbsp soy sauce, 1 tbsp sesame oil, 1 tsp minced garlic. 

Instructions: 

Heat sesame oil in a skillet over medium heat. 

Cook ground turkey until browned. 

Add vegetables and garlic, cooking until tender. 

Stir in soy sauce and serve over rice or quinoa. 

Shrimp Tacos 

Ingredients: 1 lb shrimp, 1 tsp chili powder, 1 tsp cumin, 1/2 tsp paprika, 1 tbsp 
olive oil, corn tortillas, shredded lettuce, salsa. 

Instructions: 

Season shrimp with chili powder, cumin, and paprika. 

Sauté shrimp in olive oil until cooked through. 

Serve in tortillas with lettuce and salsa. 

 

 



Zucchini Noodles with Pesto 

Ingredients: 2 zucchinis (spiralized), 1/4 cup pesto sauce, cherry tomatoes, grated 
Parmesan. 

Instructions: 

Sauté zucchini noodles in a pan for 2-3 minutes. 

Add pesto sauce and mix well. 

Top with cherry tomatoes and Parmesan. 

Stuffed Bell Peppers 

Ingredients: 4 bell peppers, 1 cup cooked quinoa, 1 cup black beans, 1/2 cup corn, 
1/2 cup shredded cheese, salsa. 

Instructions: 

Cut tops off peppers and remove seeds. 

Mix quinoa, beans, corn, and salsa in a bowl. 

Fill peppers with mixture and top with cheese. 

Bake at 375°F for 20 minutes. 

Lentil Soup 

Ingredients: 1 cup lentils, 4 cups vegetable broth, 1 cup diced tomatoes, 1 cup 
diced carrots, 1 tsp cumin, salt and pepper. 

Instructions: 

Combine all ingredients in a pot. 

Bring to a boil, then simmer for 20 minutes. 

Serve hot. 

 

 

 



Chicken Stir-Fry 

Ingredients: 1 lb chicken breast (sliced), 2 cups mixed vegetables, 2 tbsp soy 
sauce, 1 tbsp olive oil, 1 tsp ginger. 

Instructions: 

Heat oil in a skillet and cook chicken until browned. 

Add vegetables and cook until tender. 

Stir in soy sauce and ginger before serving. 

 

Cauliflower Fried Rice 

Ingredients: 2 cups cauliflower rice, 1/2 cup peas, 1/2 cup carrots, 2 eggs, 2 tbsp 
soy sauce, 1 tbsp sesame oil. 

Instructions: 

Heat sesame oil in a pan and cook eggs. 

Add cauliflower rice, peas, and carrots, and stir-fry. 

Stir in soy sauce before serving. 

 

 

Grilled Chicken and Asparagus 

Ingredients: 2 chicken breasts, 1 bunch asparagus, 1 tbsp olive oil, 1 tsp garlic 
powder, salt and pepper. 

Instructions: 

Season chicken with garlic powder, salt, and pepper. 

Grill chicken and asparagus until cooked through. 

 

 



 

 

 

Vegetable Curry 

Ingredients: 2 cups mixed vegetables, 1 can coconut milk, 2 tbsp curry paste, 1 tsp 
turmeric, salt. 

Instructions: 

Sauté vegetables in a pan. 

Add coconut milk, curry paste, and turmeric. 

Simmer for 10 minutes and serve over rice. 

Baked Tilapia and Spinach 

Ingredients: 2 tilapia fillets, 2 cups spinach, 1 tbsp olive oil, 1 tsp lemon juice, salt 
and pepper. 

Instructions: 

Place tilapia and spinach on a baking sheet. 

Drizzle with olive oil and lemon juice, then season. 

Bake at 375°F for 15 minutes. 

Eggplant Parmesan 

Ingredients: 1 eggplant, 1 cup marinara sauce, 1/2 cup mozzarella, 1/4 cup 
Parmesan, 1/4 cup breadcrumbs. 

Instructions: 

Slice eggplant and layer with marinara, cheese, and breadcrumbs in a baking dish. 

Bake at 400°F for 20 minutes. 

 

 



Turkey Meatball Pasta 

Ingredients: 1 lb ground turkey, 1/4 cup breadcrumbs, 1 egg, 1/2 tsp garlic 
powder, marinara sauce, whole-grain pasta. 

Instructions: 

Mix turkey, breadcrumbs, egg, and seasoning, then form into meatballs. 

Bake meatballs at 375°F for 15 minutes. 

Serve with pasta and marinara. 

 

Vegetarian Burrito Bowls 

Ingredients: 1 cup brown rice, 1/2 cup black beans, 1/2 cup corn, salsa, avocado 
slices, shredded cheese. 

Instructions: 

Layer rice, beans, corn, salsa, and avocado in a bowl. 

Top with cheese before serving. 

 

 

BBQ Chicken Flatbread 

Ingredients: 1 flatbread, 1/2 cup shredded chicken, 2 tbsp BBQ sauce, 1/4 cup 
mozzarella, red onion slices. 

Instructions: 

Spread BBQ sauce on flatbread. 

Add chicken, cheese, and onions. 

Bake at 400°F for 10 minutes. 

 

 



 

 

 

Sweet Potato and Black Bean Tacos 

Ingredients: 1 sweet potato, 1/2 cup black beans, taco seasoning, corn tortillas, 
salsa. 

Instructions: 

Roast diced sweet potato with taco seasoning at 400°F for 20 minutes. 

Serve in tortillas with black beans and salsa. 

Grilled Steak Salad 

Ingredients: 1 steak, mixed greens, cherry tomatoes, cucumber, balsamic 
vinaigrette. 

Instructions: 

Grill steak and slice thinly. 

Toss greens with tomatoes, cucumber, and vinaigrette. 

Top with steak slices. 

Asian Noodle Stir-Fry 

Ingredients: 8 oz rice noodles, 2 cups mixed vegetables, 2 tbsp soy sauce, 1 tbsp 
sesame oil, 1 tsp ginger. 

Instructions: 

Cook noodles according to package instructions. 

Stir-fry vegetables in sesame oil and ginger. 

Toss noodles with vegetables and soy sauce. 

 

 



Caprese Chicken 

Ingredients: 2 chicken breasts, 1/2 cup mozzarella, 1/2 cup cherry tomatoes, fresh 
basil, balsamic glaze. 

Instructions: 

Cook chicken breasts in a skillet. 

Top with mozzarella, tomatoes, and basil. 

Drizzle with balsamic glaze before serving. 

Spaghetti Squash with Marinara 

Ingredients: 1 spaghetti squash, 1 cup marinara sauce, Parmesan cheese. 

Instructions: 

Roast squash at 400°F for 30 minutes and scrape out strands. 

Toss with marinara and top with Parmesan. 

Chili Lime Shrimp Bowls 

Ingredients: 1 lb shrimp, 1 tsp chili powder, 1 tsp lime juice, 1 cup quinoa, 
avocado slices. 

Instructions: 

Cook shrimp with chili powder and lime juice. 

Serve over quinoa with avocado. 

Greek Chicken Wraps 

Ingredients: 1 cup cooked chicken, 1/4 cup tzatziki, 1/4 cup diced cucumber, 
whole-grain tortilla, lettuce. 

Instructions: 

Layer chicken, tzatziki, cucumber, and lettuce on tortilla. 

Roll up and serve. 

 



Spinach and Feta Stuffed Chicken 

Ingredients: 2 chicken breasts, 1 cup spinach, 1/4 cup feta, 1 tbsp olive oil. 

Instructions: 

Cut pockets in chicken breasts and stuff with spinach and feta. 

Cook in a skillet until chicken is cooked through. 

Vegetarian Stir-Fry with Tofu 

Ingredients: 1 block tofu, 2 cups mixed vegetables, 2 tbsp soy sauce, 1 tbsp 
sesame oil. 

Instructions: 

Cook tofu in sesame oil until crispy. 

Add vegetables and soy sauce, and stir-fry. 

Beef and Broccoli 

Ingredients: 1 lb beef slices, 2 cups broccoli, 2 tbsp soy sauce, 1 tbsp sesame oil, 1 
tsp garlic powder. 

Instructions: 

Cook beef in sesame oil until browned. 

Add broccoli and garlic powder, cooking until tender. 

Stir in soy sauce before serving. 

Chicken Fajita Bowls 

Ingredients: 1 cup cooked chicken, 1/2 cup bell peppers, 1/2 cup rice, salsa, 
shredded cheese. 

Instructions: 

Layer rice, chicken, and bell peppers in a bowl. 

Top with salsa and cheese before serving. 


