
Fee Schedule
Revised March 2019

Note: NORI has attempted to maintain our current fee schedule dated December 2017 
but due to increased costs of materials, production, administration, advertising and 
general overhead, NORI must increase fees for services. NORI understands that our 
services are not covered by insurance so we strive to keep our fees and payment 
schedule as accessible and affordable as possible.

Initial Consultations

NORI provides no-cost consultations to anyone interested in our nutritional support 
program or other services. The consultation may last for up to one hour. 

Nutritional Counseling

Nutritional counseling for cancer patients and for individuals with other conditions is 
offered at an hourly rate of $225 USD. Adjustments to this fee can be made for those 
with limited income. Billing is in one hour increments. Nutritional counseling is 
conducted in-person, by phone or over Skype. Payment may be submitted through the 
NORI website DONATE page using any credit or debit card or paid at the time of service 
by cash or check for in-person consults.

Home-Based Nutritional Support Program

NORI does not sell supplements or nutraceutical products to individuals. NORI offers a 
comprehensive home-based nutritional support program that includes all the necessary 
supplements and nutraceuticals with the exception of natural hormone blockers.

The NORI Nutritional Support Program includes:

• Unlimited nutritional counseling and general support.

• Access to our private online support group.

• All necessary supplements and nutraceuticals required for the home-based nutritional  
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  support program. NORI will provide new nutraceutical products at no extra charge as    
  they are developed.

Plan A- Lifetime Unlimited

NORI offers the complete nutritional support program for a one-time fee (donation) of 
$8,000 USD. The program is home-based and available worldwide. This is a lifetime 
program with no additional fees for NORI products and services. Clients outside the 
United States will be responsible for shipping charges. Nutritional counseling and 
general support is fully covered and unlimited. Other family members within the home 
may receive nutritional counseling at no charge.

Plan B- Yearly

NORI offers a yearly option for a one-time fee (donation) of $4,000 USD. Everything in 
Plan A is covered. After one year, one may choose a monthly payment of $400 USD for 
continued support, supplements and nutraceuticals. Installment payment plans can be 
arranged. Clients outside the United States will be responsible for shipping charges.

Plan C- Monthly

A monthly option is available for $400 per month. The first month is $800 and $400 
thereafter. An additional shipping charge will be billed for clients outside the United 
States.

NORI offers a monthly option for those with limited financial resources. All services and 
products are provided for a monthly fee of $300 USD. There is no long term 
commitment required. One must prove financial hardship. There will be an additional 
shipping charge to clients outside the United States.

Plan D- Support Only

NORI offers a support-only option that does not include supplements and 
nutraceuticals.  This plan is for one year and includes up to 4 hours nutritional 
counseling and one year access to the NORI private online support group. This plan is 
for clients that are either preventing a reoccurrence or are wishing to lower their cancer 
risk. The fee for this plan is $495 USD.
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Terms and Conditions.

1. NORI is not licensed to provide medical care, write prescriptions, diagnose or treat  
any disease and makes no claims to be able to cure any disease. NORI is an 
independent research organization focused on discovering methods of utilizing diet, 
nutraceuticals and lifestyle to enhance the effectiveness and safety of conventional 
cancer care. NORI will provide compassionate care to cancer patients who have 
exhausted all options within the standard of care.

2.  NORI provides nutritional support and lifestyle coaching to cancer patients based on 
     the most current scientific information available. The NORI support program is  
     designed to augment a patients overall treatment plan and is not intended as a 
     substitute for standard medical care.

3. NORI prefers that the client works together with his/her primary physician, oncologist 
    or naturopath and NORI to ensure optimal care, proper diagnostics and monitoring 
    and maintains the availability of all treatment options.

4. NORI reserves the right to disapprove access to our online support group for any 
    offensive, rude or inappropriate behavior. Users of the support group must respect
    the privacy, religious beliefs and individual choices of other group members. The 
    purpose of the NORI support group is to share valuable information, provide hope,  
    offer encouragement and  each individual’s unique treatment plan.

5. Donations are not tax deductible at this time. NORI plans to obtain non-profit 501(c)3 
    status in the near future.

6. Under certain circumstances, NORI may provide partial refunds.

7. NORI shall not be held liable in any manner for medical expenses or any damage.
    The client assumes all risks that may be associated with the NORI support program.

8. NORI does not sell nutraceutical products to individuals. Nutraceutical products are 
    provided by NORI as a part of the nutritional support program. New and advanced 
    nutraceutical products are constantly under development and will be incorporated into 
    the support program as they become available. All nutraceutical products are based 
    on natural compounds, herbal extracts and nontoxic excipients. At the recommended 
    doses, the nutraceutical products do not cause any adverse side effects. In some 
    cases, one may experience side effects from rapid tumor inflammation or die-off.

9. NORI is a research organization and greatly appreciates the opportunity to serve 
    cancer patients by offering diet and lifestyle guidance that may enhance their healing 
    process. In return, NORI gains knowledge and experience through clinical case 
    studies investigating how our program improves cancer treatment outcome and 
    survival. Clients may be contacted by clinical researchers to generate documentation 
    of their progress.
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10. NORI respects client’s privacy and will not share medical records or health status 
      without prior consent.

11. If any disputes arise between NORI and the client, it is agreed that both parties will 
      seek mediation as a remedy.
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