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WORSHIP LEADERS 
Pastor: Pastor Jackie Cook 
Music Ministry: Mark Gould 
Tech Team: Andy Justman, Paul Neumiller, Rich Quinlan 
 
PRELUDE Baptized in Water - Improvisational piano duet: 
Mark Gould & Glenn Henriksen 
 
THANKSGIVING FOR BAPTISM 
 
GATHERING SONG Will You Come and Follow Me 
Led by Gary Fluaitt  ELW # 798 vs.1&5 
 
GREETING  
 
PRAYER OF THE DAY  
Thanks be to you, Lord Jesus Christ, most merciful 
redeemer, for the countless blessings and benefits you 
give. May we know you more clearly, love you more dearly, 
and follow you more nearly, day by day praising you, with 
the Father and the Holy Spirit, one God, now and forever. 
Amen 
 
 
 
 

WORD  
First Reading: 1 Samuel 3:1-10 [11-20] 
Now the boy Samuel was ministering to the Lord under Eli. 
The word of the Lord was rare in those days; visions were 
not widespread.  
 
At that time Eli, whose eyesight had begun to grow dim so 
that he could not see, was lying down in his room; the lamp 
of God had not yet gone out, and Samuel was lying down 
in the temple of the Lord, where the ark of God was. Then 
the Lord called, “Samuel! Samuel!” and he said, “Here I 
am!” and ran to Eli, and said, “Here I am, for you called 
me.” But he said, “I did not call; lie down again.” So he 
went and lay down. The Lord called again, “Samuel!” 
Samuel got up and went to Eli, and said, “Here I am, for 
you called me.” But he said, “I did not call, my son; lie 
down again.” Now Samuel did not yet know the Lord, and 
the word of the Lord had not yet been revealed to him. The 
Lord called Samuel again, a third time. And he got up and 
went to Eli, and said, “Here I am, for you called me.” Then 
Eli perceived that the Lord was calling the boy. Therefore 
Eli said to Samuel, “Go, lie down; and if he calls you, you 
shall say, ‘Speak, Lord, for your servant is listening.’ ” So 
Samuel went and lay down in his place. 
 
Now the Lord came and stood there, calling as before, 
“Samuel! Samuel!” And Samuel said, “Speak, for your 
servant is listening.” [Then the Lord said to Samuel, “See, I 
am about to do something in Israel that will make both ears 
of anyone who hears of it tingle. On that day I will fulfill 
against Eli all that I have spoken concerning his house, 
from beginning to end. For I have told him that I am about 
to punish his house forever, for the iniquity that he knew, 
because his sons were blaspheming God, and he did not 
restrain them. Therefore, I swear to the house of Eli that 
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the iniquity of Eli’s house shall not be expiated by sacrifice 
or offering forever.”  
 
Samuel lay there until morning; then he opened the doors 
of the house of the Lord. Samuel was afraid to tell the 
vision to Eli. But Eli called Samuel and said, “Samuel, my 
son.” He said, “Here I am.” Eli said, “What was it that he 
told you? Do not hide it from me. May God do so to you 
and more also, if you hide anything from me of all that he 
told you.” So Samuel told him everything and hid nothing 
from him. Then he said, “It is the Lord; let him do what 
seems good to him.” 
 
As Samuel grew up, the Lord was with him and let none of 
his words fall to the ground. And all Israel from Dan to 
Beer-sheba knew that Samuel was a trustworthy prophet of 
the Lord.] 
 
PSALM 139: Filling Me with Joy 
 
SECOND READING: 1 Corinthians 6:12-20 
“All things are lawful for me,” but not all things are 
beneficial. “All things are lawful for me,” but I will not be 
dominated by anything. “Food is meant for the stomach 
and the stomach for food,” and God will destroy both one 
and the other. The body is meant not for fornication but for 
the Lord, and the Lord for the body. And God raised the 
Lord and will also raise us by his power. Do you not know 
that your bodies are members of Christ? Should I therefore 
take the members of Christ and make them members of a 
prostitute? Never! Do you not know that whoever is united 
to a prostitute becomes one body with her? For it is said, 
“The two shall be one flesh.” But anyone united to the Lord 
becomes one spirit with him. Shun fornication! Every sin 
that a person commits is outside the body; but the 

fornicator sins against the body itself. Or do you not know 
that your body is a temple of the Holy Spirit within you, 
which you have from God, and that you are not your own? 
For you were bought with a price; therefore glorify God in 
your body. 
 
CHILDREN’S MESSAGE Summer Markham 
 
GOSPEL ACCLAMATION  
 
GOSPEL: John 1:43-51 
The next day Jesus decided to go to Galilee. He found 
Philip and said to him, “Follow me.” Now Philip was from 
Bethsaida, the city of Andrew and Peter. Philip found 
Nathanael and said to him, “We have found him about 
whom Moses in the law and also the prophets wrote, Jesus 
son of Joseph from Nazareth.” Nathanael said to him, “Can 
anything good come out of Nazareth?” Philip said to him, 
“Come and see.” When Jesus saw Nathanael coming 
toward him, he said of him, “Here is truly an Israelite in 
whom there is no deceit!” Nathanael asked him, “Where 
did you get to know me?” Jesus answered, “I saw you 
under the fig tree before Philip called you.” Nathanael 
replied, “Rabbi, you are the Son of God! You are the King 
of Israel!” Jesus answered, “Do you believe because I told 
you that I saw you under the fig tree? You will see greater 
things than these.” And he said to him, “Very truly, I tell 
you, you will see heaven opened and the angels of God 
ascending and descending upon the Son of Man.” 
 
SERMON             Pastor Jackie Cook 
 
HYMN OF THE DAY  I Want to Walk as a Child of the 
Light- Led by Gary F. & Mark Gould       ELW # 815 
  



BAPTISM 
 
PRAYERS OF INTERCESSION 
 
PEACE  
 
OFFERING 
 
OFFERTORY PRAYER 
 
GREAT THANKSGIVING 
 
PREFACE 
 
WORDS OF INSTITUTION 
 
LORDS PRAYER 
 
INVITATION TO COMMUNION 
 
LAMB OF GOD  
 
TABLE BLESSING 
 
PRAYER AFTER COMMUNION 
 
BLESSING 
 
SENDING SONG      Be Thou My Vision  
Led by Gary and Mark       ELW # 793 VS. 1&3 
 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 
 
DISMISSAL 
 

POSTLUDE        Fugue in F 
-organist: Mark Gould by D. Buxtehude 
 


