From: Alyson E @yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 2, 2020 1:19 PM

To: Chevis Trotter <ctrotter@amarlawgrp.com>

Subject: Re: Settlement Check & Feedback

Hi there, and Happy New Year!

We did receive it, on New Years Eve and | planned on writing you today to let you know. Thank you and the firm so
much! Michael was great and made this process so stress free for us. | will happily leave you guys a review!!! Have a
great year!

Thank you, thank you!

Alyson

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone
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From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Michael,

Justin K @gmail.com>
Wednesday, January 8, 2020 3:01 PM

Michael

Heather MR K ben@benjaminybarralaw.com

Re: Offer From
LR_200107.PDF

Attached is the signed document. Thanks again for your work on this. It's greatly appreciated.

Note — | have NOT sent this directly to them. I was assuming you’d want this to come from your firm. If not, let me know

and I'll send this letter directly to

Thanks again,

Justin

OnJan 7, 2020, at 12:33 PM, Michael Goodman <mgoodman@amarlawgrp.com> wrote:

Justin and Heather,

Please see the attached. I will call you soon to discuss.

Best,

Michael J. Goodman, Esq.

<image001.png>

866-904-AMAR (2627)

866-226-1333 fax

mgoodman(@amarlawgrp.com

please note that our headquarters address is changing December 1, 2019 to 7001 North Scottsdale
Road, Suite 2060 Scottsdale, AZ 85253. Please have all correspondence and settlement checks sent to
this new address starting December 1°.

<Lettersi.pdf>
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From: Steve K ’ @gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 7:01 PM

To: Michael Goodman

Subject: Re: Surrender Date with

Attachments: image001.png

Hey Michael,

has paid off the loan and | received all the checks from all the services that could be cancelled. About $3500. This
should be everything! Thank you so much for all your help with this matter!

Thank you again!!
Steve

On Tue, Dec 31, 2019, 3:36 PM Michael Goodman <mgoodman@amarlawgrp.com> wrote:

Hey Steve,

{ am back in the office and saw your email. Give me a call when you have time to discuss.

Sincerely,

Michael J. Goodman, Esq.

[El—

866-904-AMAR (2627)

866-226-1333 fax

mgoodman@amarlawgrp.com

Please note that our headquarters address is changing December 1, 2019 to 7001 North Scottsdale Road, Suite 2060

Scottsdale, AZ 85253. Please have all correspondence and settlement checks sent to this new address starting
December 1°.



Derek

1pscoelectric.com

1/21/20

RE:
Robert Katz

Emily Bingham

Dear AMAR LAW GROUP:

| am writing you this long overdue letter of gratitude from my family and I. Amar law group in my
opinion went far above and beyond any expectation that | had to get a fair settlement for our boat. In
our case we purchased a brand-new boat and had nothing but problems with it. We spent over a year
with the manufacture trying to get warranty items fixed on our boat with no progress. Most times when
you buy a new vehicle once you sign the papers and are out the door you are on your own even with a
factor warranty. It got to the point where we could not use our boat and every time the factory “fixed” it
we had the same result. The summers in Washington state are about three months long and we couldn’t
use our boat. | wasn’t sure what to do we had a brand-new boat that the factory couldn’t fix, and the
factory said we couldn’t use the boat until it was fixed, or it would void the warranty. In comes Amar law
group, they got the factory to ok us using our boat while we worked out a settlement and if anything
were to break on the boat the factory would cover it under warranty. Henry and Emily were with me
every step of the way, they answered every question | had and every time | called them, they answered,
no voicemail or automated phone system they answered every time. Every time I called Henry or Emily,
they knew exactly who | was and would give me updates on how our case was going. Amar law group
was able to negotiate with the factory and didn’t get them to fix our boat they got them to trade us for a
brand new one at no cost to us. It was a horrible experience for us but without Amar law group, Henry
and Emily I'm not sure where we would be today. Thank you, Amar law group, Henry, Emily, Robert and
all the people behind the scenes that got the job done for us.

Respectably,

Derek A
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From: Lizzy M @gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, January 31, 2020 11:57 AM

To: Michael Goodman

Subject: Re: Release from

Attachments: image001.png

Thank you for everything you have done. You're greatly appreciated and | hope you have a great weekend!.

On Thuy, Jan 30, 2020, 8:33 AM Michael Goodman <mgoodman@amarlawgrp.com> wrote:

| have confirmation the check is in the mail to us. We will let you know as soon as it arrives.

Best,

Michael J. Goodman, Esg.

[El—

866-904-AMAR (2627)
866-226-1333 fax

mgoodman@amarlawgrp.com

From: Lizzy M Dgmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2020 10:07 AM

To: Michael Goodman <mgoodman@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Release from

Hi Michael,

Thank you for getting back to me so quickly. | appreciate everything you have done for me and continue to do.

Thank you for your time.



Attachments: scan0014.pdf

From: Curt E © @gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 4, 2020 12:03 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Cc: Emily Bingham <ebingham@amarlawgrp.com>

Subject: Re: One last thing

Here you go Henry.
Once again thanks for staying on top of this for me

Curt



From: Teresa H' Dgmail.com>
Sent: Monday, February 10, 2020 9:24 AM

To: Michael Goodman

Subject: Re:

Thank you for the update. | appreciate everything you have done. Have a great week. Regards, Teresa

On Mon, Feb 10, 2020 at 8:52 AM Michael Goodman <mgoodman@amarlawgrp.com> wrote:

Received the release, sending it in now. We will let you know as soon as we receive the check.
‘ Best,

' Michael J. Goodman, Esq.
R ST

© 866-904-AMAR (2627)

| 866-226-1333 fax

- mgoodman(@amarlawgrp.com



From: Larry Ki @gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, February 10, 2020 6:04 PM
To: Michael Goodman

Subject: Re: Larry K

Michael,

Thank you for your work and the clarification.

| appreciate your work.

Larry

On Feb 10, 2020, at 11:20 AM, Michael Goodman <mgoodman@amarlawgrp.com> wrote:

Hi Larry,

Nothing was attached here. Could you please resend?

Sincerely,

Michael J. Goodman, Esq.
<image001.png>
866-904-AMAR (2627)
866-226-1333 fax
mgoodman@amarlawgrp.com

From: Larry Ki @gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, February 10, 2020 11:50 AM

To: Emily Bingham <ebingham @amarlawgrp.com>; Michael Goodman <mgoodman@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Larry K

Good morning Michael,
Thank you for your call regarding the
| have attached three documents to this email and will send you the back of the title this afternoon.



From: jason s jjasonasierras@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, February 21, 2020 12:28 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Surrender appointment '

We finished the paperwork and have the new . We also wanted to say thank you for all of the effort you put in
to help us get this resolved. We can’t thank you enough.
Thank you so much we are super excited to be in a vehicle that works.

Jason and Heather

Sent from my iPhone



From: Sidney H

Sent: Monday, February 24, 2020 8:25 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>; Robert Katz (rob@robkatzlaw.com)
<rob@robkatzlaw.com>

Cc: Chevis Trotter <ctrotter@amarlawgrp.com>; amar_law_group@birdeye.com

Subject: FW: [EXTERNAL] Reminder: Follow Up from Amar Law Group Regarding Your Settlement

Good morning All,

I just sent in my reviews. Of course they were all 5 star ratings! Just a heads up | got my check from "and
deposited it. The funds are still on hold but | don’t suspect we will have an issue. THANK YOU SO MUCH! | wish you all
nothing but happiness and success! Have a good day!

“Success is not final, failure is not fatal: it is the courage to continue that counts.”
Winston Churchill

Sidney H



From: Don C ‘ . @gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 12:41 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Settlement process

Henry,
Happy to hear that this will be completed in a short period of time. Coincidentally, | have already thought of
giving you an excellent review. You have been prompt in your replies and seem to have taken care of all of our

concerns. As soon as we have the check in hand and this is a done deal, you will receive a magnificent review.

Don



From: Will | _ @gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 1, 2020 12:55 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>

Cc: ben@benjaminybarralaw.com; Emily Bingham <ebingham@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Settlement agreement

Signed. Thank you Henry and team for your help with this.

Will |



From: Dean Wi Qtallamond.com>

Sent: Monday, April 13,2020 10:16 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Surrender

Henry

I just finished the 5 stars comment over google research. It's what I want to say.
Thank you !



From: ~@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 16, 2020 8:59 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Settlement agreement

Great! Thank you for your help.
Stay well.

Sent from my iPhone. Voice-dictated, so please
forgive any errors, auto correct can be so embarrassing!
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From: ' @yahoo.com

Sent: Monday, March 23, 2020 2:10 PM
To: Michael Goodman

Subject: Dude!

| just got the check. Thank you keeping me posted during the process and prompt answers to my questions. |
just posted my Google review.

Jack



From:. -@comcast.net <lpturner@comcast.net>

Sent: Tuesday, May 19, 2020 1:40 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Cc: Vivian Alger <valger@amarlawgrp.com>

Subject: Re: Settlement process

Hi Henry,

Thank you for all your help in negotiating a great settlement! | knew from our first conversation you would be a
competent attorney but, you have truly exceeded my expectations! Thank you for advocating for me. Thank you for
serving our country and serving me as your client!

Gratefully,

Lisa

Sent from my iPhone



-

From: Codie P  <codiepitts@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, May 26, 2020 10:51 AM
To: Chevis Trotter

Subject: Re: FW: Amar Law Group -

Hello,

The check was received this morning! Thank you for all the help!

Thank you,
Codie P

On Tue, May 26, 2020 at 12:44 PM Chevis Trotter <ctrotter@amarlawgrp.com> wrote:

- Hello!
Please see tracking information below for your settlement check. Please let us know once it has been received.

Also, be on the lookout for a link to send feedback regarding your experience with the firm, it would be greatly
- appreciated!

. Warmest Regards,
Chevis Trotter

. A
: \ .
2 G

ctrotter@amarlawgrp.com

R

bR

A
v
O U Poeuc

Office:866-904-AMAR(2627)

Fax: 866-226-1333

; This message is confidential and may contain sensitive and private privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, or if you

believe you have received this message in error, please notify me immediately by reply e-mail. Please keep the contents confidential and
' delete the message and any attachments from your system.



--—-Original Message-—

From: Brad B @gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 27, 2020 8:35 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Cc: Vivian Alger <valger@amarlawgrp.com>

Subject: Re: 2020 .Surrender

Hello Henry,
Thank you so much to you and the entire team at Amar Law Group! You exceeded our expectations and were
very timely and helpful through the entire process! We wish you and your team good luck in the future.

Thanks again!

Very Respectfully,
Bradley B



From: Dawn @gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, July 20, 2020 1:41 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Settlement agreement

Hi Henry,

Document is signed.

Thank you again for all your help with this.

Thank you,

Dawn & Eddie W



From: Kyle J ..otmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 18, 2020 2:58 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen

Subject: 1loan

Just want to let you know that my account finally shows paid off. Thank you for your help.

Kyle J:

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone



From: Brandon M: @gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 18, 2020 5:58 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarfawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Settlement process

You have done a great job. My address has changed since | started working with you. Who do [ need to contact to give
my updated mailing address to?



From: ' gmail.com>

Sent: ~ Thursday, September 10, 2020 7:41 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen; Amar Law Group Documents
Subject: Check

Hello,

| have received the settlement check and are letting you know as requested. Thank you for your help and time.
Sincerely,

Angela T



From: 1@aol.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 15, 2020 1:54 PM

To: Michelle Milan <mmilan@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Amar Law Group ~

The check just arrived about an hour ago. 6 days, not bad for
overnight mail. USPS is a mess for sure. Anyway, thanks for getting
this done for me. Great job Henry.

Gordon T
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Attachments: image001.png

From: Ken J <ghsffakjohnson@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2020 11:58 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Settlement agreement for your signature

Nice meeting you and thank you for the work and success. 1sent a copy of the signed



From: James R dgmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2020 11:04 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>

Cc: Robert Katz (rob@robkatzlaw.com) <rob@robkatzlaw.com>; Vivian Alger <valger@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Settlement process

Henry,
Nothing but praise for every step during this process. You and your team were exceptional. Thank you



From: Sarah Gi @yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 29, 2020 11:10 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@katzandamar.com>

Cc: 'Robert Katz (rob@robkatzlaw.com)' <rob@robkatzlaw.com>

Subject: Re: Lender-Lessor Info Request Form

Hello Henry,

| am confirming receipt of the settlement and closing letter from your firm.
Thank you for your help in resolving the issue with

Regards,

Sarah



From: laura j @yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 1, 2020 10:54 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen @amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Surrender guidelines. Appt Set

Everything went great...signed the papers, received the check.



From: @yahoo.com - @yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, October 16, 2020 8:19 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Cc: Vivian Alger <valger@amarlawgrp.com>

Subject: RE: Settlement process

Henry,

Thank you for all the help and you did a great job of keeping me informed thru out. Glad | was able to recoup my cost
on a beautiful car that | no longer found pleasurable to drive for fear of breaking down yet again.

Kind regards,

Cindy D



From: Renee M ®@drreneemiller.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 27, 2020 12:37 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Settlement process

Hi Henry,

Thanks so much for your assistance in this matter!

3% Life is a journey...make it count! 3%

ReneeM , PsyD

Sent from my iPhone
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From: Daniel Neisess

Sent: Friday, October 30, 2020 4:07 PM
To: Shalev Amar

Cc: Emily Bingham

Subject: FW: thank youl!

From: Anthony D 1@hawaii.edu>
Sent: Tuesday, October 27, 2020 5:48 PM
To: Daniel Neisess <dneisess@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: thank you!!

Hi Dan,
just wanted to thank you for all you did for me. | couldnt have had a better experience with you, and the outcome was
exactly what | was hoping for. can't thank you enough. | will leave a google review!!

take care,
anthony d



To: ) Henry Vorderbruggen; vic It
Subject: RE: Please contact us regarding payment

From: & ’ @gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, October 31, 2020 6:45 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>; vic | @gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Please contact us regarding payment

Hi Henry,

Thank you for the good news! We are very happy and appreciate all your efforts. Thank you so much.
We would like you to send the check to us to Israel. The whole amount ( BE

Our mail address:

Ori A

Netanya
Israel

Vig,
Please confirm this email as well.

Thank you all,
Ori and Ayelet
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From: Graham S . @gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, October 31, 2020 2:48 AM

To: Michelle Milan

Cc: Henry Vorderbruggen; Vivian Alger

Subject: Re: FW: Amar Law Group - Tracking Info

The check has been received. Thanks.

Henry - Thanks for everything on this. 1turned the 'in Monday. It feels good to be done with everything. Please
thank Shalev as well.

On Fri, Oct 23, 2020 at 3:51 PM Michelle Milan <mmilan@amarlawgrp.com> wrote:

Hello Graham,
Your settlement check has been placed in the mail. Please see tracking information below and let us know when it is received.

Thank you!

Warmest Regards,

Wichelle Wilan

A M AR
L oA W
A S B O U P

¢ mmilan@amarlawgrp.com

Office:866-904-AMAR(2627)

~ Fax: 866-226-1333

This message fs confidential and may contain sensitive and private privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, or if you believe you

have received this message in error, please notify me immediately by reply e-mail. Please keep the contents confidential and delete the message and
any attachments from your system.
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Subject: Settlement process

From: Heidi D @gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, November 2, 2020 11:42 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Cc: Robert Katz (rob@robkatzlaw.com) <rob@robkatzlaw.com>
Subject: Re: Settlement process

Thank you so much! | really do appreciate all you have done!



Attachments: Image (2).jpg; Image jpg

From: Ewing F @pinnrehab.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 5, 2020 3:28 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Cc: ¢ @comcast.net

Subject: General Release Form

Thank you for all your work, Henry. Have a great day.



--—--Original Message-—-

From: Warda B @yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 10, 2020 12:02 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Settlement process

Thank u so much for ur help @

Sent from my iPhone



From: Daniel C @countryfinancial.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 19, 2020 9:51 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: RE: Repurchase

Here you go! Thanks for all that you did [ appreciate it.

Daniel



From:Janelle M @gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 19, 2020 8:45 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>

Cc: ben@benjaminybarralaw.com; Vivian Alger <valger@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: Settlement process

The original signed copy is in the mailbox ready to be picked up. it is addressed to Henry. Thank you all for your help
through this process. | really appreciate Your time, honesty, straightforwardness, and timely responses to all my

questions. Look forward to hearing from someone soon.

-Janelle

Sent from my iPhone



From: Jason R ‘ Ymac.com>

Sent: Friday, November 20, 2020 1:23 PM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>

Cc: @me.com>; Robert Katz (rob@robkatzlaw.com) <rob@robkatzlaw.com>; Vivian Alger
<valger@amarlawgrp.com>

Subject: Re: Settlement process

Henry,

Thank you and everyone on your end for all of your efforts and diligence on this! We realize that the pandemic made
this whole process way more work and hassle than normal We are extremely grateful you did not take a low-ball “final
offer’ from as final and persevered until you convinced them of the merits of our case.

As discussed on the phone, we realize didn’t become a multi-billion dollar corporation by rushing checks to
customers with defective vehicles, so we’re very patient and will wait until we hear back from someone there.

You exceeded our expectations, so we are very happy and extremely satisfied with your representation and work!

Thank you again!
Jason & Yana R

@mac.com

Sent from my iPhone



From: Raul W <westonrk@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 2, 2020 8:35 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Subject: Re: End of representation

Thank you so much for everything!

We got the boat "fixed" from . That allowed me to sell the boat. | wouldn't feel right about selling the boat in its
previous condition. The gentleman wanted the boat as a Christmas gift for his family.

So | see this as a huge win, with you guys providing a bunch of help. So thank you.

Raul



Subject: Settlement process

From: Chase C . @gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 9, 2020 8:41 AM

To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>
Cc: Robert Katz (rob@robkatzlaw.com) <rob@robkatzlaw.com>; Vivian Alger <valger@amarlawgrp.com>

Subject: Re: Settlement process

Great, thank you so much!



From: Clay F -~ Dyahoo.com>
Sent: Friday, December 11, 2020 8:21 AM
To: Henry Vorderbruggen <hvorderbruggen@amarlawgrp.com>

Subject: Re: Settlement process

You were awesome,AHenry! 1 so appreciate all you did to facilitate this! Thank you and Happy Holidays!

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android




