
Kansas Association of Taxidermists 
Brian Sigman’s Shop, Wichita, KS 

Business Meeting 
12 Oct 2019 

 
The meeting was called to order at 10:12 A.M. by President Wes Becker with 8 Members 
Present.  
 
The meeting agenda and minutes of the past meeting were passed out, Brian Sigman motioned to 
accept them, Jerry Kissenger seconds, both approved 
 
Brian Sigman passed out copies of the Treasures Report. Current amount is $22,062.56. $750 
will be paid to Rick Krane for Tim Stidham’s scholarship 
 
Old Business: 
 
Awards chair was discussed by Wes Becker. Dave Salenke and Bryan Glaser volunteered and 
will be heading up the awards 
 
IRS- No more than $600 is owed to get on good side. Brian Sigman just has to send in that we 
don’t make more than $25,000 each year. 
 
Money Market discussed by Wes Becker. Need to get with Tim Stidham. Brian Sigman will be 
talking to the bank. Clint Bowman motioned to move $10,000 over to money market. Bryan 
Glaser 2nd. Approved 
 
Award for Masters- Wes Becker discussed changing the Masters award to a belt buckle. They 
cost between $100-$120 per buckle. Clint Bowman motioned to get them. Brian Sigman 2nd. 
Approved 
 
New Business: 
 
Matuska had called about the Professional competitors award. Brian Sigman motioned to get the 
award this year. Clint Bowman 2nd, Approved 
 
Hotel- Bryan Glaser discussed menu. Tabled to the Jan Meeting 
 
Next Meeting will be Jan 5th at 10 am. Held at Brian Sigman’s shop. Back up date of Jan 12th. 
 
Showroom was discussed by Wes Becker. Have tables and walls around the edge. Have tables 
along the back 2 walls. Will be discussed Jan Meeting 
 
Looking for volunteers for working the show room 
 
Money for awards discussed by Wes Becker. Allocate money tabled to Jan Meeting 
 



Scholarship was discussed by Wes Becker. He is proposing to get rid of the scholarship to use 
the money towards a seminar for everyone. After more discussion, it was tabled for Jan Meeting 
 
Vendors- discussed by Wes Becker. Bryan Glaser will be looking into vendors for the show 
 
Donations- Brian Sigman will handle the donations for the show 
 
Looking for members to donate their time for the auction 
 
Judges- Wes Becker will contact the judges for this years show. Chris Hinshaw will be 
contacting potential judges for the 2021 and 2022 shows in Manhattan. $1,000 for each judge 
and a banquet ticket.  
 
President Challenge was discussed by Wes Becker. Chris Hinshaw motioned to do away with the 
$100 dollar award but to keep the plaque. Due to low numbers, it was costing the association 
money each year. Brain Sigman 2nd, motion approved. 
 
UTA- Discussed by Wes Becker. Tim Stidham had asked to use our backboards for the UTA 
show in Wichita. Approved. 
UTA offered for Kansas to pay for all Active members to be UTA members at a rate of $10 per 
member. Brian Sigman motioned to approve, Bryan Glaser 2nd, approved 
 
Mounts being brought in on Thursday discussed by Wes Becker. Bryan Glaser will talk with the 
hotel to see if we can get the vendor room and lock it up. No mounts to enter the show room until 
Friday morning after checking in.  
 
Brian Sigman brought up getting the wood supplier for the show. Get with Brian if you ant him 
to do work for you, not expensive. 
 
Chris Hinshaw motioned to adjourn meeting. Jerry Kissenger 2nd, meeting Adjourned at 11:23 
A.M. 
 
Members present: Clint Bowman, Dave Selenke, Brian Sigman, Jeff Rush, Bryan Glaser, Jerry 
Kissenger, Wes Becker, and Chris Hinshaw 
 
 
  


