
A.E.F.T. GAMING TERMS AND CONDITIONS  
 

These Terms and Conditions (as defined below) apply to all 
ADVANCE EVOLUTION FUTURE TREND GAMING (A.E.F.T. GAMING) 
products, services and website collectively known as its “Platform”, 
including but not limited to its membership programs, contests, website, 
products, with all information, tools and services available from this site to 
you, the user, conditioned upon your acceptance of all terms, conditions, 
policies and notices stated here. Your use of the “Platform” constitutes your 
agreement to all such Terms and Conditions. Products refers to any 
products the “Platform” has offered for sale to end users.  These Terms 
and Conditions apply to all users of the “Platform”, including without 
limitation users who are browsers, vendors, customers, merchants, and/ or 
contributors of content.  By visiting our “Platform” and/ or purchasing any 
products from us, you engage in our “Platform” and agree to be bound by 
the following Terms and Conditions. Any new features or tools which are 
added to the “Platform” shall also be subject to the Terms and Conditions. 
You can review the most current version of the Terms and Conditions at 
any time on this page. We reserve the right to update, change or replace 
any part of these Terms and Conditions by posting updates and/or changes 
to our “Platform” within a reasonable time period. It is your responsibility to 
check this page periodically for changes. Your continued use of or access 
to the “Platform” following the posting of any changes constitutes 
acceptance of those changes.  
 

If you do not agree to these Terms and Conditions, you should not 
use our services.   
 

Acceptance of these Terms and Conditions creates a binding 
agreement between the “Platform” and all users as defined above. This 
agreement begins with the first of these two (2) events to occur; the date 
you first use the “Platform” or access the “Platform”.  The agreement ends 
upon termination of your subscription or resolution of any unresolved 
dispute, whichever event occurs last in time. 22. 

 
 
 
 
 



TERMS AND CONDITIONS 
 
1.  You agree to the “Platform’s” guidelines when accessing “Platform” 
services and/or purchasing its products as well as to follow the “Platform’s” 
guidelines for its gaming communities.  
 
2. The “Platform” will not discriminate against users on the basis of race, 
color, nationality, gender identity, sexual orientation, religious affiliation, 
veteran status, or any other protected characteristic. 
 
3. The material on the “Platform” is provided for general information only 
and should not be relied upon or used as the sole basis for making 
decisions without consulting primary, more accurate, more complete or 
more timely sources of information. 
 
4.   In addition to agreeing to the “Platform’s” Privacy Policy, you agree 
that your content (except for payment information), may be transferred 
unencrypted and involve (a) transmissions over various networks; and (b) 
changes to conform and adapt to technical requirements of connecting 
networks or devices.  

 
Credit card information is encrypted during transfer over networks.  

 
5.   You are agreeing not to reproduce, duplicate, copy, sell, or resell any 
service or “Platform” product, or exploit any portion or use of the “Platform.” 
 
6. Your agreement herein, expressly acknowledges that you have 
consented to, are eligible for and are abiding by, the latest published 
Terms of Services and or Terms and Conditions for all the underlying 
third-party services (i.e., the mobile game the A.E.F.T. Gaming 
community plays) that each third-party service requires for use of its 
services and/or products. 
 
 7.  In addition to agreeing to the “Platform’s” Refund Policy, you agree 
that the “Platform” has the right to limit the quantities of any products or 
services that the “Platform” offers, at the sole discretion of the “Platform”. 
The “Platform” will strive to provide notice of changes in our 
services/products, yet our services/products or pricing are subject to 
change or cancelation at any time without advanced notice.  Such 
modifications or deletions shall not constitute a liability for the “Platform”.  



 
8. THE “PLATFORM’S’ PRODUCTS ARE PROVIDED ON AN “AS IS” 
BASIS, BY USING THE SERVICES YOU SPECIFICALLY 
ACKNOWLEDGE AND WAIVE ANY CLAIM FOR FRUSTRATION OF 
PURPOSE, MUTUAL MISTAKE, UNILATERAL MISTAKE, 
IMPOSSIBILITY, AND YOU FURTHER ACKNOWLEDGE AND ACCEPT 
THE PRODUCT WITH ALL FAULTS AND WITHOUT ANY WARRANTIES, 
REPRESENTATIONS OR GUARANTEES EITHER EXPRESS OR 
IMPLIED OF ANY KIND NATURE OR TYPE WHATSOEVER, TO THE 
EXTENT PERMITTED BY LAW, SUBJECT TO THE WARRANTIES SET 
FORTH HEREIN..  
 

The limitations and exclusions of liability set out in this paragraph and 
elsewhere in these Terms and Conditions: (a) are subject to the preceding 
paragraph; and (b) govern all liabilities arising under the disclaimer or in 
relation to the subject matter of this disclaimer, including liabilities arising in 
contract, in tort (including negligence) and for breach of statutory duty.  
 
 
9. DISPUTES AND ARBITRATION 
 

Any dispute shall be communicated in a dated writing, along with the 
sender’s updated address, email and mobile number to the following email 
address; support@aeftgaming.com.  The “Platform” shall respond to a 
dated written communication within a reasonable period of time. 
 

The parties shall attempt to resolve all disputes, controversies, or 
claims arising under, out of, or relating to these Terms and Conditions, 
including the formation, validity, binding effect, interpretation, performance, 
breach or termination of relationship and the arbitrability of the issues 
submitted to arbitration hereunder and non-contractual claims relating to 
these Terms and Conditions (each, a “dispute”) in accordance with the 
procedures in the section. If any dispute cannot be resolved through 
negotiation between the parties, such dispute shall be submitted and 
settled through binding arbitration under the rules of the American 
Arbitration Association in effect. 
 
10. DISCLAIMER 
 



TO THE MAXIMUM EXTENT PERMITTED BY LAW: THE 
“PLATFORMS’S” SERVICES/PRODUCTS ARE PROVIDED “AS IS” AND 
USED AT YOUR SOLE DISCRETION WITH NO WARRANTIES 
WHATSOEVER.  THE “PLATFORM” WILL PROVIDE THE 
SERVICES/PRODUCTS WITH REASONABLE CARE AND SKILL, BUT 
DOES NOT MAKE ANY OTHER PROMISES OR WARRANTIES ABOUT 
ITS SERVICES/PRODUCTS AND IN PARTICULAR DOES NOT 
WARRANT, CLAIM OR REPRESENT AND EXPRESSLY DISCLAIMS ALL 
SUCH WARRATIES OF ANY KIND, WHETHER EXPRESS, IMPLIED OR 
STATUTORY, WITH RESPECT TO THE SERVICES/PRODUCTS, 
INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, WARRANTIES OR CONDITIONS 
OF QUALITY, PERFORMANCE, ON-INFRINGEMENT, 
MERCHANTABILITY, OR FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE.  
THE PLATFORM FURTHER DOES NOT REPRESENT OR WARRANT 
THAT THE SERVICES WILL ALWAYS BE AVAILABLE, ACCESSIBLE, 
UNINTERRUPTED, TIMELY, SECURE, ACCURATE, COMPLETE AND 
ERROR-FREE OR WILL OPERATION WITHOUT LOSS. 
 
 
 
 


