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The Certified Technical Aerospace Consultant (CTAC) Handbook is a comprehensive guide designed to
provide individuals with a detailed understanding of the CTAC certification program. This handbook covers all

the essential aspects of the CTAC program, including the certification process, exam administration,
recertification requirements, sample exam questions, and answers to frequently asked questions.

 
Within this handbook, aspiring CTAC candidates will find a thorough explanation of the certification process,

including information about the written exam, the point system based on qualifications and experience, and the
oral exam. Detailed guidelines and instructions are provided to ensure candidates have a clear understanding

of the requirements and expectations throughout the certification journey.
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CTAC Description: 
 
Certified Technical Aerospace Consultant (CTAC) is 
a prestigious certification awarded to individuals who 
have demonstrated exceptional knowledge, 
expertise, and experience in Aviation technologies. 
CTAC professionals serve as trusted advisors and 
consultants, providing valuable technical guidance 
and support to organizations and clients in the 
Aviation industry. 

The CTAC certification signifies a high level of 
proficiency in various aspects of Aviation 
technologies, including aircraft systems, avionics, 
propulsion systems, materials, and manufacturing 
processes. Certified individuals have demonstrated a 
deep understanding of these critical areas and 
possess the ability to analyze complex technical 
challenges, offer innovative solutions, and provide 
expert advice to clients. 

CTAC professionals are well-versed in the latest 
industry standards, regulations, and best practices. 
They have a comprehensive understanding of 
relevant Aviation regulations established by 
authorities such as the Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA) and European Union Aviation 
Safety Agency (EASA). This knowledge ensures that 
their consulting services align with safety 
requirements, regulatory compliance, and industry 
norms. 

The role of a CTAC extends beyond theoretical 
knowledge. These professionals possess practical 
experience in the Aviation field, gained through years 
of hands-on work in maintenance, engineering, or 
related roles. Their experience enables them to bring 
real-world insights, problem-solving abilities, and a 
deep understanding of industry challenges to their 
consulting engagements. 

CTAC consultants are effective communicators, able 
to bridge the gap between technical complexities and 
non-technical stakeholders. They possess excellent 
interpersonal skills and can convey complex 
concepts in a clear and concise manner, making 
them valuable assets in client interactions, project 
management, and team collaboration. 

To achieve the CTAC certification, candidates 
undergo a rigorous evaluation process, including a  

written exam, a point system based on other 
certifications and experience, and an oral exam. This 
ensures that certified professionals meet the high 
standards set by the certifying body and possess the 
necessary qualifications to excel in the role of an 
Technical Aerospace consultant. 

Organizations and clients seeking expert technical 
advice and consultation in the Aviation industry can 
trust CTAC professionals to provide them with 
informed, reliable, and innovative solutions. The 
CTAC certification serves as a mark of distinction, 
signifying a consultant's competence, 
professionalism, and dedication to excellence in 
Aviation technologies. 

In summary, the Certified Technical Aerospace 
Consultant (CTAC) certification represents the 
pinnacle of expertise and knowledge in Aviation 
technologies. CTAC professionals are trusted 
advisors who bring deep technical insights, practical 
experience, and exceptional problem-solving skills to 
support and guide organizations in the dynamic and 
complex Aviation industry. 
 

Certification Criteria: 
 
The certification process for the Certified Technical 
Aerospace Consultant (CTAC) involves a thorough 
evaluation of candidates' knowledge, experience, 
and skills in aerospace technologies. It consists of 
three main components: a written exam, a point 
system based on other certifications and experience, 
and an oral exam. Here's a summary of the 
certification process:  

Written Exam: 

Candidates are required to take a comprehensive 
written exam that covers various aspects of 
aerospace technologies. The exam includes 
multiple-choice, true/false, and short-answer 
questions, assessing candidates' understanding of 
aircraft systems, avionics, propulsion systems, 
materials, and manufacturing processes. The written 
exam aims to evaluate candidates' theoretical 
knowledge and comprehension of key concepts. 

Point System:In addition to the written exam, a 
point system is employed to consider candidates' 
other certifications and experience. The point system 
takes into account  
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qualifications such as attendance at a FAR 147 
school, possession of an 
Associates/Bachelors/Masters degree, Airframe and 
Powerplant License, Inspection Authorization, FCC 
GROL (General Radiotelephone Operator License), 
NCATT (National Center for Aerospace & 
Transportation Technologies) AET (Aircraft 
Electronics Technician) certification, NCATT FOD 
(Foreign Object Damage) certification, and years of 
experience in relevant aerospace fields. Each 
qualification earns candidates a certain number of 
points, reflecting their expertise and educational 
background. 

 

The point system for the Certified Technical 
Aerospace Consultant (CTAC) certification, 
considering various qualifications and experience 
levels: 

Attendance at FAR 147 School: 

Completion of a recognized FAR 147 school: 5 
points 
 
Education: 

Associates Degree in Aviation Technology or related 
field: 5 points 

Bachelor's Degree in Aviation Engineering or related 
field: 10 points 

Master's Degree in Aviation Science or related field: 
15 points 
 
NOTE: Education points are not cumulative 
 
Professional Certifications: 

Airframe and Powerplant (A&P) License: 5 points 

Inspection Authorization (IA): 10 points 

FCC General Radiotelephone Operator License 
(GROL): 5 points 

NCATT AET (Aircraft Electronics Technician) 
certification: 10 points 

Any other  NCATT certification or Endorsement: 5 
points 

 

Experience: 

Years of experience in Aviation maintenance, 
engineering, or related roles: 

Less than 2 years: 5 points 

2 to 5 years: 10 points 

6 to 10 years: 15 points 

11 or more years: 20 points 
 

Candidates can accumulate points based on their 
qualifications and experience. The total points 
earned by each candidate will provide an indication 
of their expertise and knowledge in Aviation 
technologies. The points system allows for a 
balanced assessment, considering both formal 
education and practical experience.  
 
There will be an opportunity to submit other 
Certification for consideration to the points system. 
Non-aerospace business certifications will be 
considered for credit  
 
A Total of 50 points or higher is required to take the 
written Examination.  

Oral Exam: 

The final stage of the certification process involves 
an oral exam. Candidates are interviewed by a panel 
of industry experts who assess their communication 
skills, problem-solving abilities, and overall suitability 
for the role of a technical consultant. The oral exam 
allows candidates to demonstrate their practical 
knowledge, critical thinking, and ability to apply their 
expertise to real-world scenarios. 
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CTAC Proficency:  
 
The Certified Technical Aerospace Consultant 
(CTAC) will demonstrate proficiency in seven key 
areas of business. Here are the identified areas: 
 
1) Key Performance Indicators (KPIs) Management: 

 Understanding and implementing relevant 
KPIs to measure and monitor performance 

 Analyzing KPI data to identify trends, areas of 
improvement, and strategic insights 

 Developing action plans based on KPI 
analysis to drive organizational success 

2) Information Systems Management: 
 Managing and optimizing information 

systems to support business operations 
 Ensuring data security, integrity, and 

accessibility 
 Leveraging technology to enhance efficiency, 

decision-making, and collaboration 
3) Industry Standards and Regulations 

Management: 
 Staying up-to-date with industry standards, 

regulations, and best practices 
 Ensuring compliance with applicable laws, 

certifications, and safety requirements 
 Implementing processes and procedures to 

maintain regulatory compliance 
4) Supply Chain Management: 

 Effectively managing the flow of goods and 
services throughout the supply chain 

 Optimizing inventory levels, procurement 
processes, and supplier relationships 

 Mitigating risks and ensuring timely delivery 
of quality products and services 

5) Quality Management System: 
 Implementing and maintaining a robust 

quality management system 
 Conducting audits, inspections, and 

continuous improvement initiatives 
 Ensuring adherence to quality standards, 

customer satisfaction, and regulatory 
requirements 
 

6) Human Capital Management: 
 Developing and implementing strategies for 

talent acquisition and retention 
 Nurturing a positive organizational culture 

and fostering employee engagement 
 Providing professional development 

opportunities and performance management 
7) Organizational Structure Management: 

 Designing and optimizing organizational 
structures to support business objectives 

 Defining roles, responsibilities, and reporting 
lines 

 Promoting effective communication, 
collaboration, and decision-making within the 
organization 

Proficiency in these seven key areas of business 
ensures that CTAC professionals possess the 
necessary skills and knowledge to effectively 
navigate and manage the business aspects of 
aerospace consulting. It enables them to provide 
holistic and comprehensive guidance to clients, 
encompassing both technical expertise and business 
acumen. 
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Sample Oral Questions: 
 
This Section will provide three sample questions 
from each of the seven areas of business previously 
identified.  
 
1. KPI: 
 
Here are three oral questions related to the first key 
area of Key Performance Indicators (KPIs) 
Management, specifically focusing on aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing: 
 
Question: In the context of aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing, what are some key 
performance indicators (KPIs) that can be used to 
measure operational efficiency? 
 
This question aims to assess the candidate's 
understanding of KPIs relevant to aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing and their ability to 
identify specific indicators that gauge operational 
efficiency, such as aircraft turnaround time, on-time 
performance, utilization rates, or labor productivity. 
 
Question: How can KPIs be utilized to track and 
monitor safety performance in aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing operations? 
 
This question evaluates the candidate's knowledge 
of utilizing KPIs for safety management. The 
candidate should discuss how KPIs related to safety 
incidents, accident rates, compliance with safety 
regulations, or implementation of safety procedures 
can be used to effectively track and monitor safety 
performance within aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing environments. 
 
Question: Describe a situation where KPIs can help 
identify areas of improvement in aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing processes and suggest 
appropriate corrective measures. 
 
This question assesses the candidate's ability to 
apply KPIs in identifying areas for improvement and 
proposing suitable corrective actions. The candidate 
should provide a specific example or scenario where 
KPIs, such as maintenance cycle time, defect rates, 
or equipment downtime, can be utilized to pinpoint 
process inefficiencies and recommend appropriate 
steps to enhance performance and productivity. 
 

These oral questions aim to evaluate the candidate's 
knowledge, critical thinking, and practical 
understanding of applying KPIs within the context of 
aerospace maintenance/manufacturing. The 
responses will provide insights into their ability to 
analyze data, identify performance gaps, and 
propose actionable solutions to drive improvements 
in this key area of expertise. 
 
2. ISM: 
 
Here are three oral questions related to the second 
key area of Information Systems Management (ISM) 
in the context of aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing: 
 
Question: How can information systems be 
leveraged to enhance supply chain visibility and 
efficiency in aerospace maintenance/manufacturing? 
 
This question assesses the candidate's 
understanding of the role of information systems in 
supply chain management within the aerospace 
industry. The candidate should discuss how 
technologies like Enterprise Resource Planning 
(ERP), Material Requirements Planning (MRP), or 
Warehouse Management Systems (WMS) can be 
utilized to improve visibility, traceability, and 
coordination across the supply chain, leading to 
enhanced efficiency and responsiveness. 
 
Question: What are some potential cybersecurity 
risks and challenges specific to aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing information systems, 
and how can they be mitigated? 
 
This question evaluates the candidate's knowledge 
of cybersecurity considerations in the aerospace 
industry. The candidate should identify potential 
risks, such as data breaches, intellectual property 
theft, or system vulnerabilities, and discuss 
appropriate measures to mitigate these risks, such 
as robust access controls, encryption, regular 
security assessments, and employee awareness 
programs. 
 
Question: Describe the benefits and challenges of 
implementing cloud-based information systems in 
aerospace maintenance/manufacturing operations. 
 
This question assesses the candidate's 
understanding of cloud computing in the aerospace 
industry. The candidate should explain the  
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advantages of cloud-based systems, such as 
scalability, accessibility, and cost-effectiveness, as 
well as potential challenges like data security, 
regulatory compliance, or reliance on internet 
connectivity. They should also discuss strategies for 
addressing these challenges and ensuring 
successful adoption. 
 
These oral questions aim to evaluate the candidate's 
knowledge, critical thinking, and practical 
understanding of information systems management 
in the context of aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing. The responses will 
provide insights into their ability to analyze 
technology requirements, assess risks, and propose 
effective strategies for leveraging information 
systems to optimize operations and achieve 
business objectives. 
 
3. ISRM: 
 
Here are three oral questions related to the third key 
area of Industry Standards and Regulations 
Management (ISRM) in the context of aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing: 
 
Question: Explain the significance of regulatory 
compliance in aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing operations and its 
impact on business performance. 
 
This question assesses the candidate's 
understanding of the importance of regulatory 
compliance in the aerospace industry. The candidate 
should discuss how adherence to industry standards 
and regulations, such as those set by the FAA or 
EASA, ensures safety, quality, and legal compliance. 
They should also highlight the potential 
consequences of non-compliance and the impact it 
can have on business reputation, operational 
efficiency, and customer trust. 
 
Question: How do you stay updated with the latest 
industry standards and regulatory changes relevant 
to aerospace maintenance/manufacturing? 
 
This question evaluates the candidate's approach to 
continuous learning and staying informed about 
industry regulations. The candidate should discuss 
strategies they employ to keep up-to-date with 
evolving standards, such as attending industry 
conferences, participating in professional 
associations, engaging with regulatory agencies, or  
 

actively monitoring industry publications and 
updates. 
 
Question: Provide an example of a recent industry 
standard or regulatory change that significantly 
impacted aerospace maintenance/manufacturing 
operations, and explain how organizations can 
effectively adapt to such changes. 
 
This question assesses the candidate's awareness 
of recent regulatory developments and their ability to 
identify their implications and propose effective 
adaptation strategies. The candidate should describe 
a specific regulatory change, such as the 
implementation of a new airworthiness directive or 
revised maintenance procedures, and discuss how 
organizations can successfully navigate such 
changes through effective communication, training 
programs, process modifications, or technology 
implementations. 
 
These oral questions aim to evaluate the candidate's 
knowledge, critical thinking, and practical 
understanding of industry standards and regulations 
in the context of aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing. The responses will 
provide insights into their ability to comprehend and 
apply regulatory requirements, stay informed about 
industry changes, and propose effective strategies 
for compliance and adaptation. 
 
4. SCM 
 
Here are three oral questions related to the fourth 
key area of Supply Chain Management (SCM in the 
context of aerospace maintenance/manufacturing: 
 
Question: How can supply chain disruptions impact 
aerospace maintenance/manufacturing operations, 
and what strategies can be implemented to mitigate 
these disruptions? 
 
This question assesses the candidate's 
understanding of the impact of supply chain 
disruptions and their ability to propose mitigation 
strategies. The candidate should discuss the 
potential consequences of disruptions, such as 
delays in parts availability or supplier failures, and 
highlight strategies such as dual sourcing, supplier 
diversification, inventory management, or 
contingency planning to minimize the impact of 
disruptions on operations. 
 
 



Certified Technical Aerospace Consultant (CTAC) Handbook                                         7 
 

Question: Describe the role of lean principles and 
practices in improving supply chain efficiency within 
aerospace maintenance/manufacturing operations. 
 
This question evaluates the candidate's knowledge 
of lean principles and their application in the 
aerospace industry. The candidate should explain 
how lean concepts, such as just-in-time inventory, 
waste reduction, value stream mapping, or 
continuous improvement, can be employed to 
optimize supply chain efficiency, streamline 
processes, and enhance overall operational 
performance. 
 
Question: What are some key considerations in 
managing supplier relationships within the aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing supply chain, and how 
can these relationships be effectively nurtured? 
 
This question assesses the candidate's 
understanding of supplier relationship management. 
The candidate should discuss factors such as 
supplier selection criteria, performance evaluation 
metrics, collaboration and communication strategies, 
or long-term partnerships, and highlight effective 
approaches to building and maintaining strong 
relationships with suppliers in the aerospace 
industry. 
 
These oral questions aim to evaluate the candidate's 
knowledge, critical thinking, and practical 
understanding of supply chain management in the 
context of aerospace maintenance/manufacturing. 
The responses will provide insights into their ability 
to analyze supply chain challenges, propose 
effective strategies, and optimize operations for 
enhanced efficiency and resilience. 
 
5. QMS 
 
Here are three oral questions related to the fifth key 
area of Quality Management System (QMS) in the 
context of aerospace maintenance/manufacturing: 
 
Question: Explain the importance of implementing a 
robust quality management system (QMS) in 
aerospace maintenance/manufacturing operations 
and its impact on overall product/service quality. 
 
This question assesses the candidate's 
understanding of the significance of a QMS in the 
aerospace industry. The candidate should discuss 
how a well-designed QMS ensures compliance with 
quality standards, enhances product/service  

reliability, fosters customer satisfaction, and 
improves overall organizational performance. They 
should also highlight the role of metrics, audits, and 
continuous improvement processes within a QMS. 
 
Question: Describe the key components of an 
effective quality management system specific to 
aerospace maintenance/manufacturing, and how 
they contribute to quality assurance. 
 
This question evaluates the candidate's knowledge 
of the essential components of a QMS in the 
aerospace industry. The candidate should discuss 
elements such as document control, non-
conformance management, corrective and 
preventive actions, supplier quality management, 
training programs, and customer feedback 
processes. They should explain how these 
components work together to ensure quality 
assurance throughout the 
maintenance/manufacturing operations. 
 
Question: How can risk management be integrated 
into the quality management system in aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing operations? 
 
This question assesses the candidate's 
understanding of risk management within a QMS. 
The candidate should explain how risk assessment, 
identification, analysis, and mitigation techniques can 
be integrated into a QMS in the aerospace industry. 
They should discuss the importance of proactive risk 
management to prevent quality issues, ensure 
safety, and maintain compliance with industry 
standards and regulatory requirements. 
 
These oral questions aim to evaluate the candidate's 
knowledge, critical thinking, and practical 
understanding of quality management systems in the 
context of aerospace maintenance/manufacturing. 
The responses will provide insights into their ability 
to comprehend and apply quality principles, establish 
effective processes, and drive continuous 
improvement to achieve excellence in 
product/service quality. 
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6. HCM: 
 
Here are three oral questions related to the sixth key 
area of Human Capital Management (HCM) in the 
context of aerospace maintenance/manufacturing: 
 
Question: Discuss the importance of talent 
acquisition and retention strategies in the aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing industry, and how they 
contribute to organizational success. 
 
This question assesses the candidate's 
understanding of the significance of talent 
management in the aerospace industry. The 
candidate should explain how effective talent 
acquisition and retention strategies help attract 
skilled professionals, build a competent workforce, 
foster employee engagement, and contribute to 
overall organizational success. They should also 
discuss the challenges specific to talent 
management in the aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing sector. 
 
Question: How can professional development 
programs and training initiatives benefit aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing organizations, and what 
approaches can be used to ensure their 
effectiveness? 
 
This question evaluates the candidate's knowledge 
of professional development and training in the 
aerospace industry. The candidate should discuss 
the benefits of continuous learning, skill 
enhancement, and career advancement 
opportunities for individuals and organizations in the 
maintenance/manufacturing sector. They should also 
propose approaches such as competency-based 
training, blended learning methods, or performance 
evaluations to ensure the effectiveness of 
professional development programs. 
 
Question: Describe strategies for fostering a positive 
organizational culture and employee engagement 
within aerospace maintenance/manufacturing 
organizations. 
 
This question assesses the candidate's 
understanding of organizational culture and 
employee engagement. The candidate should 
discuss strategies such as effective communication, 
recognition and rewards programs, work-life balance 
initiatives, opportunities for employee feedback and 
involvement, and a commitment to employee well-
being. They should emphasize the importance of a  

positive work environment in promoting productivity, 
teamwork, and employee satisfaction within the 
aerospace maintenance/manufacturing context. 
 
These oral questions aim to evaluate the candidate's 
knowledge, critical thinking, and practical 
understanding of human capital management in the 
context of aerospace maintenance/manufacturing. 
The responses will provide insights into their ability 
to comprehend the importance of talent 
management, propose effective strategies for 
employee development, and create a positive work 
culture conducive to organizational success. 
 
7. OSM: 
 
Here are three oral questions related to the seventh 
key area of Organizational Structure Management 
(OSM) in the context of aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing: 
 
Question: Explain the significance of an effective 
organizational structure in aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing operations, and how it 
impacts communication, decision-making, and 
overall efficiency. 
 
This question assesses the candidate's 
understanding of the importance of organizational 
structure in the aerospace industry. The candidate 
should discuss how a well-designed structure 
facilitates clear communication channels, 
streamlined decision-making processes, and efficient 
coordination among different departments and teams 
within maintenance/manufacturing operations. They 
should also highlight the role of organizational 
structure in promoting accountability, delegation of 
authority, and effective resource allocation. 
 
Question: Describe the key factors to consider when 
designing an organizational structure for aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing organizations, and how 
these factors can influence operational effectiveness. 
 
This question evaluates the candidate's knowledge 
of the factors influencing organizational structure 
design. The candidate should discuss considerations 
such as the size of the organization, the complexity 
of operations, the need for specialization, reporting 
relationships, span of control, and the balance 
between centralized and decentralized decision-
making. They should explain how the appropriate 
alignment of these factors can optimize operational  
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effectiveness within the maintenance/manufacturing 
context. 
 
Question: How can organizational restructuring be 
effectively managed within aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing organizations to 
accommodate changes in business needs or market 
conditions? 
 
This question assesses the candidate's 
understanding of managing organizational change. 
The candidate should discuss strategies for 
implementing organizational restructuring, such as 
clear communication, stakeholder involvement, 
change management frameworks, and providing 
support and training to employees during the 
transition. They should also emphasize the 
importance of assessing the impact of restructuring 
on employee morale, productivity, and overall 
organizational performance. 
 
These oral questions aim to evaluate the candidate's 
knowledge, critical thinking, and practical 
understanding of organizational structure 
management in the context of aerospace 
maintenance/manufacturing. The responses will 
provide insights into their ability to comprehend the 
significance of organizational design, propose 
effective structures, and manage organizational 
change for improved operational efficiency and 
adaptability. 
 
Application Process: 
 
The first step of the application process is submitting 
the Application found on GhostAerospace.com 
(Form GFM-700) to Consult@GhostAerospace.com. 
Once the Application is accepted, written and oral 
exam fee totals $200 USD. Once processing is 
completed, applicants will be contacted about 
scheduling. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


