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The number one cause of deaths in the United States isn’t heart attacks, cancer, diabetes, or car 
accidents – it’s abortion. 

Abortion is the worst evil. It’s the killing of God’s greatest gift – human life. Murder is the most heinous 
crime and sin of all, but even more so when it’s the murder of a totally innocent being – a baby. 

Babies are being expunged with the fallacious justification that it’s a woman’s reproductive right 
because it’s her body and she can choose what to do with it, “Pro-Choice”, which is really a pseudonym 
for “Pro-Death.” 

There have been approximately 50 million abortions in the U.S. since Roe v. Wade was enacted, which 
was a terrible decision by the Supreme Court that had no basis in the Constitution. Recently, the court 
reversed that decision and returned the abortion issue to the states, but that doesn’t come close to 
eliminating abortion or reducing it substantially. There are over one million abortions annually in our 
country – precious little humans that would’ve experienced the joys of life had they not been expunged. 
That’s a monumental tragedy. The U.S. population is declining, yet we’re killing babies, which makes no 
sense whatsoever.  

Abortion is brutal, especially partial birth abortion. One commonly used method is to insert a 
hypodermic needle into the baby’s heart, inject poison to stop the beating and kill the baby. 
Ultrasound images show the babies’ faces writhing with pain. Forceps are then used to tear apart the 
baby’s body parts and remove them from the womb, the head being the hardest to pull out. Full-term 
babies, just born, that mothers don’t want, are drowned in buckets of water or left to suffocate while 
the doctors and nurses watch. This is abominable and grossly evil. It's infanticide and should be 
prosecuted the same as a first-degree homicide. Too bad we can’t ask the baby if he or she would 
choose to live or die in the womb. Of course, we can’t, but we think that the answer unequivocally 
would be, “I want to live.” 

There’s vociferous arguments over when a fetus grows sufficiently to be considered a baby. That’s not 
the real issue. The real question is when does human life actually begin? Upon conception is the embryo 
dead or alive? Is it a viable human life or not? If it’s dead, it would be automatically rejected from the 
mother’s body within a few days – a miscarriage. If it’s not rejected, that would imply it’s alive. It must 
be alive because dead cells don’t reproduce and grow, as an embryo does. So, without any doubt, the 
embryo is an active human life, God-given at the very moment of conception. It makes no difference 
whether it’s aborted an hour, a day, a month, or six months later – it’s undeniably a human life.  
A comprehensive study done at the University of Chicago in 2019 determined that 96% of 5,577 
biologists surveyed worldwide believe that human life begins at conception. That stunning survey 
showed that 63% of the biologists were non-religious, 89% were liberals, and 92% were Democrats. 
Obviously, that survey wasn’t biased towards religious conservatives.  

  



There is nothing more precious in this world than a newborn baby, which all of those aborted fetuses 
would become if they weren't destroyed. When a baby is born to a mother, she has a new learning 
experience to love in a beautiful, nurturing, overwhelming, incredible way that she's never experienced 
before. Unfortunately, a mother who aborts her baby will never realize that transforming God-given 
love. Since two thirds of the U.S. is Christian, it's obvious that many Christian women have abortions, or 
support it, which is definitely contrary to Christian precepts. Statistics show that a large number of 
abortions are performed on Black women, who are 83% Christian. These are mainly done by Planned 
Parenthood, which is an abortion factory. In fact, 80% of their facilities are located in Black 
neighborhoods. Planned Parenthood was founded over a hundred years ago by Margaret Sanger, an 
avowed racist who advocated using eugenics to diminish the Black population which she thought was 
inferior and mentally defective, which we know is absurd. 

Unfortunately, 450 million taxpayer dollars are donated to Planned Parenthood annually by our federal 
government, supposedly because of other services it provides women, when the big money is made 
from abortions. That's a gross misuse of taxpayer money and should stop immediately. That evil 
organization has made billions of dollars aborting mainly Black and Hispanic babies — 45% Black and 
35% Hispanic. It also was the promoter of the Roe v. Wade lawsuit which legalized abortion, thus 
enabling it to make huge money by killing minority babies. In fact, the Black and Hispanic population 
would be at least double now if it wasn’t for Planned Parenthood abortions. Of course, the main reason 
minority women seek abortions is because they can't afford the baby because they've been 
economically disadvantaged by the Democratic Party. Unfortunately, the minorities in the ghettos and 
barrios don't realize what the Democrats have done to them, currently and in the past.  

The slave plantations in the old South were all owned by Democrats. The Republicans in the northern 
U.S. fought and died fighting the southern Democrats in the Civil War to free the slaves. After the war 
the Democrats started the Ku Klux Klan— the KKK – which lynched innocent Blacks and instituted Jim 
Crow laws to separate and subjugate the Blacks from the white population. Today the ghettos and 
barrios are basically located in big cities controlled by the Democrats. For many decades they have kept 
the minorities dependent on them for meager welfare handouts to get their votes. The Democrats don't 
want to lose control of the minorities, so they thwart the Republican's efforts to give choice of schools 
for minority kids, which negates their advancement by keeping them in substandard schools. That keeps 
them economically disadvantaged, unable to escape their penury, and under the Democrats control. So, 
the Democratic Party is directly responsible for the high percentage of abortions among Blacks and 
Hispanics. 

Women who support abortion march with signs proclaiming, “my body – my choice.” Only part of that 
statement is correct – “my choice.” Of course, every pregnant woman can make the choice to have an 
abortion, but there’s a big difference between a choice and a right. God gives all humans free will to 
make choices, but he also gives us our rights, and the right to life is one of them. In fact, it’s the most 
important right he gives us that only he has the right to take. The Fifth Commandment says, “Thou shall 
not kill.” It doesn’t say, “except for embryos, fetuses, and babies.” The Declaration of Independence 
states that we all have the “right to life, liberty and the pursuit of happiness.” So, when a woman has an 
abortion, it’s a choice, not a right. Someone may make the choice to shoot the next-door neighbor, but 
it's not a right, it’s a very bad choice. A woman might make the choice to commit suicide because it’s her 
own body, but it also is not a right. In fact, it’s against the law, as abortion should be. Therefore, when a 
woman makes the choice to have an abortion, she’s choosing to cancel the right of another human 



being to have life. The part of the statement “my body, my choice” that ‘s incorrect is “my body.”  
It’s not her body that she’s denying the right to life – it’s a separate body from her own. It’s a body 
within her body that relies on her for survival. If it was her body, she’d have two heads, four arms, four 
legs, two hearts, etc. In fact, the DNA of the mother is always different than the child’s DNA, so the 
embryo, fetus or baby can’t be part of her body. Most women will never choose to have an abortion, 
but because they’ve been propagandized and incited by the radical left liberals, many of them have 
become pro-choice. They’ve been told that they’ve been unfairly treated – that their rights as women 
have been violated because of abortion restrictions, making them loud and angry. Since about 85% of 
Americans believe in God and 64% are Christians, it’s obvious that many abortion supporters are 
Christians. It’s hard to understand how these people, men and women, can reconcile supporting 
abortion, the killing of human, God-given life, with their Christian beliefs. We’re very sure that Jesus 
Christ himself would condemn their choice. It seems that these people have forgotten that life is very 
short and we’ll all be leaving this world soon. Do they think that God will not hold them responsible for 
supporting the killing of innocent lives that he created? God is merciful, but he’s also just. There’s no 
doubt that he wants us to be merciful to the unborn.  

A hundred years is but an instant, and not even that compared to eternity which never ends. God is 
incredible – beyond our imaginations. The creature will never fully know God, the creator, because he is 
ineffable. We will never fully grasp his essence, whether in this life or in the next. But we will know him 
to the extent of our human capacity, mainly through his Son, Jesus Christ, the second person of the 
Blessed Trinity who deigned to take a human form, thereby having two natures, the nature of God and 
the nature of man that enabled him to sacrifice himself on the cross for our sins. The universe that God 
created is so immense that its size is impossible to comprehend. Traveling at the speed of light (186,00 
miles per second), which is seven and a half times around the world in one second, it would take 91 
billion years to traverse the universe from one end to the other.  Science doesn’t know what’s beyond 
the known universe, but we do. Of course, it’s God himself – Father, Son, and Holy Spirit. Again, that’s a 
concept our limited human intelligence can’t comprehend. God created this magnificent universe and 
everything in it, including each one of us. If he withdrew from the universe for even one second, it and 
all of us, would ease to exist because everything exists in him, which we also cannot understand, but 
which we know is true because God has told us so. There are people termed atheists who deny the 
existence of God – a being of unlimited intelligence and power, which would mean that the universe 
would have created itself, which is patently impossible and ridiculous.  

Science has determined that the entire universe was most likely created by the huge explosion of a 
dense amount of inanimate matter about the size of an eraser on the end of a pencil – the “big bang 
theory.” It’s unfathomable how anyone with reasonable intelligence could believe that a small amount 
of inanimate matter could not only create itself, but then explode itself in a trillionth of a second to 
create the universe. So, if it’s most reasonable that God created the universe, isn’t it most logical that 
he's the creator of human life, because in essence we are all part of the universe? Therefore, since God 
created all human life, isn't it most reasonable that only he has the absolute right to end life? Probably 
most of the people who support abortion are basically good, conscientious people who think they are 
doing the right thing – unfortunately, they're not. They've become victims of the radical left, Marxists 
who have no regard for human life, and who promote abortion to further divide Americans for their 
nefarious goals. A sensible, moral alternative to abortion is adoption. There are enough people waiting 
to adopt a newborn to ensure that all unwanted babies will have a home. It's unfathomable how any 



Christian or believer in God can support abortion in good conscience. Many women who have abortions 
eventually experience emotional and mental problems because their consciences catch up with them.  

God has favored America with incredible blessings. It has been the bastion of freedom and success, but 
will he continue to favor us if we displease him by killing millions of precious innocent lives in the womb 
that he created? There is one exception that justifies abortion – the imminent threat to the mother's 
life.  

There are a lot of charities and/or nonprofit organizations that solicit donations on TV, by mail, or on the 
Internet. We decided to check on the salaries that the CEOs and other executives earn in those 
organizations, and we were shocked. Many of those people make enormous amounts of money. The top 
executives earn $600,000 per year and even more! Subordinate executives make $300,000 to $400,000 
per year. Without naming the organizations, we will tell you that they are very well known. The 
percentage of their income that they fund for their charitable works is quite small in many cases, 
probably due to their expenses which include a lot of very high salaries and expensive TV ads. The 
charities with the lowest expenses and the highest funding were religious charities with low salaries and 
no TV ads. Their approach being by mail or the Internet. The TV ads which good hearted people watch 
that prompt them to donate are well made and we applaud those donors for their generosity, but sadly, 
they may be victims of exploitation. We highly recommend that before anyone donates, a thorough 
investigation be made online to check out the finances of the soliciting entity. Who's being paid? How 
much money and where does all the money go?  

Currently we aren’t registered as a deductible charity, which we’re sure we will be shortly. In the 
meantime, we would appreciate contributions to our organization that we will use to help defeat 
abortions.  

We believe that the best way to do this is to show photographs on our website of aborted fetuses and 
babies to stir peoples’ consciences. We will also print and distribute them by mail, and other means, to 
the general public along with printed copies of the dialogue therein. The photos are shocking and heart 
wrenching, and many people will probably object to them, but we think it’s important to show the 
devastating reality of abortion.  

As Christians, we vow that the funds we receive from generous donors will not be used for our personal 
enrichment but will be used at minimal cost to help eliminate abortions. Our income and expense 
statements will be supplied to any donor upon request. Therefore, hereby pledge that the co-founders 
of our organization will earn no more than $150,000 each annually, adjusted only for inflation and that 
other employees hired as we go will earn reasonably moderate incomes. That is fair because the laborer 
is worthy of his hire. However, the co-founders’ income will be limited in any case to 10% of the funds 
donated, with a maximum being $150,000.   
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