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Adoleseenthood

Tne usB of the lerm adolescenthood as a
concept of human development helps us to
define adolescence as a distinct entity rather
tåan as a period of t¡ensition and change
during which a person moves from childhood
to adulthood. As long as adolescence is con-
ceptuelized as an in-between stage, the ado-
lescent has no status in his own right. He can
be viewed neither as a child nor as an adult
and is apt to be treated as either, neitåer, or
both.

The concept of adolescentlood requires us
¡s think of, and to relate to, youth as though
this developmental period-in its early, mid-
dle, and late phases-has specific nsaning
and presents the adolescent with specific
problems. It requires a conceptual shift sim-
ila¡ to that which occurred ea¡lier in this
ceDtury concerning childhood development.
Before that time children were regalded as
miniature adults, and that is how they were
rea¡ed. With the understanding that a child
does not feel, think, or relate as does an
adult ceme the recognition of childhi¡od as a
distinct phase of human development. The
whole approach to rearing, educating, help-
ing, healing, and saving children took a new
focus and, I believe, a more appropriate one.
Should not adolescence be viewed in a sim-
ilar fashion?

We tend to deal with or¡¡ world as we con-
ceive of it. Do we regard adolescents as ado-
lescents for the time being or as "just young
kids" who will be adults tomorrow? To deal
with youth, we need to understand the period
of adolescence for what it is. With that
thought i¡ mind, I should like to explore
simultaneously two major questions: What
is involved in conceptueli.ing adolescent-
hood? What are the implications of such a
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conceptual shift in our understanrling of chil-
dren and youth?

A Period of Being

There is no longer much question about our
perception of, and attin¡de toward, child-
hood. According to a standard American
dictionary, childhood is "the state or time
of being ¿ çhilfl," and adolescence is "the
state or process of growing up from child-
hood to manhood g¡ s,/g¡¡nhsod." Our em-
phasis on adolescence as a .;me of change
and growth, as a passing developmental phe-
nomenon introducing adulthood, reveals
more about our hopes and fea¡s than about
the actual content and opportunities of ado-
lescent development. It is nlmost as if we
were saþg to ourselves and to these young
persons: "Whatever it is, it will pass. Don't
take adolescence too seriously. Think of it as
a process of change that will lead to a dif-
ferent life-hopefully a more real and deÊ-
uiteþ a more comfofable one."

Anne Frank challenges us clearly when she
comments in her diary: 1 "I feel so differ-
ently. I wish they would tell me what I can
expect to feel rather than put me off with the
explanation that I am in a phase of change."

Essentiall¡ the adolescent is regarded as a
child who has left the safe ha¡bor of child-
hood but has not yet reached the shores of
maturity. In short, he is at sea. Ife has the
hope and promise of reaching a land of op-
pornnig so long as he does not fall prey to
the doubts and temptations of his travel com-
panions, his peers. (And while at sea, he
must blot out, as frivolous, all childish fanta-
sies of a ca¡efree life lest he drift toward
never-never-land.)

In view of the fact that adolescence ooven¡
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half of the growing-up period, our perc€p-
tion of it as a pha.se of change is not ap-
propriate. Who wants to remain "i[-between"
for several years of his life? In fact, tle com-
bination of longer life expectancy and the
need for preparing for the ever-increasing
complexity of modern life points to the possi-
bility that adolescence will become even more
prolonged. Adolescence will have to serve fr¡
the major developnental proving ground for
living in a higbly technological society. For
these reasons, I submit tlat we need to con-
sider adolescence for what it is-a period of
being an adolescent.

Actually, this is not a new concept. Ernest
A. Snith, in his book on group life in teen-
age culture, describes a youth culture that he
clearly distinguishes from its adult counter-
part.2 Similarly, Talcott Parsons points out
that young persons in the age group betsreen
childhood and adulthood form distinctive
patterrx¡ of values and anitudes that facil-
itate processes of adjushent from childhood
emotional dependenry to full, adult matur-
ity.3 Edgar Friedenberg,4 in his provocative
thesis, defines adolescence as a time for the
young peñron to differentiate himself from
his culture, thougb on tle cultu¡e's terms.

Resources for Ego Ex¡lression
and Repair

Our current consern over teen-age behavior,
youth culture, and adolescent crises suggests
that we need to define the ways ¿¡d 6sans sf
ego expression for adolescenthood, as we
have done quite successfully for childhood
and, to a conside¡able extent, for adulthood-
We have clearly accepted the idea that, for
the childhood period, pløy is the appropriate
channel for the individual's creative invest-
ment and the mirror for his sense of compe-
tence. In adulthood worÉ assumes a like
function. In adolescenthood, we ale not sure
whether both, either, or neither of these is
the salient factor.

We have no clear undentanding of what
the ego-building processes a¡e in adolescence.
Childhood allows ample outlets for ego re-
pair-recovery from personal defeats, frus-
trations, a¡d loss of a sense of competence-
through play and fantasy. Adulthood affords
men and women institutionalized opportuni-
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ties for stepping aside from the pressures of
daily work and living. The bowling alley, the
golf course, and the fishing trip serve as ex-
âmples of a wide array of such resources.
The cocklail lounge, the divorce court, club
activities, even taking a drive a¡e other social
outlets for overcoming personal rfifficul-
ties and readþg ou¡selves for facing adult
life anew. We may well ask ourselves: "What
a¡e the corresponding resou¡ces for self-re-
pair for adolescents?"

In relation to childhood, both the child
and the adult have a tacit mutual understand-
ing of the appropriate forms of behavior for
expressing the proper dependence and inde-
pendence that they grant each other and that
¡fisir immsfiate society expects. The adoles-
cenÇ howevef, knows only that he has a pe-
riod of approximately ten years of prolonged
dependence upon his elders, a dependence
that must end eventually. I should like to
introduce here the idea that peer associations
and peer groups, with their relevant group
norms, serye as the major avenue for ego
development and ego repair in adolescence.
This will be discussed in greater detail later.

Another crucial and complex question for
adolescents is that of sexual adjustment and
behavior. For the child, the question sup-
posedly does not exist; the subject is taboo.
In adulthood, sexual behavior is legitimatized
by marriage and other social customs. During
adolescence, sexual interests are only tenta-
tively granted recopition. These interests
usually ¿chieve clea¡ definition only when
their existence creates unusual complications.
I have no clear formulation for a resolution
ef this problem except to suggest that we
need to examine it candidly. The adolescent
must find ways to resolve it other than by
simulating a maturity that he does not yet
possess. Simultaneously, he should not deny
his sexual urges ¿ut he grows up but rather
discover how best to sublimate them as he
waits for the sanctions of marriage in a dim
and distant future.

Modes of Thinking

What, then, constitutes adolescenthood?
First, we should recognize tlat adolescents,
like children and adults, have their distinct
modes of thinking. [¡¡s þ¡enk jolted us into
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a stark awareness of an adolescent's pene-
trating, insigbtful thinking. Her sensitivity
and literary style are probably unique. How-
ever, her 5sa¡shing inquiries, I believe, could
be matched by most adolescents-if we had
access to their 1þinking and took time really
to listen to them. We should probably find
that the adolescent has a consuming interest
in relating himself to others and to the world
around him. His mode of thinking is con-
cerned y¡ith "fitting the pieces together,"
building a consistent whole out of his as yet
partially developed understanding of his life
experiences and ideas.

With the onset of adolescence, the youth
can deal with abstractions and become more
able to handle his own relationship to his
world in symbolic terms. He can deal witl
questions of relativity and differential rela-
tionships. With this acquisition he can be all
things to all people. He tends to become fas-
cinated by hypothetical questions and the
construction of hypotheses. The many proba-
bilities inhs¡s¡¡ in one hypothesis seem to
hold greater interest than the reality that sur-
rounds iL The adolescent is apt, for example,
to find more pleasure and greater success in
ûguring out a number of unusual ways to do
a job than in tackting it and completing it
expediently and immediately.

¡¡4s5¡ imFortant is the realization tlat, in
adolescence, the youth is able effectively to
combine horizontal thinking and reasoning
with vertical hinking and reasoning. Once
life could be explained in relation to cur-
rent events, but he now wants to uudersta¡d
the present in terms of the past, ald the past
by is outcome in the present. He ¡elates his
and otlers' experiences to past, present, and
futu¡e. To adults, tle adolescent's inquiries
and challenges may appær impertinent and
inquisitive. To the youth, they are pertinent.
Empirical knowledge no longer sufrces. New
experiences and understanrling serve as points
of departure for new mental explorations.
Cu¡ious as it may appea¡ in his mental ex-
plorations, he tries to apply logic, tries to
recoßtruct åu understanding of his wo¡ld
into a consistent whole.In his everyday life,
however, it is the nature of the experience,
the empirical evidence, that couûts and that
defines his behavior. We can readily find a

fifteen-year-old who can give a mah¡re in-
terpretation of the universal meening of fair-
asss-in fact, a teen-age club code tends to
make it very clear-but in the same teen-
ager's everyday conduct, fairness is applied
with a ¡s¡s linifsd and time-bound per-
spective.ú

In most of these mental exploratioos, lan-
guage serves the adolesc€nt as his tool for
thinking. The spoken language heþ him
sort out experiences and ideas, deal with the
complications of daily life, and experiment
with a variety of roles. We migbt say that the
adolescent puts his internal struggle clearly
before him-r'sa 1¡" 1¿þls"-as he tries out
ideas. His ys¡þalizing shifts from one extreme
to anottrer. Our understandi.g that these
shifts are taking place should reassr¡re us that
the adolescent's playing with ideas, his teking
extreme positions, his boasting or confessing,
and his exaggerated talk of exploits or con-
quests may all represent his way of ûtting
together different roles and perspectives into
a complex but unified whole.

In childhood, hinking takes the form of
actron-playing out thoughts. In adolescent-
hood, thinking occurs by talking out altetlra-
tives, usually more than one at a ''rîe. Adults
should guard agninst labeling tlese mental
explorations as actual verbal comnihents.
They are not. The youth's hair-spliüing and
verbosity a¡e his essential ego tools for com-
pleting his adolescenthood. The problem for
society and the youth himself a¡ises when the
youth acts out his thoughts and feelings. TliIe
must be awa¡e that the adolesc¿nt needs a
compatible arena whe¡e he can purzue his
verbal explorations. In such an arena, he can
try out his world for the proper fit.

Peer Associations

Earlier in this article I mentioned that paral-
lel to childhood's play and adulthood's work
is adolescenthood's reliance upon peer asso-
ciations as the major channel for ego devel-
opment and ego repair. Through peer asso-
ciations the youth can find his seû¡e of being
and his proof of competence. Once we accept
this prenise, we can regard with less sus-
picion the adolescent's preocanpation with
Peer groups.

Our studies of the adolescent's lÞer cotr-
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tacts reveal that many of his activities are di-
rected toward selfdefinition. It is in adoles-
ceûthood that the youth searches for what he
thinks, for what he is, for how he really feels'
and for what is expected of him. And these

developmental phenomena find their most
vital expression within Peer groups. Among
his peers, the youth brings into the open his
concerrxi about defining himself, his preoccu-
pation with the role he will finally assume in
life. All ttre while, he tries out various new
roles. This is a manifestation that Erik Erik-
son describes as establishing a seû¡e of iden-
tity while over@ming a sense of role diffu-
sion.6

Part of this search for a "sense of being"
in adolescenthood finds expression in the
adolescent's multiple involvements in many
activities. He feels hara.ssed, and yet he feels

a seru;e of urgency to participate in a number
of di.fferent group associations. He dashes

madly from one group activity to another.
Each of these associations sen¡es the ado-
lescent's purpose in trying out new roles
while he forks simultaneousþ on tlose he

wants to keep.
In his peer associations the youth tries to

dare himself and to da¡e others. He experi-
ments with some paüerns of behavior while
he a¡bitrarily discards others. He tries to
identify closely with some Persoû¡ and vio-
lently iejects others. If we were to study the
theme of an adolescent's behavior-the
theme of his role-taking-we would ûnd that
today's adolescent is much like yesterday's

Robin Hood, an individual involved in play-
ing many roles in many clothes. Like Robin
Hood, our adolescent is trying to come out
on toP with a satisfactory image of hi+seü-
He is-acting out-meking a fool of authority

-as he attempts to locate the essence of
authority. He is testing his peers while he is
forming close relationships with them. He is

ridiculing his society while he forges his own
societal membenhip. The adolescent works
on serious life questions anq in so doing,

vacillates between opposite extremes in think-
ing and feeling. Erikson describes him frt-
tingly when he says that at times the youth is

more devotedly perverse, at others more per-
versely devoted.? To the adult, many of the
youthts peer contacts seem to constitute a

mixture of horseplay and unholy ¡lliances-

To the youth himself, they a¡e serious busi-
as5s-his very life. Peer association is tåe
arena in which old a¡d new ideas, relation-
ships, and noÍIü¡ of behavior are tested;

some are discarded, and some are revanped
and eventually accePted for good-

Recent studies have shown thæ boys tend

to relate to peeñ¡ in small groups that serve

as the testing ground for locating norms of
behavior and for standa¡dizing their own be-
havior. Girls, on the other hand, bnd to rely

and in his work with adolescent boys and
girls. Above all, tle findings indicate that
peer associations are essential ingrgdlents
lor adolescent developmenl It is obvious,
therefore, that the adolescent needs the a¡
propriate time, space, resoulces' and sanc-

tionì for a wide variety of such associations

within the fabric of his everyday life.
Our sfirdies have shown that the ade'

lescent faces crises and change with and
through peer support. An understanding of
this fact calls for a second look at such treat-
ment practices as splitting up cliques, groups'

or gangs, or subtly sabotaging the youth's

desire to be with his fiends because we do
not like their looks or feel too much excluded
from his life. Social workers must also accept
the challenge to our common belief that at
the point of crisis, an individual tends to seek

refuge and help in the sanctity of a confi-
dential one-to-one interview. On the con-
trary, the adolescent tends to fnd his best

sanctuary for heþ in what he considers to
be the "privacy" of a peer goup. Therefore,
treatment or counseling of adolescents may
possibly be m.ost naturally carried out within
the context of, and by neans of, a group.

New Dependence Secures
Independence

In thinking about the development of the
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serve as a new social mat¡ix in this matura-
tional process. Dependence upon elden is in
part replaced by dependence upon peer
relationships. The adolescent becomes in-
creasingly independent of immediaæ adult
control. F¡om infancy on, he has been en-
couraged to take steps toward increased
independence as well as to embrace new
forms of dependence, including his eventual
dependence on his peers. Human develop-
ment involves, in part, a constant progression
through successive stages of dependence.s
Secure dependence prepares for eventual in-
dependence in a given area and, in turn,
allows the individual to become dependent in
new and more advanced areas. The new de-
pendencies become a steppingstone for
growth toward further independence. This
progression from dependence to independ-
ence, to new dependence followed by new
independence, continues through adolescent
and adult development.

Thus, an adolescent's demand for inde-
pendence is neither a radical shift nor a sud-
den insult to parental or other adult preroga-
tives. His independence can develop only
within the various ranges of adult authority,
not outside them. Adult authority itself is
not under attack so much as it is r¡nder
scrutiny. The youth sea¡ches for aspects of
independence while simultaneously freeing
himself for new spheres of dependence. In
so doing, he slowly enters tle family's "cir-
cle of elders," with a ne$r and increasingly
maüue sense of dependence upon his fanily
and other oew adult associations.

¡¡4ss1 important, parents still continue to
sewe their adolescent offspring, but now
they become his mainstay in new and difier-
ent areas. Parents continue to serve as the
mirror for the youth's feelings, thoughts, and
actions. They also 6ain¡¿i¡ their position as
tåe youth's final authority, regardless of the
images and questions the youth may cast
upon them. They may feel lonely and de-
serted, but thei¡ feelings of loneliness are
duplicated and may even be exceeded in
the adolescent. The youth tends to feel
lonely because his former dependent attach-
ments to his parents do not provide him with
satisfying company, and he has not yet found
the beginning of a new life partnership. He

,

tlerefore turns to his peers, who are the only
ones who can ûll this void.

What we find in adolescenthood is a split
in the youth's ¡¡xsans of meeting his depend-
ency needs. He looks to his peers for every-
day satisfactions a¡d to his elders for long-
range orientations. The emergence of the
Freedom Riders provides an exanple ef ihis
phenomenon. Elders gave direction and pro-
vide.d the ideas that the youth could then
ü¡nslate into purposeful behavio¡. gimil¿¡
exa.mples are the Peace Corps and President
Kennedy's suggestion for a fifty-nile hike.
Elders o¡tlins the ideas, and if they really
believe in them and are not merely tossing
out empty phrases with little conviction,
these ideas will capture the youtl's imagina-
tion and he will carry them out with compe-
tent creativity.

The previously cited shift in dependency
is also reflected in sibling rivalry. In early
childhood, sibling rivalry occurs over seÆur-
ing greater dependency satisfaction-that is,
siblings vie for the closest relationship with
tle parent. In adolescenthood, sibling rivalry
occws ¿s siþlings vie to become the fi¡st in
commard-that is, tåe one closest to replac-
ing the parent. This advanced form of sibling
rivalry finds its expression not only within
the family but also, though more indirectly,
in siblinglike strivings for statr¡s and rccog-
nition as the authority (a replacement of the
parent) within tle youth's group of peers.
The child needs to lnow the parent is 'hith
him"; later, the youth needs the parent's ex-
pression of confidence that "he can do it."

New Codes for lfeterosexual Behavior

In adolescenthood, the question of relation-
ship to the opposite sex, the concurrent on-
set of sexual desires and the problem of
self-control, present a most perplexing di-
lemma for the adolescent and his elders. The
adolescent achieves fulI sexual maturity be-
fore he achieves psychosocial maturity, but
there is no clear definition of what the stand-
a¡ds of adolescent sexual behavior should be.
The inherent s6nflict between internal de-
sires and their outward expression is a prod-
uct of socialization. The absence of a gen-
erally accepted code of adolescent behavior
in this area requires our special attention.
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It seems to me that the adolescent of to-
day has developed an admirable repertory
of heterosexual behavior for casual contacts,
dating and premarital pairing. Yet we lack
a clear pronouncement of the range of stand-
a¡ds we accept as legitimate for adolescent-
hood. Adolescents sense what their elders
are conveying to them: "Almost everyone
does it, but no one admits it.' At the same
time, adolescents convey to each other the
thought: "Let me admit to you more than I
actually did. After all, who wants to be
thought of as a square?" Moreover, the im-
plication that "almost everyone does it" cre-
ates a justification of behavior for which
standards or codes are at best vague and un-
clear. Distinctions between right and wrong,
good and bad, acceptable and unacceptable
in a¡ absolute sense are blurred, and the
absence of guiding st¡ndards, codes, and
mores is as nuch a societal and cultural
problem for adults as it is for adolescents.

My own feeling is that answers to this
problem will energe from working with out
adolescents to devise appropriate codes for
adolescent sexual behavior. lhere should be
an emphasis upon meeting their condition of
prolonged adolescence rather than mereþ re-
acting to the pattems that emerge. Such
contemporary, adolescent practices as halg-
ing around the corner dnrgstore, phoning a
friend on tle hour and talking to him for an
hour, going steady, riding around in cars,
and so on tend to be distrubing to adults.
But they do clearly reflect tle adolescent's
strong desire to relate to others. He wishes
to develop new forms of mutual dependence
with a single partner while desperately wa¡d-
ing oft the fear of being alone. The parents'
recopition of norms of adolescent behavior
would enable them to accept these behavior
patterns as appropriate for the timc being,
witlout fear that they would last beyond
adolescenthood.

Conclusion

Ordinary adolescent thoughts and behavior
are phase-bound, even though youth may
claim, and adults may fear, that they will
last for life. We should view the earþ,
middle, and late years of adolescent develop-
ment as comprising a distinct state of adoles-
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centhood. Such a concept may facilitate the
exploration of adolescent behavior in terms
of its essential ingredients of emersing adult-
hood. Just as a child's messiness, constaût
activity, and desi¡e to touch everything are
accepted as basic ingredients of childhood,
so the ostentatious behavior or dress, per-
petual mobility, and provocative deûance of
authority of the adolescent constifi¡te essen-
tial ingredients of his strivings both for an
autononous role 0 as an adolescent and for
his own sense of identity.lo

An accepto"ce of the concept of adoles-
centhood as a developmental stage rather
than a transitory phase would foster social
guarantees (societal sanctions) for appro-
priate customs, programs, associations, and,
especiall¡ ample time to assure adolescent
development. Then vocational training
centers, youtb. centers, extracurricular ac-
tivities, social centers for leafing, bowling,
or dancing, and youth counseling or employ-
ment services with access to work opportuni-
ties would gain further relevance as basic
social institutions for normal adolescent de-
velopment. In a number of cities, youth
committees have been set up to consider or
regulate curfew hours and other critical
issues for youth. They are working examples
of other resources tbroug! which adolescents
can have a chance to define their behavior
for themselves within the context of their
community.

Essentiall¡ the development of codes of
behavior as guidelines for youth must be
supported, not necessarily to defend the re-
spectability of the adult comnunity but out
of a recognition of adolescenthood. The
former may be a fringe benefit, but it can¡ot
be the primary motive. Added institutional
outlets for adolescenthood would assist the
youth to unfold his individual creativíty and
test his sense of competence ¡6¡ himself :rnd
his peers. Above all, he is more apt to feel
and know that he, as an adolesænt todøy,
has a fufire to which he himself is contrib-
uting. He ca¡ thetr work toward a future
forged out of his own a¡d his elders' de-
velopmental past and present. In short, ado-
lescent life must be integrated with adult life
as part of a living community in which the
adolescent is free to be an adolescent.
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